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BID NO. 
RX NO.   
DATE:  
BUYER:  

ITEM 
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION

EST 
QTY UNIT

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

1

GROUP 1                                                                                                                                          
CARS, LIGHT TRUCKS, AND MEDIUM 
DUTY VEHICLES                                             
LABOR RATE PER HOUR FOR 
SERVICES PROVIDED DURING 
NORMAL BUSINESS HOURS 50 HR $80.00 $4,000.00 $90.00 $4,500.00 

2

GROUP 2                                                                                                                                        
TRAILERS, BOATS, AND HEAVY-DUTY 
VEHICLES                                                          
LABOR RATE PER HOUR FOR 
SERVICES PROVIDED DURING 
NORMAL BUSINESS HOURS 50 HR $80.00 $4,000.00 $90.00 $4,500.00 

3 STROBE 360 AMBER 15 EA $123.59 $1,853.85 No Bid No Bid
4 SPOTLIGHT HALOGEN 25 EA $176.24 $4,406.00 No Bid No Bid
5 1023 BREAKAWAY BATTERY 10 EA $13.90 $139.00 $20.25 $202.50 
6 5520 BRKWY CNTRL ACTIVATOR 20 EA $46.81 $936.20 $76.49 $1,529.80 
7 WHEEL 16" GALV.MOD 8 LUG 10 EA $63.09 $630.90 $74.18 $741.80 
8 CONNECTOR TRAILER MALE 6 PIN 10 EA $4.97 $49.70 $7.10 $71.00 
9 BOLT SPRING HANGER TRAILER 10 EA $1.20 $12.00 $31.05 $310.50 
10 SHACKLE 10 EA $0.65 $6.50 $1.35 $13.50 
11 HANDLE JACK 10 EA $19.30 $193.00 $15.90 $159.00 
12 WARN WINCH 3700LB 15 EA $376.89 $5,653.35 $411.30 $6,169.50 
13 LIGHT RED STUD MOUNT 20 EA $2.29 $45.80 $3.33 $66.60 
14 BACKING PLATE 12X2 ELECT US 25 EA $53.22 $1,330.50 $48.60 $1,215.00 
15 ACTUATOR 8K 2" BALL BLACK 25 EA $255.78 $6,394.50 $191.70 $4,792.50 
16 BRAKE ASSY ELECTRIC LH, 3623112 2 EA $53.22 $106.44 $35.95 $71.90 
17 BRAKE ASSY ELECTRIC RH, 3623113 2 EA $53.22 $106.44 $35.95 $71.90 
18 WHEEL 15" WHITE 5 ON 5 1 EA $28.82 $28.82 $45.81 $45.81 
19 JACK TRAILER 12000 LBS 1 EA $108.87 $108.87 $184.45 $184.45 
20 LEG TRAILER JACK DROP 1 EA $149.70 $149.70 $133.65 $133.65 
21 DRUM 8 LUG 42 BRAKE 6.5 BOLT 2 EA $60.50 $121.00 $64.80 $129.60 
22 PLATE BACKING LEFT 2 EA $53.22 $106.44 $48.60 $97.20 
23 PLATE BACKING RIGHT 2 EA $53.22 $106.44 $48.60 $97.20 
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

Special Instructions:  Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.
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24 BATTERY TRAILER BREAKAWAY 2 EA $13.90 $27.80 $43.20 $86.40 
25 SEAL 4 EA $21.53 $86.12 $3.15 $12.60 
26 CONTROLLER BRAKER TRAILER 1 EA $69.50 $69.50 $76.49 $76.49 

27
Flat fee for "Code Red" deliveries, to be made 
within 4 business hours EA $3.00 No Bid

$16,278.90
Section 3 - Delivery Charge for Code Red Items Only (5 points)

Approved By:  Jonathan Dalchau

* Non-responsive

Prepared By:  Julia Ramirez

TOTAL $22,668.87

TOTAL BID $30,671.87 $25,278.90
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