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BID NO. 
RX NO.   
DATE:  
BUYER:  

ITEM 
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION

EST 
QTY UNIT

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

1 FREON HVAC R134A 30 LB CYL 60 EA $107.80 $6,468.00 $113.46 $6,807.60 $74.00 $4,440.00 
2 SWITCH TRINARY NORMALLY OPEN 28 EA $39.61 $1,109.08 $21.08 $590.24 $29.40 $823.20 
3 SWITCH HVAC HI TEMP CONTROL 2 EA $18.78 $37.56 $20.46 $40.92 $32.00 $64.00 
4 ACCUMULATOR HVAC DRIER 27 EA $25.86 $698.22 $25.42 $686.34 $27.45 $741.15 
5 ACCUMULATOR HVAC 9 EA $18.18 $163.62 $24.80 $223.20 $26.90 $242.10 
6 DRIER 10 EA $26.86 $268.60 $48.98 $489.80 $41.50 $415.00 
7 DRIER HVAC 3 EA $22.14 $66.42 $39.06 $117.18 $36.40 $109.20 
8 VALVE HVAC EXPANSION 15 EA $17.11 $256.65 $27.28 $409.20 $33.88 $508.20 
9 VALVE HVAC EXPANSION 7 EA $17.53 $122.71 $26.04 $182.28 $28.44 $199.08 
10 EXPANSION VALVE 5 EA $24.06 $120.30 $26.04 $130.20 $26.60 $133.00 
11 SLEEVE HVAC #10 CRIMP 12 EA $1.30 $15.60 $1.86 $22.32 $0.99 $11.88 
12 COMPRESSOR HVAC 9 EA $226.63 $2,039.67 $239.94 $2,159.46 $256.60 $2,309.40 
13 COMPRESSOR HVAC 9 EA $210.36 $1,893.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 COMPRESSOR HVAC ASSEMBLY 4 EA $240.00 $960.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 COMPRESSOR HVAC 2 EA $243.01 $486.02 $566.68 $1,133.36 $517.65 $1,035.30 
16 COMPRESSOR HVAC SYSTEM 1 EA $210.36 $210.36 No Bid No Bid $295.00 $295.00 
17 COMPRESSOR HVAC 1 EA $220.28 $220.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
18 COMPRESSOR 1 EA $221.63 $221.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
19 HOSE A/C 3 EA $1.82 $5.47 No Bid No Bid $2.92 $8.76 
20 HOSE A/C 5/8 3 EA $2.10 $6.31 No Bid No Bid $2.92 $8.76 
21 HOSE HVAC ASSEMBLY 3 EA $80.99 $242.97 No Bid No Bid $2.87 $8.61 
22 FAN ASSEMBLY 12" 1 EA $171.03 $171.03 No Bid No Bid $96.00 $96.00 
23 HEATER CORE ASSEMBLY 1 EA $168.51 $168.51 $73.16 $73.16 No Bid No Bid
24 CORE AC EVAPORATOR 1 EA $208.83 $208.83 No Bid No Bid $243.60 $243.60 

25
Flat fee for "Code Red'' deliveries, to be made 
within 4 business hours 20 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $17.00 $340.00 

$16,161.08

Longhorn International 
Trucks

Austin, TX

$13,065.26

Section 1 - Most Frequently Ordered Items (50 points)

Austin, TX

JSD0221

Jeff Dilbert

Prepared By:  Julia Ramirez

7800 13062100443
7/23/2013

$11,692.24

Austin Rebuilders, Inc.1 -800- Radiator & A/C of 
Austin

Approved By:  Jonathan Dalchau

MBE/WBE
Austin, TX

Section 2 - Delivery Charge for Code Red Items Only (10 points)
TOTAL BID

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

Special Instructions:  Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name
City, State

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

OEM MOTOR VEHICLE AIR CONDITIONER REPAIR PARTS
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