The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
DRUG AND ALCOHOL TESTING
BID NO. TLGO0101
RX NO. 9300 14030700248

DATE: 5/13/2014
BUYER: Terra Green

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Capital Area Occupational

Medicine dba St. David's Foremost Forensics On Site
Occupational Health Drug & Alcohol Testing,
Vendor Name DSI Medical Services, Inc.  [Services LILC
City, State Horsham, PA Austin, TX Austin, TX
MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY |UNIT| PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

SECTION A - PRICE

Category 1-APD Collection/Testing (Normal Business Hours, M-F) Using Vendor Fixed Collection Site

Urine specimen collection: 5 Panel plus
1.1 Ecstasy, Laboratory Analysis & MRO Review 500 YEAR $33.50 $16,750.00 $35.00 $17,500.00 $45.00 $22,500.00

Urine specimen collection: LSD Panel (for
cause only) Laboratory Analysis & MRO
1.2 Review 2 YEAR $59.00 $118.00 $84.00 $168.00 $50.00 $100.00

Urine specimen collection: Other Opiate
(every 3rd test, random) Laboratory Analysis &

1.3 MRO Review 150 | YEAR $33.50 $5,025.00 $25.00 $3,750.00 $50.00 $7,500.00

1.4 Breath Alcohol Testing 1 YEAR $22.00 $22.00 $25.00 $25.00 $35.00 $35.00
Hair Specimen Collection, Laboratory Analysis

1.5 & MRO Review 250 | YEAR $57.00 $14,250.00 $64.00 $16,000.00 $100.00 $25,000.00

1.6 Steroid Panel: Anabolic Steroid 2 YEAR $150.00 $300.00 $180.00 $360.00 No Bid No Bid
Blood Specimen Collection, Laboratory

1.7 Analysis & MRO Review 20 YEAR No Bid No Bid $27.00 $540.00 No Bid No Bid

TOTAL BID for Category 1 $36,465.00 $38,343.00 $55,135.00

Category 2- APD Collection/Testing (After Business Hours, M-F) Using Vendor Fixed Collection Site

Urine specimen collection: 5 Panel plus
2.1 Ecstasy, Laboratory Analysis & MRO Review 05 YEAR $33.50 $2,177.50 $68.00 $4,420.00 $145.00 $9,425.00

Urine specimen collection: Other Opiate
(every 3rd test, random) Laboratory Analysis &

2.2 MRO Review 1 YEAR $33.50 $33.50 $25.00 $25.00 $150.00 $150.00
2.3 Breath Alcohol Testing 1 YEAR $22.00 $22.00 $25.00 $25.00 $135.00 $135.00
2.4 Steroid Panel: Anabolic Steroid 1 YEAR $150.00 $150.00 $180.00 $180.00 No Bid No Bid
Blood Specimen Collection, Laboratory
2.5 Analysis & MRO Review 1 YEAR No Bid No Bid $27.00 $27.00 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL BID for Category 2 $2,383.00 $4,677.00 $9,710.00
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
DRUG AND ALCOHOL TESTING

BID NO. TLGO0101

RX NO. 9300 14030700248

DATE: 5/13/2014

BUYER: Terra Green

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Capital Area Occupational

Medicine dba St. David's Foremost Forensics On Site
Occupational Health Drug & Alcohol Testing,
Vendor Name DSI Medical Services, Inc.  [Services LILC
City, State Horsham, PA Austin, TX Austin, TX
MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY |UNIT| PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

Category 3- APD Collection/Testing (Weekends and Holidays 24 hours) Using Vendor Fixed Collection Site

Urine specimen collection: 5 Panel plus
3.1 Ecstasy, Laboratory Analysis & MRO Review 20 YEAR $33.50 $670.00 $68.00 $1,360.00 $175.00 $3,500.00

Urine specimen collection: Other Opiate
(every 3rd test, random) Laboratory Analysis &

3.2 MRO Review 1 YEAR $33.50 $33.50 $25.00 $25.00 $175.00 $175.00
3.3 Breath Alcohol Testing 1 YEAR $22.00 $22.00 $25.00 $25.00 $175.00 $175.00
3.4 Steroid Panel: Anabolic Steroid 1 YEAR $150.00 $150.00 $180.00 $180.00 No Bid No Bid
Blood Specimen Collection, Laboratory
3.5 Analysis & MRO Review 1 YEAR No Bid No Bid $27.00 $27.00 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL BID for Category 3 $875.50 $1,617.00 $3,850.00

Category 4 AFD Collection/Testing (Normal Business Hours, M-F) Using Vendor Fixed Collection Site

Urine specimen collection: 5 Panel, Laboratory

4.1 Analysis & MRO Review 300 | YEAR $33.50 $10,050.00 $31.00 $9,300.00 $45.00 $13,500.00

4.2 Breath Alcohol Testing 10 YEAR $22.00 $220.00 $25.00 $250.00 $35.00 $350.00
TOTAL BID for Category 4 $10,270.00 $9,550.00 $13,850.00

Category 5 AFD Collection/Testing (After Business Hours, M-F) Using Vendor Fixed Collection Site
Urine specimen collection: 5 Panel, Laboratory

5.1 Analysis & MRO Review 15 YEAR $33.50 $502.50 $64.00 $960.00 $145.00 $2,175.00

5.2 Breath Alcohol Testing 10 YEAR $22.00 $220.00 $25.00 $250.00 $135.00 $1,350.00
TOTAL BID for Category 5 $722.50 $1,210.00 $3,525.00

Category 6 AFD Collection/Testing (Weekends and Holidays-24 hours) Using Vendor Fixed Collection Site

Urine specimen collection: 5 Panel, Laboratory
6.1 Analysis & MRO Review 10 YEAR $33.50 $335.00 $64.00 $640.00 $175.00 $1,750.00
6.2 Breath Alcohol Testing 10 YEAR $22.00 $220.00 $25.00 $250.00 $175.00 $1,750.00
TOTAL BID for Category 6 $555.00 $890.00 $3,500.00

Category 7-Austin Travis County Emergency Medical Services Collections/Testing (Normal Business Hours, M-F) Using Vendor Fixed Collection Site
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

DRUG AND ALCOHOL TESTING

BID NO. TLGO0101

RX NO. 9300 14030700248
DATE: 5/13/2014
BUYER: Terra Green

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Capital Area Occupational

Medicine dba St. David's Foremost Forensics On Site
Occupational Health Drug & Alcohol Testing,
Vendor Name DSI Medical Services, Inc.  [Services LILC
City, State Horsham, PA Austin, TX Austin, TX
MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY |UNIT| PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Urine specimen collection: 7 panel plus
Fentanyl and Oxycodone, Laboratory Analysis
7.1 & MRO Review 350 | YEAR $58.00 $20,300.00 $40.00 $14,000.00 $50.00 $17,500.00
7.2 Breath Alcohol Testing 80 YEAR $22.00 $1,760.00 $25.00 $2,000.00 $35.00 $2,800.00
7.3 Saliva Testing: 7 panel +3 350 | YEAR No Bid No Bid $47.00 $16,450.00 $45.00 $15,750.00
TOTAL BID for Category 7 $22,060.00 $32,450.00 $36,050.00

Category 8-Austin Travis County Emergency Medical Setvices Collections/Testing (After Business Hours, M-F) Using Vendor Fixed Collection Site

Urine specimen collection: 7 panel plus
Fentanyl and Oxycodone, Laboratory Analysis

8.1 & MRO Review 60 YEAR $58.00 $3,480.00 $73.00 $4,380.00 $150.00 $9,000.00

8.2 Breath Alcohol Testing 60 YEAR $22.00 $1,320.00 $25.00 $1,500.00 $135.00 $8,100.00

8.3 Saliva Testing: 7 panel +3 60 YEAR No Bid No Bid $47.00 $2,820.00 $145.00 $8,700.00
TOTAL BID for Category 8 $4,800.00 $8,700.00 $25,800.00

Category 9-Austin Travis County Emergency Medical Setvices Collections/Testing (Weekends and Holidays 24 hours) Using Vendor Fixed Collection Site

Urine specimen collection: 7 panel plus
Fentanyl and Oxycodone, Laboratory Analysis

9.1  |& MRO Review 100 | YEAR | $58.00 $5,800.00 $73.00 $7,300.00 $175.00 | $17,500.00

92 |Breath Alcohol Testing 40 | YEAR|  $22.00 $880.00 $25.00 $1,000.00 $175.00 $7,000.00

9.3 [Saliva Testing: 7 panel +3 100 | YEAR | No Bid No Bid $47.00 $4,700.00 $175.00 | $17,500.00

TOTAL BID for Category 9 $6,680.00 $13,000.00 $42,000.00
Category 10- Expert Witness per hour

101 |Expert Witness(es) | 1 |HOUR| $25000 | $250.00 $300.00 |  $300.00 $27500 | $275.00

TOTAL BID for Category 10 $250.00 $300.00 $275.00
Category 11- Speciment Testing

11.1  |Blind Specimen Testing 4 | YEAR| $2850 $114.00 $27.00 $108.00 $200.00 $800.00

112 |Split Specimen Testing 5 | YEAR| $150.00 $750.00 $200.00 $1,000.00 $150.00 $750.00
TOTAL BID for Category 11 $864.00 $1,108.00 $1,550.00

Category 12- Other Costs
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

DRUG AND ALCOHOL TESTING
BID NO. TLGO0101
RX NO. 9300 14030700248
DATE: 5/13/2014
BUYER: Terra Green

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Capital Area Occupational
Medicine dba St. David's Foremost Forensics On Site
Occupational Health Drug & Alcohol Testing,
Vendor Name DSI Medical Services, Inc.  [Services LILC
City, State Horsham, PA Austin, TX Austin, TX
MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY |UNIT| PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Itemized administrative costs (items not
included above): Bidder is to attach a separate
12.1 sheet with items included in the category $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Itemized other direct costs (items not included
in 13.1 above): Bidder is to attach a separate
12.2 sheet with items included in this category. $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL BID for Category 12 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL Evaluation Section A (Category 1-13) $85,925.00 $111,845.00 $195,245.00

Section D- Local Business Presence (10 points)

For Informational Purposes Only

1 The City May Wish to Purchase Additional Items or Services from the Successful Bidder in the Future.

On-site (at the scene of an accident) Blood
2 Testing 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid

On-site (at the scene of an accident) Breath
3 Alcohol Testing 1 $22.00 No Bid $175.00

If a City employee tests positive during initial
screening, a second test of the specimen may
be performed at employee's physician's office.
In order to ensure the integrity of the sample,
personnel from the Contractor shall
accompany the employee to the physician's

4 office 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Prepared By: Julia Ramirez
Approved By: Terra Green
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