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1

Flexible Base per Section 0500 - Delivered to 

Zone #1
9,400 TON

$17.66 $166,004.00 $14.15 $133,010.00 $19.00 $178,600.00 $17.95 $168,730.00 $19.50 $183,300.00 

2

Flexible Base per Section 0500 - Delivered to 

Zone #2
6,300 TON

$16.76 $105,588.00 $18.22 $114,786.00 $19.75 $124,425.00 $22.95 $144,585.00 $19.50 $122,850.00 

3

Flexible Base per Section 0500 - Picked up by 

City
1,200 TON

$8.50 $10,200.00 $7.43 $8,916.00 $6.75 $8,100.00 $7.95 $9,540.00 $10.50 $12,600.00 

4

Substation Surface Rock per Section 0505 - 

Delivered to Zone #1
8,500 TON

No Bid $14.97 $127,245.00 $20.00 $170,000.00 $19.50 $165,750.00 $28.50 $242,250.00 

5

Substation Surface Rock per Section 0505 - 

Delivered to Zone #2
5,800 TON

No Bid $19.04 $110,432.00 $21.00 $121,800.00 $24.50 $142,100.00 $28.50 $165,300.00 

6

Substation Surface Rock per Section 0505 - 

Picked up by City
1,000 TON

No Bid $8.25 $8,250.00 $7.50 $7,500.00 $9.50 $9,500.00 $18.50 $18,500.00 

7

3"x5" Limestone per Section 0510 - Delivered 

to Zone #1
8,850 TON

No Bid $19.59 $173,371.50 $24.05 $212,842.50 $22.95 $203,107.50 $21.50 $190,275.00 

8

3"x5" Limestone per Section 0510 - Delivered 

to Zone #2
6,150 TON

No Bid $23.66 $145,509.00 $24.90 $153,135.00 $27.95 $171,892.50 $21.50 $132,225.00 

9

3"x5" Limestone per Section 0510 - Picked up 

by City
1,000 TON

No Bid $12.87 $12,870.00 $11.70 $11,700.00 $12.95 $12,950.00 $13.50 $13,500.00 

10

Flexible Base per Section 0500 - Delivered to 

Zone #1
20,000 TON

$17.66 $353,200.00 $14.15 $283,000.00 $19.00 $380,000.00 $17.95 $359,000.00 $19.50 $390,000.00 

11

Flexible Base per Section 0500 - Delivered to 

Zone #2
13,000 TON

$16.76 $217,880.00 $18.22 $236,860.00 $19.75 $256,750.00 $22.95 $298,350.00 $19.50 $253,500.00 

12

Flexible Base per Section 0500 - Picked up by 

City
500 TON

$8.50 $4,250.00 $7.43 $3,715.00 $6.75 $3,375.00 $7.95 $3,975.00 $10.50 $5,250.00 

13

Substation Surface Rock per Section 0505 - 

Delivered to Zone #1
125 TON

No Bid $14.97 $1,871.25 $20.00 $2,500.00 $19.50 $2,437.50 $25.50 $3,187.50 

14

Substation Surface Rock per Section 0505 - 

Delivered to Zone #2
125 TON

No Bid $19.04 $2,380.00 $21.00 $2,625.00 $24.50 $3,062.50 $25.50 $3,187.50 

15

Substation Surface Rock per Section 0505 - 

Picked up by City
125 TON

No Bid $8.25 $1,031.25 $7.50 $937.50 $9.50 $1,187.50 $18.00 $2,250.00 

16

3"x5" Limestone per Section 0510 - Delivered 

to Zone #1
1,000 TON

No Bid $19.59 $19,590.00 $24.05 $24,050.00 $22.95 $22,950.00 $21.50 $21,500.00 

Austin, TX Austin, TX

$988,102.50 $1,028,155.00 

GROUP #2 - VARIOUS CITY DEPTS

SUBTOTAL (GROUP #1)

GROUP #1 - AUSTIN ENERGY

$281,792.00 $834,389.50 

MBE/WBE

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

Vendor Name

City, State

Hard Rock TransportationAustin Materials State Wide Materials Dinca Group, LLC

Austin, TX Manor, TX

BID TABULATION

CITY OF AUSTIN

CONTRACT FOR FLEXIBLE BASE, SUBSTATION SURFACE ROCK AND LIMESTONE
DNJ0126

16020300247

3/24/2016

Darralyn Johnson

Special Instructions:  Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

$1,080,800.00

Melendrez Trucking, LLC

Austin, TX
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Austin, TX Austin, TX

MBE/WBE

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

Vendor Name

City, State

Hard Rock TransportationAustin Materials State Wide Materials Dinca Group, LLC

Austin, TX Manor, TX

BID TABULATION

CITY OF AUSTIN

CONTRACT FOR FLEXIBLE BASE, SUBSTATION SURFACE ROCK AND LIMESTONE
DNJ0126

16020300247

3/24/2016

Darralyn Johnson

Special Instructions:  Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Melendrez Trucking, LLC

Austin, TX

17

3"x5" Limestone per Section 0510 - Delivered 

to Zone #2
1,000 TON

No Bid $23.66 $23,660.00 $24.90 $24,900.00 $27.95 $27,950.00 $21.50 $21,500.00 

18

3"x5" Limestone per Section 0510 - Picked up 

by City
125 TON

No Bid $12.87 $1,608.75 $11.70 $1,462.50 $12.95 $1,618.75 $13.50 $1,687.50 

19

Flexible Base per Section 0500 - Delivered to 

Zone #1 29,400 TON $17.66 $519,204.00 $14.15 $416,010.00 $19.00 $558,600.00 $17.95 $527,730.00 $19.50 $573,300.00 

20

Flexible Base per Section 0500 - Delivered to 

Zone #2 19,300 TON $16.76 $323,468.00 $18.22 $351,646.00 $19.75 $381,175.00 $22.95 $442,935.00 $19.50 $376,350.00 

21

Flexible Base per Section 0500 - Picked up by 

City 1,700 TON $8.50 $14,450.00 $7.43 $12,631.00 $6.75 $11,475.00 $7.95 $13,515.00 $10.50 $17,850.00 

22

Substation Surface Rock per Section 0505 - 

Delivered to Zone #1 8,625 TON No Bid $14.97 $129,116.25 $20.00 $172,500.00 $19.50 $168,187.50 $25.50 $219,937.50 

23

Substation Surface Rock per Section 0505 - 

Delivered to Zone #2 5,925 TON No Bid $19.04 $112,812.00 $21.00 $124,425.00 $24.50 $145,162.50 $25.50 $151,087.50 

24

Substation Surface Rock per Section 0505 - 

Picked up by City 1,125 TON No Bid $8.25 $9,281.25 $7.50 $8,437.50 $9.50 $10,687.50 $18.00 $20,250.00 

25

3"x5" Limestone per Section 0510 - Delivered 

to Zone #1 9,850 TON No Bid $19.59 $192,961.50 $24.05 $236,892.50 $22.95 $226,057.50 $21.50 $211,775.00 

26

3"x5" Limestone per Section 0510 - Delivered 

to Zone #2 7,150 TON No Bid $23.66 $169,169.00 $24.90 $178,035.00 $27.95 $199,842.50 $21.50 $153,725.00 

27

3"x5" Limestone per Section 0510 - Picked up 

by City 1,125 TON No Bid $12.87 $14,478.75 $11.70 $13,162.50 $12.95 $14,568.75 $13.50 $15,187.50 

$720,531.25 

SUBTOTAL (GROUP #3) $857,122.00 $1,408,105.75 

GROUP #3 - AUSTIN ENERGY AND VARIOUS CITY DEPTS

SUBTOTAL (GROUP #2) $575,330.00 $573,716.25 $696,600.00 

$3,497,372.50

$1,684,702.50 $1,748,686.25 

Approved By:  Darralyn N. Johnson

TOTAL BID (GROUPS 1-3) $2,816,211.50

Prepared By:  Stephanie Hollanders

$1,714,244.00 $3,369,405.00

$1,739,462.50

$3,522,325.00

$702,062.50
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