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1

Texas Red Bud                                                                                                  

Cercis canadensis var. texensis 100 Each $13.00 $1,300.00 $12.50 $1,250.00 $17.50 $1,750.00 

2

Texas Red Bud                                                                                                  

Cercis canadensis var. texensis 100 Each $49.00 $4,900.00 $45.00 $4,500.00 $44.50 $4,450.00 

3

Texas Mountain Laurel                                                                                                 

Sophora secundiflora 100 Each $13.00 $1,300.00 $13.50 $1,350.00 $24.50 $2,450.00 

4

Texas Mountain Laurel                                                                                                 

Sophora secundiflora 100 Each $53.00 $5,300.00 $55.00 $5,500.00 $54.00 $5,400.00 

5

Yaupon Holly                                                                                                 

llex vomitoria 100 Each $15.00 $1,500.00 $13.50 $1,350.00 $17.50 $1,750.00 

6

Yaupon Holly                                                                                                 

llex vomitoria 50 Each $49.00 $2,450.00 $55.00 $2,750.00 $55.00 $2,750.00 

7

Mexican Plum                                                                                                 

Prumus mexicana 100 Each $12.50 $1,250.00 $13.50 $1,350.00 $17.50 $1,750.00 

8

Mexican Plum                                                                                                 

Prumus mexicana 100 Each $53.00 $5,300.00 $50.00 $5,000.00 $55.00 $5,500.00 

9

Mexican Buckey                                                                                                 

Ungnadia speciosa 50 Each $12.50 $625.00 $12.00 $600.00 $24.50 $1,225.00 

10

Mexican Buckey                                                                                                 

Ungnadia speciosa 50 Each $49.00 $2,450.00 $45.00 $2,250.00 $55.00 $2,750.00 

11

Flame Leaf Sumac                                                                                              

Rhus lanceolata 25 Each No Bid No Bid $12.50 $312.50 $24.50 $612.50 

12

Flame Leaf Sumac                                                                                              

Rhus lanceolata 25 Each No Bid No Bid $50.00 $1,250.00 $55.00 $1,375.00 

13

Possum-Haw Holly                                                                                            

llex decidua 25 Each No Bid No Bid $13.50 $337.50 $24.50 $612.50 

14

Possum-Haw Holly                                                                                            

llex decidua 25 Each No Bid No Bid $50.00 $1,250.00 $55.00 $1,375.00 

15

Desert Willow                                                                                            

Chilopsis linearis 100 Each $12.50 $1,250.00 $12.50 $1,250.00 $24.50 $2,450.00 

16

Desert Willow                                                                                            

Chilopsis linearis 50 Each $49.00 $2,450.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $55.00 $2,750.00 

17

Eve's Necklace                                                                                            

Sophora affinis 75 Each No Bid No Bid $12.50 $937.50 $24.50 $1,837.50 

18

Eve's Necklace                                                                                            

Sophora affinis 50 Each $49.00 $2,450.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $55.00 $2,750.00 

19

Rough-Leaf Dogwood                                                                                            

Cornus drummondii 50 Each No Bid No Bid $12.00 $600.00 $24.50 $1,225.00 

20

Rough-Leaf Dogwood                                                                                            

Cornus drummondii 50 Each $49.00 $2,450.00 $45.00 $2,250.00 $55.00 $2,750.00 

21

Texas Persimmon                                                                                           

Diospyros texana 100 Each No Bid No Bid $13.50 $1,350.00 $24.50 $2,450.00 

22

Texas Persimmon                                                                                           

Diospyros texana 100 Each No Bid No Bid $55.00 $5,500.00 $55.00 $5,500.00 

23

Anacacho Orchid Tree                                                                                           

Bauhinia lunarioides 50 Each No Bid No Bid $13.50 $675.00 $24.50 $1,225.00 

24

Anacacho Orchid Tree                                                                                           

Bauhinia lunarioides 25 Each $49.00 $1,225.00 $55.00 $1,375.00 $55.00 $1,375.00 

25

Crape Myrtle                                                                                         

Lagerstroemia indica 150 Each $13.00 $1,950.00 $12.00 $1,800.00 $24.50 $3,675.00 
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26

American Smoketree                                                                                         

Cotinus obovatus 25 Each No Bid No Bid $15.00 $375.00 $25.50 $637.50 

27

American Smoketree                                                                                         

Cotinus obovatus 25 Each No Bid No Bid $60.00 $1,500.00 $58.50 $1,462.50 

28

Wax Myrtle                                                                                                    

Myrica cerifera 25 Each $13.00 $325.00 $12.00 $300.00 $32.50 $812.50 

29

Wax Myrtle                                                                                                    

Myrica cerifera 25 Each $49.00 $1,225.00 $50.00 $1,250.00 $64.00 $1,600.00 

30

Texas Kidneywood                                                                                                   

Eysenhardtia texana 25 Each $13.00 $325.00 $11.00 $275.00 $24.50 $612.50 

31

Texas Kidneywood                                                                                                   

Eysenhardtia texana 25 Each $49.00 $1,225.00 $45.00 $1,125.00 $55.00 $1,375.00 

32

Goldenball Lead Tree                                                                                                   

Leucana retusa 25 Each $13.00 $325.00 $13.50 $337.50 $32.50 $812.50 

33

Goldenball Lead Tree                                                                                                   

Leucana retusa 20 Each $54.00 $1,080.00 $55.00 $1,100.00 $64.00 $1,280.00 

34

Compact Texas Sage                                                                                                   

Leucophyllum frutescens 'Compactum' 75 Each No Bid No Bid $11.50 $862.50 $24.50 $1,837.50 

35

Compact Texas Sage                                                                                                   

Leucophyllum frutescens 'Compactum' 25 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.00 $1,375.00 

36

Common Tree Senna                                                                                                   

Senna corymbosa 25 Each No Bid No Bid $12.00 $300.00 $24.50 $612.50 

37

Common Tree Senna                                                                                                   

Senna corymbosa 20 Each $49.00 $980.00 $50.00 $1,000.00 $55.00 $1,100.00 

38

Evergreen Sumac                                                                                                   

Rhus virens 100 Each No Bid No Bid $13.50 $1,350.00 $24.50 $2,450.00 

39

Evergreen Sumac                                                                                                   

Rhus virens 50 Each No Bid No Bid $60.00 $3,000.00 $55.00 $2,750.00 

40

Arroyo Sweetwood                                                                                                  

Myrospermum sousanum 50 Each No Bid No Bid $12.50 $625.00 $24.50 $1,225.00 

41

American Beauty Berry                                                                                                

Calicarpa americana 25 Each No Bid No Bid $11.50 $287.50 $24.50 $612.50 

42

Pride of Barbados                                                                                               

Caesalpina pulcherrima 25 Each No Bid No Bid $12.50 $312.50 $24.50 $612.50 

43

Esperanza                                                                                               

Tecoma stans 'Esperanza' 25 Each No Bid No Bid $10.50 $262.50 $24.50 $612.50 

44

Texas Rd Bud                                                                                               

Cercis canadensis var. texensis 2 Each $115.00 $230.00 $125.00 $250.00 $150.00 $300.00 

45

Bur Oak                                                                                            

Quercus macrocarpa 4 Each $12.50 $50.00 $12.00 $48.00 $24.50 $98.00 

46

Bur Oak                                                                                            

Quercus macrocarpa 2 Each $49.00 $98.00 $45.00 $90.00 $64.00 $128.00 

47

Bur Oak                                                                                            

Quercus macrocarpa 1 Each $110.00 $110.00 $100.00 $100.00 $150.00 $150.00 

48

Chinquapin Oak                                                                                            

Quercus muhlenbergii 5 Each $12.50 $62.50 $12.50 $62.50 $24.50 $122.50 

49

Chinquapin Oak                                                                                            

Quercus muhlenbergii 2 Each $49.00 $98.00 $50.00 $100.00 $64.00 $128.00 

50

Chinquapin Oak                                                                                            

Quercus muhlenbergii 1 Each $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $150.00 $150.00 

51

Montezuma Cypress                                                                                        

Taxodium mucronatum 1 Each $49.00 $49.00 $45.00 $45.00 $64.00 $64.00 

52

Bigtooth Maple                                                                                        

Acer grandidentatum 2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.00 $128.00 

53

Live Oak                                                                                       

Quercus virginiana or Quercus fusiformis 5 Each $12.50 $62.50 $12.50 $62.50 $24.50 $122.50 

54

Live Oak                                                                                       

Quercus virginiana or Quercus fusiformis 2 Each $49.00 $98.00 $45.00 $90.00 $64.00 $128.00 

55

Live Oak                                                                                       

Quercus virginiana or Quercus fusiformis 1 Each $110.00 $110.00 $100.00 $100.00 $150.00 $150.00 
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56

Mexican White Oak                                                                                       

Quercus polymorpha 10 Each $12.50 $125.00 $12.50 $125.00 $24.50 $245.00 

57

Mexican White Oak                                                                                       

Quercus polymorpha 5 Each $49.00 $245.00 $50.00 $250.00 $64.00 $320.00 

58

Mexican White Oak                                                                                       

Quercus polymorpha 1 Each $115.00 $115.00 $110.00 $110.00 $150.00 $150.00 

59

Cedar Elm                                                                                    

Ulmus crassifolia 4 Each $12.50 $50.00 $12.50 $50.00 $24.50 $98.00 

60

Cedar Elm                                                                                    

Ulmus crassifolia 1 Each $49.00 $49.00 $50.00 $50.00 $64.00 $64.00 

61

Pecan                                                                                    

Carya illinioensis 2 Each $0.00 $60.00 $120.00 $64.00 $128.00 

$86,191.50

Approved By:  Darralyn N. Johnson

TOTAL BID $65,813.00

Prepared By: VERONICA HAWKINS

$45,297.00
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