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1
Texas Red Bud                                                                                                  

Cercis canadensis var. texensis 80 EACH $12.00 $960.00 $12.50 $1,000.00 $12.25 $980.00 

2
Texas Red Bud                                                                                                  

Cercis canadensis var. texensis 80 EACH $44.00 $3,520.00 $45.00 $3,600.00 $44.50 $3,560.00 

3
Texas Mountain Laurel                                                                                                 

Sophora secundiflora 100 EACH $13.00 $1,300.00 $13.50 $1,350.00 $12.75 $1,275.00 

4
Texas Mountain Laurel                                                                                                 

Sophora secundiflora 70 EACH $50.00 $3,500.00 $55.00 $3,850.00 $52.75 $3,692.50 

5
Yaupon Holly                                                                                                 

llex vomitoria 75 EACH No bid No Bid $13.50 $1,012.50 $13.25 $993.75 

6
Yaupon Holly                                                                                                 

llex vomitoria 25 EACH $45.00 $1,125.00 $55.00 $1,375.00 $48.50 $1,212.50 

7
Mexican Plum                                                                                                 

Prumus mexicana 75 EACH $13.00 $975.00 $13.50 $1,012.50 $12.25 $918.75 

8
Mexican Plum                                                                                                 

Prumus mexicana 50 EACH $50.00 $2,500.00 $55.00 $2,750.00 $49.50 $2,475.00 

9
Mexican Buckey                                                                                                 

Ungnadia speciosa 50 EACH $12.00 $600.00 $12.00 $600.00 $11.75 $587.50 

10
Mexican Buckey                                                                                                 

Ungnadia speciosa 30 EACH $50.00 $1,500.00 $45.00 $1,350.00 $44.75 $1,342.50 

11
Flame Leaf Sumac                                                                                              

Rhus lanceolata 25 EACH No bid No Bid $12.50 $312.50 $12.25 $306.25 

12
Flame Leaf Sumac                                                                                              

Rhus lanceolata 25 EACH No bid No Bid $50.00 $1,250.00 $49.50 $1,237.50 

13
Possum-Haw Holly                                                                                            

llex decidua 10 EACH No bid No Bid $13.50 $135.00 $13.25 $132.50 

14
Possum-Haw Holly                                                                                            

llex decidua 10 EACH No bid No Bid $50.00 $500.00 $49.50 $495.00 

15
Desert Willow                                                                                            

Chilopsis linearis 50 EACH $12.00 $600.00 $12.50 $625.00 $12.25 $612.50 

16
Desert Willow                                                                                            

Chilopsis linearis 15 EACH $48.00 $720.00 $50.00 $750.00 $48.75 $731.25 

17
Eve's Necklace                                                                                            

Sophora affinis 30 EACH No bid No Bid $12.50 $375.00 $12.25 $367.50 

18
Eve's Necklace                                                                                            

Sophora affinis 20 EACH $48.00 $960.00 $50.00 $1,000.00 $48.50 $970.00 

19
Rough-Leaf Dogwood                                                                                            

Cornus drummondii 20 EACH No bid No Bid $12.00 $240.00 $11.75 $235.00 
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20
Rough-Leaf Dogwood                                                                                            

Cornus drummondii 40 EACH $48.00 $1,920.00 $45.00 $1,800.00 $44.75 $1,790.00 

21
Texas Persimmon                                                                                           

Diospyros texana 20 EACH No bid No Bid $13.50 $270.00 $13.25 $265.00 

22
Texas Persimmon                                                                                           

Diospyros texana 20 EACH No bid No Bid $55.00 $1,100.00 $54.50 $1,090.00 

23
Anacacho Orchid Tree                                                                                           

Bauhinia lunarioides 25 EACH No bid No Bid $13.50 $337.50 $13.25 $331.25 

24
Anacacho Orchid Tree                                                                                           

Bauhinia lunarioides 10 EACH $48.00 $480.00 $60.00 $600.00 $48.50 $485.00 

25
Crape Myrtle                                                                                         

Lagerstroemia indica 150 EACH $12.00 $1,800.00 $12.00 $1,800.00 $11.75 $1,762.50 

26
American Smoketree                                                                                         

Cotinus obovatus 25 EACH No bid No Bid $15.00 $375.00 $14.85 $371.25 

27
American Smoketree                                                                                         

Cotinus obovatus 25 EACH No bid No Bid $60.00 $1,500.00 $59.00 $1,475.00 

28
Wax Myrtle                                                                                                    

Myrica cerifera 25 EACH No bid No Bid $12.00 $300.00 $11.75 $293.75 

29
Wax Myrtle                                                                                                    

Myrica cerifera 25 EACH $48.00 $1,200.00 $50.00 $1,250.00 $48.75 $1,218.75 

30
Texas Kidneywood                                                                                                   

Eysenhardtia texana 20 EACH $12.00 $240.00 $11.00 $220.00 $10.95 $219.00 

31
Texas Kidneywood                                                                                                   

Eysenhardtia texana 20 EACH $48.00 $960.00 $45.00 $900.00 $44.75 $895.00 

32
Goldenball Lead Tree                                                                                                   

Leucana retusa 20 EACH No bid No Bid $13.50 $270.00 $12.75 $255.00 

33
Goldenball Lead Tree                                                                                                   

Leucana retusa 20 EACH $52.00 $1,040.00 $55.00 $1,100.00 $53.50 $1,070.00 

34
Compact Texas Sage                                                                                                   

Leucophyllum frutescens 'Compactum' 30 EACH No bid No Bid $11.50 $345.00 $11.50 $345.00 

35
Compact Texas Sage                                                                                                   

Leucophyllum frutescens 'Compactum' 25 EACH No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00 $1,875.00 

36
Common Tree Senna                                                                                                   

Senna corymbosa 20 EACH No bid No Bid $12.00 $240.00 $11.75 $235.00 

37
Common Tree Senna                                                                                                   

Senna corymbosa 20 EACH $48.00 $960.00 $50.00 $1,000.00 $48.75 $975.00 

38
Evergreen Sumac                                                                                                   

Rhus virens 35 EACH No bid No Bid $13.50 $472.50 $13.25 $463.75 
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39
Evergreen Sumac                                                                                                   

Rhus virens 25 EACH No bid No Bid $60.00 $1,500.00 $75.00 $1,875.00 

40
Arroyo Sweetwood                                                                                                  

Myrospermum sousanum 25 EACH No bid No Bid $12.50 $312.50 $12.25 $306.25 

41
American Beauty Berry                                                                                                

Calicarpa americana 10 EACH No bid No Bid $11.50 $115.00 $11.25 $112.50 

42
Pride of Barbados                                                                                               

Caesalpina pulcherrima 10 EACH No bid No Bid $12.50 $125.00 $12.25 $122.50 

43
Esperanza                                                                                               

Tecoma stans 'Esperanza' 10 EACH No bid No Bid $10.50 $105.00 $10.25 $102.50 

44
Texas Rd Bud                                                                                               

Cercis canadensis var. texensis 2 EACH $120.00 $240.00 $125.00 $250.00 $113.00 $226.00 

45
Bur Oak                                                                                            

Quercus macrocarpa 4 EACH $12.00 $48.00 $12.00 $48.00 $11.75 $47.00 

46
Bur Oak                                                                                            

Quercus macrocarpa 2 EACH $48.00 $96.00 $45.00 $90.00 $44.50 $89.00 

47
Bur Oak                                                                                            

Quercus macrocarpa 1 EACH $110.00 $110.00 $100.00 $100.00 $105.00 $105.00 

48
Chinquapin Oak                                                                                            

Quercus muhlenbergii 5 EACH $12.00 $60.00 $12.50 $62.50 $12.25 $61.25 

49
Chinquapin Oak                                                                                            

Quercus muhlenbergii 2 EACH $48.00 $96.00 $50.00 $100.00 $48.50 $97.00 

50
Chinquapin Oak                                                                                            

Quercus muhlenbergii 1 EACH $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $109.00 $109.00 

51
Montezuma Cypress                                                                                        

Taxodium mucronatum 1 EACH $48.00 $48.00 $45.00 $45.00 $44.50 $44.50 

52
Bigtooth Maple                                                                                        

Acer grandidentatum 2 EACH No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $110.00 $220.00 

53
Live Oak                                                                                       

Quercus virginiana or Quercus fusiformis 5 EACH $12.00 $60.00 $12.50 $62.50 $12.25 $61.25 

54
Live Oak                                                                                       

Quercus virginiana or Quercus fusiformis 2 EACH $48.00 $96.00 $45.00 $90.00 $44.50 $89.00 

55
Live Oak                                                                                       

Quercus virginiana or Quercus fusiformis 1 EACH $110.00 $110.00 $100.00 $100.00 $99.50 $99.50 

56
Mexican White Oak                                                                                       

Quercus polymorpha 10 EACH $12.00 $120.00 $12.50 $125.00 $12.25 $122.50 

57
Mexican White Oak                                                                                       

Quercus polymorpha 5 EACH $48.00 $240.00 $50.00 $250.00 $48.75 $243.75 
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58
Mexican White Oak                                                                                       

Quercus polymorpha 1 EACH $120.00 $120.00 $110.00 $110.00 $109.50 $109.50 

59
Cedar Elm                                                                                    

Ulmus crassifolia 4 EACH $12.00 $48.00 $12.50 $50.00 $12.25 $49.00 

60
Cedar Elm                                                                                    

Ulmus crassifolia 1 EACH $48.00 $48.00 $50.00 $50.00 $48.50 $48.50 

61
Pecan                                                                                    

Carya illinioensis 2 EACH $48.00 $96.00 No Bid No Bid $59.50 $119.00 

$28,606.00 $41,999.75

Approved By:  Darralyn N. Johnson

TOTAL BID $40,768.00

Prepared By:  Stephanie Hollanders
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