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1
3/8 INCH DIAMETER FOR 3 INCH PIPE, WITH 2-1/2 INCH 
THREAD LENGTH.       AE P/N 308 1,500 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.23 $1,845.00 

2
3/8 INCH DIAMETER FOR 4 INCH PIPE, WITH 2-1/2 INCH 
THREAD LENGTH.       AE P/N 8705 1,000 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.63 $1,630.00 

3
3/8 INCH DIAMETER FOR 2 INCH PIPE, WITH 2-1/2 INCH 
THREAD LENGTH.       AE P/N 8706 150 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.93 $139.50 

4
1/2 INCH DIAMETER, FOR 5 INCH PIPE WITH 3 INCH 
THREAD LENGTH.       AE P/N 8707 200 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.76 $552.00 

5
3/8 INCH DIA FOR 4-1/2 INCH PIPE WITH 2-1/2 INCH 
THREAD LENGTH.       AE P/N 22388 200 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.95 $390.00 

6 5/8 DIAMETER BY 3 INCHES LONG       AE P/N 8416 100 EA $1.14 $114.00 $0.72 $72.00 $1.48 $148.00 $3.35 $335.00 
7 3/4 X 18 INCHES.        AE P/N 8432 150 EA $4.11 $616.50 $4.00 $600.00 $3.79 $568.50 $5.65 $847.50 
8 5/8 X 1-1/2.                 AE P/N 8417 100 EA $1.10 $110.00 $0.58 $58.00 $0.99 $99.00 $1.50 $150.00 
9 5/8 X 10.                      AE P/N 8418 1,200 EA $1.23 $1,476.00 $1.64 $1,968.00 $1.11 $1,332.00 $1.65 $1,980.00 
10 3/4 X 2.                       AE P/N 8426 50 EA $2.53 $126.50 $0.66 $33.00 $1.55 $77.50 $2.30 $115.00 
11 3/4 X 16 INCHES       AE P/N 8431 250 EA $3.43 $857.50 $3.30 $825.00 $3.15 $787.50 $4.70 $1,175.00 
12 1/2 X 6.                      AE P/N 8413 350 EA $1.08 $378.00 $0.70 $245.00 $0.94 $329.00 $1.40 $490.00 
13 5/8 DIAMETER X 18 INCHES LONG        AE P/N 8422 200 EA $2.27 $454.00 $2.36 $472.00 $2.11 $422.00 $3.15 $630.00 
14 5/8 X 20 INCHES.        AE P/N 8423 50 EA $3.25 $162.50 $2.60 $130.00 $3.00 $150.00 $4.45 $222.50 
15 3/4 X 10 INCHES        AE P/N 8428 50 EA $2.48 $124.00 $2.40 $120.00 $2.28 $114.00 $3.40 $170.00 
16 3/4 INCHES X 20 INCHES                        AE P/N8433 50 EA $4.48 $224.00 $4.40 $220.00 $4.15 $207.50 $6.15 $307.50 

17 5/8 X 24. On QPL EL112       AE P/N 8691 100 EA $3.77 $377.00 $4.80 $480.00 $3.45 $345.00 $5.15 $515.00 

GROUP 3 (ITEMS 17-20) BOLT, DOUBLE ARMING, HOT DIP GALVANIZED, FULL 
THREAD FURNISHED ASSEMBLED WITH FOR (4) SQUARE NUTS.

$4,235.00 

SUBTOTAL ITEMS 1-5 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,556.50 

Gabriel Guerrero

Graybar Electric
Austin, TX Austin, TX Plano, TX

Techline, Inc.

GROUP 1 (ITEMS 1-5) BOLT, U, GALVANIZED WITH TWO (2) GALVANIZED 
NUTS. 50 Per Box

GROUP 2 (ITEMS 6-16) BOLT, MACHINE, SQUARE HEAD, ROLLED THREADS, 
HOT DIP GALVANIZED G5, FURNISHED ASSEMBLED WITH ONE (1) SQUARE 
NUT. 50 Per Box

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

Special Instructions:  Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name
City, State

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

CONTRACT FOR HARDWARE & FASTENERS ANNUAL PRICE AGREEMENT

12/16/2015

FastServ Supply, Inc.
Priester-Mell & Nicholson, 
Inc.

15112400120
GGU0154

Pflugerville, TX

$6,422.50 

MBE/WBE

SUBTOTAL ITEMS 6-16 $4,643.00 $4,743.00 



Page 2

BID NO. 
RX NO.   
DATE:  
BUYER:  

ITEM 
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION

EST 
QTY UNIT

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

Gabriel Guerrero

Graybar Electric
Austin, TX Austin, TX Plano, TX

Techline, Inc.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

Special Instructions:  Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.
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CITY OF AUSTIN

CONTRACT FOR HARDWARE & FASTENERS ANNUAL PRICE AGREEMENT

12/16/2015

FastServ Supply, Inc.
Priester-Mell & Nicholson, 
Inc.

15112400120
GGU0154

Pflugerville, TX
MBE/WBE

18 5/8 X 20. ON QPL EL112       AE P/N 8689 100 EA $3.24 $324.00 $4.40 $440.00 $2.96 $296.00 $4.40 $440.00 
19 5/8 X 18 INCHES. ON QPL EL112       AE P/N 8688 150 EA $3.03 $454.50 $4.00 $600.00 $2.80 $420.00 $4.15 $622.50 
20 5/8 X 32. ON QPL EL112       AE P/N 8692 50 EA $6.42 $321.00 $5.90 $295.00 $5.92 $296.00 $8.80 $440.00 

21 1/2 INCH X 3 INCH       AE P/N 479 1,200 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.91 $1,092.00 
22 1/2 INCH X 1-1/2 INCH.       AE P/N 599 500 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.55 $275.00 
23 1/ 2 INCH X 2 INCH.       AE P/N 600 11,000 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.65 $7,150.00 
24 1/2 INCH X 2-1/2 INCH.       AE P/N 601 6,000 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.70 $4,200.00 
25 1/2 INCH X 3-1/2 INCH, 13.       AE P/N 602 350 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.98 $343.00 

26 3/8 INCH X 1-1/2 INCH.       AE P/N 8356 1,200 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.95 $1,140.00 
27 3/8 INCH X 2 INCH.       AE P/N 8357 1,200 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.30 $1,560.00 
28 3/8 INCH X 2-1/2 INCH.       AE P/N 8358 100 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.50 $150.00 
29 1/2 INCH X 1 INCH.       AE P/N 8359 300 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.65 $495.00 
30 1/2 INCH X 1-1/2 INCH.       AE P/N 8360 400 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.80 $720.00 
31 1/2 INCH X 2 INCH.       AE P/N 8361 3,000 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.10 $6,300.00 
32 1/2 INCH X 2-1/2 INCH.       AE P/N 8362 2,100 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.20 $4,620.00 
33 1/2 INCH X 3 INCH.       AE P/N 8363 300 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.55 $765.00 
34 1/2 INCH X 4 INCH.       AE P/N 8364 200 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.85 $770.00 
35 1/2 INCH X 5 INCH.       AE P/N 8365 600 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.95 $2,970.00 
36 1/2 INCH X 6 INCH.       AE P/N 8366 1,500 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.30 $7,950.00 

37 BOLT HEX HEAD ZINC G5CT 3/8 X 1   AE P/N 8385 500 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.06 $30.00 

$13,060.00 

SUBTOTAL ITEMS 26-36
GROUP 6 (ITEMS 37-45) 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $27,440.00 

GROUP 4 (ITEMS 21-25) BOLT, HEX HEAD STAINLESS STEEL 18-8, 13 UNC., BOLT 
SHALL HAVE ANTI SEIZE COMPOUND APPLIED TO THREADS. 
MANUFACTURED MARKED HEAD WITH CERTIFIED TEST REPORTS WITH 
EACH SHIPMENT. 50 Per Box.

SUBTOTAL ITEMS 21-25
GROUP 5 (ITEMS 26-36) BOLT, HEX HEAD, SILICON BRONZE, ALLOY 651 
AMERICAN NATIONAL COARSE SERIES THREADS. CERTIFIED TEST REPORTS 
SHALL ACCOMPANY ALL DELIVERIES. ON QPL EL-431

No Bid No Bid No Bid

SUBTOTAL ITEMS 17-20 $1,476.50 $1,815.00 $1,357.00 $2,017.50 
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

Special Instructions:  Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.
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Inc.

15112400120
GGU0154

Pflugerville, TX
MBE/WBE

38 BOLT HEX HEAD ZINC G5CT 3/8 X 1-1/2   AE P/N 8386 350 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.08 $28.00 
39 BOLT HEX HEAD ZINC G5CT 1/2 X 1   AE P/N 8394 4,500 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.14 $630.00 
40 BOLT HEX HEAD ZINC G5CT 1/2 X 1-1/2   AE P/N 8395 2,000 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.19 $380.00 
41 BOLT HEX HEAD ZINC G5CT 1/2 X 2   AE P/N 8396 2,500 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.22 $550.00 
42 BOLT HEX HEAD ZINC G5CT 1/2 X 2-1/2   AE P/N 8397 3,500 BOX No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.26 $910.00 
43 BOLT HEX HEAD ZINC G5CT 1/2 X 3   AE P/N 8398 600 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.30 $180.00 
44 BOLT HEX HEAD ZINC G5CT 1/2 X 5   AE P/N 8399 125 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.40 $50.00 
45 BOLT HEX HEAD ZINC G5CT 5/8 X 2-1/2   AE P/N 8404 100 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.40 $40.00 

46
BOLT, HEX HEAD, A325 STRUCTURAL STEEL, 5/8" X 2".       
AE P/N 334  350 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.42 $147.00 

47
BOLT, HEX HEAD, A325 STRUCTURAL STEEL, 1 INCH X 2 
INCH, ALL THREAD       AE P/N 707 1,100 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.35 $3,685.00 

48

EYEBOLT, FORGED, ROLLED THREADS, HOT DIP 
GALVANIZED, 3/4" DIAMETER X 12, FURNISHED WITH 
ON SQUARE NUT ASSEMBLED. MINIMUM TENSILE 
STRENGTH SHALL BE 18350 LBS OR GREATER        AE 
P/N 8442 150 EA No Bid $5.64 $846.00 $7.70 $1,155.00 $11.40 $1,710.00 

49 BOLT CARRIAGE ZINC G2CT 3/8 X 3    AE P/N 8337 450 EA No Bid $0.30 $135.00 No Bid $0.14 $63.00 

50
BOLTS, CARRIAGE, GALVANIZED, 3/8" X 4", WITH A 
MINIMUM THREAD LENGTH OF 1 3/4".   AE P/N 8437 1,100 EA No Bid $0.32 $352.00 $0.65 $715.00 $0.22 $242.00 

51
BOLT, HEX HEAD, A394 SERIES TYPE 0, 5/8 INCH X 1-1/4 
INCH LENGTH.       AE P/N 815 1,200 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.85 $1,020.00 

52
BOLT MACH HEX HEAD HOT DIP GALV G5 1/2 X 1-1/2       
AE P/N 8369 100 EA No Bid $0.36 $36.00 No Bid $0.38 $38.00 

53

BOLTS, MACHINE, 1/2 X 4, HEX HEAD, ROLLED 
THREADS, HOT DIP GALVANIZED, FURNISHED WITH 
ONE SQUARE NUT ASSEMBLED.        AE P/N 8412 150 EA No Bid $0.52 $78.00 No Bid $0.70 $105.00 

54

BOLT, ALUMINUM, 1/2" X 2", 25 PER BOX. BOX TO 
INCLUDE: 50 FLAT WASHERS , 25 LOCK WASHERS AND 
25 NUTS.       AE P/N 8348 150 BOX No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.00 $6,750.00 

SUBTOTAL ITEMS 37-45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,798.00 
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Special Instructions:  Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name
City, State

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

CONTRACT FOR HARDWARE & FASTENERS ANNUAL PRICE AGREEMENT

12/16/2015

FastServ Supply, Inc.
Priester-Mell & Nicholson, 
Inc.

15112400120
GGU0154

Pflugerville, TX
MBE/WBE

55

BOLT, POWER SCREW, SELF TAPPING, MECH GLAV 
COATING, HARDENED, ½ X 4 INCHES LONG, HEX 
HEAD, ANCHOR LENGTH STAMPED ON HEAD, GALV 
HEAT TREATED CARBON STEEL.       AE P/N 22839 125 BOX No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.00 $5,875.00 

56
NUT, HEX HEAD, 18-8 STAINLESS STEEL, 13 UNC., 1/2 
INCH.       AE P/N 480 8,000 EA No Bid No Bid $0.79 $6,320.00 $0.19 $1,520.00 

57
NUT, HEX HEAD, A325 STRUCTURAL STEEL, 5/8 INCH.       
AE P/N 709 1,800 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.20 $360.00 

58 NUT HEX ZINC CT 1/4;        AE P/N 8454 1,000 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.02 $20.00 

59
NUTS, MACHINE SCREW PLATED HEX ZINC CT 3/8.        
AE P/N 8456 1,000 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.03 $30.00 

60 NUT HEX ZINC CT 1/2       AE P/N 8457 10,000 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.08 $800.00 
61 NUT SQ HOT DIP GALV G5CT 5/8       AE P/N 8459 1,500 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.22 $330.00 

62
NUT SQUARE HOT DIPPED GALVANIZED GRADE 5 
COARSE THREAD 3/4 IN.       AE P/N 8460 500 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.31 $155.00 

63

NUT, HEX, 3/8 INCH, SILICON BRONZE, ALLOY 651, 
AMERICAN NATIONAL COARSE SERIES THREADS.       
AE P/N 8509 1,500 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.30 $450.00 

64

NUTS, HEX, 1/2 INCH, SILICON BRONZE, ALLOY 651, 
AMERICAN NATIONAL COARSE SERIES THREADS.       
AE P/N 8510 10,200 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.69 $7,038.00 

65

WASHER, FLAT, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR 1/2 INCH BOLT, 
.5625 INCH I.D. X 1.515 INCH O.D. X .131 INCH       AE P/N 
481 4,200 EA No Bid No Bid $3.46 $14,532.00 $3.40 $14,280.00 

66

WASHER, 1/2 INCH, FLAT, 18-8 ALLOY STAINLESS STEEL. 
1.14" O.D. X .515" I.D. X .125" THICK, EXACT SIZE, NO 
VARIANCE.       AE P/N 519 25,000 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.27 $6,750.00 

67

WASHER, COIL SPRING, FOR 1/2" BOLT, 
MECHANICALLY PLATED WITH ZINC AND TIN, 
TRAVEL DISTANCE IS .13" TO .145", MAXIMUM 
DEFLECTION AT 750 POUNDS IS .093".    AE P/N 1234 100 EA No Bid No Bid $0.50 $50.00 $0.39 $39.00 
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68
WASHER, SPLIT LOCK, ZINC COATED, FOR 1/2" BOLT       
AE P/N 1237 1,000 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.04 $40.00 

69
WASHER FLAT SHAKE PROOF ZINC EXTERNAL TOOTH 
5/8       AE P/N 8472 1,000 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.10 $100.00 

70 WASHER FLAT USS ZINC 1/4       AE P/N 8473 500 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.02 $10.00 
71 WASHER FLAT USS ZINC 3/8       AE P/N 8475 1,800 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.03 $54.00 
72 WASHER, FLAT, USS, ZINC, 1/2 INCH.   AE P/N 8476 5,000 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.06 $300.00 

73
WASHER, SPLIT LOCK, GALVANIZED, 5/8 INCH.        AE 
P/N 8481 1,500 EA No Bid $0.10 $150.00 $0.11 $165.00 $0.08 $120.00 

74 WASHER SPLIT LOCK ZINC 1/4       AE P/N 8488 500 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.01 $5.00 
75 WASHER SPLIT LOCK ZINC 5/16       AE P/N 8490 200 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.02 $4.00 
76 WASHER SPLIT LOCK ZINC 3/8       AE P/N 8492 4,000 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.02 $80.00 
77 WASHERS, ROUND, HOT DIP GALV, 3/8.  AE P/N 8493 4,600 EA No Bid $0.06 $276.00 $0.08 $368.00 $0.03 $138.00 

78

WASHER, FLAT, FOR 1" BOLT, 1-1/16" ID X 2.5" OD X 
3/16" THICK, HOT DIP GALVANIZED, FOR USE ON SLPA 
FOUNDATIONS.       AE P/N 8496 3,500 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.31 $1,085.00 

79
WASHER, SPLIT LOCK, 3/8 INCH, BRASS OR SILICON 
BRONZE ALLOY 651.       AE P/N 8515 2,300 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.16 $368.00 

80
WASHERS, SPLIT LOCK, 1/2 INCH, BRASS OR SILICON 
ALLOY 651.       AE P/N 8516 8,000 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.30 $2,400.00 

81
WASHERS, FLAT, 3/8", 1/16" MIN. THICNESS, BRASS OR 
SILICON BRONZE ALLOY 651.       AE P/N 8520 2,600 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.25 $650.00 

82

WASHER, FLAT, FOR BOLT SIZE 1/2 INCH, 3/32 INCH 
THICK, OD IS 1-1/16 INCH, MADE FROM BRONZE 
ALLOY 651.       AE P/N 8521 15,000 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.69 $10,350.00 

Prepared By:  Stephanie Hollanders
Approved By:  Gabriel Guerrero
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