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RQM 16010700191

3/22/2016

Gabriel Guerrero

ITEM
EST 

QTY
UNIT UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE

1 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $165.00 $1,650.00

2 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $205.00 $2,050.00

3 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $385.00 $3,850.00

4 30 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $589.00 $17,670.00

5 150 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.35 $352.50

6 100 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.35 $235.00

7 60 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.25 $135.00

8 130 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.80 $234.00

9 270 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.80 $486.00

10 80 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.80 $144.00

11 50 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.30 $165.00

12 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.40 $74.00

13 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.30 $163.00

14 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $835.00 $8,350.00 $617.00 $6,170.00 No Bid

15 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $205.00 $2,050.00 $152.00 $1,520.00 No Bid

16 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $205.00 $2,050.00 $152.00 $1,520.00 No Bid

17 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $205.00 $2,050.00 $152.00 $1,520.00 No Bid

18 50 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $205.00 $10,250.00 $152.00 $7,600.00 No Bid

19 11 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $245.00 $2,695.00 $183.00 $2,013.00 No Bid

20 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $245.00 $2,450.00 $183.00 $1,830.00 No Bid

21 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $245.00 $2,450.00 $183.00 $1,830.00 No Bid

22 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $245.00 $2,450.00 $183.00 $1,830.00 No Bid

23 20 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.80 $96.00

FUSE, REFILL UNIT 100 AMP, SLOW 

SPEED AE #16811

FUSE, REFILL UNIT 125 AMP, SLOW 

SPEED AE #16813

FUSE, REFILL UNIT, 150 AMP, 

SLOW SPEED AE #16810

FUSE, REFULL UNIT 200 AMP, 

SLOW SPEED AE #16814

FUSE, TIME DELAY, CURRENT 

LIMITING, 10,000 AMPS AE #5881

Techline, Inc.

Austin, TX

FUSE, CURRENT LIMITING CLASS L 

600 V 2000 AMP, 200,000 RMS AE #5771

FUSE, CURRENT LIMITING, CLASS L, 

600 V, 2500 AMP, 200,000RMS AE #5772

FUSE, CURRENT LIMITING, CLASS L, 

600 V, 4000 AMP, 200,000RMS AE #5774

FUSE, CARTRIDGE TY DE TIME-DELAY 

3 AMP, CLASS RK5, 250 VOLT AE #5732

J.L. Matthews Co. Inc.

Austin, TX

Priester-Mell & Nicholson

Austin, TX

BID TABULATION

CITY OF AUSTIN

Electrical Supplies Price Agreement

Bid No.

RX No.

Date

Buyer

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Ft. Worth, TX

Tape Solutions, Inc.

Austin, TX

Power Supply

Austin, TX

Ace 1 Power Equipment

FUSE, CARTRIDGE TY DE TIME-DELAY 

20 AMP, CLASS RK5, 250 V AE #5730

FUSE, CARTRIDGE TY DE TIME-DELAY 

30 AMP, CLASS RK5, 250 V AE #5731

FUSE, CARTRIDGE TY DE TIME-DELAY 

60 AMP, CLASS RK5, 250 V AE #5736

FUSE, CARTRIDGE TY DE TIME-DELAY 

100 AMP, CLASS RK5, 250 V  AE #5737

FUSE REFILL UNIT FOR SWITCHGEAR 

80E AMP SML-4Z HOLDER AE #18016

FUSE, CURRENT LIMITING, CLASS L, 

600 V, 1000 AMP, 200,000 RMS AE #586

FUSE,CARTRIDGE TY DE TIME-DELAY 

6 AMP, CLASS RK5, 250 VOLT AE #5733

FUSE, CARTRIDGE TY DE TIME-DELAY 

10 AMP, CLASS RK5, 250 V AE #5734

FUSE, CARTRIDGE TY DE TIME-DELAY 

15 AMP, CLASS RK5, 250 V AE #5729

FUSE, CARTRIDGE TY DE TIME-DELAY 

200 AMP, CLASS RK5, 250 V AE #5738

HOLDER, FUSE, SML-4Z TYPE, 

DISCONNECT, 45 DEGREE  AE #5814

FUSE, REFILL UNIT 200 AMP, SLOW 

SPEED AE #16812

FUSE REFILL UNIT FOR SWITCHGEAR 

50E AMP SML-4Z HOLDER  AE #18015

FUSE REFILL UNIT FOR SWITCHGEAR 

175E AMP SML-4Z HOLDER AE #16816
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24 40 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.05 $362.00

25 250 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.65 $162.50

26 40 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.65 $26.00

27 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

28 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

29 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.88 $358.80 $35.50 $355.00

30 4,280 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.00 $17,120.00

31 40 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.89 $1,635.60 $35.50 $1,420.00

32 150 RL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

33 30 RL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.95 $508.50

34 1,650 RL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

35 20 RL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.75 $595.00

36 270 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

37 70 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $93.00 $6,510.00 $86.00 $6,020.00 $125.00 $8,750.00

38 80 RL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

39 360 RL $1.48 $532.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.97 $1,069.20

40 310 RL $1.48 $458.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.97 $920.70

41 380 RL $1.48 $562.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.97 $1,128.60

42 180 RL $1.48 $266.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.97 $534.60

43 300 RL $0.95 $285.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.97 $891.00

44 590 RL $1.48 $873.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.97 $1,752.30

45 800 RL $1.48 $1,184.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.97 $2,376.00

46 480 RL $1.48 $710.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.97 $1,425.60

47 270 RL $9.00 $2,430.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.50 $3,915.00

48 70 EA No Bid No Bid $49.30 $3,451.00 $57.50 $4,025.00 No Bid $54.38 $3,806.60

49 90 EA No Bid No Bid $58.00 $5,220.00 $74.00 $6,660.00 No Bid $70.02 $6,301.80

50 110 EA No Bid No Bid $47.35 $5,208.50 $35.00 $3,850.00 No Bid $31.34 $3,447.40

51 150 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $140.63 $21,094.50

52 490 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.00 $11,760.00

TAPE, RUBBER MASTIC, 2 INCH 

WIDE AE #496

TAPE, HIGH VOLTAGE, LINERLESS, 

RUBBER, 1 IN X 30 FT AE #593

FUSE UNIT, 8.3 KV ALL SIZES AE 

#5812

FUSE UNIT, 8.3 KV 4 AMP AE #5813

FUSE LIMITER, REPLACEABLE, 

NETWORK, 200 AMP AE #5781

FUSE, MIDGET 600V AC 5 AMP, 

FAST ACTING AE #22043

FUSE LIMITER, REPLACEABLE, 

NETWORK, 100 AMP AE #5779

TAPE, ELECTRICAL,  SELF-FUSING, 

SILICONE RUBBER AE #493

TAPE, VARNISH CAMBRIDGE, 1" 

WIDE X 36 YDS AE #15175

TAPE SEALANT TEFLON 1/2 IN X 36 

YDS AE #15262

FUSE, LINK NEMA STAND. TYPE 

200 (N) (FIT ALL) 5 AMP AE #5679

FUSE, PLUG, SIZE 15 A., 125 V. W/ 

THREAD METAL TOP CAP AE #5709

FUSE, PLUG, 125 V, SIZE 30 A,  W/ 

THREAD METAL TOP CAP AE #5710

MULETAPE, POLYESTER, FLAT, 

WOVEN, AE #19559

TAPE, ELECTRICAL, 3/4 INCH X 36 

YARDS, 8.5 MIL AE #491

TAPE, COLOR CODED, YELLOW AE 

#15229

TAPE, COLOR CODED, ORANGE AE 

#15230

TAPE, COLOR CODED, BROWN AE 

#15231

TAPE, COLOR CODED, GREEN AE 

#15232

TAPE, COLOR CODED, VIOLET AE 

#15233

TAPE, COLOR CODED, RED AE 

#15226

TAPE, COLOR CODED, WHITE AE 

#15227

TAPE, COLOR CODED, BLUE AE 

#15228

TAPE, DUCT, 2 INCHES X 60 YARDS 

AE #15163

 BAG, TOOL, 22 INCH X 13 INCH X 8 

INCH AE #549

BAG, TOOL, CANVAS, PLASTIC 

REINFORCED, OVAL AE #1355

BAG, CANVAS ONLY WITH PLASTIC 

BOTTOM AE #6957

BAG, FOR PAD MOUNT XFRMR OIL 

CONTAINMENT AE #1374

KNIFE, CABLE SKINNING. AE #9547
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53 20 PR No Bid No Bid $510.00 $10,200.00 No Bid No Bid $522.83 $10,456.60

54 50 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.65 $2,532.50

55 1,800 FT No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.25 $13,050.00 No Bid $4.42 $7,956.00

56 20 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

57 290 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

58 480 RL $1.17 $561.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.75 $840.00

59 40 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $41.00 $1,640.00 $49.48 $1,979.20 $33.45 $1,338.00

60 670 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.50 $3,685.00 $6.08 $4,073.60 $4.75 $3,182.50

61 5,855 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.28 $1,639.40 $0.42 $2,459.10 $0.29 $1,697.95

62 320 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.25 $2,640.00 $12.50 $4,000.00 $9.50 $3,040.00

63 20 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $449.99 $8,999.80

64 15 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $329.50 $4,942.50

65 5 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $408.50 $2,042.50

66 50 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $245.75 $12,287.50

67 30 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $134.50 $4,035.00

68 20 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $329.50 $6,590.00

69 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $408.50 $4,085.00

70 30 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $245.75 $7,372.50

71 1,300 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.00 $9,100.00 $5.65 $7,345.00 $5.99 $7,787.00

72 1,060 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.50 $9,010.00 No Bid $7.50 $7,950.00

73 40 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $300.00 $12,000.00 No Bid No Bid

74 30 EA No Bid $30.99 $929.70 $29.50 $885.00 $19.00 $570.00 No Bid $20.15 $604.50

75 360 EA No Bid $47.18 $16,984.80 $45.90 $16,524.00 $35.75 $12,870.00 No Bid $35.92 $12,931.20

76 270 EA No Bid $58.86 $15,892.20 $56.25 $15,187.50 $44.00 $11,880.00 No Bid $52.27 $14,112.90

77 100 EA No Bid $69.54 $6,954.00 $66.50 $6,650.00 $52.50 $5,250.00 No Bid $66.55 $6,655.00

78 400 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 $4,500.00 $13.13 $5,252.00 $12.75 $5,100.00

79 550 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.58 $869.00

80 50 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $237.26 $11,863.00 $227.75 $11,387.50

81 2,110 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CLIMBERS(MFG PART NUMBER IS 

TB94089A) AE #19363

FLANGE WRAP OIL-SELECTIVE 

(FWO-2448) AE #19378

WRAP, POLE, BANDAGES AE 

#16080

PUMP, SUBMERSIBLE, 1HP 

MINIMUM AE #473

DRUM, BARREL, 55 GALLON, OPEN 

TOP AE #2528

FLAGGING, PLASTIC, PINK, 1-1/4 

INCH AE #8297

DEADEND, FORMED WIRE, 4/0 (7 

STRAND) AE #6689

DEADEND, FORMED WIRE, 4/0 

ACSR AND AAC AE #6681

TAP, COMPRESSION, TYPE C, 

COPPER CRIMPIT AE #7244

LUG, COMPRESSION, NEMA TWO-

HOLE, 750 MCM AE #1367

RELAY, TWO-POLE, 30 AMPS, 

120/240 VOLTS. AE #47

SPLICE, KIT, HEAT SHRINK, 15KV, 

1/C 2/0 LEAD TO 1/C AE #7278

SPLICE KIT, HEAT-SHRINKABLE 

FOR 15KV, EPR INSUL AE #7282

ELBOW KIT, REPLACEMENT, 200 

AMP LOADBREAK AE #1902

ELBOW, REPAIR, 200 AMP, 

LOADBREAK, AE #1901

SPLICE, KIT, HEAT SHRINK, 15KV, 

1/C 2/0 LEAD TO 1/C AE #7278

SPLICE KIT, HEAT-SHRINKABLE 

FOR 15KV AE #7282

ELBOW KIT, REPLACEMENT, 200 

AMP LOADBREAK AE #1902

CONNECTOR, 4/0 TO 4/0 COPPER 

AE #7309

CONNECTOR, GROUND, BRONZE, 

2/0 TO 250 MCM AE #7423

SWITCH, DISCONNECT, 15KV, 900 

AMPS AE #1298

GRIP, CABLE, FOR CONDUIT 

RISER, 2" CONDUIT AE #6672

GRIP, CABLE, FOR CONDUIT 

RISER, 3" CONDUIT AE #6673

GRIP, CABLE, FOR CONDUIT 

RISER, 4" CONDUIT AE #6674

GRIP, CABLE, FOR CONDUIT 

RISER, 5" CONDUIT AE #6676

CLAMP, HOT LINE TAP, BODY 6061-

T6 EXTRUDED ALUM AE #19312

BAND, PUNCH-LOCK FOR CABLE 

GRIP AE #6677

Aluminum alloy terminal, welded, 

expansion AE #6534

CONNECTOR, LIQUID-TIGHT, 2 

INCH AE #344
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82 130 EA No Bid No Bid $11.65 $1,514.50 No Bid No Bid $11.15 $1,449.50

83 20 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $495.00 $9,900.00 $370.00 $7,400.00

84 40 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $438.00 $17,520.00 $336.50 $13,460.00

85 140 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.00 $3,920.00

86 80 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $195.00 $15,600.00

87 220 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.75 $2,145.00 No Bid $8.20 $1,804.00

88 600 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $237.26 $142,356.00 No Bid

89 40 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $169.00 $6,760.00 No Bid No Bid

90 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.37 $183.70 $20.65 $206.50

91 20 CART No Bid No Bid No Bid $350.00 $7,000.00 $391.00 $7,820.00 $305.00 $6,100.00

92 50 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.40 $820.00

93 520 EA No Bid $10.54 $5,480.80 No Bid No Bid $19.09 $9,926.80 $15.95 $8,294.00

94 300 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.75 $9,225.00 $42.85 $12,855.00

95 550 FT No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.00 $3,300.00 $6.57 $3,613.50 $5.85 $3,217.50

$7,864.60 $46,241.50 $64,840.50 $162,879.40 $271,364.30 $340,948.75

INSULATION, 1/4 INCH ROUND 

SPLIT TUBE, GRAY  AE #16785

Aluminum alloy terminal, welded, 

expansion, for connecting 4" sched 40 

IPS to a 4" NEMA 4 pad AE #6534

BRACKET, FOR MOUNTING 

DISCONNECTS ON 3 PHASE RISER 

POLES. AE #6567

INSULATOR, HIGH DENSITY 

POLYETHYLENE, PIN TYPE, 35KV 

AE #1929

SLEEVE, METER, SOCKET, 

DISCONNECT AE #6223

CONNECTOR 4 CONDUCTOR, 750 

KCMIL TO #2 AE #19256

DISPENSER, GUY-WIRE SAFETY-

PREFORMED Cobrahead AE #40

GRIPS, CABLE, HOOK ENDS, FOR 

350 AND 750 MCM AE #10446

TOTAL

DEADEND, CROSSARM, HEAVY 

DUTY GRAY FIBERGLASS, 4" X 7.5" 

X 144" AE #18071

CROSSARM, TANGENT, HEAVY 

DUTY GRAY FIBERGLASS, 4" X 7.5" 

X 144" AE #18072

INSULATOR, LINE POST, 46KV, F-

NECK, ANSI CLASS 57-3 AE #18073

CHANNEL, STEEL, 1-5/8" X 3-1/4", 12 

GAUGE AE #6864

CLAMPS, BLANKET, 8 1/2" LNG AE 

#9186

DEAD END, AUTOMATIC, WITH 

GALV CLEVIS STRAP AE #6819
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RQM 16010700191

3/22/2016

Gabriel Guerrero

ITEM
EST 

QTY
UNIT UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE

1 10 EA No Bid No Bid $274.45 $2,744.50 $152.75 $1,527.50 $167.37 $1,673.70 $159.31 $1,593.10

2 10 EA No Bid No Bid $471.10 $4,711.00 $190.98 $1,909.80 $209.47 $2,094.70 $199.19 $1,991.90

3 10 EA No Bid No Bid $624.00 $6,240.00 $358.02 $3,580.20 $392.37 $3,923.70 $373.42 $3,734.20

4 30 EA No Bid No Bid $966.60 $28,998.00 $546.06 $16,381.80 $581.75 $17,452.50 $569.55 $17,086.50

5 150 EA No Bid No Bid $3.55 $532.50 $2.21 $331.50 $2.47 $370.50 $2.28 $342.00

6 100 EA No Bid No Bid $3.55 $355.00 $2.21 $221.00 $2.47 $247.00 $2.28 $228.00

7 60 EA No Bid No Bid $3.40 $204.00 $2.11 $126.60 $2.27 $136.20 $2.17 $130.20

8 130 EA No Bid No Bid $2.70 $351.00 $1.70 $221.00 $1.84 $239.20 $1.75 $227.50

9 270 EA No Bid No Bid $2.70 $729.00 $1.70 $459.00 $1.84 $496.80 $1.75 $472.50

10 80 EA No Bid No Bid $2.70 $216.00 $1.70 $136.00 $1.84 $147.20 $1.75 $140.00

11 50 EA No Bid No Bid $4.95 $247.50 $3.10 $155.00 $3.35 $167.50 $3.19 $159.50

12 10 EA No Bid No Bid $11.10 $111.00 $6.95 $69.50 $7.52 $75.20 $7.17 $71.70

13 10 EA No Bid No Bid $24.45 $244.50 $15.29 $152.90 $16.55 $165.50 $15.77 $157.70

14 10 EA No Bid No Bid $964.45 $9,644.50 $604.02 $6,040.20 $711.48 $7,114.80 $693.55 $6,935.50

15 10 EA No Bid No Bid $272.75 $2,727.50 $148.45 $1,484.50 $176.80 $1,768.00 $158.48 $1,584.80

16 10 EA No Bid No Bid $210.25 $2,102.50 $148.45 $1,484.50 $176.80 $1,768.00 $158.48 $1,584.80

17 10 EA No Bid No Bid $210.25 $2,102.50 $148.45 $1,484.50 $176.80 $1,768.00 $158.48 $1,584.80

18 50 EA No Bid No Bid $244.45 $12,222.50 $148.45 $7,422.50 $176.80 $8,840.00 $158.48 $7,924.00

19 11 EA No Bid No Bid $329.55 $3,625.05 $179.07 $1,969.77 $213.25 $2,345.75 $158.48 $1,743.28

20 10 EA No Bid No Bid $329.55 $3,295.50 $179.07 $1,790.70 $213.25 $2,132.50 $158.48 $1,584.80

21 10 EA No Bid No Bid $329.55 $3,295.50 $179.07 $1,790.70 $213.25 $2,132.50 $158.48 $1,584.80

22 10 EA No Bid No Bid $329.55 $3,295.50 $179.07 $1,790.70 $213.25 $2,132.50 $158.48 $1,584.80

23 20 EA No Bid No Bid $6.55 $131.00 $4.50 $90.00 $4.84 $96.80 $4.65 $93.00

FUSE, CURRENT LIMITING CLASS L 

600 V 2000 AMP, 200,000 RMS AE #5771

Georgetown, TX Carson, CA Clifton Heights, USA Austin, TX

ITEM DESCRIPTION

FUSE, CURRENT LIMITING, CLASS L, 

600 V, 1000 AMP, 200,000 RMS AE #586

Buda, TX St. Louis, MO

BID TABULATION

CITY OF AUSTIN

Electrical Supplies Price Agreement

Bid No. Texas Electric 

Cooperative
DMC Power, Inc. CAPP USA KBS Stuart C. Irby

Graybar Electric 

Company, Inc.

Buyer

FUSE, TIME DELAY, CURRENT 

LIMITING, 10,000 AMPS AE #5881

FUSE, CURRENT LIMITING, CLASS L, 

600 V, 2500 AMP, 200,000RMS AE #5772

FUSE, CURRENT LIMITING, CLASS L, 

600 V, 4000 AMP, 200,000RMS AE #5774

FUSE, CARTRIDGE TY DE TIME-DELAY 

3 AMP, CLASS RK5, 250 VOLT AE #5732

FUSE,CARTRIDGE TY DE TIME-DELAY 

6 AMP, CLASS RK5, 250 VOLT AE #5733

RX No.

Date

FUSE, CARTRIDGE TY DE TIME-DELAY 

30 AMP, CLASS RK5, 250 V AE #5731

FUSE, CARTRIDGE TY DE TIME-DELAY 

60 AMP, CLASS RK5, 250 V AE #5736

FUSE, CARTRIDGE TY DE TIME-DELAY 

100 AMP, CLASS RK5, 250 V  AE #5737

FUSE, CARTRIDGE TY DE TIME-DELAY 

200 AMP, CLASS RK5, 250 V AE #5738

FUSE, CARTRIDGE TY DE TIME-DELAY 

20 AMP, CLASS RK5, 250 V AE #5730

HOLDER, FUSE, SML-4Z TYPE, 

DISCONNECT, 45 DEGREE  AE #5814

FUSE, REFILL UNIT 200 AMP, SLOW 

SPEED AE #16812

FUSE REFILL UNIT FOR SWITCHGEAR 

50E AMP SML-4Z HOLDER  AE #18015

FUSE REFILL UNIT FOR SWITCHGEAR 

80E AMP SML-4Z HOLDER AE #18016

FUSE, CARTRIDGE TY DE TIME-DELAY 

10 AMP, CLASS RK5, 250 V AE #5734

FUSE, CARTRIDGE TY DE TIME-DELAY 

15 AMP, CLASS RK5, 250 V AE #5729

FUSE REFILL UNIT FOR SWITCHGEAR 

175E AMP SML-4Z HOLDER AE #16816

FUSE, REFILL UNIT 100 AMP, SLOW 

SPEED AE #16811

FUSE, REFULL UNIT 200 AMP, 

SLOW SPEED AE #16814

FUSE, REFILL UNIT 125 AMP, SLOW 

SPEED AE #16813

FUSE, REFILL UNIT, 150 AMP, 

SLOW SPEED AE #16810
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24 40 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.12 $124.80 $4.75 $190.00 $8.77 $350.80

25 250 EA No Bid No Bid $2.35 $587.50 $0.61 $152.50 $0.69 $172.50 $0.62 $155.00

26 40 EA No Bid No Bid $2.35 $94.00 $0.61 $24.40 $0.66 $26.40 $0.62 $24.80

27 10 EA No Bid No Bid $277.80 $2,778.00 $128.34 $1,283.40 $192.00 $1,920.00 $155.05 $1,550.50

28 10 EA No Bid No Bid $388.90 $3,889.00 $128.34 $1,283.40 $192.00 $1,920.00 $155.05 $1,550.50

29 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $71.25 $712.50 No Bid

30 4,280 EA No Bid No Bid $6.00 $25,680.00 $3.77 $16,135.60 $4.07 $17,419.60 $12.45 $53,286.00

31 40 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $51.15 $2,046.00 No Bid

32 150 RL No Bid No Bid $37.60 $5,640.00 No Bid $7.85 $1,177.50 $31.75 $4,762.50

33 30 RL No Bid No Bid $25.55 $766.50 No Bid $7.29 $218.70 $14.31 $429.30

34 1,650 RL No Bid No Bid $15.15 $24,997.50 No Bid $5.84 $9,636.00 $8.89 $14,668.50

35 20 RL No Bid No Bid $36.05 $721.00 No Bid $34.10 $682.00 $21.51 $430.20

36 270 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.22 $2,759.40

37 70 EA $120.00 $8,400.00 No Bid No Bid $177.55 $12,428.50 $115.00 $8,050.00 $63.33 $4,433.10

38 80 RL No Bid No Bid $5.05 $404.00 No Bid $4.75 $380.00 $7.49 $599.20

39 360 RL No Bid No Bid $4.05 $1,458.00 No Bid $1.77 $637.20 $3.39 $1,220.40

40 310 RL No Bid No Bid $4.05 $1,255.50 No Bid $1.77 $548.70 $3.39 $1,050.90

41 380 RL No Bid No Bid $4.05 $1,539.00 No Bid $1.77 $672.60 $3.39 $1,288.20

42 180 RL No Bid No Bid $4.05 $729.00 No Bid $1.77 $318.60 $3.39 $610.20

43 300 RL No Bid No Bid $4.05 $1,215.00 No Bid $1.77 $531.00 $3.39 $1,017.00

44 590 RL No Bid No Bid $4.05 $2,389.50 No Bid $1.77 $1,044.30 $3.39 $2,000.10

45 800 RL No Bid No Bid $4.05 $3,240.00 No Bid $1.77 $1,416.00 $3.39 $2,712.00

46 480 RL No Bid No Bid $4.05 $1,944.00 No Bid $1.77 $849.60 $3.39 $1,627.20

47 270 RL No Bid No Bid $14.25 $3,847.50 $13.25 $3,577.50 $6.54 $1,765.80 $12.54 $3,385.80

48 70 EA $69.40 $4,858.00 No Bid No Bid $54.78 $3,834.60 $53.77 $3,763.90 $85.83 $6,008.10

49 90 EA $80.60 $7,254.00 No Bid No Bid $64.45 $5,800.50 $68.75 $6,187.50 $74.06 $6,665.40

50 110 EA $102.25 $11,247.50 No Bid No Bid $52.62 $5,788.20 $30.77 $3,384.70 $67.82 $7,460.20

51 150 EA $150.00 $22,500.00 No Bid No Bid $120.00 $18,000.00 $129.17 $19,375.50 $120.97 $18,145.50

FUSE, PLUG, SIZE 15 A., 125 V. W/ 

THREAD METAL TOP CAP AE #5709

TAPE, ELECTRICAL,  SELF-FUSING, 

SILICONE RUBBER AE #493

FUSE, LINK NEMA STAND. TYPE 

200 (N) (FIT ALL) 5 AMP AE #5679

 BAG, TOOL, 22 INCH X 13 INCH X 8 

INCH AE #549

BAG, TOOL, CANVAS, PLASTIC 

REINFORCED, OVAL AE #1355

FUSE UNIT, 8.3 KV 4 AMP AE #5813

FUSE, PLUG, 125 V, SIZE 30 A,  W/ 

THREAD METAL TOP CAP AE #5710

FUSE UNIT, 8.3 KV ALL SIZES AE 

#5812

FUSE LIMITER, REPLACEABLE, 

NETWORK, 200 AMP AE #5781

FUSE, MIDGET 600V AC 5 AMP, 

FAST ACTING AE #22043

FUSE LIMITER, REPLACEABLE, 

NETWORK, 100 AMP AE #5779

TAPE, ELECTRICAL, 3/4 INCH X 36 

YARDS, 8.5 MIL AE #491

TAPE, RUBBER MASTIC, 2 INCH 

WIDE AE #496

TAPE, HIGH VOLTAGE, LINERLESS, 

RUBBER, 1 IN X 30 FT AE #593

TAPE, VARNISH CAMBRIDGE, 1" 

WIDE X 36 YDS AE #15175

TAPE, COLOR CODED, YELLOW AE 

#15229

TAPE, COLOR CODED, ORANGE AE 

#15230

TAPE, COLOR CODED, BROWN AE 

#15231

TAPE SEALANT TEFLON 1/2 IN X 36 

YDS AE #15262

MULETAPE, POLYESTER, FLAT, 

WOVEN, AE #19559

TAPE, COLOR CODED, RED AE 

#15226

TAPE, COLOR CODED, WHITE AE 

#15227

TAPE, COLOR CODED, GREEN AE 

#15232

TAPE, COLOR CODED, VIOLET AE 

#15233

BAG, CANVAS ONLY WITH PLASTIC 

BOTTOM AE #6957

BAG, FOR PAD MOUNT XFRMR OIL 

CONTAINMENT AE #1374

TAPE, COLOR CODED, BLUE AE 

#15228

TAPE, DUCT, 2 INCHES X 60 YARDS 

AE #15163
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52 490 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.69 $10,628.10 $19.57 $9,589.30

53 20 PR No Bid No Bid No Bid $536.85 $10,737.00 $575.00 $11,500.00 $287.67 $5,753.40

54 50 EA $54.00 $2,700.00 No Bid No Bid $45.00 $2,250.00 $46.00 $2,300.00 $161.29 $8,064.50

55 1,800 FT No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.65 $13,770.00 $28.50 $51,300.00 $22.20 $39,960.00

56 20 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $483.87 $9,677.40

57 290 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $195.00 $56,550.00 $215.05 $62,364.50

58 480 RL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.66 $1,756.80

59 40 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.00 $1,920.00 $9.46 $378.40

60 670 EA $5.50 $3,685.00 No Bid No Bid $4.57 $3,061.90 $5.18 $3,470.60 $11.24 $7,530.80

61 5,855 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.25 $1,463.75 No Bid

62 320 EA $8.85 $2,832.00 No Bid $96.70 $30,944.00 $9.05 $2,896.00 $15.84 $5,068.80 No Bid

63 20 EA $635.00 $12,700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $511.83 $10,236.60

64 15 EA $390.00 $5,850.00 No Bid No Bid $373.08 $5,596.20 $329.77 $4,946.55 $313.85 $4,707.75

65 5 EA $483.00 $2,415.00 No Bid No Bid $462.61 $2,313.05 $408.15 $2,040.75 $389.17 $1,945.85

66 50 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $261.00 $13,050.00 $253.26 $12,663.00

67 30 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $295.00 $8,850.00 $264.12 $7,923.60

68 20 EA $390.00 $7,800.00 No Bid No Bid $373.08 $7,461.60 $329.77 $6,595.40 $313.85 $6,277.00

69 10 EA $483.00 $4,830.00 No Bid No Bid $462.61 $4,626.10 $408.15 $4,081.50 $389.17 $3,891.70

70 30 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $317.00 $9,510.00 $253.26 $7,597.80

71 1,300 EA No Bid $16.22 $21,086.00 No Bid No Bid $5.90 $7,670.00 No Bid

72 1,060 EA $16.00 $16,960.00 No Bid $15.00 $15,900.00 $12.17 $12,900.20 $14.22 $15,073.20 No Bid

73 40 EA $264.00 $10,560.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $440.00 $17,600.00 $0.00 $0.00

74 30 EA $31.00 $930.00 No Bid No Bid $17.10 $513.00 $26.26 $787.80 $52.86 $1,585.80

75 360 EA $47.25 $17,010.00 No Bid $72.35 $26,046.00 $32.15 $11,574.00 $39.53 $14,230.80 $56.37 $20,293.20

76 270 EA $58.90 $15,903.00 No Bid $104.45 $28,201.50 $47.10 $12,717.00 $49.31 $13,313.70 $82.94 $22,393.80

77 100 EA $69.60 $6,960.00 No Bid No Bid $59.55 $5,955.00 $58.27 $5,827.00 $95.37 $9,537.00

78 400 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.15 $4,460.00 $80.65 $32,260.00

79 550 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $62.00 $34,100.00 $1.69 $929.50 $26.88 $14,784.00

LUG, COMPRESSION, NEMA TWO-

HOLE, 750 MCM AE #1367

SPLICE KIT, HEAT-SHRINKABLE 

FOR 15KV AE #7282

GRIP, CABLE, FOR CONDUIT 

RISER, 2" CONDUIT AE #6672

GRIP, CABLE, FOR CONDUIT 

RISER, 3" CONDUIT AE #6673

RELAY, TWO-POLE, 30 AMPS, 

120/240 VOLTS. AE #47

SPLICE, KIT, HEAT SHRINK, 15KV, 

1/C 2/0 LEAD TO 1/C AE #7278

GRIP, CABLE, FOR CONDUIT 

RISER, 5" CONDUIT AE #6676

CLAMP, HOT LINE TAP, BODY 6061-

T6 EXTRUDED ALUM AE #19312

BAND, PUNCH-LOCK FOR CABLE 

GRIP AE #6677

PUMP, SUBMERSIBLE, 1HP 

MINIMUM AE #473

DRUM, BARREL, 55 GALLON, OPEN 

TOP AE #2528

CONNECTOR, 4/0 TO 4/0 COPPER 

AE #7309

CONNECTOR, GROUND, BRONZE, 

2/0 TO 250 MCM AE #7423

SWITCH, DISCONNECT, 15KV, 900 

AMPS AE #1298

GRIP, CABLE, FOR CONDUIT 

RISER, 4" CONDUIT AE #6674

FLAGGING, PLASTIC, PINK, 1-1/4 

INCH AE #8297

DEADEND, FORMED WIRE, 4/0 (7 

STRAND) AE #6689

DEADEND, FORMED WIRE, 4/0 

ACSR AND AAC AE #6681

TAP, COMPRESSION, TYPE C, 

COPPER CRIMPIT AE #7244

SPLICE, KIT, HEAT SHRINK, 15KV, 

1/C 2/0 LEAD TO 1/C AE #7278

SPLICE KIT, HEAT-SHRINKABLE 

FOR 15KV, EPR INSUL AE #7282

ELBOW KIT, REPLACEMENT, 200 

AMP LOADBREAK AE #1902

ELBOW, REPAIR, 200 AMP, 

LOADBREAK, AE #1901

ELBOW KIT, REPLACEMENT, 200 

AMP LOADBREAK AE #1902

FLANGE WRAP OIL-SELECTIVE 

(FWO-2448) AE #19378

WRAP, POLE, BANDAGES AE 

#16080

KNIFE, CABLE SKINNING. AE #9547

CLIMBERS(MFG PART NUMBER IS 

TB94089A) AE #19363
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80 50 EA $300.50 $15,025.00 $571.99 $28,599.50 $159.75 $7,987.50 $142.58 $7,129.00 $153.66 $7,683.00 $80.65 $4,032.50

81 2,110 EA No Bid No Bid $29.30 $61,823.00 $12.97 $27,366.70 $12.15 $25,636.50 No Bid

82 130 EA $13.00 $1,690.00 No Bid No Bid $10.20 $1,326.00 $8.77 $1,140.10 $9.22 $1,198.60

83 20 EA $410.00 $8,200.00 No Bid No Bid $337.50 $6,750.00 No Bid $376.34 $7,526.80

84 40 EA $375.00 $15,000.00 No Bid No Bid $308.35 $12,334.00 No Bid $381.72 $15,268.80

85 140 EA $31.25 $4,375.00 No Bid No Bid $14.75 $2,065.00 $27.75 $3,885.00 $113.40 $15,876.00

86 80 EA No Bid No Bid $508.00 $40,640.00 No Bid $210.00 $16,800.00 No Bid

87 220 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.83 $1,722.60 $8.75 $1,925.00 $8.12 $1,786.40

88 600 EA $144.00 $86,400.00 $571.99 $343,194.00 No Bid $142.58 $85,548.00 $152.84 $91,704.00 $80.65 $48,390.00

89 40 EA $165.00 $6,600.00 No Bid No Bid $233.25 $9,330.00 $270.75 $10,830.00 $152.95 $6,118.00

90 10 EA $20.50 $205.00 No Bid No Bid $18.10 $181.00 $19.21 $192.10 $67.30 $673.00

91 20 CART $190.00 $3,800.00 No Bid No Bid $285.42 $5,708.40 $350.00 $7,000.00 $6.04 $120.80

92 50 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.25 $762.50 $24.26 $1,213.00

93 520 EA $21.95 $11,414.00 No Bid $65.45 $34,034.00 $18.70 $9,724.00 $14.40 $7,488.00 $54.98 $28,589.60

94 300 EA $51.00 $15,300.00 No Bid No Bid $39.73 $11,919.00 $32.15 $9,645.00 $52.65 $15,795.00

95 550 FT $3,382.50 $1,860,375.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.47 $3,008.50 $4.03 $2,216.50

$2,193,778.50 $392,879.50 $416,877.05 $430,628.02 $603,202.30 $640,707.38

INSULATION, 1/4 INCH ROUND 

SPLIT TUBE, GRAY  AE #16785

CHANNEL, STEEL, 1-5/8" X 3-1/4", 12 

GAUGE AE #6864

DEAD END, AUTOMATIC, WITH 

GALV CLEVIS STRAP AE #6819

Aluminum alloy terminal, welded, 

expansion, for connecting 4" sched 40 

IPS to a 4" NEMA 4 pad AE #6534

BRACKET, FOR MOUNTING 

DISCONNECTS ON 3 PHASE RISER 

POLES. AE #6567

Aluminum alloy terminal, welded, 

expansion AE #6534

CONNECTOR, LIQUID-TIGHT, 2 

INCH AE #344

INSULATOR, HIGH DENSITY 

POLYETHYLENE, PIN TYPE, 35KV 

AE #1929

Prepared by: Stephanie Hollanders

Approved by:  Gabriel Guerrero

DISPENSER, GUY-WIRE SAFETY-

PREFORMED Cobrahead AE #40

CLAMPS, BLANKET, 8 1/2" LNG AE 

#9186

GRIPS, CABLE, HOOK ENDS, FOR 

350 AND 750 MCM AE #10446

SLEEVE, METER, SOCKET, 

DISCONNECT AE #6223

CONNECTOR 4 CONDUCTOR, 750 

KCMIL TO #2 AE #19256

DEADEND, CROSSARM, HEAVY 

DUTY GRAY FIBERGLASS, 4" X 7.5" 

X 144" AE #18071

CROSSARM, TANGENT, HEAVY 

DUTY GRAY FIBERGLASS, 4" X 7.5" 

X 144" AE #18072

INSULATOR, LINE POST, 46KV, F-

NECK, ANSI CLASS 57-3 AE #18073

TOTAL

8


