City of Austin Purchasing Office — Log of Offers Rec  gg 1100 MEA1013 02./11/20

600V DRY-Type-Slip Cover Brushing
Solicitation Number:

D IFB Disclaimer: The information contained on D RFP/RFQS Disclaimer: The contents of a proposal shall For more information, you may contact the Purchasing Office by:
the following bid sheets are for information only remain confidentia! until a contract is awarded. This log of Phone ~ 512-974-2500
and does not constitute actual award/execution offers is for information purposes only and does not Email - Purchinfo@austintexas.qov
of a contract. constitute actual award/execution of a contract. Physical Address — 124 W. 8 St., Third floor, Austin, TX 78701
Hours of Operation ~ Monday-Friday 7:46 a.m. to 4:46 p.m.
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* Only complete if the vendor name is different from the name on the offerors documents inside the envelope that is opened during the webinar.




CITY OF AUSTIN
BID TABULATION
600V Dry-Type Slip-Over Bushing Current Transformers

Solicitation No. IFB 1100 MEA1013

RX No. 19112100144

Opening Date: 12/11/20

Buyer: Maria Andrade

Receipt No.

Vendor Name

Texas Electric Cooperati Pri

Power Supply

KBS Electrical Distributors

Arteche USA *

Spectrum Industries Inc.*

ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION

U/M

EST.
QTY

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

Transformer, current, 600V, 10kV BIL, 60Hz, dry-type, outdoor, bushing, slip -over, dual core.
Both cores shall be 2000/5, multi-ratio, C400, RF=2 at 30°C. The CT shall meet applicable
requirements of the latest revision of IEEE C57.13. Each unit shall be provided with a nameplate.

The secondary terminals of the two cores shall be housed in cither a single weather-proof enclosure
or separate weather-proof enclosures. If two enclosures are supplied, the enclosures must be
positioned on the current transformer adjacent to each other. A maximum of 1 separation
allowed between enclosures.

The inside diameter shall be no less than 24 inches. The height shall be no more than 5 inches.
'The outside perimeter shall be round with less than a 34 inch diameter. No square corners allowed.

Mounting hardware shall be supplied. The hardware shall consist of 4 (four) aluminum brackets
connected to stainless-steel all thread rods and nuts.

An aluminum ground shicld shall be provided on the top surface of the unit. The shield shall be
provided with a pad with 9/16” diameter holes for connection to the substation ground grid.

Technical specifications, dimensional drawings, mounting hardwate drawings, and name plate
drawings shall be supplied with the bid, as per Section 0400, Paragraph 8.

Standard test reports and installation, Operating, and Maintenance manuals shall be suppled with
the units, as per Section 0400, Paragraph 8.

Includes a five (5) year warranty per Section 0400, Paragraph 11.

EA

$2,225.00 $20,025.00 $2,630.00 $23,670.00 $6,050.00 $54,450.00

$9,044.25 $81,398.25

TOTAL BID|

$20,025.00 $23,670.00 $54,450.00

$81,398.25

Award Method: Line by line

Note: * Deemed non-responsive - Did not meet requirements of the solicitation.

Prepared By

Lezee Perkins

Approved Maria Andrade

Yellow notates award.
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SECTION 0600 - BID SHEET

CITY OF AUSTIN
PURCHASING OFFICE
600V DRY-TYPE TRANSFORMERS
SOLICITATION NO.: IFB 1100 MEA1013 4
RX NO.: RQM 1100 19112100144
OPENING DATE: 2/4/2020
BUYER: Maria Andrade

Special Instructions: Offerors must use this Bid Sheet to submit pricing. Be advised that exceptions taken, qualifying statements, or alterations of the bid sheet may jeopardize acceptance
of the bid.

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. Actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical or anticipated
usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

A bid of '0" (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of 'no bid' or no response (space left blank) will be
interpreted by the City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on that item.

The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line items, cost, or any criteria or
combination deemed most advantageous to the City. The bidder may choose to submit pricing for all items listed on the bid sheet or only specific items in consideration of this solicitation.

Prices offered on the bid sheet shall be all inclusive of fees including administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping or transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-
fee, etc.) to deliver services or items to the required location.

**++THE QUANTITIES REQUESTED ARE ANNUAL ESTIMATES*****
NOTICE TO BIDDERS: PLEASE INSERT UNIT PRICE AND ALLOW FORMULAS TO CALCULATE PRIOR TO PRINTING BID SHEET.

CEAD EXTENDED |
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION QTyY. | UM TIME | UNIT PRICE PRICE
Transformer, current, 600V, 10kV BIL, 60Hz, dry-type, outdoor, bushing, slip -over, dual core. Both cores shall be
2000/5, multi-ratio, C400, RF=2 at 30°C. The CT shall meet applicable requirements of the latest revision of IEEE
C57.13. Each unit shall be provided with a nameplate.
The secondary terminals of the two cores shall be housed in either a single weather-proof enclosure or separate
weather-proof enclosures. If two enclosures are supplied, the enclosures must be positioned on the current transformer
adjacent to each other. A maximum of 1" separation allowed between enclosures.
The inside diameter shall be no less than 24 inches. The height shall be no more than 5 inches. The outside perimeter
1 shall be round with less than a 34 inch diameter. No square corners allowed. g EA 60 9,044.25 81,398.25

Mounting hardware shall be supplied. The hardware shall consist of 4 (four) aluminum brackets connected to stainless-
steel all thread rods and nuts.

An aluminum ground shield shall be provided on the top surface of the unit. The shield shall be provided with a pad
with 9/16" diameter holes for connection to the substation ground grid.

Technical specifications, dimensional drawings, mounting hardware drawings, and name plate drawings shall be
supplied with the bid, as per Section 0400, Paragraph 8.

Standard test reports and instaliation, Operating, and Maintenance manuals shall be suppled with the units, as per
Section 0400, Paragraph 8.

Includes a five (5) year warranty per Section 0400, Paragraph 11.

A»h) j;rg& TOTAL BID $81,398.25
ks G- & wel

CAantina NCNAN



SECTION 0600 - BID SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN
PURCHASING OFFICE
600V DRY-TYPE TRANSFORMERS

NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

ITEM NO. The City reserves the right to add additional items not specified above. % MARKUP OVER MFG'S CONFIGURED PRICE
002 Bidders shall provide a percentagt? markup over their invoice. Reference 0400 Supplemental Purchase 8%
Provisions Section 2 Pricing Requirements - Non-Specified Items.
DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED
DELIVERY METHOD: X COMMON CARRIER (FedEx, UPS) ____VENDOR DELIVERY
COMPANY NAME: KBS
PRINTED NAME: Matt McGuire
EMAIL ADDRESS: mmcguire@kbselectric.com




SECTION 0600 - BID SHEET

CITY OF AUSTIN
PURCHASING OFFICE
600V DRY-TYPE TRANSFORMERS
SOLICITATION NO.: IFB 1100 MEA1013
RX NO.: RQM 1100 19112100144
OPENING DATE: 2/4/2020
BUYER: Maria Andrade

Special Instructions: Offerors must use this Bid Sheet to submit pricing. Be advised that exceptions taken, qualifying statements, or alterations of the bid sheet may jeopardize acceptance
of the bid.

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. Actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical or anticipated
usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

A bid of '0' (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of 'no bid' or no response (space left blank) will be
interpreted by the City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on that item.

The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line items, cost, or any criteria or
combination deemed most advantageous to the City. The bidder may choose to submit pricing for all items listed on the bid sheet or only specific items in consideration of this solicitation.

Prices offered on the bid sheet shall be all inclusive of fees including administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping or transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-
fee, etc.) to deliver services or items to the required location.

***THE QUANTITIES REQUESTED ARE ANNUAL ESTIMATES*****
NOTICE TO BIDDERS: PLEASE INSERT UNIT PRICE AND ALLOW FORMULAS TO CALCULATE PRIOR TO PRINTING BID SHEET.

CEAD EXTENDED |
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY. | UM TIME | UNIT PRICE PRICE
Transformer, current, 600V, 10kV BIL, 60Hz, dry-type, outdoor, bushing, slip -over, dual core. Both cores shall be
2000/5, multi-ratio, C400, RF=2 at 30°C. The CT shall meet applicable requirements of the latest revision of IEEE
C57.13. Each unit shall be provided with a nameplate.
The secondary terminals of the two cores shall be housed in either a single weather-proof enclosure or separate
weather-proof enclosures. |If two enclosures are supplied, the enclosures must be positioned on the current transformer
adjacent to each other. A maximum of 1" separation allowed between enclosures.
The inside diameter shall be no less than 24 inches. The height shall be no more than 5 inches. The outside perimeter 10
1 shall be round with less than a 34 inch diameter. No square corners allowed. 9 EA | Weeks 2.950.00 26,550.00
Mounting hardware shall be supplied. The hardware shall consist of 4 (four) aluminum brackets connected to stainless- ARO

steel all thread rods and nuts.

An aluminum ground shield shall be provided on the top surface of the unit. The shield shall be provided with a pad
with 9/16" diameter holes for connection to the substation ground grid.

Technical specifications, dimensional drawings, mounting hardware drawings, and name plate drawings shall be
supplied with the bid, as per Section 0400, Paragraph 8.

Standard test reports and installation, Operating, and Maintenance manuais shall be suppled with the units, as per
Section 0400, Paragraph 8.

Includes a five (5) year warranty per Section 0400, Paragraph 11.

TOTAL BID $26,550.00




SECTION 0600 - BID SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN
PURCHASING OFFICE
600V DRY-TYPE TRANSFORMERS
NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

ITEM NO. The City reserves the right to add additional items not specified above. % MARKUP OVER MFG'S CONFIGURED PRICE
002 Bidders shall provide a percentage markup over their invoice. Reference 0400 Supplemental Purchase 0%
Provisions Section 2 Pricing Requirements - Non-Specified ltems.
DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED
DELIVERY METHOD: COMMON CARRIER (FedEx, UPS) x VENDOR DELIVERY
COMPANY NAME: Arteche USA
PRINTED NAME: Charbel Saliba
EMAIL ADDRESS: charbel.saliba@arteche.com




SECTION 0600 - BID SHEET

CITY OF AUSTIN
PURCHASING OFFICE
600V DRY-TYPE TRANSFORMERS
SOLICITATION NO.: IFB 1100 MEA1013
RX NO.: RQM 1100 19112100144
OPENING DATE: 2/4/2020
BUYER: Maria Andrade

Special Instructions: Offerors must use this Bid Sheet to submit pricing. Be advised that exceptions taken, qualifying statements, or alterations of the bid sheet may jeopardize acceptance
of the bid.

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. Actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical or anticipated
usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

A bid of '0' (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of 'no bid’ or no response (space left blank) will be
interpreted by the City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on that item.

The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line items, cost, or any criteria or
combination deemed most advantageous to the City. The bidder may choose to submit pricing for all items listed on the bid sheet or only specific items in consideration of this solicitation.

Prices offered on the bid sheet shall be all inclusive of fees including administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping or transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-
fee, etc.) to deliver services or items to the required location.

»**THE QUANTITIES REQUESTED ARE ANNUAL ESTIMATES*****
NOTICE TO BIDDERS: PLEASE INSERT UNIT PRICE AND ALLOW FORMULAS TO CALCULATE PRIOR TO PRINTING BID SHEET.

LEAD EXTENDED |
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY. | UM TIME | UNIT PRICE PRICE
Transformer, current, 600V, 10kV BIL, 60Hz, dry-type, outdoor, bushing, slip -over, dual core. Both cores shall be
2000/5, multi-ratio, C400, RF=2 at 30°C. The CT shall meet applicable requirements of the latest revision of IEEE
C57.13. Each unit shall be provided with a nameplate.
The secondary terminals of the two cores shall be housed in either a single weather-proof enclosure or separate
weather-proof enclosures. if two enclosures are supplied, the enclosures must be positioned on the current transformer
adjacent to each other. A maximum of 1" separation allowed between enclosures.
The inside diameter shall be no less than 24 inches. The height shall be no more than 5 inches. The outside perimeter 4-5 *
1 shall be round with less than a 34 inch diameter. No square corners aliowed. 9 EA wee:s 2.100.00 18,900.00
Mounting hardware shall be supplied. The hardware shall consist of 4 (four) aluminum brackets connected to stainless- to ship
steel all thread rods and nuts. ARO u
An aluminum ground shield shall be provided on the top surface of the unit. The shield shall be provided with a pad € sed
with 9/16" diameter holes for connection to the substation ground grid. O‘H-MLILQA l
Technical specifications, dimensional drawings, mounting hardware drawings, and name plate drawings shall be &Wﬂs
supplied with the bid, as per Section 0400, Paragraph 8. r fof“' "«\QO
Standard test reports and installation, Operating, and Maintenance manuals shall be suppled with the units, as per ol i o‘\’d
Section 0400, Paragraph 8. R~cephions
Includes a five (5) year warranty per Section 0400, Paragraph 11.
TOTAL BID $18,900.00




SECTION 0600 - BID SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN
PURCHASING OFFICE
600V DRY-TYPE TRANSFORMERS

NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

ITEM NO. The City reserves the right to add additional items not specified above. % MARKUP OVER MFG'S CONFIGURED PRICE
Bidders shall provide a percentage markup over their invoice. Reference 0400 Supplemental Purchase
002 . . . i i 17%
Provisions Section 2 Pricing Requirements - Non-Specified Items.
DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED
DELIVERY METHOD: X COMMON CARRIER (FedEx, UPS) VENDOR DELIVERY
COMPANY NAME: SPECTRUM INDUSTRIES, INC. /7
PRINTED NAME: MARIA SIMILI-CROTEAU ///L_——’/
ﬂ L 4
EMAIL ADDRESS: meters@spectrumind.com




SECTION 0600 - BID SHEET

CITY OF AUSTIN
PURCHASING OFFICE
600V DRY-TYPE TRANSFORMERS
SOLICITATION NO.: IFB 1100 MEA1013
RX NO.: RQM 1100 19112100144
OPENING DATE: 2142020
BUYER: Maria Andrade

Special Instructions: Offerors must use this Bid Sheet to submit pricing. Be advised that exceptions taken, qualifying statements, or alterations of the bid sheet may jeopardize acceptance
of the bid.

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volumae. Actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical or anticipated
usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

A bid of ‘0° (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expact to pay for that item. A bid of 'no bid’ or no response (space ieft blank) will be interpreted
by the City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on that item.

The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or muitiple awards based on individual or categoriesi/groups of specific ine items, cost, or any criteria or
combination d d most tag to the City. The bidder may ch to submit pricing for all items listed on the bid sheet or only specific items in consideration of this solicitation.

Prices offered on the bid sheet shall be all inclusive of fees including administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping or transportation costs {travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-fee,
atc.) to deliver services or items to the required location.

**THE QUANTITIES REQUESTED ARE ANNUAL ESTIMATES""***

NOTICE TO BIDDERS: PLEASE INSERT UNIT PRICE AND ALLOW FORMULAS TO CALCULATE PRIOR TO PRINTING BID SHEET.
LEAD EXTENDED |
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY. | UM | TIME | UNIT PRICE PRICE
Transformer, current, 600V, 10kV BIL, 60Hz, dry-type, outdoor, bushing, slip -over, dual core. Both cores shall be
2000/5, mutti-ratio, C400, RF=2 at 30°C. The CT shall meet applicable requirements of the latest revision of IEEE
C57.13. Each unit shall be provided with a nameplate.

The secondary terminals of the two cores shall be housed in either a single weather-proof enclosure or separate weather-
proof enclosures. If two enclosures are supplied, the enclosures must be positioned on the current transformer adjacent
to each other. A maximum of 1" separation allowed between enclosures.

The inside diameter shall be no less than 24 inches. The height shall be no more than 5 inches. The outside perimeter 35-42
1 shall be round with less than a 34 inch diameter. No square comers aliowed. 9 EA Days 2,225.00 20,025.00

Mounting hardware shall be supplied. The hardware shall consist of 4 (four) aluminum brackets connected to stainless- ARO
stee! all thread rods and nuts.

An aluminum ground shield shall be provided on the top surface of the unit. The shield shall be provided with a pad with
9/16" diameter holes for connection to the substation ground grid.

Technical specificatk di ional drawings, ing hardware drawings, and name piate drawings shall be supplied
with the bid, as per Section 0400, Paragraph 8.

Standard test reports and installation, Operating, and Maintenance manuals shall be suppled with the units, as per
Section 0400, Paragraph 8.

Includes a five () year wamranty per Section 0400, Paragraph 11.

TOTAL BID $20,025.00

NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

ITEM NO. The City resarves the right to add additional items not specified above. % MARKUP OVER MFG'S CONFIGURED PRICE

002 Bidders shall provide a percentage markup over their invoice. Reference 0400 Supplemental Purchase

'Provlsions Section 2 Pricing Requirements - Non-Specified items. 0%

DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

DELIVERY METHOD: X COMMON CARRIER (FedEx, UPS) VENDOR DELIVERY
COMPANY NAME: Texas Electric Cooperatives
PRINTED NAME: Adrian Lopez

EMAIL ADDRESS: alopez@texas-ec.org




SECTION 0600 - BID SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN
PURCHASING OFFICE
600V DRY-TYPE TRANSFORMERS

SOLICITATION NO.: IFB 1100 MEA1013

RX NO.: RQM 1100 19112100144
OPENING DATE: 2/4/2020

BUYER: Maria Andrade

Special Instructions: Offerors must use this Bid Sheet to submit pricing. Be advised that exceptions taken, qualifying statements, or aiterations of the bid sheet may jeopardize acceptance
of the bid.

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. Actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical or anticipated
usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

A bid of '0' (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of 'no bid' or no response (space left blank) will be
interpreted by the City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on that item.

The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line items, cost, or any criteria or
combination deemed most advantageous to the City. The bidder may choose to submit pricing for all items listed on the bid sheet or only specific items in consideration of this solicitation.

Prices offered on the bid sheet shall be all inclusive of fees including administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping or transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-
fee, etc.) to deliver services or items to the required location.

***THE QUANTITIES REQUESTED ARE ANNUAL ESTIMATES*****

NOTICE TO BIDDERS: PLEASE INSERT UNIT PRICE AND ALLOW FORMULAS TO CALCULATE PRIOR TO PRINTING BID SHEET.

TEAD EXTENDED |
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY. UM TIME | UNIT PRICE PRICE
Transformer, current, 600V, 10kV BIL, 60Hz, dry-type, outdoor, bushing, slip -over, dual core. Both cores shall be
2000/5, multi-ratio, C400, RF=2 at 30°C. The CT shall meet applicable requirements of the latest revision of IEEE
C57.13. Each unit shall be provided with a nameplate.

The secondary terminals of the two cores shall be housed in either a single weather-proof enclosure or separate
weather-proof enclosures. [f two enclosures are supplied, the enclosures must be positioned on the current transformer
adjacent to each other. A maximum of 1" separation allowed between enclosures.

The inside diameter shall be no less than 24 inches. The height shall be no more than 5 inches. The outside perimeter

1 shali be round with less than a 34 inch diameter. No square corners allowed. 60

9 EA AYS 6,050.00 54,450.00
Mounting hardware shall be supplied. The hardware shall consist of 4 (four) aluminum brackets connected to stainless- D

steel all thread rods and nuts.

An aluminum ground shield shall be provided on the top surface of the unit. The shield shall be provided with a pad
with 9/16" diameter holes for connection to the substation ground grid.

Technical specifications, dimensional drawings, mounting hardware drawings, and name plate drawings shall be
supplied with the bid, as per Section 0400, Paragraph 8.

Standard test reports and installation, Operating, and Maintenance manuals shall be suppled with the units, as per
Section 0400, Paragraph 8.

Includes a five (5) year warranty per Section 0400, Paragraph 11.

TOTAL BID $54,450.00




SECTION 0600 - BID SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN
PURCHASING OFFICE
600V DRY-TYPE TRANSFORMERS

NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

PRINTED NAME:

EMAIL ADDRESS:

MARK DAVIS

mdavis@wesco.com

ITEM NO. The City reserves the right to add additional items not specified above. % MARKUP OVER MFG'S CONFIGURED PRICE
002 Bidders shall provide a percentage markup over their invoice. Reference 0400 Supplemental Purchase 20%
Provisions Section 2 Pricing Requirements - Non-Specified Items.
DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED
DELIVERY METHOD: X COMMON CARRIER (FedEx, UPS) __VENDOR DELIVERY
COMPANY NAME: POWER SUPPLY




SECTION 0600 - BID SHEET

CITY OF AUSTIN
PURCHASING OFFICE
600V DRY-TYPE TRANSFORMERS
SOLICITATION NO.: IFB 1100 MEA1013
RX NO.: RQM 1100 19112100144
OPENING DATE: 21420
BUYER: Maria Andrade

ial Instructions: Offerors must use this Bid Sheet to submit pricing. Be advised that exceptions taken, qualifying statements, or alterations of the bid sheet may jeopardize
acceptance of the bid.

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual vol Actual purch may be more or less. Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical or
anticipated usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

A bid of *0’ (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of 'no bid’ or no response {space left blank) will
be interpreted by the City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on that item.

The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on individual or cat ies/groups of specific line items, cost, or any

criteria or combination deemed most advantageous to the City. The bidder may choose to submit pricing for all items listed on the bid shest or only specific items in
consideration of this solicitation.

Prices offered on the bid sheet shall be all inclusive of fees including administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping or transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges,
mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to deliver services or items to the required location.

*+=THE QUANTITIES REQUESTED ARE ANNUAL ESTIMATES™*

NOTICE TO BIDDERS: PLEASE INSERT UNIT PRICE AND ALLOW FORMULAS TO CALCULATE PRIOR TO PRINTING BID SHEET

LEAD EXTENDED |
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY. | UM | TIME | UNIT PRICE PRICE
Transformer, current, 600V, 10kV BIL, 60Hz, dry-type, outdoor, bushing, slip -over, dual core. Both cores shall be

2000/5, multi-ratio, C400, RF=2 at 30°C. The CT shall meet applicable requirements of the latest revision of IEEE
C57.13. Each unit shall be provided with a nameplate.

The secondary terminals of the two cores shall be housed in either a single weather-proof enclosure or separate
weather-proof enclosures. If two enclosures are supplied, the enclosures must be positioned on the current
transformer adjacent to each olher. A maximum of 1" separation allowed between enclosures.

The inside diameter shall be noless than 24 inches. The height shall be no more than 5inches. The outside
1 perimeter shall be round with less than a 34 inch diameter. No square corners allowed. 9 EA 8 2,630.00 2367000
Mounting hardware shall be supplied. The hardware shall consist of 4 (four) aluminum brackels connected to 10wks '
stainless-steel all thread rods and nuts.

An aluminum ground shield shall be provided on the top surface of the unit. The shield shall be provided with a pad
with 9/16" diameter holes for connection to the substation ground grid.

Technical specifications, dimensional drawings, mounting hardware drawings, and name plate drawings shall be
supplied with the bid, as per Section 0400, Paragraph 8.

Standard test reports and installation, Operating, and Maintenance manuals shall be suppled with the units, as per
Section 0400, Paragraph 8.

Includes a five (5) year warranty per Section 0400, Paragraph 11.

TOTAL BID $23,670.00

NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

ITEM NO. |The City reserves the right to add additional items not specified above. % MARKUP OVER MFG'S CONFIGURED PRICE

Bidders shall provide a percentage markup over their invoice. Reference 0400 Supplemental Purchase %
Provisions Section 2 Pricing Requi s - Non-Specified ltems.

DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION. PREPAID AND ALLOWED

DELIVERY METHOD X COMMON CARRIER (FedEx, UPS) VENDOR DELIVERY

COMPANY NAME Priester-Mell & Nicholson

PRINTED NAME: Donnie Carter

EMAIL ADDRESS: donnic.carteru pmn-inc.com




SECTION 0600 - BID SHEET

CITY OF AUSTIN
PURCHASING OFFICE
800V DRY-TYPE TRANSFORMERS
SOLICITATION NO.: IFB 1100 MEA1013
RX NO.: RQM 1100 19112100144
OPENING DATE: 2/4/2020
BUYER: Marla Andrade

Special Instructions: Offerors must use this Bid Sheet to submit pricing. Be advised that exceptions taken, qualifying statements, or alterations of the bid sheet may jeopardize acceptance

of the bid.

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. Actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical or anticipated

usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specifled by the City for each order.

A bid of '0' (zero) will be Interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of 'no bid’ or no response (space left blank) will be

interpreted by the City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on that item.

The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line Items, cost, or any criteria or
combination deemed most advantageous to the City. The bidder may choose to submit pricing for all items listed on the bid sheet or only specific items in consideration of this solicitation.

Prices offared on the bid sheet shall be all inclusive of fees including administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping or transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-

fee, otc.) to deliver services or items to the required location.

“++THE QUANTITIES REQUESTED ARE ANNUAL ESTIMATES*****

NOTICE TO BIDDERS: PLEASE INSERT UNIT PRICE AND ALLOW FORMULAS TO CALCULATE PRIOR TO PRINTING BiD SHEET.

LCEAD EXTENDED |
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY. | UM | TIME | UNIT PRICE PRICE

Transformer, current, 600V, 10kV BIL, 60Hz, dry-type, outdoor, bushing, slip -over, dual core. Both cores shall be
20005, multi-ratio, C400, RF=2 at 30°C. The CT shall meet applicable requirements of the latest revision of IEEE
1C57.13. Each unit shall be provided with a nameplate.

The secondary terminals of the two cores shall be housed in either a single weather-proof enclosure or separate
weather-proof enclosures. If two enclosures are supplied, the enclosures must be positioned on the current transformer
adjacent to each other. A maximum of 1" separation allowed between enclosures.

4-5
The inside diameter shall be no less than 24 inches. The height shall be no more than 6 inches. The outside perimeter WEEKS
1 shall be round with less than a 34 inch diameter. No square corners allowed. 9 EA To 2250.23 20.252.07
Mounting hardware shall be supplied. The hardware shall consist of 4 (four) aluminum brackets connected to stainless- SHIP ' o
steel all thread rods and nuts. ARO
An aluminum ground shield shall be provided on the top surface of the unit. The shield shall be provided with a pad ?k‘\"t see
with 9/16" diameter holes for connection to the substation ground grid. ,L‘H-.d,‘u\
Technical specifications, dimensional drawings, mounting hardware drawings, and name plate drawings shall be vdte sh c.d’
supplied with the bid, as per Section 0400, Paragraph 8. Eoc ?h, Yiafe
Standard test reports and installation, Operating, and Maintenance manuals shall be suppled with the units, as per A wed d\
Section 0400, Paragraph 8. Q)&ULQ Yions
Includes a five (5) year warranty per Section 0400, Paragraph 11,
TOTAL BID $20,252.07
Section 0600
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SECTION 0600 - BID SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN
PURCHASING OFFICE
600V DRY-TYPE TRANSFORMERS

NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

ITEM NO. The City reserves the right to add additional items not specified above.

% MARKUP OVER MFG'S CONFIGURED PRICE

002 Bidders shall provide a percentage markup over their invoice. Reference 0400 Supplemental Purchase
Provisions Section 2 Pricing Requirements - Non-Specified Items.

17%

DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

DELIVERY METHOD: X COMMON CARRIER (FedEx, UPS) VENDOR DELIVERY
COMPANY NAME: SPECTRUM INDUSTRIES, INC. P
PRINTED NAME: MARIA SIMILI-CROTEAU ﬁ/k
7
EMAIL ADDRESS: meters ctrumind.com
Section 0600
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