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  Revised 07/2020 

IFB Disclaimer: The information contained on 
the following bid sheets are for information only 
and does not constitute actual award/execution 
of a contract. 

RFP/RFQS Disclaimer: The contents of a proposal shall 
remain confidential until a contract is awarded. This log of 
offers is for information purposes only and does not 
constitute actual award/execution of a contract. 

For more information, you may contact the Purchasing Office by: 
Phone – 512-974-2500 
Email – PurchInfo@austintexas.gov 
Physical Address – 124 W. 8th St., Third floor, Austin, TX 78701 
Hours of Operation – Monday-Friday 7:45 a.m. to 4:45 p.m. 

This certifies the response was received prior to the solicitation closing. 

mailto:PurchInfo@austintexas.gov
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ITEM 
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 
QUANTITY

UNIT OF
MEASURE

UNIT PRICE
EXTENDED

PRICE

1

Powdered Activated Carbon
Ullrich Water Treatment Plant
1000 Forest View Drive
Austin, TX 78746

MFG. Name:

370 tons $1,460.00 $540,200.00

2

Powdered Activated Carbon 
Davis Water Treatment Plant
3500 W. 35th Street
Austin, TX 78703

MFG. Name:

265 tons $1,500.00 $397,500.00

3

Powdered Activated Carbon
Handcox Water Treatment Plant 
6800 N. FM 620
Austin, TX 78732

MFG. Name: 

150 tons $1,460.00 $219,000.00

$1,156,700.00

ITEM 
NO.

UNIT OF MEASURE PRICE*

4 Per Truck
$34,000           *includes 

PAC and delivery

5 Discount from MSRP 0
__________% Discount

Delivery Method:

DELIVERY TERMS:  DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

Percentage discount off catalogue/price list of other items:  Indicate the discount from 
Manufacturer's Suggested Retail Price.

* Unless otherwise specified, Price may be quoted as a firm-fixed price or as a percentage discount from quoter's regular fees.

Printed Company Name: 

Additional Products or Catalog Items (FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSE - PRICING FOR THIS SECTION WILL NOT BE USED TO DETERMINE 
AWARD).  
Please provide any other products or catalog items you will provide the City and the prices you would charge.  This information will not be used in the 
evaluation of the quote and is for informational purposes only. There is no guarantee of purchase.

Please list any additional products or catalog items your Company offers and the associated discount off retail price or mark-up to cost for the listed 
products or catalog items. A quote of zero ('0') will be interpreted by the City that the additional products or catalog items will be sold at the Manufacturer's 
Suggested Retail Price.  A 'no quote' or blank entry will be interpreted by the City that your Company does not wish to provide additional products or 
catalog items. This information is for informational purposes only and will not be evaluated. The City does not guarantee the purchase of any additional 
products or catalog items.

PRICE SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN

POWDERED ACTIVATED CARBON

Special Instructions: Offerors must use this Bid Sheet to submit pricing.  The City intends to award to the lowest responsive bid.

Be advised that exceptions taken or qualifying statements made to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid and 
may result in disqualification of the bid. 

Prices being submitted shall include ALL discounts, handling and shipping charges, FOB Destination. 

A bid of '0' (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item.  A bid of 'no bid' will be 
interpreted by the City that the responder does not wish to bid on that item.

The quantities noted below are annual estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume.  The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed.  
Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical usage.  Actual purchases may be more or less.

DESCRIPTION OF OTHER SERVICES OR PRODUCTS

TOTAL

Solicitation: 

Flat Rate for Emergency Delivery - Shall be made within twenty-four (24) hours after receipt of 
order. The City may require partial deliveries from a single truckload to be made at more than one 
location (specified in Section 0400 Paragraph 5I).

Page 1



ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED

ANNUAL
QUANTITY

UNIT OF
MEASURE

UNIT PRICE
EXTENDED

PRICE

1

Powdered Activated Carbon
Ullrich Water Treatment Plant
1000 Forest View Drive
Austin, TX 78746

MFG. Name:

370 tons

2

Powdered Activated Carbon
Davis Water Treatment Plant
3500 W. 35th Street
Austin, TX 78703

MFG. Name:

265 tons

3

Powdered Activated Carbon
Handcox Water Treatment Plant
6800 N. FM 620
Austin, TX 78732

MFG. Name:

150 tons

ITEM
NO.

UNIT OF MEASURE PRICE*

4 Per Truck

5 Discount from MSRP
__________% Discount

PRICE SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN

POWDERED ACTIVATED CARBON

Special Instructions: Offerors must use this Bid Sheet to submit pricing. The City intends to award to the lowest responsive bid.

Be advised that exceptions taken or qualifying statements made to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid and
may result in disqualification of the bid.

Prices being submitted shall include ALL discounts, handling and shipping charges, FOB Destination.

A bid of '0' (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of 'no bid' will be
interpreted by the City that the responder does not wish to bid on that item.

The quantities noted below are annual estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed.
Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical usage. Actual purchases may be more or less.

DESCRIPTION OF OTHER SERVICES OR PRODUCTS

TOTAL

Solicitation:

Flat Rate for Emergency Delivery - Shall be made within twenty-four (24) hours after receipt of
order. The City may require partial deliveries from a single truckload to be made at more than one
location (specified in Section 0400 Paragraph 5I).

Delivery Method:

DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

Percentage discount off catalogue/price list of other items: Indicate the discount from
Manufacturer's Suggested Retail Price.

* Unless otherwise specified, Price may be quoted as a firm-fixed price or as a percentage discount from quoter's regular fees.

Printed Company Name:

Additional Products or Catalog Items (FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSE - PRICING FOR THIS SECTION WILL NOT BE USED TO DETERMINE
AWARD).
Please provide any other products or catalog items you will provide the City and the prices you would charge. This information will not be used in the
evaluation of the quote and is for informational purposes only. There is no guarantee of purchase.

Please list any additional products or catalog items your Company offers and the associated discount off retail price or mark-up to cost for the listed
products or catalog items. A quote of zero ('0') will be interpreted by the City that the additional products or catalog items will be sold at the Manufacturer's
Suggested Retail Price. A 'no quote' or blank entry will be interpreted by the City that your Company does not wish to provide additional products or
catalog items. This information is for informational purposes only and will not be evaluated. The City does not guarantee the purchase of any additional
products or catalog items.
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ADA Carbon Solutions (Red River), LLC

ADA Carbon Solutions (Red River), LLC

ADA Carbon Solutions (Red River), LLC

0

Bulk Trailer

IFB 2200 BYO1014 Powdered Activated Carbon
CarbPure Technologies, LLC

0% 

$810.00 per ton

$838.00 per ton

$810.00 per ton

$299,700.00

$222,070.00

$121,500.00

$643,270.00



ITEM 

NO.
ITEM DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF

MEASURE
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED

PRICE

1

Powdered Activated Carbon
Ullrich Water Treatment Plant

1000 Forest View Drive
Austin, TX 78746

MFG. Name:

370 tons

2

Powdered Activated Carbon 

Davis Water Treatment Plant

3500 W. 35th Street

Austin, TX 78703

MFG. Name:

265 tons

3

Powdered Activated Carbon

Handcox Water Treatment Plant 

6800 N. FM 620

Austin, TX 78732

MFG. Name: 

150 tons

ITEM 

NO.
UNIT OF MEASURE PRICE*

4 Per Truck

5 Discount from MSRP
__________% Discount

Delivery Method:

DELIVERY TERMS:  DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

Percentage discount off catalogue/price list of other items:  Indicate the discount from 

Manufacturer's Suggested Retail Price.

* Unless otherwise specified, Price may be quoted as a firm-fixed price or as a percentage discount from quoter's regular fees.

Printed Company Name: 

Additional Products or Catalog Items (FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSE - PRICING FOR THIS SECTION WILL NOT BE USED TO DETERMINE 

AWARD).  

Please provide any other products or catalog items you will provide the City and the prices you would charge.  This information will not be used in the 

evaluation of the quote and is for informational purposes only. There is no guarantee of purchase.

Please list any additional products or catalog items your Company offers and the associated discount off retail price or mark-up to cost for the listed 

products or catalog items. A quote of zero ('0') will be interpreted by the City that the additional products or catalog items will be sold at the 

Manufacturer's Suggested Retail Price.  A 'no quote' or blank entry will be interpreted by the City that your Company does not wish to provide additional 
products or catalog items. This information is for informational purposes only and will not be evaluated. The City does not guarantee the purchase of any 
additional products or catalog items.

PRICE SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN

POWDERED ACTIVATED CARBON

Special Instructions: Offerors must use this Bid Sheet to submit pricing.  The City intends to award to the lowest responsive bid.

Be advised that exceptions taken or qualifying statements made to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid and 

may result in disqualification of the bid. 

Prices being submitted shall include ALL discounts, handling and shipping charges, FOB Destination. 

A bid of '0' (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item.  A bid of 'no bid' will be 
interpreted by the City that the responder does not wish to bid on that item.

The quantities noted below are annual estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume.  The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities 
listed.  Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical usage.  Actual purchases may be more or less.

DESCRIPTION OF OTHER SERVICES OR PRODUCTS

TOTAL

Solicitation: 

Flat Rate for Emergency Delivery - Shall be made within twenty-four (24) hours after receipt of 

order. The City may require partial deliveries from a single truckload to be made at more than 
one location (specified in Section 0400 Paragraph 5I).
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Powdered Activated Carbon
Chemrite, Inc.

ADA Carbon

ADA Carbon

ADA Carbon

Bulk Pneumatic truck 

Aaron Opp      Vice President

$1500

N/A

$1017

$1017

$1017

$376,290

$269,505

$152,550

$798,345



ITEM 
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 
QUANTITY

UNIT OF
MEASURE

UNIT PRICE
EXTENDED

PRICE

1

Powdered Activated Carbon
Ullrich Water Treatment Plant
1000 Forest View Drive
Austin, TX 78746

MFG. Name:

370 tons $1,354.00 $500,980.00

2

Powdered Activated Carbon 
Davis Water Treatment Plant
3500 W. 35th Street
Austin, TX 78703

MFG. Name:

265 tons $1,354.00 $358,810.00

3

Powdered Activated Carbon
Handcox Water Treatment Plant 
6800 N. FM 620
Austin, TX 78732

MFG. Name: 

150 tons $1,354.00 $203,100.00

$1,062,890.00

ITEM 
NO.

UNIT OF MEASURE PRICE*

4 Per Truck $1,650.00

5 Discount from MSRP 0
__________% Discount

Delivery Method:

DELIVERY TERMS:  DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

Percentage discount off catalogue/price list of other items:  Indicate the discount from 
Manufacturer's Suggested Retail Price.

* Unless otherwise specified, Price may be quoted as a firm-fixed price or as a percentage discount from quoter's regular fees.

Printed Company Name: 

Additional Products or Catalog Items (FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSE - PRICING FOR THIS SECTION WILL NOT BE USED TO DETERMINE 
AWARD).  
Please provide any other products or catalog items you will provide the City and the prices you would charge.  This information will not be used in the 
evaluation of the quote and is for informational purposes only. There is no guarantee of purchase.

Please list any additional products or catalog items your Company offers and the associated discount off retail price or mark-up to cost for the listed 
products or catalog items. A quote of zero ('0') will be interpreted by the City that the additional products or catalog items will be sold at the Manufacturer's 
Suggested Retail Price.  A 'no quote' or blank entry will be interpreted by the City that your Company does not wish to provide additional products or 
catalog items. This information is for informational purposes only and will not be evaluated. The City does not guarantee the purchase of any additional 
products or catalog items.

PRICE SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN

POWDERED ACTIVATED CARBON

Special Instructions: Offerors must use this Bid Sheet to submit pricing.  The City intends to award to the lowest responsive bid.

Be advised that exceptions taken or qualifying statements made to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid and 
may result in disqualification of the bid. 

Prices being submitted shall include ALL discounts, handling and shipping charges, FOB Destination. 

A bid of '0' (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item.  A bid of 'no bid' will be 
interpreted by the City that the responder does not wish to bid on that item.

The quantities noted below are annual estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume.  The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed.  
Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical usage.  Actual purchases may be more or less.

DESCRIPTION OF OTHER SERVICES OR PRODUCTS

TOTAL

Solicitation: 

Flat Rate for Emergency Delivery - Shall be made within twenty-four (24) hours after receipt of 
order. The City may require partial deliveries from a single truckload to be made at more than one 
location (specified in Section 0400 Paragraph 5I).

Page 1



ITEM 
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 
QUANTITY

UNIT OF
MEASURE

UNIT PRICE
EXTENDED

PRICE

1

Powdered Activated Carbon
Ullrich Water Treatment Plant
1000 Forest View Drive
Austin, TX 78746

MFG. Name:

370 tons $1,090.00 $403,300.00

2

Powdered Activated Carbon 
Davis Water Treatment Plant
3500 W. 35th Street
Austin, TX 78703

MFG. Name:

265 tons $1,140.00 $302,100.00

3

Powdered Activated Carbon
Handcox Water Treatment Plant 
6800 N. FM 620
Austin, TX 78732

MFG. Name: 

150 tons $1,090.00 $163,500.00

$868,900.00

ITEM 
NO.

UNIT OF MEASURE PRICE*

4 Per Truck $30,000.00

5 Discount from MSRP
__________% Discount

PRICE SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN

POWDERED ACTIVATED CARBON

Special Instructions: Offerors must use this Bid Sheet to submit pricing.  The City intends to award to the lowest responsive bid.

Be advised that exceptions taken or qualifying statements made to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid and 
may result in disqualification of the bid. 

Prices being submitted shall include ALL discounts, handling and shipping charges, FOB Destination. 

A bid of '0' (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item.  A bid of 'no bid' will be 
interpreted by the City that the responder does not wish to bid on that item.

The quantities noted below are annual estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume.  The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed.  
Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical usage.  Actual purchases may be more or less.

DESCRIPTION OF OTHER SERVICES OR PRODUCTS

TOTAL

Solicitation: 

Flat Rate for Emergency Delivery - Shall be made within twenty-four (24) hours after receipt of 
order. The City may require partial deliveries from a single truckload to be made at more than one 
location (specified in Section 0400 Paragraph 5I).

Delivery Method:

DELIVERY TERMS:  DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

Percentage discount off catalogue/price list of other items:  Indicate the discount from 
Manufacturer's Suggested Retail Price.

* Unless otherwise specified, Price may be quoted as a firm-fixed price or as a percentage discount from quoter's regular fees.

Printed Company Name: 

Additional Products or Catalog Items (FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSE - PRICING FOR THIS SECTION WILL NOT BE USED TO DETERMINE 
AWARD).  
Please provide any other products or catalog items you will provide the City and the prices you would charge.  This information will not be used in the 
evaluation of the quote and is for informational purposes only. There is no guarantee of purchase.

Please list any additional products or catalog items your Company offers and the associated discount off retail price or mark-up to cost for the listed 
products or catalog items. A quote of zero ('0') will be interpreted by the City that the additional products or catalog items will be sold at the Manufacturer's 
Suggested Retail Price.  A 'no quote' or blank entry will be interpreted by the City that your Company does not wish to provide additional products or 
catalog items. This information is for informational purposes only and will not be evaluated. The City does not guarantee the purchase of any additional 
products or catalog items.

Carbon Activated Corp.

IFB 2200 BY01014

0

Pneumatic Tanker Trailer

Carbon Ativated Corp.  LPAC ‐
325

Carbon Activated Corp. LPAC ‐325

Carbon Activated Corp.  LPAC‐325
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