BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
INSPECTION AND TESTING OF STATIONARY CRANES

BID NO. ISR0013

ROM NO. 2200 15101900050

BUYER: Georgia Billela

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.
Vendor Name Royal Arc Welding Reinhart & Associates, Inc. Alltech Engineering Corp *
City, State Flat Rock, Ml Pflugerville, Tx Mendota Heights, MN
Cost for
Complete Cost for Cost for
Safety TOTAL FOR | Complete Safety TOTAL FOR | Complete Safety TOTAL FOR
Inspection | SafetyTests | EACH LINE Inspection SafetyTests | EACH LINE Inspection SafetyTests EACH LINE
Building Location #2 - Hornsby Bend Biosolids Facility, 2210 S. FM 973, Austin, TX
1 [Generator Building $ 12125(% 226.50 | $ 34775 | $ 400.00 No Bid $ 400.00 | $ 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
2 |FEB $ 111.25( % 216.50 | $ 32775 | $ 400.00 No Bid $ 400.00 | $ 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
3 |Non Potable Water Building $ 111.25($ 216.50 | $ 32775 | $ 700.00 No Bid $ 700.00 | $ 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
4 |Maintenance Shop $ 15125($% 256.50 | $ 407.75 | $ 1,100.00 No Bid $ 1,100.00 | $ 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
5 |Tool Room $ 121.25(% 226.50 | $ 347.75 | $ 350.00 No Bid $ 350.00|% 387.00 [ $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
6 |Tool Room $ 111.25( % 216.50 | $ 32775 | $ 350.00 No Bid $ 350.00(% 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
7 |Tool Room $ 91251 % 196.50 | $ 287.75 | $ 350.00 No Bid $ 350.00(% 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
8 |Chain Hoist $ 111.25($ 216.50 | $ 32775 | $ 350.00 No Bid $ 350.001|% 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
9 |Thickner $ 111.25($ 216.50 | $ 32775 | $ 1,100.00 No Bid $ 1,100.00 | $ 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
Total for Location| $ 3,029.75 Total for Location| $ 5,100.00 Total for Location| $ 10,836.00
Building Location #4 - Walnut Creek Wastewater Treatment Plant, 7113 E. MLK Blvd, Austin, TX
10 |Maintenance Shop $ 151.25(% 256.50 | $ 407.75 | $ 1,100.00 No Bid $ 1,100.00 | $ 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
11 |Maintenance Shop $ 91251 $ 19650 | $ 287.75 | $ 350.00 No Bid $ 350.00(% 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
12 [Operations Bldg $ 201.25(% 306.50 | $ 507.75 | $ 1,300.00 No Bid $ 1,300.00 | $ 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
13 [Chlorine Storage $ 11125(% 216.50 | $ 327.75 | $ 800.00 No Bid $ 800.001|$ 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
14 [SO2 Building $ 111.25(% 216.50 | $ 327.75 | $ 800.00 No Bid $ 800.00|% 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
15 |S02 Building $ 91251 % 196.50 | $ 287.75 | $ 300.00 No Bid $ 300.00 (% 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
16 |Operations Raw Wet Well $ 111.25( % 216.50 | $ 32775 | $ 550.00 No Bid $ 550.00(% 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
17 |Maintenance Shop/Tool Room $ 11125($% 216.50 | $ 32775 | $ 300.00 No Bid $ 300.00|$ 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
18 [HW2 | Beams $ 151.25($ 256.50 | $ 40775 | $ 350.00 No Bid $ 350.001| % 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
19 [Shop A-Frame $ 9125 1] % 19650 | 287.75 | $ 350.00 No Bid $ 350.00|% 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
20 [Tool room Chain falls $ 111.25( % 216.50 | $ 32775 | $ 300.00 No Bid $ 300.00 (% 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
Total for Location| $ 3,825.25 Total for Location| $ 6,500.00 Total for Location| $ 13,244.00
Building Location; #6 - #13 - Walnut Creek Wastewater Treatment Plant (Lift Stations) 7113 E. MLK Blvd, Austin, TX
Lake Creek
21 (8601 Parmer Lane $ 121.25(% 226.50 | $ 34775 | $ 800.00 No Bid $ 800.00($% 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
Boggy East
22 16611 Shelton Road $ 151.25(% 256.50 | $ 407.75 | $ 800.00 No Bid $ 800.00|% 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
Tracor Lift Station
23 |7001 FM 969 $ 151.25($ 256.50 | $ 40775 | $ 800.00 No Bid $ 800.00|$ 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
Four Points |
24 112118 Wilson Pk $ 111.25($ 216.50 | $ 32775 | $ 350.00 No Bid $ 350.001| % 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
Four Points Il
25 112117 Wilson Pk $ 11125( % 216.50 | $ 32775 | $ 350.00 No Bid $ 350.00(% 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00




BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
INSPECTION AND TESTING OF STATIONARY CRANES

BID NO. ISR0013

ROM NO. 2200 15101900050

BUYER: Georgia Billela

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may

eopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name Royal Arc Welding Reinhart & Associates, Inc. Alltech Engineering Corp *
City, State Flat Rock, Ml Pflugerville, Tx Mendota Heights, MN
Cost for
Complete Cost for Cost for
Safety TOTAL FOR | Complete Safety TOTAL FOR | Complete Safety TOTAL FOR
Inspection | SafetyTests | EACH LINE Inspection SafetyTests | EACH LINE Inspection SafetyTests EACH LINE
Rattan Creek
26 |2709 W. Parmer $ 11125($% 216.50 | $ 32775 | $ 350.00 No Bid $ 350.001|% 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
Great Hills
27 |9011 Spicebrush $ 11125($ 216.50 | $ 32775 | $ 350.00 No Bid $ 350.00] % 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
Total for Location| $ 2,474.25 Total for Location| $ 3,800.00 Total for Location| $ 8,428.00
Building Location #14 - #21 - SOUTH Pumping Stations & Reservior Maintenance Division; South Service Center 3616 S. 1st. Street Austin, TX
28 |744 Slaughter Lane Pump Stn $ 20125(% 306.50 | $ 507.75 | $ 1,300.00 No Bid $ 1,300.00 | $ 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
29 |2901 Davis Lane Pump Stn $ 201.25(% 306.50 | $ 507.75 | $ 1,300.00 No Bid $ 1,300.00 | $ 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
Leuthan Lane Pump Stn
30 |5827 Y2 Terravista Drive $ 11125(% 216.50 | $ 32775 | $ 350.00 No Bid $ 350.001|% 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
Leuthan Lane Pump Stn
31 5827 ¥ Terravista Drive $ 11125($ 216.50 | $ 32775 | $ 800.00 No Bid $ 800.00|$ 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
Neverbend Pump Stn
32 |2400 Neverbend Cove $ 11125($ 216.50 | $ 327.75 | $ 800.00 No Bid $ 800.00 | $ 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
Thomas Springs Res
33 |8005 Thomas Springs Road $ 11125|% 216.50 | $ 327.75 | $ 800.00 No Bid $ 800.00| % 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
Camp Ben Pump Stn,
34 111100 Y2 FM 1826 $ 11125($% 216.50 | $ 32775 | $ 400.00 No Bid $ 400.00 | $ 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
Pilot Knop Station
35 (1800 1/2 Colton Bluff Spring Road $ 15125(% 256.50 | $ 407.75 | $ 900.00 No Bid $ 900.00 | $ 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
Barclay Pump Station
36 |1702 Barclay Drive $ 11125($ 216.50 | $ 327.75 | $ 500.00 No Bid $ 500.00|$ 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
Allen Road Pump Station
37 |1307 Allen Road $ 11125(% 216.50 | $ 32775 | $ 700.00 No Bid $ 700.00 | $ 387.00 | $ 817.00 | $ 1,204.00
Total for Location| $ 3,717.50 Total for Location| $ 7,850.00 Total for Location| $ 12,040.00
INCLUDE THE FOLLOWING COSTS
Road Service (includes transportation
38 |and travel time for 1 technician) $ 0.575 |Price Per Mile $ 2.00 |Price Per Mile $ 3.00 |Price Per Mile
Road Service (includes transportation
39 |and travel time for 2 technicians) $ 1.15 |Price Per Mile $ 3.00 |Price Per Mile $ 6.00 |Price Per Mile
Road Service (includes transportation,
equipment to dielectic test bucket liners,
40 |and travel time for 1 technician) $ 0.575 |Price Per Mile No Bid Price Per Mile $ 8.00 |Price Per Mile
Road Service (includes transportation,
equipment to dielectic test bucket liners,
41 |and travel time for 2 technicians) $ 1.15 |Price Per Mile No Bid Price Per Mile $ 12.00 [Price Per Mile




INSPECTION AND TESTING OF STATIONARY CRANES

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

BID NO. ISR0013
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Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.
Vendor Name Royal Arc Welding Reinhart & Associates, Inc. Alltech Engineering Corp *
City, State Flat Rock, Ml Pflugerville, Tx Mendota Heights, MN
Cost for
Complete Cost for Cost for
Safety TOTAL FOR | Complete Safety TOTAL FOR | Complete Safety TOTAL FOR
Inspection | SafetyTests | EACH LINE Inspection SafetyTests | EACH LINE Inspection SafetyTests EACH LINE
Any requested additional maintenance or
42 |repairs $ 60.00 |Price Per Hour No Bid Price Per Hour $ 65.00 |Price Per Hour
ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
ANNUAL ANNUAL ANNUAL
EQUIPMENT RENTAL AMOUNT PERCENTAGE AMOUNT PERCENTAGE AMOUNT PERCENTAGE
% Mark up to cost for third party
equipment rentals as indicated in section
3.2.4 and 3.2.4i - 3.2.4iv of scope of
43 |work $500.00 10% $700.00 10% $500.00 10%

* Deemed Non-Responsive

Prepared By: Stephanie Hollanders

Approved By: Georgia Billela




