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6/14/2016

Joshua Pace

ITEM
EST 

QTY
UNIT UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE

1 28 EA No Bid No Bid $184.18 $5,157.04 $190.00 $5,320.00 $550.00 $15,400.00 $313.00 $8,764.00

2 20 EA No Bid No Bid $243.62 $4,872.40 $252.00 $5,040.00 $711.70 $14,234.00 $414.00 $8,280.00

3 2 EA No Bid No Bid $740.52 $1,481.04 $742.00 $1,484.00 $1,162.70 $2,325.40 $1,219.00 $2,438.00

4 2 EA $630.93 $1,261.86 $676.65 $1,353.30 $665.99 $1,331.98 $660.00 $1,320.00 $1,810.00 $3,620.00

5 3 EA $630.93 $1,892.79 $676.65 $2,029.95 $665.99 $1,997.97 $660.00 $1,980.00 $1,810.00 $5,430.00

6 2 EA $778.74 $1,557.48 $831.05 $1,662.10 $882.00 $1,764.00 $814.00 $1,628.00 $2,223.00 $4,446.00

7 2 EA $835.71 $1,671.42 $899.65 $1,799.30 $882.00 $1,764.00 $873.40 $1,746.80 $2,406.00 $4,812.00

8 8 EA $234.51 $1,876.08 $269.20 $2,153.60 $222.99 $1,783.92 $243.10 $1,944.80 $640.00 $5,120.00

9 45 EA $68.64 $3,088.80 $76.74 $3,453.30 $56.69 $2,551.05 $71.50 $3,217.50 $166.00 $7,470.00

10 4 EA No Bid No Bid $317.75 $1,271.00 $299.99 $1,199.96 $400.40 $1,601.60 $287.00 $1,148.00

Hutto, TX

Techline Pipe

BID TABULATION

CITY OF AUSTIN

CONTRACT FOR DUCTILE IRON PIPE FITTINGS & PIPE JOINT RESTRAINTS

Bid No.

RX No.

Date

Buyer

SLEEVE CI CUTTING-IN OVERSIZE, 

MECH JT X PLAIN END 8 INCH (DUAL 

PURPOSE)  IN ACCORDANCE WITH 

SPL NO. WW-27B  CITY STOCK 

NUMBER 890-49-315-003

SLEEVE CI CUTTING-IN OVERSIZE, 

MECH JT X PLAIN END 12 INCH (DUAL 

PURPOSE) IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL 

NO. WW-27B CITY STOCK NUMBER 890-

49-315-004

KLP Commercial LLC

Pflugerville, TX

HD Supply Waterworks

PIPE JOINT RESTRAINT FOR PVC PIPE 

MJ GLANDS 12 INCH (PVC MEGALUG) 

IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-

27A.  CITY STOCK NUMBER 659-44-902-

004 

HYD PT OFFSET GRADE 6 X 6 X 12 

WITH SWIVEL GLAND, STAR PIPE # 

GRADELOK 06 OR BUYER APPROVED 

EQUAL CITY STOCK NUMBER 340-60-

141-001

Round Rock, TX

SLEEVE CI MECH JT TAPPING 6 X 4 

INCH IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. 

WW-243 CITY STOCK NUMBER 890-49-

285-002                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        

SLEEVE CI MECH JT TAPPING 6 X 6 

INCH IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. 

WW-243 CITY STOCK NUMBER 890-49-

285-003

ACT Pipe & Supply

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Pflugerville, TX

Ferguson Waterworks

Georgetown, TX

SLEEVE CI CUTTING-IN OVERSIZE, 

MECH JT X PLAIN END 6 INCH (DUAL 

PURPOSE) IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL 

NO. WW-27B CITY STOCK NUMBER 890-

49-315-002

SLEEVE CI MECH JT TAPPING 8 X 6 

INCH IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. 

WW-243 CITY STOCK NUMBER 890-49-

285-005

SLEEVE CI MECH JT TAPPING 8 X 8 

INCH IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. 

WW-243 CITY STOCK NUMBER 890-49-

285-006

PIPE JOINT RESTRAINT FOR D.I. PIPE 

MJ GLANDS 24 INCH (MEGALUG) IN 

ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27A 

CITY STOCK NUMBER 659-44-901-008
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Joshua Pace
Hutto, TX

Techline Pipe

BID TABULATION

CITY OF AUSTIN

CONTRACT FOR DUCTILE IRON PIPE FITTINGS & PIPE JOINT RESTRAINTS

Bid No.

RX No.

Date

Buyer

KLP Commercial LLC

Pflugerville, TX

HD Supply Waterworks

Round Rock, TX

ACT Pipe & Supply

Pflugerville, TX

Ferguson Waterworks

Georgetown, TX

11 200 EA $1.35 $270.00 $0.91 $182.00 $0.89 $178.00 $4.40 $880.00 $2.00 $400.00

12 100 EA $1.57 $157.00 $1.11 $111.00 $0.95 $95.00 $5.50 $550.00 $2.00 $200.00

13 10 EA $89.96 $899.60 $101.20 $1,012.00 $93.99 $939.90 $106.70 $1,067.00 $156.00 $1,560.00

14 100 EA $14.62 $1,462.00 $15.86 $1,586.00 $16.50 $1,650.00 $17.09 $1,709.00 $33.00 $3,300.00

15 2,000 EA $12.88 $25,760.00 $10.64 $21,280.00 $11.60 $23,200.00 $11.53 $23,060.00 $26.00 $52,000.00

16 100 EA $17.17 $1,717.00 $14.27 $1,427.00 $14.88 $1,488.00 $15.38 $1,538.00 $34.00 $3,400.00

17 100 EA $28.33 $2,833.00 $23.54 $2,354.00 $24.10 $2,410.00 $25.38 $2,538.00 $57.00 $5,700.00

18 20 EA $33.32 $666.40 $27.98 $559.60 $31.45 $629.00 $29.85 $597.00 $67.00 $1,340.00

19 40 EA $40.57 $1,622.80 $34.07 $1,362.80 $33.72 $1,348.80 $36.36 $1,454.40 $82.00 $3,280.00

20 20 EA $46.97 $939.40 $39.44 $788.80 $41.72 $834.40 $42.09 $841.80 $95.00 $1,900.00

21 20 EA $55.56 $1,111.20 $46.65 $933.00 $54.15 $1,083.00 $49.78 $995.60 $114.00 $2,280.00

PIPE, CI PRESSURE TYTON DUCTILE 

16 INCH, CLASS 250 IN ACCORDANCE 

WITH SPL. NO. WW-27  CITY STOCK 

NUMBER 890-49-100-006

PIPE, CI PRESSURE TYTON DUCTILE 

18 INCH, CLASS 250 IN ACCORDANCE 

WITH SPL. NO. WW-27 CITY STOCK 

NUMBER 890-49-100-009

PIPE, CI PRESSURE TYTON 

DUCTILE 20 INCH, CLASS 250 IN 

ACCORDANCE WITH SPL. NO. WW-

27 CITY STOCK NUMBER 658-46-

421-001

PIPE, CI PRESSURE TYTON DUCTILE 4 

INCH, CLASS 350 IN ACCORDANCE 

WITH SPL. NO. WW-27 CITY STOCK 

NUMBER 890-49-100-007                                                          

PIPE, CI PRESSURE TYTON DUCTILE 6 

INCH, CLASS 350 IN ACCORDANCE 

WITH SPL. NO. WW-27 CITY STOCK 

NUMBER 890-49-100-001

PIPE, CI PRESSURE TYTON DUCTILE 8 

INCH, CLASS 350 IN ACCORDANCE 

WITH SPL. NO. WW-27 CITY STOCK 

NUMBER 890-49-100-002

PIPE, CI PRESSURE TYTON DUCTILE 

14 INCH, CLASS 250 IN ACCORDANCE 

WITH SPL. NO. WW-27 CITY STOCK 

NUMBER 890-49-100-008

BOLT T-HEAD COURSE THREAD 3/4 

INCH X 4 INCH, TYLER PIPE: T-HEAD 

COR-TEN (LOW ALLOY STEEL) BOLTS 

AND NUTS OR BUYER APPROVED 

EQUAL CITY STOCK NUMBER 320-20-

112-001

BOLT T-HEAD COURSE THREAD 3/4 

INCH X 5 INCH, TYLER PIPE:  T-HEAD 

COR-TEN (LOW ALLOY STEEL) BOLTS 

AND NUTS OR BUYER APPROVED 

EQUAL CITY STOCK NUMBER 320-20-

941-001

PIPE, CI PRESSURE TYTON DUCTILE 

12 INCH, CLASS 350  IN ACCORDANCE 

WITH SPL. NO. WW-27  CITY STOCK 

NUMBER 890-49-100-003

TEE CI MECH JT 8 X 8 X 6 INCHS 

SWIVEL GLAND MJ IN ACCORDANCE 

WITH SPL NO. WW-27B CITY STOCK 

NUMBER 890-49-290-011
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15100800021

6/14/2016

Joshua Pace
Hutto, TX

Techline Pipe

BID TABULATION

CITY OF AUSTIN

CONTRACT FOR DUCTILE IRON PIPE FITTINGS & PIPE JOINT RESTRAINTS

Bid No.

RX No.

Date

Buyer

KLP Commercial LLC

Pflugerville, TX

HD Supply Waterworks

Round Rock, TX

ACT Pipe & Supply

Pflugerville, TX

Ferguson Waterworks

Georgetown, TX

22 20 EA $75.50 $1,510.00 $63.43 $1,268.60 $61.50 $1,230.00 $67.68 $1,353.60 $151.00 $3,020.00

23 20 EA $146.54 $2,930.80 $143.88 $2,877.60 $136.39 $2,727.80 $153.52 $3,070.40 No Bid No Bid

24 400 EA $3.53 $1,412.00 $2.91 $1,164.00 $2.75 $1,100.00 $13.20 $5,280.00 $4.00 $1,600.00

25 50 EA $91.03 $4,551.50 $102.40 $5,120.00 $94.59 $4,729.50 $107.80 $5,390.00 $158.00 $7,900.00

26 10 EA $177.55 $1,775.50 $198.66 $1,986.60 $161.99 $1,619.90 $183.70 $1,837.00 $470.00 $4,700.00

27 6 EA $71.83 $430.98 $80.80 $484.80 $75.59 $453.54 $84.70 $508.20 $125.00 $750.00

28 3 EA $1,720.88 $5,162.64 $1,746.15 $5,238.45 $1,720.00 $5,160.00 $1,703.90 $5,111.70 $4,670.00 $14,010.00

$74,969.28 $75,113.72 $103,179.80 $158,868.00

Approved By:  Joshua Pace

TOTAL BID

TEE CI MECH JT 6" X 6"X 6" SWIVEL 

GLAND MJ IN ACCORDANCE WITH 

SPL NO. WW-243 CITY STOCK 

NUMBER 659-85-212-005

SLEEVE CI MECH JT TAPPING 12 X 

8 INCH IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL 

NO. WW-243 CITY STOCK NUMBER 

890-49-285-012

PIPE, CI PRESSURE TYTON 

DUCTILE 24 INCH, CLASS 250 IN 

ACCORDANCE WITH SPL. NO. WW-

27 CITY STOCK NUMBER 890-49-

100-004

PIPE, CI PRESSURE TYTON 

DUCTILE 36 INCH, CLASS 250 IN 

ACCORDANCE WITH SPL. NO. WW-

27 CITY STOCK NUMBER 658-46-

421-002

PIPE JOINT RESTRAINT FOR D.I. 

PIPE MJ GLANDS 20 INCH IN 

ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-

27A CITY STOCK NUMBER 659-44-

901-013

Prepared by:  Stephanie Hollanders

BOLT T-HEAD CT, ANTI-ROTATION 

3/4 IN X 5 IN BOLTS AND NUTS OR 

BUYER APPROVED EQUAL CITY 

STOCK NUMBER 670-52-102-002

COUPLING DI ANCHOR 8" X 12" MJ 

SOLID X MJ SWIVEL GLAND IN 

ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-

27A CITY STOCK NUMBER 659-33-

200-001

$66,560.25
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