The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
CONTRACT FOR
LAB CHEMICALS AND SUPPLIES

BID NO. JXP0118
RXNO. 16072000582
DATE: 8/23/2016
BUYER:  Joshua Pace

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name Fox Scientific VWR International LLI.C Government Scientific ExpoTech
City, State Alvarado, TX Suwanee, GA Reston, VA Houston, TX
MBE/WBE
TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION ESTQTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE, UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
BUFFER, PH 7, YELLOW 500 mL
Brand/Manufacturer: Aqua Individual
1 Solutions, Manufacturer Cat. # 1500- 150 Unit $7.57 $1,135.50 $5.68 $852.00 $8.10 $1,215.00 $10.00 $1,500.00
500ML
BUFFER, PH10, BLUE 500 mL
Brand/Manufacturer: Aqua Individual
2 Solutions, Manufacturer Cat. # 1525- 125 Unit $7.57 $946.25 $5.68 $710.00 $8.10 $1,012.50 $10.00 $1,250.00
500ML
BUFFER SOLUTION, PHO9,
COLORLESS, 500 mL Individual
3 Brand/Manufacturer: RICCA, 240 Unit $7.23 $1,735.20 $7.50 $1,800.00 $23.77 $5,704.80 $20.84 $5,001.60
Manufacturer Cat. # R1590000-500A
DICHLOROMETHANE
W/CYCLOHEXENE 4L Individual . .
4 Brand/Manufacturer: Burdick & 20 Unit No Bid No Bid $41.33 $826.60 $64.27 $1,285.40 $143.75 $2,875.00
Jackson, Manufacturer Cat. # 300-4
NITRIC ACID, PLASMA PURE,
2.5L Individual
i i . 1,002.1 . . 112. 1,120.
5 Brand/Manufacturer: SCP Science, 10 Unit No Bid No Bid $100.21 $1,002.10 $84.78 $847.80 $ 00 $1,120.00
Manufacturer Cat. # 250-038-175
SODIUM SULFATE, BAR, PEST
2.5KG ..
Individual . .
6 Brand/Manufacturer: Avantor 12 Unit No Bid No Bid $82.11 $985.32 $88.30 $1,059.60 $325.00 $3,900.00
Performance Materials, Manufacturer
Cat. #3375-05
METHANOL, A.C.S. REAGENT, 4
7 X 4L 20 Individual No Bid No Bid $68.10 $1,362.00 $68.84 $1,376.80 $190.00 $3,800.00
Brand/Manufacturer: J.T. Baker, Unit o © ’ T ’ S ' U
Manufacturer Cat. # 9070-33
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
CONTRACT FOR
LAB CHEMICALS AND SUPPLIES

BID NO. JXP0118
RXNO. 16072000582
DATE: 8/23/2016
BUYER:  Joshua Pace

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name Fox Scientific VWR International LI.C Government Scientific ExpoTech
City, State Alvarado, TX Suwanee, GA Reston, VA Houston, TX
MBE/WBE
TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION EST QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE, UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
POTASSIUM IODIDE, RE CS-
4X2, 5 KG Brand/Manufacturer: Individual . .
8 EMD Millipore, Manufacturer Cat. 12 Unit No Bid No Bid $389.91 $4,678.92 $376.81 $4,521.72 $475.00 $5,700.00
#PX1505-5
HEXANE OMNISOLYV 4L
9 Brand/Manufacturer: EMD o |tedividuall Qg No Bid $60.85 $730.20 §94.54 $1,134.48 $137.50 $1,650.00
Millipore, Manufacturer Cat. Unit
#HX0296-1
SODIUM SULFATE
ANHYDROUS 2.5KG Individual
10 Brand/Manufacturer: Avantor Perf 12 natvidua No Bid No Bid $71.58 $858.96 $69.23 $830.76 $142.50 $1,710.00
Unit
Mat - Macron Lab, Manufacturer Cat.
#8024-06
AMMONIUM HYDROXIDE,
REAG 6 X 2.5L Individual . .
11 Brand/Manufacturer: |.T. Baker, 18 Unit No Bid No Bid $42.09 $757.62 $40.97 $737.46 $68.34 $1,230.12
Manufacturer Cat. # 9721-33
POTASS PHOSPHATE, MONCS- Individual
12 4X500GM Brand/Manufacturer: J.T. 16 UV itua No Bid No Bid $56.68 $906.88 $55.04 $880.64 $95.00 $1,520.00
Baker, Manufacturer Cat. # 3246-1 n
SULFAMIC ACID 500GM
Brand/Manufacturer: EMD Individual . .
13 Millipore, Manufacturer Cat. # 5 Unit No Bid No Bid $105.78 $528.90 $109.48 $547.40 $130.00 $650.00
SX1140-3
SULFURIC ACID 0.IN TITRSTR
1L ..
Individual . .
14 Brand/Manufacturer: EMD 15 ) No Bid No Bid $15.15 $227.25 $120.19 $1,802.85 $75.00 $1,125.00
- Unit
Millipore, Manufacturer Cat. #
SX1243G-6
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
CONTRACT FOR
LAB CHEMICALS AND SUPPLIES

BID NO. JXP0118

RX NO.
DATE:

16072000582
8/23/2016

BUYER: Joshua Pace

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name Fox Scientific VWR International LI.C Government Scientific ExpoTech
City, State Alvarado, TX Suwanee, GA Reston, VA Houston, TX
MBE/WBE
TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
ITEM NO. TEM DESCRIPTION ESTQTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNITPRICE | o Co
SILVER SULFATE, REAG PWD
25GM .
Individual . .
15 Brand/Manufacturer: EMD 5 , No Bid No Bid $127.29 $636.45 $130.42 $652.10 $190.00 $950.00
e Unit
Millipore, Manufacturer Cat. #
SX0210-2
HYDROCHLORIC ACID,
OMNITR, 2.51. Individuad
16 Brand/Manufacturer: EMD 5 nevidua No Bid No Bid $77.04 $385.20 $87.57 $437.85 $175.00 $875.00
e Unit
Millipore, Manufacturer Cat. #
HX0607-2
N, N-DIETHYL-P-PHENYL
OXAL 25G Individual . .
17 Brand,/ Manufacturer: T, Baker, 30 Unie No Bid No Bid $264.45 $7,933.50 $262.40 $7.872.00 $365.00 $10,950.00
Manufacturer Cat. # H916-03
STANNOUS CHLORIDE REA
18 4X500GM Brand/Manufacturer: 8 Individual | - T No Bid $181.56 $1,452.48 $174.78 $1,398.24 $300.00 $2.400.00
Avantor Performance Materials, Unit
Manufacturer Cat. # 3980-01
ENTEROPLURI TEST Individual
19 Brand/Manufacturer: BD, 300 n UV itua $14.01 $4.203.00 $13.01 $3,903.00 $12.17 $3,651.00 $15.20 $4.560.00
Manufacturer Cat. # 215336 n
SODIUM HYDROXIDE, N.F. 2.5
20 KG Brand/Manufacturer: EMD 5 Individual | - "1 No Bid $55.94 $279.70 $75.57 $377.85 $130.00 $650.00
Millipore, Manufacturer Cat. # Unit
SX0590-3
et A\ ek $8,019.95 $30,817.08 $37,346.25 $53.416.72
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
CONTRACT FOR
LAB CHEMICALS AND SUPPLIES

BID NO. JXP0118
RXNO. 16072000582
DATE: 8/23/2016
BUYER:  Joshua Pace

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name Fox Scientific VWR International LLI.C Government Scientific ExpoTech
City, State Alvarado, TX Suwanee, GA Reston, VA Houston, TX
MBE/WBE
TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION ESTQTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE, UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
SULFAMIC ACID, POWDER
PILLOWS, 300 mL
VWR Cat. # 97026-174 Individual
21 Fquivalent Manufacturer Name and 1,000 Unit $0.38 $380.00 $0.33 $330.00 $0.30 $300.00 $0.40 $400.00
Part #
VIAL COD DIGESTION High
Range
VWR Cat. # 97009-590 .
Individual
22 4,500 . $0.79 $3,555.00 $1.42 $6,390.00 $1.45 $6,525.00 $1.80 $8,100.00
. Unit
Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part #
REAGENT ALKLINE IODIDE-
AZIDE POWDER PILLOWS
VWR Cat. # 97026-268 Individual
23 1,000 v . “ $0.34 $341.00 $0.30 $300.00 $0.28 $280.00 $0.98 $983.00
. Unit
Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part #
FLUORIDE AD]J PP 25 mL
VWR Cat. # 97021-786
Individual
2 1,2 . . . ) . . 1.01 1,212.
4 Equivalent Manufacturer Name and 200 Unit $0.66 $795.60 $0.57 $684.00 $0.54 $648.00 $1.0 $1, 00
Part #
BUFFER BOD POWDER 0.5 ml.
VWR Cat. # 97026-674
Individual
2 2 2 . 2 ) 22 . .92 1 .
> Equivalent Manufacturer Name and 000 Unit $0.27 $540.00 $0.24 $480.00 $0 $440.00 $0.9 $1,840.00
Part #
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID NO. JXP0118

RX NO.
DATE:

16072000582
8/23/2016

BUYER: Joshua Pace

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
CONTRACT FOR
LAB CHEMICALS AND SUPPLIES

Vendor Name Fox Scientific VWR International LLI.C Government Scientific ExpoTech
City, State Alvarado, TX Suwanee, GA Reston, VA Houston, TX
MBE/WBE
TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION ESTQTY | UNIT UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE, UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
MANGANOUS SULFATE
POWDER PILLOWS
VWR Cat. # 97026-680 Individual
26 750 vied $0.35 $263.25 $0.31 $232.50 $0.29 $217.50 $0.88 $660.00
. Unit
Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part #
S 5 Sk $5,874.85 $8,416.50 $8,410.50 $13,195.00
DISH, PETRI DISPOSABLE,
STERILE CS-500 60X15MM Individual
27 Manufacturer: BD, Manufacturer Cat. 10,000 Unit $0.33 $3,330.00 $0.29 $2,900.00 $0.27 $2,700.00 $0.35 $3,500.00
# 351007
FILT MEMB PK1000 0.45UM
-6 Autocl 1 Individual
pg  |47MM, GN-6 Autoclavable - 100,000 | Mndividua $0.60 $60,000.00 $0.36 $36,000.00 $0.57 $57,000.00 $0.58 $57,500.00
Manufacturer: Pall Laboratories, Unit
Manufacturer Cat. # 66068
ELECTRODE, AMMONIA GAS
SENS BNC Orion 9512HPBNWP Individual
29 Manufacturer: Orion -Thermo Fisher 2 U‘;itu $581.83 $1,163.66 $681.19 $1,362.38 $601.88 $1,203.76 $580.00 $1,160.00
Scientific, Manufacturer Cat. #
9512HPBNWP
Syringe Filters, 25mm, Nylon
M . 12 Individual
30 embranc, 0.45 m CS128 2000 | Individua $2.52 $5,044.00 $1.77 $3,540.00 $1.97 $3,940.00 $2.01 $4,020.00
Manufacturer: Pall Laboratories, Unit
Manufacturer Cat. # 4502
Environmental Express Double
Weight Filters for TSS (47mm) Individual
31 Manufacturer: Environmental 1,200 Uzlitua $1.17 $1,404.00 $1.27 $1,524.00 $1.37 $1,644.00 No Bid No Bid
Express, Manufacturer Cat. #
F93447TMM-X
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
CONTRACT FOR
LAB CHEMICALS AND SUPPLIES

BID NO. JXP0118
RXNO. 16072000582
DATE: 8/23/2016
BUYER:  Joshua Pace

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name Fox Scientific VWR International LI.C Government Scientific ExpoTech
City, State Alvarado, TX Suwanee, GA Reston, VA Houston, TX
MBE/WBE
TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION ESTQTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
Environmental Express ProWeigh
Double Weigh TSS/VSS Filters
32 (47MM) . 1,200 IndlvlFlual $1.76 $2,114.40 $1.29 $1,548.00 $1.49 $1,788.00 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Environmental Unit
Express, Manufacturer Cat. #
F93447VOL-X
Environmental Express ProWeigh
Original (Single Weigh) TSS/VSS
il M Individual
33 |Pilters GMM) 1200 |Individua $1.31 $1,573.20 $0.93 $1,116.00 $1.07 $1,284.00 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Environmental Unit
Express, Manufacturer Cat. #
F93447VOL
Loose membranes for Orion
Ammonia Jon Selective Electrodes Individual
34 Manufacturer: Orion- Thermo Fisher 100 viad $5.24 $524.40 $5.84 $584.00 $5.37 $537.00 $5.95 $595.00
.. Unit
Scientific, Manufacturer Cat. #
951204
Loose membranes for Orion
Ammonia Jon Selective Electrodes Individual
35 Manufacturer: Orion- Thermo Fisher 100 v . ua $5.32 $532.40 $5.19 $519.00 $5.45 $545.00 $5.70 $570.00
.. Unit
Scientific, Manufacturer Cat. #
951214
Hach Sample Cells, Round Glass, 10 Individual
36 mlL  Manufacturer: Hach, 30 n U‘;itua $6.60 $198.00 $5.30 $159.00 $4.90 $147.00 $11.33 $339.99
Manufacturer Cat. # 2427606
Section C Subtotal: $75,884.06 $49,252.38 $70,788.76 $67,684.99
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
CONTRACT FOR
LAB CHEMICALS AND SUPPLIES

BID NO. JXP0118
RX'NO. 16072000582
DATE:  8/23/2016
BUYER:  Joshua Pace
Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name Fox Scientific VWR International LI.C

Government Scientific

ExpoTech

City, State Alvarado, TX Suwanee, GA

Reston, VA

Houston, TX

MBE/WBE

TOTAL
PRICE

TOTAL

PRICE UNIT PRICE

UNIT | UNIT PRICE

ITEM NO. EST QTY

ITEM DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

BURET-AUTO SELF ZEROING,
CLASS A CERT 25 ML
VWR Cat. # 89001-634 or equivalent
37 5 EA
Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part

$204.85 $1,024.25

$248.99 $1,244.95

No.

$179.27

$896.35

$240.00

$1,200.00

100 mL, CLASS A, Volumetric
Pipets
VWR Cat. # 89003-368 or
equivalent

24 EA $40.17 $964.03 $29.93 $718.32

38

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part
No.

$26.91

$645.84

$31.67

$760.01

500 mL, wide-mouth HDPE bottles

VWR Cat. # 89095-043 or equivalent

1 EA

5 Equivalent Manufacturer Name and 440
Part

$1.04 $1,497.60 $1.27 $1,828.80

No.

$1.70

$2,448.00

$1.81

$2,600.64
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
CONTRACT FOR
LAB CHEMICALS AND SUPPLIES

BID NO. JXP0118
RX'NO. 16072000582
DATE:  8/23/2016
BUYER:  Joshua Pace
Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name Fox Scientific VWR International LI.C

Government Scientific

ExpoTech

City, State Alvarado, TX Suwanee, GA

Reston, VA

Houston, TX

MBE/WBE

TOTAL
PRICE

TOTAL

PRICE UNIT PRICE

ITEM NO. ESTQTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE

ITEM DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE PRICE

Sterile polypropylene container used
to test for coliforms
VWR Cat. # 46610-592 or equivalent
40 5,600 EA
Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part

$0.28 $1,568.00 $0.33 $1,848.00

No.

$0.27

$1,512.00

$0.63 $3,500.00

Half-gallon/2000 mL. HDPE jugs
QEC Cat. # 621M-0064 or
equivalent
41 1,080 EA
Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part

$0.48 $518.40 $1.67 $1,803.60

No.

$1.36

$1,468.80

No Bid No Bid

50 mL polypropylene disposable
digestion tubes for metals analyses.
Includes leak free polyethylene screw
caps with no metallic additives

42 SCP Cat. # 010-500-263 or 12,000 EA

equivalent

$0.30 $3,564.00 $0.22 $2,640.00

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part
No.

$0.20

$2,400.00

No Bid No Bid
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract

RX NO.
DATE:
BUYER:

BID NO. JXP0118

16072000582
8/23/2016

Joshua Pace

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
CONTRACT FOR

LAB CHEMICALS AND SUPPLIES

Fox Scientific

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.
Vendor Name

City, State

Alvarado, TX

VWR International LI.C

Government Scientific

ExpoTech

MBE/WBE

Suwanee, GA

Reston, VA

ITEM NO.

Houston, TX

ITEM DESCRIPTION

EST QTY

UNIT

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT PRICE

UNIT PRICE TOTAL

43

Sterling Nitrile Exam Gloves,
Kimberly-Clark, size MEDIUM;
Powder-free, latex-free

VWR Cat # 89140-820 or equivalent

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and

Part
No.

10,000

EA

$0.05

$500.00

$0.09

$900.00

$0.88 $8,800.00

PRICE

$0.19 $1,900.00

44

VWR Cat. # 89166-211 or equivalent

Lavender Nitrile Exam Gloves,
Kimberly-Clatk, size LARGE,;
Powder-free, latex-free Nonsterile.
Thickness: 2.8mil (finger), 2mil
(palm), 1.6mil (cuff). AQL 1.5.

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and

Part
No.

12,500

EA

$937.50

$0.08

$1,000.00

$0.72 $9,000.00

$0.15 $1,850.00

45

Density Polyethylene, Wide Mouth,

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and

No.

VWR Large Sample Bottle, High

2L
VWR Cat. # 414004-205 or

equivalent

Part

50

EA

$512.15

$10.35

$517.50

$27.42 $1,371.00

$25.00 $1,250.00
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID NO. JXP0118
RXNO. 16072000582
DATE: 8/23/2016
BUYER:  Joshua Pace

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
CONTRACT FOR
LAB CHEMICALS AND SUPPLIES

Vendor Name

Fox Scientific

VWR International LI.C

Government Scientific

ExpoTech

City, State

Alvarado, TX

Suwanee, GA

Reston, VA

Houston, TX

MBE/WBE

ITEM NO.
ITEM DESCRIPTION

EST QTY

UNIT

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE PRICE

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRICE PRICE

VWR Large Sample Bottle, High
Density Polyethylene, Wide Mouth,
4L
VWR Cat. # 414004-186 or

46 equivalent

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part
No.

50

EA

$4.22 $210.75 $13.86

$693.00

$36.68 $1,834.00

$26.00 $1,300.00

VWR Laboratory Bottles, High-
Density Polyethylene, Wide Mouth,
125 mL, Caps included
VWR Cat. # 414004-112 or

47 equivalent

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part
No.

48

EA

$0.92 $44.16 $0.67

$32.16

$2.32 $111.36

$3.33 $160.03

VWR Laboratory Bottles, High-
Density Polyethylene, Wide Mouth,
250 mL, Caps included
VWR Cat. # 414004-113 ot

48 equivalent

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part
No.

48

EA

$1.48 $71.09 $1.00

$48.00

$3.60 $172.80

$4.59 $220.32
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

RX NO.
DATE:

BID NO. JXP0118
16072000582
8/23/2016
BUYER:  Joshua Pace
Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
CONTRACT FOR

LAB CHEMICALS AND SUPPLIES

Vendor Name

Fox Scientific

VWR International LI.C

Government Scientific

ExpoTech

City, State

Alvarado, TX

Suwanee, GA

Reston, VA

Houston, TX

MBE/WBE

ITEM NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION

EST QTY

UNIT

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

49

VWR Laboratory Bottles, High-
Density Polyethylene, Wide Mouth,
500 Ml, Caps included
VWR Cat. # 414004-114 or

equivalent

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part
No.

48

EA

$2.10

$100.75

$1.40

$67.20

$5.04

$241.92

$5.00

$240.00

50

VWR Laboratory Bottles, High-
Density Polyethylene, Wide Mouth, 1
L, Caps included
VWR Cat. # 414004-115 or
equivalent

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part
No.

48

EA

$3.30

$158.16

$2.67

$128.16

$4.62

$221.76

$11.00

$528.00

51

VWR 100-1000 uL Pipet Tips; Tips
and hinged racks are autoclavable.
VWR Cat. # 83007-376 or equivalent

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part
No.

5,000

EA

$0.02

$90.00

$0.02

$100.00

$0.03

$150.00

$0.04

$180.00
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
CONTRACT FOR
LAB CHEMICALS AND SUPPLIES

BID NO. JXP0118
RX'NO. 16072000582
DATE:  8/23/2016
BUYER:  Joshua Pace
Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name Fox Scientific VWR International LI.C

Government Scientific

ExpoTech

City, State Alvarado, TX Suwanee, GA

Reston, VA

Houston, TX

MBE/WBE

TOTAL
PRICE

TOTAL

PRICE UNIT PRICE

UNIT | UNIT PRICE

ITEM NO. EST QTY

ITEM DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

1-200 uL. VWR Bevel Point Pipet
Tips; Autoclavable.
VWR Cat. # 53508-810 or equivalent
52 5,000 EA
Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part

$75.00 $0.01 $50.00

$0.02

No.

$0.02

$100.00

$0.03

$140.00

VWR General Purpose Laboratory
Labeling Tape, Rainbow Pack
VWR Cat. # 89098-062 or equivalent
53 120 EA
Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part

$10.17 $1,220.40 $3.92 $470.40

No.

$6.32

$758.40

$6.67

$800.04

WYPALL L40 Wipers, Kimbetly-
Clark Professional
VWR Cat. # 89000-692 or equivalent
54 13,500 EA
Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part

$0.10 $1,350.00

$0.09 $1,215.00

No.

$0.09

$1,269.00

$0.13

$1,809.00

Page 12




The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
CONTRACT FOR
LAB CHEMICALS AND SUPPLIES

BID NO. JXP0118
RX'NO. 16072000582
DATE:  8/23/2016
BUYER:  Joshua Pace
Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name Fox Scientific VWR International LI.C

Government Scientific

ExpoTech

Alvarado, TX Suwanee, GA

City, State

Reston, VA

Houston, TX

MBE/WBE

ITEM NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION

EST QTY

UNIT

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

55

GRADE 934AH GILASS
MICROFIBER Binder Free, GE
Healthcare, 7 cm
VWR Cat. # 28496-911 or equivalent

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part
No.

4,500

EA

$0.55

$2,475.00

$0.601

$2,745.00

$0.53

$2,385.00

$0.68

$3,060.00

56

GRADE 934AH GLASS
MICROFIBER Binder Free, GE
Healthcare, 11 cm
VWR Cat. # 28496-955 or
equivalent

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part
No.

4,500

EA

$0.92

$4,140.00

$1.08

$4,860.00

$0.96

$4,320.00

$1.02

$4,590.00

57

KIMTECH SCIENCE Kimwipes
Delicate Task Wipers, Kimberly-
Clark Professional
VWR Cat. # 21905-011 or equivalent

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part
No.

14,700

EA

$0.02

$338.10

$0.08

$1,176.00

$0.02

$338.10

$0.05

$705.60
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID NO. JXP0118
RXNO. 16072000582
DATE: 8/23/2016
BUYER:  Joshua Pace

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
CONTRACT FOR

LAB CHEMICALS AND SUPPLIES

Vendor Name

Fox Scientific

VWR International LI.C

Government Scientific

ExpoTech

City, State

Alvarado, TX

Suwanee, GA

Reston, VA

Houston, TX

MBE/WBE

ITEM NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION

EST QTY

UNIT

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

58

PP VIALS AND CAPS, PRESLIT
VWR Cat. # 97051-416

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part
No.

6,000

EA

$0.72

$4,320.00

$0.56

$3,360.00

$0.57

$3,420.00

$0.69

$4,140.00

59

Sterile polypropylene container used
to test for coliforms
VWR Cat. # 46610-592

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part
No.

6,000

EA

$0.28

$1,680.00

$0.34

$2,040.00

$0.27

$1,620.00

$0.63

$3,750.00

60

GRADE 934AH GLASS
MICROFIBER Binder Free, GE
Healthcare, 7 cm
VWR Cat. # 28496-911

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part
No

4,500

EA

$0.55

$2,475.00

$0.61

$2,745.00

$0.53

$2,385.00

$0.68

$3,060.00

61

Micro Cotton Head Swab, Sterile
VWR Cat. # 10805-154

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part
No.

1,500

EA

$0.07

$105.00

$0.06

$90.00

$0.20

$300.00

$0.20

$300.00
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
CONTRACT FOR
LAB CHEMICALS AND SUPPLIES

BID NO. JXP0118
RXNO. 16072000582
DATE: 8/23/2016
BUYER:  Joshua Pace

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name Fox Scientific VWR International LI.C

Government Scientific

ExpoTech

City, State Alvarado, TX Suwanee, GA

Reston, VA

Houston, TX

MBE/WBE

TOTAL TOTAL
ITEM NO. ESTQTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION Q PRICE PRICE

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

Level I Vial with Open-Top Cap 40
mL Amber
VWR Cat. # 23050-008
62 ) 1,080 EA $0.72 $777.60 $1.41 $1,522.80
Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part
No.

$1.24

$1,339.20

$2.77

$2,990.52

Glass Fiber Filter, Grade 693, 7 cm
VWR Cat. # 28297-508

63 Equivalent Man;facmfef Nameand [ 5 9 EA $0.55 $1,100.00 $0.29 $580.00
art

No.

$0.53

$1,060.00

$0.70

$1,400.00

Glass Fiber Filter, Grade 691, 5.5 cm
VWR Cat. # 28297-984

64 Equivalent Man;facturer Name and 1,000 EA $0.40 $402.00 $0.14 $140.00
art

No.

$0.25

$250.00

$0.28

$280.00

Pipet Tip EP-TIP, 10 ML
VWR Cat. # 47747-992

65 Equivalent Maml;facturer Name and 5,000 EA $0.29 $1,450.00 $0.29 $1,450.00
art

No.

$0.25

$1,250.00

$0.43

$2,150.00
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
CONTRACT FOR
LAB CHEMICALS AND SUPPLIES

BID NO. JXP0118
RXNO. 16072000582
DATE: 8/23/2016
BUYER:  Joshua Pace

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name Fox Scientific VWR International LI.C

Government Scientific

ExpoTech

City, State Alvarado, TX Suwanee, GA

Reston, VA

Houston, TX

MBE/WBE

TOTAL TOTAL
ITEM NO. ESTQTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION Q PRICE PRICE

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

Disposable Culture Tube, Round
Bottom, Screw-Cap Finish, 16 x 150
mm

VWR Cat. # 72690-020

66 10,000 EA $0.23 $2,300.00 $0.23 $2,300.00

Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part
No

$0.23

$2,300.00

$0.33

$3,250.00

Neotouch Neoprene Glove 25-101,
Chemical Resistant,
Size Large, 5 mil
67 VWR Cat. # 89011-908 1,500 EA $0.12 $180.00 $0.14 $210.00
Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part
No.

$0.37

$555.00

$0.45

$675.00

UltraSense EC Microflex Glove,
Powder-Free, Nitrile, Size Small
VWR Cat. # 89065-280
68 ) 1,500 EA $0.13 $195.00 $0.12 $180.00
Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part

No.

$0.27

$405.00

$0.30

$450.00

40 mL Processed Vial, Open-Top,
Amber
VWR Cat. # 89093-870
69 ) 1,440 EA $0.67 $964.80 $1.17 $1,684.80
Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part
No.

$2.54

$3,657.60

$2.04

$3,800.16
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID NO.
RX NO.
DATE:
BUYER:

JXP0118
16072000582
8/23/2016

Joshua Pace

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
CONTRACT FOR
LAB CHEMICALS AND SUPPLIES

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name Fox Scientific VWR International LI.C Government Scientific ExpoTech
City, State Alvarado, TX Suwanee, GA Reston, VA Houston, TX
MBE/WBE
TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION ESTQTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
40 mL Quality Assured Vial, Open-
Top, Amber
VWR Cat. # 89093-874
70 ) 1,080 EA $0.67 $723.60 $1.60 $1,728.00 $2.17 $2,343.60 $2.43 $2,625.48
Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part
No.
All Plastic Disposable Luer-Lok
Syringes, Thermo-Scientific, 10 mL
VWR Cat. # 66064-766
71 ) 4,000 EA $0.28 $1,120.00 $0.78 $3,120.00 $0.72 $2,880.00 $0.70 $2,800.00
Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part
No.
Quality Assured Wide Mouth Packer,
HDPE, 500 Ml capacity
VWR Cat. # 89095-043
72 ) 1,800 EA $1.04 $1,872.00 $1.27 $2,286.00 $1.70 $3,060.00 $1.81 $3,250.80
Equivalent Manufacturer Name and
Part
No.
Section D Subtotal: $41,110.04 $47,436.99 $67,269.73 $61,715.60
Section E Subtotal: $300,000.00 $300,000.00 $300,000.00 $300,000.00
TOTAL BID $430,888.90 $435,922.95 $483,815.24 $496,012.31

Prepared By: Carol Shelton
Approved By: Joshua Pace
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