The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS
BID NO. SSC0181
RXNO. 2200 11072600490
DATE: 11/2/2011
BUYER: Sydney Ceder
Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name Sid Tool Co dba MSC Industrial Supply [ACT Pipe & Supply HD Supply Waterworks Municipal Water Works Supply

City, State San Antonio, TX Pflugerville, TX Round Rock, TX Royse City, TX

MBE/WBE

ITEM EST TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE

1 Plug CI Mech JT 6 inch Solid 20 EA NO BID NO BID $ 25.09| $ 501.80| $ 24.09( $ 493.80( $ 26.36| $ 527.20
2 Plug CI Mech JT 4 inch Solid 4 EA NO BID NO BID $ 13.29] § 53.16( $§ 13.07| $§ 5228 § 13.96| $ 55.84
3 Plug CI Mech JT 8 inch Solid 10 EA NO BID NO BID $ 37.88| § 378.80| $§ 37.28| § 372.80| $ 39.80| $ 398.00
4 Plug CI Mech JT 12 inch Solid 4 EA NO BID NO BID $ 69.25| $ 277.00( $ 68.27| § 273.08| $ 72.88| $ 291.52
5 Plug CI Mech JT 4x2-1/2 in Tap 5 EA NO BID NO BID $ 104.00| $ 520.00| $ 2517 $ 125.85| § 109.46| $ 547.30
6 Plug CI Mech JT 6x2-1/2 in Tap 5 EA NO BID NO BID $ 116.00| $ 580.00| $§ 36.80| § 184.00| $ 121.87| $ 609.35
7 Plug CI Mech JT 8x2-1/2 in Tap 5 EA NO BID NO BID $ 128.75] $ 643.75| $§ 49.38| § 246.90( $ 135.31] $ 676.55
8 Plug CI Mech JT 12x2-1/2 in Tap 4 EA NO BID NO BID $ 160.00| $ 640.00( $ 80.37| $ 321.48| $ 168.39| $ 673.56
9 Bend CI Mech JT 22-1/2 Deg 4 in 4 EA NO BID NO BID $ 24.40| $ 97.60| $ 23.72( $ 94.88| $ 2533| $ 101.32
10 Bend CI Mech JT 45 Deg 4 in 4 EA NO BID NO BID $ 25.00| $ 100.00| $§ 24.69( $ 98.76| $ 26.36| $ 105.44
11 Bend CI Mech JT 90 Deg 4 in 4 EA NO BID NO BID $ 30.50| $ 122.00| $ 30.02| § 120.08] $ 32.05| § 128.20
12 Bend CI Mech JT 22-1/2 Deg 6 in 15 EA NO BID NO BID $ 37.25| $ 558.75| $§ 36.80( § 552.00( $ 39.25| $ 588.75
13 Bend CI Mech JT 45 Deg 6 in 30 EA NO BID NO BID $ 40.75| $ 1,222.50| $ 40.18| $ 1,205.40| $ 4290| $ 1,287.00
14 Bend CI Mech JT 90 Deg 6 in 20 EA NO BID NO BID $ 50.00( $ 1,000.00| $ 49.38| § 987.60( $ 52.72( § 1,054.40
15 Bend CI Mech JT 11-1/4 Deg 8 in 10 EA NO BID NO BID $ 53.00| $ 530.00| $ 5229( $ 522.90] $§ 55.82| § 558.20
16 Bend CI Mech JT 22-1/2 Deg 8 in 20 EA NO BID NO BID $ 58.00( $ 1,160.00| $ 57.13| $§ 1,142.60| $ 60.99| $ 1,219.80
17 Bend CI Mech JT 45 Deg 8 in 25 EA NO BID NO BID $ 59.25( $ 1,481.25| § 58.58| $ 1,464.50| $ 62.54| $ 1,563.50
18 Bend CI Mech JT 90 Deg 8 in 6 EA NO BID NO BID $ 73.75| $ 442.50( $§ 72.63| § 435.78| $§ 77.53] $ 465.18
19 Bend CI Mech JT 11-1/4 Deg 12 in 4 EA NO BID NO BID $ 93.33| § 373.32| § 105.07| $ 420.28 $ 112.16] $ 448.64
20 Bend CI Mech JT 22-1/2 Deg 12 in 4 EA NO BID NO BID $ 114.00{ $ 456.00( $ 112.33] § 449.32| $ 11991| $ 479.64
21 Bend CI Mech JT 45 Deg 12 in 4 EA NO BID NO BID $ 130.25| $ 521.00| $ 128.31] § 513.24| $ 136.97| $ 547.88
22 Bend CI Mech JT 90 Deg 12 in 10 EA NO BID NO BID $ 157.43| § 1,574.30| $ 154.94] $§ 1,549.40( $§ 165.40| $ 1,654.00
23 Sleeve CI Mech JT Oversize,4x12in 6 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 122.98] $ 737.88| $ 178.76| $ 1,072.56
24 Sleeve CI Mech JT Oversize,6x12in 25 EA NO BID NO BID $ 126.00( $ 3,150.00| $ 133.15] $§ 3,328.75| $§ 225.84| $ 5,646.00
25 Sleeve CI Mech JT Oversize 8x12 in 6 EA NO BID NO BID $ 165.00| $ 990.00( $ 178.67| $ 1,072.02| $ 287.64| $ 1,725.84
26 Reducer CI Mech JT & mch JT8x6" 15 EA NO BID NO BID $ 4225| $ 633.75| $ 41.64| $ 624.60( $ 44.45| $ 666.75
27 Reducer CI Mech JT & mch JT6x4" 5 EA NO BID NO BID $ 29.25| § 146.25| $ 28.56| § 142.80| $ 30.50 | § 152.50
28 Reducer CIMech JT & mch]T12x6" 4 EA NO BID NO BID $ 72.50| $ 290.00( $ 71.66 | $ 286.04| $ 76.50 | $ 306.00
29 Reducer CIMech JT & mch]T12x8" 4 EA NO BID NO BID $ 7425| $ 297.00( $ 7311 $ 292.44| $ 78.05| $ 312.20
30 Reducer CIMech JT & mch]T8x4in 4 EA NO BID NO BID $ 39.75| $ 159.00| $ 3922 § 156.88] $ 41.87| $ 167.48
31 Reducer CIMech JT & plain end8x6 4 EA NO BID NO BID $ 42.25| § 169.00| $ 5520 $§ 220.80| $ 49.16| $ 196.64
32 Sleeve CI Mech JT Reg 4x12 inches 50 EA NO BID NO BID $ 25.09| $ 1,254.50| $ 24.69| $ 1,234.50| $ 26.30| $ 1,318.00
33 Sleeve CI Mech JT Reg 6x12 inches 500 EA NO BID NO BID $ 45.000 $§  22,500.00| $ 4454 $  22270.00| $ 4755 ¢  23,775.00
34 Sleeve CI Mech JT Reg 8x12 inches 150 EA NO BID NO BID $ 7350 $  11,025.00| $ 73111 $  10,966.50| $ 78.05| $ 11,707.50
35 Sleeve CI Mech JT Reg 12x12 in 60 EA NO BID NO BID $ 118.00| $ 7,080.00| $ 118.14] $§ 7,088.40| § 126.12] $§ 7,567.20
36 Sleeve CI Mech JT Reg 20x15 in 8 EA NO BID NO BID $ 357.00( $ 2,8560.00| $ 350.08] $ 2,800.64| $ 373.09| $ 2,989.52
37 Sleeve CI Mech JT Reg 24x15 in 8 EA NO BID NO BID $ 471.00( $ 3,768.00| $ 461.46| $ 3,091.68| $ 492.57| $ 3,940.56
38 Sleeve CI Mech JT Reg 14x12 in 2 EA NO BID NO BID $ 182.50| $ 365.00( $ 178.67| $ 357.34| $ 190.71| $ 381.42
39 Sleeve CI Mech JT Reg 36x24 in 2 EA NO BID NO BID $ 16.38] $§ 32.75| $ 1,297.68| § 2,595.36| $ 1,385.17| $ 2,770.34
40 Sleeve CI Mech JT Reg 30x24 in 2 EA NO BID NO BID $ 987.00( $ 1,974.00| $ 966.48| $ 1,932.96| $ 1,031.63| $ 2,063.26
41 Sleeve CI Mech JT Reg 16x15 in 8 EA NO BID NO BID $ 231.00( $ 1,848.00| $ 226.61| $ 1,812.88| § 241.89( $ 1,935.12
42 Sleeve DI Mech JT Reg 18x15 2 EA NO BID NO BID $ 295.00( $ 590.00| $ 290.04| § 580.08 § 309.60( $ 619.20
43 Sleeve DI Mech JT Reg 42x24 2 EA NO BID NO BID $ 1,815.00( $§ 3,630.00| $ 1,782.86| § 3,565.72| $ 1,801.83| $ 3,603.66
44 Sleeve DI Mech JT Reg 48x24 2 EA NO BID NO BID $ 2,250.00| $ 4,500.00| $ 2,212.35| $ 4,424.70| $ 2,235.90| $ 4,471.80
45 Sleeve CI Cutting-in oversize, 4 in 6 EA NO BID NO BID $ 240.00( $ 1,440.00| $ 157.36| $ 944.16| $ 342.80( $ 2,056.80
46 Sleeve CI Cutting-in oversize, 6 in 30 EA NO BID NO BID $ 203.00{ $ 6,090.00( $ 168.50| $ 5,055.00( § 402.39( §  12,071.70




The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.
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47 Sleeve CI Cutting-in oversize, 8 in 10 EA NO BID NO BID $ 265.00( $ 2,650.00| $ 229.03| $ 2,290.30| $ 516.42| $§ 5,164.20
48 Sleeve CI Cutting-in oversize, 12 in 2 EA NO BID NO BID $ 780.00( $ 1,560.00 $ 455.15( § 910.30| $ 1,026.25| $ 2,052.50
49 Rod,stl underground 5/8in x 10ft 10 EA NO BID NO BID $ 11.50| $ 115.00| $ 10.00( $ 100.00| $ 11.35| $ 113.50
50 Rod,stl underground 3/4in x 10ft 100 EA NO BID NO BID $ 14.00| $ 1,400.00| $§ 15.00| $ 1,500.00| $ 16.65| $ 1,665.00
51 Coupling,rod coarse thread 5/8 in 10 EA NO BID NO BID $ 1.50| $§ 15.00 $ 1221 $ 1220 $ 021 $ 2.10
52 Coupling,rod coarse thread 3/4 in 20 EA NO BID NO BID $ 095 $ 19.00| $ 1.38] $ 27.60| $ 0.77( $ 15.40
53 Duc Lug,underg for 4 in-12 in pipe 300 EA NO BID NO BID $ 1.30] $ 390.00( $ 1.17] $ 351.00( $§ 132§ 396.00
54 Sleeve CI Mech JT Tap 6x6in 20 EA NO BID NO BID $ 704.50[ §  14,090.00| $ 454.83| $ 9,096.60| $ 465.50| $ 9,310.00
55 Sleeve CI Mech JT Tap 8x6in 2 EA NO BID NO BID $ 862.00( $ 1,724.00| $ 558.60| $ 1,117.20( $ 575.50| $ 1,151.00
56 Sleeve CI Mech JT Tap 8x8in 6 EA NO BID NO BID $ 932.00( $ 5,592.00| $ 604.30| $ 3,625.80| $ 612.19( $ 3,673.14
57 Tee CI Mech JT 6x6x6 inches 20 EA NO BID NO BID $ 73.00| $ 1,460.00| $ 72.14| $§ 1,442.80| $ 80.40( § 1,608.00
58 Tee CI Mech JT 8x8x6 inches 15 EA NO BID NO BID $ 91.00| $ 1,365.00| $ 89.57| § 1,343.55| $§ 95.62| $ 1,434.30
59 Tee CI Mech JT 8x8x6 in swivel 10 EA NO BID NO BID $ 105.00| $ 1,050.00( $ 104.10| $ 1,041.00( $ 112.00| $ 1,120.00
60 Tee CI Mech JT 8x8x8 inches 15 EA NO BID NO BID $ 109.00| $ 1,635.00 $ 107.97| $ 1,619.55( § 115.26| $ 1,728.90
61 Tee CI Mech JT 12x12x6 inches 4 EA NO BID NO BID $ 148.00| $ 592.00| $ 145.74] $ 582.96| $ 155.58| $ 622.32
62 Tee CI Mech JT 12x12x12 inches 5 EA NO BID NO BID $ 219.00( $§ 1,095.00( $ 215.95| § 1,079.75] $ 230.52| $§ 1,152.60
63 Tee CI Mech JT 12x12x8 inches 4 EA NO BID NO BID $ 171.00| $ 684.00( $ 168.50| $ 674.00( $ 187.69| $ 750.76
64 Gland Pack Mech JT, Fittings 4in 300 EA NO BID NO BID $ 10.80| $ 3,240.00| $ 10.42] $ 3,126.00| $ 11.64| $ 3,492.00
65 Gland Pack Mech JT, Fittings 6in 1500 | EA NO BID NO BID $ 1425| §  21,375.00| $ 14211 $  21,315.00| $ 1550 §  23,250.00
66 Gland Pack Mech JT, Fittings 8in 500 EA NO BID NO BID $ 16.50| $ 8,250.00| $§ 16.10] $§ 8,050.00| $ 17.58| $§ 8,790.00
67 Gland Pack Mech JT, Fittings 12in 150 EA NO BID NO BID $ 25.00| $ 3,750.00| $ 24.15| $ 3,622.50| $ 26.36| $ 3,954.00
68 Gland Pack Mech JT, Fittings 14in 6 EA NO BID NO BID $ 38.50| $ 231.00( $ 3742 $ 224.52| $ 40.85| $ 245.10
69 Gland Pack Mech JT, Fittings 16in 20 EA NO BID NO BID $ 41.00| $ 820.00| $§ 39.78| § 795.60( $ 43.42| § 868.40
70 Gland Pack Mech JT, Fittings 18in 4 EA NO BID NO BID $ 55.25( $ 221.00| $ 53.52| § 214.08| $ 59.08 $ 236.32
71 Gland Pack Mech JT, Fittings 24in 20 EA NO BID NO BID $ 77.00( $ 1,540.00( $ 104.21] $ 2,084.20| $ 105.65| $ 2,113.00
72 Gland Pack Mech JT, Fittings 20in 8 EA NO BID NO BID $ 77.00| $ 616.00| $ 7436 | $ 594.88( $ 76.05| $ 608.40
73 Gland Pack Mech JT, Fittings 30in 4 EA NO BID NO BID $ 191.00| $ 764.00( $ 186.15| $ 744.60( $ 192.30| $ 769.20
74 Gland Pack Mech JT, Fittings 36in 4 EA NO BID NO BID $ 282.00( $ 1,128.00 $ 271.89| § 1,087.56| $ 280.75| $ 1,123.00
75 Gland Pack Mech JT, Fittings 42in 4 EA NO BID NO BID $ 484.00( $ 1,936.00( $ 467.52| $ 1,870.08( $ 482.00( $ 1,928.00
76 Gland Pack Mech JT, Fittings 48in 4 EA NO BID NO BID $ 615.00( $ 2,460.00| $ 594.94| $ 2,379.76| $ 608.00( $ 2,432.00
77 Gland Pk Mch JT(DUO)Fittings4in 10 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 12.68| $§ 126.80| $ 24.25| § 242.50
78 Gland Pk Mch JT(DUO)Fittings6in 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 15.50| $ 775.00( $ 40.00| $ 2,000.00
79 Gland Pk Mch JT(DUO)Fittings8in 15 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1774 $§ 266.10( $ 58.55( $ 878.25
80 Glnd Pk Mch JT(DUO)Fittings12in 10 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 26.72( $ 267.20| $ 110.00| $ 1,100.00
81 Pipe Joint Restraint DI pipe 4 in 40 EA | § 1971 $ 788.40( $§ 12.50| $ 500.00| $ 13.62| $§ 544.80( $ 20.26| $ 810.40
82 Pipe Joint Restraint DI pipe 6 in 600 EA | § 21.87] $ 13,122.00| $ 14.45] $ 8,670.00| § 15.72| § 9,432.00| $ 24541 $  14,724.00
83 Pipe Joint Restraint DI pipe 8 in 125 EA | § 33.20( $ 4,150.00| $ 22.25| $ 2,781.25| $§ 2441| $ 3051.25| $ 33.85| $ 4,231.25
84 Pipe Joint Restraint DI pipe 12 in 50 EA | § 76.57| $ 3,828.50| $ 48.25| $ 2,412.50| $ 51.97| $ 2,598.50| $ 66.24 | $ 3,312.00
85 Pipe Joint Restraint DI pipe 14 in 4 EA | $ 122.86| $ 491.44| § 63.20( $ 252.80( $§ 67.89| § 271.56| $ 93.05| $ 372.20
86 Pipe Joint Restraint DI pipe 16 in 20 EA | §$ 151.43] $§ 3,028.60| $ 88.35( § 1,767.00| $ 95.20| $ 1,904.00| $ 118.54| $ 2,370.80
87 Pipe Joint Restraint DI pipe 24 in 12 EA | § 343.43| $§ 4,121.16] $ 183.00| $ 2,196.00| $ 196.64| $ 2,359.68| $ 229.95| $ 2,759.40
88 Pipe Joint Restraint PVC pipe 4 in 25 EA | § 25.14| $ 628.50( $ 15.25| $ 381.25| $ 17.10] $ 427.50| $ 24.15| $ 603.75
89 Pipe Joint Restraint PVC pipe 6 in 275 EA | § 28.27| $ 7,774.25| § 18.35| $§ 5,046.25| § 19.87| § 5,464.25| $ 34.00( $§ 9,350.00
90 Pipe Joint Restraint PVC pipe 8 in 500 EA | § 41.60| $  20,800.00| $ 27251 8  13,625.00| § 29.67| $ 14,835.00( $ 39.95[ ¢  19,975.00
91 Pipe Joint Restraint PVC pipe 12 in 15 EA | § 89.14| $ 1,337.10| $ 55.00( $ 825.00| $ 58.94| § 884.10( $ 7240( $ 1,086.00
92 HYD PT Offset Grade 6x6x12 150 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 136.42| $  20,463.00| $ 287.00( $  43,050.00
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS
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Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

'Vendor Name Sid Tool Co dba MSC Industrial Supply [ACT Pipe & Supply HD Supply Waterworks Municipal Water Works Supply
City, State San Antonio, TX Pilugerville, TX Round Rock, TX Royse City, TX
MBE/WBE
ITEM EST TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
93 HYP PT Adapter 6x24 Str. Nipple 10 EA NO BID NO BID $ 123.50| $ 1,235.00 $ 122.02] $ 1,220.20( $ 130.25| $ 1,302.50
94 Bolt T-Head CT 3/4inx4in 1,600 | EA NO BID NO BID $ 1.30] $ 2,080.00| $ 1.20] $ 1,920.00( $ 124 $ 1,984.00
95 Bolt T-Head CT 3/4inx5in 200 EA NO BID NO BID $ 1.50| $ 300.00{ $ 1.36] $ 272.00( $ 143 $ 286.00
96 Adapter Foster CI Mech Jt 6 in 30 EA NO BID NO BID $ 8040 § 2,412.00| $ 82.05| § 2,461.50| $ 9290 $ 2,787.00
97 Adapter Foster CI Mech Jt 6 in 50 EA NO BID NO BID $ 120.00| $ 6,000.00| $ 121.00] $ 6,050.00| $ 135.00| $ 6,750.00
98 Cap, Cast Iron, Mech Joint size 4 in 20 EA NO BID NO BID $ 11.25] § 225.00( $ 11.13] $ 222.60( $§ 11.89| $ 237.80
99 Cap, Cast Iron, Mech Joint size 6 in 20 EA NO BID NO BID $ 20.00| § 400.00| $ 1985 $§ 397.00( $ 2327| $ 465.40
100 |Cap, Cast Iron, Mech Joint size 8 in 20 EA NO BID NO BID $ 32.75| § 655.00( $§ 3244 § 648.80| $ 34.60( $ 692.00
101 |Tee, CI Mech JT 8inx 8inx 8 in 10 EA NO BID NO BID $ 160.00| $ 1,600.00 $ 157.85| $§ 1,578.50 $ 168.50| $ 1,685.00
102 |Tee, CI Mech JT 12in x 12 in X6 in 10 EA NO BID NO BID $ 152.00| $ 1,520.00| $ 150.10{ $ 1,501.00( $ 160.20| $ 1,602.00
103 |Tee, CI Mech JT 12 in x 12 in x6 in 10 EA NO BID NO BID $ 152.00| $ 1,520.00 $ 150.10| $ 1,501.00 $ 240.34| $ 2,403.40
TOTAL BID| $ 60,069.95 | $ 226,193.03 | $ 242176.39 | $ 314,328.11

Prepared By: Julia Ramirez
Approved By: Sydney Ceder
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