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BID NO. 
RX NO.   
DATE:  
BUYER:  

MBE/WBE

ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION
EST 
QTY UNIT

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

1
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B 
operating nut 62-1 125 EA $177.49 $22,186.25 $207.55 $25,943.75 $167.64 $20,955.00 No Bid No Bid

2
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B 
breakable rod coupling62-29-30 15 EA $43.74 $656.10 $29.36 $440.40 $41.32 $619.80 No Bid No Bid

3
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B seat O 
ring outside 62-36-2 30 EA $15.99 $479.70 $3.25 $97.50 $15.10 $453.00 No Bid No Bid

4
Hydrant Part American Daring B62B seat O-
ring inside 62-36-3 30 EA $10.94 $328.20 $3.25 $97.50 $10.34 $310.20 No Bid No Bid

5
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B frangible 
bolt and nut 600 EA $10.94 $6,564.00 $4.89 $2,934.00 $10.34 $6,204.00 No Bid No Bid

6
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B main 
valve62-41 10 EA $67.29 $672.90 $48.00 $480.00 $63.56 $635.60 No Bid No Bid

7
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B hose 
nozzle O ring 62-20-61 150 EA $5.89 $883.50 $3.15 $472.50 $5.57 $835.50 No Bid No Bid

8
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B pumper 
nozzle O ring 150 EA $6.73 $1,009.50 $5.13 $769.50 $6.36 $954.00 No Bid No Bid

9
Hydrant Part American Darling B84B pipe 
plug 84-5-3 100 EA $4.21 $421.00 $1.25 $125.00 $3.98 $398.00 No Bid No Bid

10
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B pipe 
plug 62-5-3 100 EA $4.21 $421.00 $1.25 $125.00 $3.98 $398.00 No Bid No Bid

11
Hydrant Part Mueller Centurion retaining 
screw nozzle lock A-13 200 EA $0.46 $92.00 $0.72 $144.00 $0.046 $9.20 $0.75 $150.00 

12
Hyddrant Part American Darling B62B steel 
spring 62-30-03 20 EA $64.78 $1,295.60 $65.05 $1,301.00 $61.18 $1,223.60 No Bid No Bid

13
Hydrant Part American Darling B84B seat O 
ring 84-36-1 50 EA $10.94 $547.00 $3.48 $174.00 $10.34 $517.00 No Bid No Bid

14
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B housing 
cover 62-9 20 EA $49.64 $992.80 $62.71 $1,254.20 $46.88 $937.60 No Bid No Bid

15
Hydrant Part American Darling B84B housing 
O ring 84-2-2 50 EA $5.89 $294.50 $2.60 $130.00 $5.57 $278.50 No Bid No Bid

16
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B cover 
fiber gasket 62-13 75 EA $5.89 $441.75 $6.62 $496.50 $5.57 $417.75 No Bid No Bid

17
Hydrant Part American DarlingB62B drain 
lever rivet 62-34 50 EA $4.21 $210.50 $2.56 $128.00 $3.98 $199.00 No Bid No Bid
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.
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18
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B drain 
lever 62-31 15 EA $127.82 $1,917.30 $165.54 $2,483.10 $120.97 $1,814.55 No Bid No Bid

19
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B seat ring 
62-35 30 EA $190.11 $5,703.30 $241.55 $7,246.50 $179.55 $5,386.50 No Bid No Bid

20
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B valve 
top 62-40 15 EA $43.74 $656.10 $55.74 $836.10 $41.32 $619.80 No Bid No Bid

21
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B value 
bottom 62-42 10 EA $77.39 $773.90 $98.33 $983.30 $73.09 $730.90 No Bid No Bid

22
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B upper 
rod 62-30-11 10 EA $154.78 $1,547.80 $126.65 $1,266.50 $146.18 $1,461.80 No Bid No Bid

23
Hydrant Part American Darling B84B upper 
rod 84-30-11 10 EA $129.54 $1,295.40 $102.20 $1,022.00 $122.35 $1,223.50 No Bid No Bid

24
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B seat ring 
62-35-02 20 EA $190.11 $3,802.20 $241.55 $4,831.00 $179.55 $3,591.00 No Bid No Bid

25
Hydrant Part American Darling pump nozzle 
62-25-60 and 84-25-60 20 EA $219.55 $4,391.00 $278.71 $5,574.20 $207.36 $4,147.20 No Bid No Bid

26
Hydrant part 5 1/4 Clow Medallion main valve 
kit M15, M16, M18, M20, M21, M22 100 EA No Bid No Bid $71.66 $7,166.00 $239.41 $23,941.00 No Bid No Bid

27
Hydrant Part Mueller improved threaded break 
away safety stem co H-75 15 EA $69.49 $1,042.35 $53.46 $801.90 $69.50 $1,042.50 $41.50 $622.50 

28
Hydrabt Part Mueller improved threaded break 
away couples safe H-95 15 EA $30.46 $456.90 No Bid No Bid $30.46 $456.90 $23.60 $354.00 

29
Hydrant Part 5 1/4 American Darling B84B  
seat ring 84-35-02 40 EA $184.22 $7,368.80 $233.05 $9,322.00 $173.99 $6,959.60 No Bid No Bid

30
Hydrant Part 5 1/4 American Darling B84B  
traffic model rod coupling 84-29-30 15 EA $43.74 $656.10 $32.83 $492.45 $41.32 $619.80 No Bid No Bid

31
Hydrant Part 5 1/4 Kennedy Guardian K81A 
drain valve K8136 15 EA No Bid No Bid $149.35 $2,240.25 $164.50 $2,467.50 No Bid No Bid

32
Hydrant Part American Darling B84B main 
hydrant valve 84-41 60 EA $67.29 $4,037.40 $46.33 $2,779.80 $63.56 $3,813.60 No Bid No Bid

33
Hydrant Part American Darling B84B hydrant 
spring 84-30-03 15 EA $64.78 $971.70 $67.59 $1,013.85 $61.18 $917.70 No Bid No Bid
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34
Hydrant Part Kennedy, K81A operating nut 
#K8102 15 EA No Bid No Bid $168.00 $2,520.00 $142.77 $2,141.55 No Bid No Bid

35
Hydrant Part American Darling B84B 
operating nut 84-1 60 EA $154.78 $9,286.80 $183.49 $11,009.40 $146.18 $8,770.80 No Bid No Bid

36
Hydrant Part American Darling B84B nose 
nozzle 2 1/2 54-84-20-3 40 EA $77.39 $3,095.60 $106.25 $4,250.00 $73.09 $2,923.60 No Bid No Bid

37
Hydrant Part American Darling B84B pumper 
nozzle 4" 84-25-3 15 EA $219.55 $3,293.25 $233.05 $3,495.75 $207.36 $3,110.40 No Bid No Bid

38
Hydrant Part Mueller Centurion lower valve 
plate nut A-49 15 EA $11.07 $166.05 $16.49 $247.35 $11.08 $166.20 $13.80 $207.00 

39
Hydrant Part Mueller Centurion lock washer A-
48 30 EA $2.55 $76.50 $2.75 $82.50 $2.56 $76.80 $3.50 $105.00 

40
Hydrnt Part Mueller Centurion cap nut seal A-
47 50 EA $0.99 $49.50 $3.02 $151.00 $0.099 $4.95 $1.65 $82.50 

41
Hydrant Part Mueller Centurion lower valve 
plate  A-46 15 EA $16.40 $246.00 $18.85 $282.75 $16.40 $246.00 $14.40 $216.00 

42
Hydrant Park Mueller improved valve plate nut 
H-90 50 EA $6.00 $300.00 $10.35 $517.50 $6.00 $300.00 $5.70 $285.00 

43
Hydrant Part Mueller improved cap nut brass 
H-91 20 EA $15.47 $309.40 $20.98 $419.60 $15.48 $309.60 $13.80 $276.00 

44
Hydrant Part Mueller improved upper stem H-
74 10 EA $115.32 $1,153.20 $103.12 $1,031.20 $115.32 $1,153.20 $75.24 $752.40 

Approved By:  Stephen T. Aden

TOTAL BID $3,050.40

Prepared By:  Julia Ramirez

$90,092.85 $113,742.70$107,178.85
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