The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS
BID NO. STA1118
RX NO. 2200 14012900175
DATE: 4/9/2014
BUYER: Steve Aden

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Ferguson Enterprises, Inc.
Vendor Name dba/ Ferguson Waterworks |[HD Supply Waterworks
City, State Georgetown, TX Pflugerville, TX
MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY |UNIT| PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
PLUG CI MECH JT 6 INCH SOLID IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
1 CSN 890-49-220-002 20 EA $36.60 $732.00 $34.89 $697.80
PLUG CI MECH JT 4 INCH SOLID IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
2 CSN 890-49-220-003 4 EA $18.60 $74.40 $17.74 $70.96
PLUG CI MECH JT 8 INCH SOLID IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
3 CSN 890-49-220-004 10 EA $54.60 $546.00 $65.87 $658.70
PLUG CI MECH JT 12 INCH SOLID IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
4 CSN 890-49-220-005 4 EA $94.80 $379.20 $90.52 $362.08
PLUG CI MECH JT 4 X 2-1/2 INCH TAPPED
IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
5 CSN 890-49-225-001 5 EA $136.20 $681.00 $78.84 $394.20
PLUG CI MECH JT 6 X 2-1/2 INCH TAPPED
IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
6 CSN 890-49-225-002 5 EA $155.00 $775.00 $96.02 $480.10
PLUG CI MECH JT 8 X 2-1/2 INCH TAPPED
IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
7 CSN 890-49-225-003 5 EA $199.00 $995.00 $52.07 $260.35
PLUG CI MECH JT 12 X 2-1/2 INCH
TAPPED IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO.
WW-27B
8 CSN 890-49-225-004 4 EA $276.13 $1,104.52 $90.41 $361.64
BEND CI MECH JT 22-1/2 DEG 4 INCH IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
9 CSN 890-49-230-003 4 EA $33.00 $132.00 $31.47 $125.88
BEND CI MECH JT 45 DEG 4 INCH IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
10 CSN 890-49-230-004 4 EA $34.80 $139.20 $33.19 $132.76
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS
BID NO. STA1118
RX NO. 2200 14012900175
DATE: 4/9/2014
BUYER: Steve Aden

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Ferguson Enterprises, Inc.
Vendor Name dba/ Ferguson Waterworks [HD Supply Waterworks
City, State Georgetown, TX Pflugerville, TX
MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY |UNIT| PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
BEND CI MECH JT 90 DEG 4 INCH IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
11 CSN 890-49-230-005 4 EA $42.00 $168.00 $40.06 $160.24
BEND CI MECH JT 22-1/2 DEG 6 INCH IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
12 CSN 890-49-230-007 15 EA $51.60 $774.00 $48.97 $734.55
BEND CI MECH JT 45 DEG 6 INCH IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
13 CSN 890-49-230-008 30 EA $55.80 $1,674.00 $53.22 $1,596.60
BEND CI MECH JT 90 DEG 6 INCH IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL  NO. WW-27B
14 CSN 890-49-230-009 20 EA $69.00 $1,380.00 $65.81 $1,316.20
BEND CI MECH JT 11-1/4 DEG 8 INCH IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
15 CSN 890-49-230-010 10 EA $72.60 $726.00 $69.24 $692.40
BEND CI MECH JT 22-1/2 DEG 8 INCH IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
16 CSN 890-49-230-011 20 EA $79.80 $1,596.00 $76.11 $1,522.20
BEND CI MECH JT 45 DEG 8 INCH IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
17 CSN 890-49-230-012 25 EA $81.60 $2,040.00 $77.82 $1,945.50
BEND CI MECH JT 90 DEG 8 INCH IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
18 CSN 890-49-230-013 6 EA $100.80 $604.80 $96.13 $576.78
BEND CI MECH JT 11-1/4 DEG 12 INCH IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
19 CSN 890-49-230-014 4 EA $146.40 $585.60 $139.62 $558.48
BEND CI MECH JT 22-1/2 DEG 12 INCH IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
20 CSN 890-49-230-015 4 EA $156.00 $624.00 $149.78 $599.12
BEND CI MECH JT 45 DEG 12 INCH IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
21 CSN 890-49-230-016 4 EA $178.20 $712.80 $169.95 $679.80
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS
BID NO. STA1118
RX NO. 2200 14012900175
DATE: 4/9/2014
BUYER: Steve Aden

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Ferguson Enterprises, Inc.
Vendor Name dba/ Ferguson Waterworks
City, State

MBE/WBE

HD Supply Waterworks
Pflugerville, TX

Georgetown, TX

ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION

EST
QTY

UNIT

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

205

BEND CI MECH JT 90 DEG 12 INCH IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
CSN 890-49-230-017

10

EA

$215.40

$2,154.00

$205.43

$2,054.30

23

SLEEVE CI MECH JT OVERSIZE, DUAL
PURPOSE (DUO) 4 X 12 INCHES IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
CSN 890-49-240-001

EA

No Bid

No Bid

$127.61

$765.66

24

SLEEVE CI MECH JT OVERSIZE, DUAL
PURPOSE (DUO) 6 X 12 INCHES IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
CSN 890-49-240-002

25

EA

No Bid

No Bid

$132.76

$3,319.00

25

SLEEVE CI MECH JT OVERSIZE, DUAL
PURPOSE (DUO) 8 X 12 INCHES IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
CSN 890-49-240-003

EA

No Bid

No Bid

$187.12

$1,122.72

26

REDUCER CI MECH JT & MCH JT 8 X6
INCHS IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO.
WW-27B CSN 890-49-255-001

15

EA

$58.20

$873.00

$55.51

$832.65

27

REDUCER CI MECH JT & MCH JT 6 X 4
INCHS IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO.
WW-27B CSN 890-49-255-002

EA

$40.20

$201.00

$38.34

$191.70

28

REDUCER CI MECH JT & MCH JT 12 X 6
INCHS IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO.
WW-27B CSN 890-49-255-003

EA

$99.60

$398.40

$94.89

$379.56

29

REDUCER CI MECH JT & MCH JT 12 X 8
INCHS IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO.
WW-27B CSN 890-49-255-004

EA

$102.00

$408.00

$97.28

$389.12

30

REDUCER CI MECH JT & MCH JT 8 X4
INCHS IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO.
WW-27B CSN 890-49-255-007

EA

$54.60

$218.40

$52.09

$208.36

31

REDUCER CI MECH JT & PLAIN END 8 X 6
INCHS IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO.
WW-27B CSN 890-49-260-001

EA

$57.60

$230.40

$54.93

$219.72

32

SLEEVE CI MECH JT REG 4 X 12 INCHS
IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
CSN 890-49-280-002

50

EA

$37.20

$1,860.00

$35.48

$1,774.00
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BID NO.
RX NO.
DATE:
BUYER:

STA1118

2200 14012900175
4/9/2014

Steve Aden

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name

Ferguson Enterprises, Inc.
dba/ Ferguson Waterworks

HD Supply Waterworks

City, State

Georgetown, TX

Pflugerville, TX

MBE/WBE

ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION

EST
QTY

UNIT

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

33

SLEEVE CI MECH JT REG 6 X 12 INCHS
IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
CSN 890-49-280-003

500

EA

$62.40

$31,200.00

$59.51

$29.755.00

34

SLEEVE CI MECH JT REG 8 X 12 INCHS
IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
CSN 890-49-280-004

150

EA

$102.00

$15,300.00

$97.28

$14,592.00

35

SLEEVE CI MECH JT REG 12 X 12 INCHS
IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
CSN 890-49-280-005

60

EA

$164.40

$9,864.00

$156.79

$9,407.40

36

SLEEVE CI MECH JT REG 20 X 15 INCHS
IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
CSN 890-49-280-006

EA

$486.00

$3,888.00

$463.50

$3,708.00

37

SLEEVE CI MECH JT REG 24 X 15 INCHS
IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
CSN 890-49-280-007

EA

$640.80

$5,126.40

$611.13

$4,889.04

38

SLEEVE CI MECH JT REG 14 X 12 INCHS
TYLER, STAR PRODUCTS OR BUYER
APPROVED EQUAL.

CSN 890-49-280-008

EA

$248.40

$496.80

$236.90

$473.80

39

SLEEVE CI MECH JT REG 36 X 24 INCHS
TYLER PIPE, A-1 FOUNDRY, SOMEP OR
BUYER APPROVED EQUAL.

CSN 890-49-280-009

EA

$1,884.00

$3,768.00

$1,796.67

$3,593.34

40

SLEEVE CI MECH JT REG 30 X 24 INCHS
TYLER PIPE, A-1 FOUNDRY, SOMEP OR
BUYER APPROVED EQUAL.

CSN 890-49-280-010

EA

$1,341.60

$2,683.20

$1,279.49

$2,558.98

41

SLEEVE CI MECH JT REG 16 X 15 INCHS
IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
CSN 890-49-280-011

EA

$315.00

$2,520.00

$300.42

$2,403.36

42

SLEEVE D.l. MECH JT REGULAR 18 X 15,
TYLER, STAR PRODUCTS OR BUYER
APPROVED EQUAL.

CSN 659-73-521-001

EA

$402.60

$805.20

$383.96

$767.92
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS

BID NO. STA1118

RX NO. 2200 14012900175
DATE: 4/9/2014
BUYER: Steve Aden

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Ferguson Enterprises, Inc.

Vendor Name dba/ Ferguson Waterworks [HD Supply Waterworks
City, State Georgetown, TX Pflugerville, TX
MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY [UNIT| PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

SLEEVE D.l. MECH JT REGULAR 42 X 24,
TYLER PIPE, A-1 FOUNDRY, SOMEP OR
BUYER APPROVED EQUAL.

43 CSN 659-73-521-002 2 EA $2,520.00 $5,040.00 $2,403.33 $4,806.66

SLEEVE D.l. MECH JT REGULAR 48 X 24,
TYLER PIPE, A-1 FOUNDRY, SOMEP OR
BUYER APPROVED EQUAL.

44 CSN 659-73-521-003 2 EA $3,540.00 $7,080.00 $3,376.11 $6,752.22

SLEEVE CI CUTTING-IN OVERSIZE,
MECH JT X PLAIN END 4 INCH (DUAL
PURPOSE) IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL
NO. WW-27B

45 CSN 890-49-315-001 6 EA No Bid No Bid $209.43 $1,256.58

ROD, STL UNDERGROUND ALL THREAD
5/8 INCH X 10 FT., STEEL ALL THREAD,
PLAIN OR ZINC PLATED IS ACCEPTABLE,
OR BUYER APPROVED EQUAL. CSN 890-
46 49-355-002 10 EA $1.65 $16.50 $10.56 $105.60

ROD, STL UNDERGROUND ALL THREAD
3/4 INCH X 10 FT., STEEL, ALL THREAD,
PLAIN OR ZINC PLATED IS ACCEPTABLE,
OR BUYER APPROVED EQUAL. CSN 890-
47 49-355-003 100 EA $2.87 $287.00 $14.44 $1,444.00

DUC LUG, UNDERGROUND FOR 4 INCH
TO 12 INCH PIPE DUC LUG OR BUYER
APPROVED EQUAL.

48 CSN 890-49-355-006 300 EA $3.02 $906.00 $1.50 $450.00

TEE ClI MECH JT 6X6X6 INCHES IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
49 CSN 890-49-290-008 20 EA $100.20 $2,004.00 $95.56 $1,911.20
TEE CI MECH JT 8 X8 X 6 INCHES
SWIVEL GLAND MJ IN ACCORDANCE
WITH SPL NO. WW-27B

50 CSN 659-85-212-001 10 EA $144.60 $1,446.00 $119.02 $1,190.20
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BID NO.
RX NO.
DATE:
BUYER:

STA1118

2200 14012900175
4/9/2014

Steve Aden

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name

Ferguson Enterprises, Inc.
dba/ Ferguson Waterworks

HD Supply Waterworks

City, State

Georgetown, TX

Pflugerville, TX

MBE/WBE

ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION

EST
QTY

UNIT

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

51

TEE CIMECH JT 8 X8 X 8 INCHES IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
CSN 890-49-290-021

15

EA

$150.00 $2,250.00

$143.47 $2,152.05

52

TEE CI MECH JT 12 X 12 X 6 INCHES IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
CSN 890-49-290-013

EA

$202.80 $811.20

$193.41 $773.64

53

TEE CI MECH JT 12 X 12 X 12 INCHS IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
CSN 890-49-290-014

EA

$300.00 $1,500.00

$286.11 $1,430.55

54

TEE CI MECH JT 12 X 12 X 8 INCHS IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27B
CSN 890-49-290-016

EA

$234.00 $936.00

$223.17 $892.68

55

GLAND PACK MECH JT — W/NUTS,
BOLTS, GASKET, FOR DI FITTINGS 4
INCH IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO.
WW-27B

CSN 659-44-891-001

300

EA

$14.30 $4,290.00

$12.59 $3,777.00

56

GLAND PACK MECH JT - W/NUTS,
BOLTS, GASKET, FOR DI FITTINGS 6
INCH IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO.
WW-27B CSN 659-44-891-002

1,500

EA

$19.50 $29,250.00

$17.17 $25,755.00

57

GLAND PACK MECH JT — W/NUTS,
BOLTS, GASKET, FOR DI FITTINGS 8
INCH IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO.
WW-27B CSN 659-44-891-003

500

EA

$22.10 $11,050.00

$19.46 $9,730.00

58

GLAND PACK MECH JT — W/NUTS,
BOLTS, GASKET, FOR DI FITTINGS 12
INCH IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO.
WW-27B CSN 659-44-891-005

150

EA

$33.15 $4,972.50

$18.65 $2,797.50

59

GLAND PACK MECH JT — W/NUTS,
BOLTS, GASKET, FOR DI FITTINGS 14
INCH IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO.
WW-27B CSN 659-44-891-006

EA

$51.35 $308.10

$45.21 $271.26
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS

BID NO. STA1118

RX NO. 2200 14012900175
DATE: 4/9/2014
BUYER: Steve Aden

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Ferguson Enterprises, Inc.

Vendor Name dba/ Ferguson Waterworks [HD Supply Waterworks
City, State Georgetown, TX Pflugerville, TX
MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY [UNIT| PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

GLAND PACK MECH JT — W/NUTS,

BOLTS, GASKET, FOR DI FITTINGS 16
INCH IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO.
60 WW-27B CSN 659-44-891-007 20 EA $54.60 $1,092.00 $48.07 $961.40

GLAND PACK MECH JT — W/NUTS,
BOLTS, GASKET, FOR DI FITTINGS 18
INCH TYLER PIPE OR BUYER APPROVED
61 EQUAL CSN 659-44-891-008 4 EA $73.45 $293.80 $64.66 $258.64

GLAND PACK MECH JT — W/NUTS,

BOLTS, GASKET, FOR DI FITTINGS 24
INCH IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO.
62 WW-27B CSN 659-44-891-009 20 EA $143.00 $2,860.00 $125.89 $2,517.80

GLAND PACK MECH JT — W/NUTS,

BOLTS, GASKET, FOR DI FITTINGS 20
INCH IN ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO.
63 WW-27B CSN 659-44-891-010 8 EA $102.05 $816.40 $89.84 $718.72

GLAND PACK MECH JT — W/NUTS,
BOLTS, GASKET, FOR DI FITTINGS 30
INCH TYLER PUPE OR BUYER
APPROVED EQUAL

64 CSN 659-44-891-012 4 EA $255.45 $1,021.80 $224.88 $899.52

GLAND PACK MECH JT — W/NUTS,
BOLTS, GASKET, FOR DI FITTINGS 36
INCH TYLER PIPE OR BUYER APPROVED
EQUAL

65  |CSN 659-44-891-013 4 EA $373.10 $1,492.40 $328.46 $1,313.84

GLAND PACK MECH JT — W/NUTS,
BOLTS, GASKET, FOR DI FITTINGS 42
INCH TYLER PIPE OR BUYER APPROVED
EQUAL

66  |CSN 659-44-891-014 4 EA $641.55 $2,566.20 $564.78 $2,259.12
GLAND PACK MECH JT — W/NUTS,
BOLTS, GASKET, FOR DI FITTINGS 48
INCH TYLER PIPE OR BUYER APPROVED
EQUAL

67  |CSN 659-44-891-015 4 EA $816.40 $3,265.60 $586.13 $2,344.52
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS
BID NO. STA1118
RX NO. 2200 14012900175
DATE: 4/9/2014
BUYER: Steve Aden

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Ferguson Enterprises, Inc.
Vendor Name dba/ Ferguson Waterworks
City, State

MBE/WBE

HD Supply Waterworks
Pflugerville, TX

Georgetown, TX

ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION

EST
QTY

UNIT

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

68

GLAND PACK MECH JT (DUO) — W/NUTS,
BOLTS, GASKET, FOR OVERSIZE DI

FITTINGS 4 INCH TYLER PIPE OR BUYER
APPROVED EQUAL CSN 659-44-892-001

10

EA

No Bid

No Bid

$9.67

$96.70

69

GLAND PACK MECH JT (DUO) — W/NUTS,
BOLTS, GASKET, FOR OVERSIZE DI

FITTINGS 6 INCH TYLER PIPE OR BUYER
APPROVED EQUAL CSN 659-44-892-002

50

EA

No Bid

No Bid

$14.00

$700.00

70

GLAND PACK MECH JT (DUO) — W/NUTS,
BOLTS, GASKET, FOR OVERSIZE DI
FITTINGS 8 INCH TYLER PIPE OR BUYER
APPROVED EQUAL

CSN 659-44-892-003

15

EA

No Bid

No Bid

$15.87

$238.05

71

GLAND PACK MECH JT (DUO) — W/NUTS,
BOLTS, GASKET, FOR OVERSIZE DI
FITTINGS 12 INCH TYLER PIPE OR
BUYER APPROVED EQUAL

CSN 659-44-892-005

10

EA

No Bid

No Bid

$18.66

$186.60

72

PIPE JOINT RESTRAINT FOR D.I. PIPE MJ
GLANDS 4 INCH (MEGALUG) IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27A
CSN 659-44-901-001

40

EA

$20.15

$806.00

$26.44

$1,057.60

73

PIPE JOINT RESTRAINT FOR D.I. PIPE MJ
GLANDS 6 INCH (MEGALUG) IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27A
CSN 659-44-901-002

600

EA

$23.40

$14,040.00

$32.67

$19,602.00

74

PIPE JOINT RESTRAINT FOR D.I. PIPE MJ
GLANDS 8 INCH (MEGALUG) IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27A
CSN 659-44-901-003

125

EA

$35.10

$4,387.50

$44.56

$5,570.00

75

PIPE JOINT RESTRAINT FOR D.I. PIPE MJ
GLANDS 12 INCH (MEGALUG) IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27A
CSN 659-44-901-005

50

EA

$75.40

$3,770.00

$85.22

$4,261.00
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BID NO.
RX NO.
DATE:
BUYER:

STA1118

2200 14012900175
4/9/2014

Steve Aden

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name

Ferguson Enterprises, Inc.
dba/ Ferguson Waterworks

HD Supply Waterworks

City, State

Georgetown, TX

Pflugerville, TX

MBE/WBE

ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION

EST
QTY

UNIT

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

76

PIPE JOINT RESTRAINT FOR D.I. PIPE MJ
GLANDS 14 INCH (MEGALUG) IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27A
CSN 659-44-901-006

EA

$96.20

$384.80

$109.11

$436.44

77

PIPE JOINT RESTRAINT FOR D.I. PIPE MJ
GLANDS 16 INCH (MEGALUG) IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27A
CSN 659-44-901- 007

20

EA

$137.15

$2,743.00

$147.22

$2,944.40

78

PIPE JOINT RESTRAINT FOR PVC PIPE
MJ GLANDS 4 INCH (PVC MEGALUG) IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27A
CSN 659-44-902-001

25

EA

$24.05

$601.25

$30.44

$761.00

79

PIPE JOINT RESTRAINT FOR PVC PIPE
MJ GLANDS 6 INCH (PVC MEGALUG) IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27A
CSN 659-44-902-002

275

EA

$29.25

$8,043.75

$38.11

$10,480.25

80

PIPE JOINT RESTRAINT FOR PVC PIPE
MJ GLANDS 8 INCH (PVC MEGALUG) IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SPL NO. WW-27A
CSN 659-44-902-003

500

EA

$42.90

$21,450.00

$51.44

$25,720.00

81

HYD PT ADAPTER 6 X 24 STR. NIPPLE
SWIVEL & SOLID W/SWIVEL GLAND,
STAR PIPE # MJH0624 OR BUYER
APPROVED EQUAL

CSN 340-60-142-002

10

EA

$169.80

$1,698.00

$161.94

$1,619.40

82

ADAPTER, FOSTER CI MECH Jt 6 INCH
W/BOLTS & GASKETS, OR BUYER
APPROVED EQUAL.
CSN-659-06-931-001

30

EA

$106.28

$3,188.40

$78.47

$2,354.10

83

ADAPTER, FOSTER CI MECH Jt 8 INCH
W/BOLTS & GASKETS, OR BUYER
APPROVED EQUAL.
CSN-659-06-931-002

50

EA

$153.64

$7,682.00

$116.81

$5,840.50
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID NO.
RX NO.
DATE:
BUYER:

STA1118

2200 14012900175
4/9/2014

Steve Aden

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name

Ferguson Enterprises, Inc.
dba/ Ferguson Waterworks

HD Supply Waterworks

City, State

Georgetown, TX

Pflugerville, TX

MBE/WBE

ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION

EST
QTY

UNIT

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

84

CAP, CAST IRON, MECHANICAL JOINT
SIZE 4 INCH, OR BUYER APPROVED
EQUAL.

CSN-659-27-291-001

20

EA

$15.60

$312.00

$14.88

$297.60

85

CAP, CAST IRON, MECHANICAL JOINT
SIZE 6 INCH, OR BUYER APPROVED
EQUAL.

CSN-659-27-291-002

20

EA

$27.60

$552.00

$26.22

$524.40

86

CAP, CAST IRON, MECHANICAL SIZE
JOINT 8 INCH, OR BUYER APROVED
EQUAL.

CSN 659-27-291-003

20

EA

$45.60

$912.00

$43.49

$869.80

87

TEE, CIMECH Jt 8 INCH x 8 INCH x 8
INCH SWIVEL GLAND MJ, OR BUYER
APPROVED EQUAL.
CSN-659-85-212-002

10

EA

$219.60

$2,196.00

$199.13

$1,991.30

88

TEE,CI MECH Jt 12 INCH x 12 INCH X 6
INCH SWIVEL GLAND MJ, OR BUYER
APPROVED EQUAL.
CSN-659-85-212-003

10

EA

$208.80

$2,088.00

$210.59

$2,105.90

89

TEE,CI MECH Jt 12 INCH x 12 INCH X 8
INCH SWIVEL GLAND MJ, OR BUYER
APPROVED EQUAL.
CSN-659-85-212-004

10

EA

$312.60

$3,126.00

$282.44

$2,824.40

TOTAL BID

$261,974.52

$264,583.11

Prepared By: Julia Ramirez
Approved By: Stephen T. Aden
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