The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID NO.
RX NO.
DATE:
BUYER:

STA1142

2200 14082200520
10/1/2014

Steve Aden

FIRE HYDRANT REPAIR PARTS

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name

ACT Pipe & Supply

Ferguson Enterprises, Inc.
dba Ferguson Waterworks

HD Supply Water works

Hydraflo, Inc.

City, State

Pflugerville, TX

Georgetown, TX

Pflugervlle, TX

Beaumont, TX

MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY |UNIT| PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

Hydrant Part American Darling B62B

1 breakable rod coupling 62-29-30 15 EA $37.80 $567.00 $47.67 $715.05 $46.63 $699.45 No Bid No Bid
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B

2 seat O ring outside 62-36-2 30 EA $3.77 $113.10 $17.73 $531.90 $17.34 $520.20 No Bid No Bid
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B

3 seat O ring outside 62-36-3 30 EA $3.77 $113.10 $12.23 $366.90 $11.96 $358.80 No Bid No Bid
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B

4 frangible bolt and nut (break away bolt) 600 EA $5.85 $3,510.00 $12.23 $7,338.00 $11.96 $7,176.00 No Bid No Bid
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B

5 main valve 62-41 10 EA $55.80 $558.00 $73.34 $733.40 $69.47 $694.70 No Bid No Bid
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B

6 hose nozzle O ring 62-20-61 150 EA $3.42 $513.00 $6.73 $1,009.50 $6.58 $987.00 No Bid No Bid
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B

7 pumper nozzle O ring 62-25-61 150 EA $5.57 $835.50 $7.34 $1,101.00 $7.17 $1,075.50 No Bid No Bid
Hydrant Part American Darling B84B

8 pipe plug 84-5-3 100 EA $1.89 $189.00 $4.89 $489.00 $4.78 $478.00 No Bid No Bid
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B

9 pipe plug 62-5-3 100 EA $1.89 $189.00 $4.89 $489.00 $4.78 $478.00 No Bid No Bid
Hydrant Part American Darling B84B

10 seat O ring 84-36-1 50 EA $3.77 $188.50 $17.73 $886.50 $17.34 $867.00 No Bid No Bid
Hydrant Part American Darling B84B

11 housing O ring 84-2-2 50 EA $3.42 $171.00 $6.73 $336.50 $6.58 $329.00 No Bid No Bid
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B

12 drain lever rivet 62-34 50 EA $3.42 $171.00 $4.89 $244.50 $4.78 $239.00 No Bid No Bid
Hydrant Part American Darling B62B

13 upper rod 62-30-11 10 EA $166.50 $1,665.00 $168.67 $1,686.70 $159.79 $1,597.90 No Bid No Bid
Hydrant Part American Darling B84B

14 upper rod 84-30-11 10 EA $118.80 $1,188.00 $141.17 $1,411.70 $133.74 $1,337.40 No Bid No Bid
Hydrant Part 5 1/4 Clow Medallion main

15 valve kit M15, M16, M18, M20, M21, M22| 100 EA $88.20 $8,820.00 No Bid No Bid $53.09 $5,309.00 No Bid No Bid
Hydrant Part Mueller improved threaded

16 break away safety stem co H-75 15 EA $62.10 $931.50 $89.80 $1,347.00 $75.62 $1,134.30 $51.88 $778.20
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID NO. STA1142

RX NO. 2200 14082200520
DATE: 10/1/2014
BUYER: Steve Aden

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

FIRE HYDRANT REPAIR PARTS

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name

ACT Pipe & Supply

Ferguson Enterprises, Inc.
dba Ferguson Waterworks

HD Supply Water works

Hydraflo, Inc.

City, State

Pflugerville, TX

Georgetown, TX

Pflugervlle, TX

Beaumont, TX

MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY |UNIT| PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Hydrant Part 5 1/4 American Darling
17 B84B traffic model rod coupling 84-29-30 15 EA $37.80 $567.00 $47.67 $715.05 $46.63 $699.45 No Bid No Bid
Hydrant Part 5 1/4 Kennedy Guardian
18 K81A drain valve K8136 15 EA $274.50 $4,117.50 $185.50 $2,782.50 $156.21 $2,343.15 No Bid No Bid
Hydrant Part American Darling B84B
19 main hydrant valve 84-41 60 EA $55.80 $3,348.00 $73.34 $4.,400.40 $69.47 $4,168.20 No Bid No Bid
Hydrant Part American Darling B84B
20 pumper nozzle 4" 84-25-3 15 EA No Bid No Bid $239.56 $3,593.40 $226.32 $3,394.80 No Bid No Bid
Hyd Part Mueller improved uper stem H-
21 74 10 EA $124.20 $1,242.00 $149.02 $1,490.20 $125.48 $1,254.80 $86.53 $865.30
Hyd Part Kennedy 5 1/4 Repair Kit K10B
22 Model 10 EA $184.50 $1,845.00 $219.95 $2,199.50 $255.12 $2,551.20 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL BID $30,842.20 $33,867.70 $37,692.85 $1,643.50

Prepared By: Julia Ramirez
Approved By: Stephen T. Aden
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