The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID NO.
RX NO.
DATE:
BUYER:

STA1154

2200 15021700205
3/31/2015

Steve Aden

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

SCHEDULE 40 PVC FITTINGS AND PIPE

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name ACT Pipe & Supply Ferguson Enterprises John Deere Landscapes Texas Irrigation Supply
City, State Pflugerville, TX Austin, TX Austin, TX Round Rock, TX
MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY |UNIT| PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Group 1
ADAPTER PVC SCHEDULED 40, 1"
1 SLIP TO 1" FIPT 50 EA $0.26 $13.00 $0.231 $11.55 $0.23 $11.50 $0.23 $11.50
ADAPTER PVC SCHEDULED 40, 1"
2 SLIP TO 1" MIPT 50 EA $0.29 $14.50 $0.253 $12.65 $0.26 $13.00 $0.26 $13.00
ADAPTER PVC SCHEDULED 40, 1 1/2"
3 SLIP TO 1 1/2" FIPT 25 EA $0.46 $11.50 0.410 $10.25 $0.41 $10.25 $0.42 $10.50
ADAPTER PVC SCHEDULED 40, 1 1/2"
4 SLIP TO 1 1/2" MIPT 25 EA $0.46 $11.50 $0.410 $10.25 $0.41 $10.25 $0.42 $10.50
ADAPTER PVC SCHEDULED 40, 1 1/4"
5 SLIP TO 1 1/4" FIPT 25 EA $0.40 $10.00 $0.358 $8.95 $0.36 $9.00 $0.36 $9.00
ADAPTER PVC SCHEDULED 40, 1 1/4"
6 SLIP TO 1 1/4" MIPT 25 EA $0.35 $8.75 $0.307 $7.68 $0.31 $7.75 $0.31 $7.75
ADAPTER PVC SCHEDULED 40, 1/2"
7 SLIP TO 1/2" FIPT 25 EA $0.18 $4.50 $0.157 $3.93 $0.16 $4.00 $0.16 $4.00
ADAPTER PVC SCHEDULED 40, 1/2"
8 SLIP TO 1/2" MIPT 25 EA $0.14 $3.50 $0.126 $3.15 $0.13 $3.25 $0.13 $3.25
ADAPTER PVC SCHEDULED 40, 2"
9 SLIP TO 2" FIPT 25 EA $0.62 $15.50 $0.552 $13.80 $0.56 $14.00 $0.56 $14.00
ADAPTER PVC SCHEDULED 40, 2"
10 SLIP TO 2" MIPT 25 EA $0.61 $15.25 $0.539 $13.48 $0.54 $13.50 $0.55 $13.75
ADAPTER PVC SCHEDULED 40, 3/4"
11 SLIP TO 3/4" FIPT 75 EA $0.23 $17.25 $0.201 $15.08 $0.20 $15.00 $0.21 $15.75
ADAPTER PVC SCHEDULED 40, 3/4"
12 SLIP TO 3/4" MIPT 100 EA $0.16 $16.00 $0.140 $14.00 $0.14 $14.00 $0.14 $14.00
13 COUPLING PVC SCHEDULE 40 1" 200 EA $0.25 $50.00 $0.222 $44.40 $0.22 $44.00 $0.23 $46.00
14 COUPLING PVC SCHEDULE 40 1 1/2" 50 EA $0.37 $18.50 $0.329 $16.45 $0.33 $16.50 $0.34 $17.00
15 COUPLING PVC SCHEDULE 40 1 1/4" 50 EA $0.35 $17.50 $0.307 $15.35 $0.31 $15.50 $0.31 $15.50
16 COUPLING PVC SCHEDULE 40 1/2" 150 EA $0.10 $15.00 $0.092 $13.80 $0.09 $13.50 $0.10 $15.00
17 COUPLING PVC SCHEDULE 40 2" 100 EA $0.57 $57.00 $0.499 $49.90 $0.50 $50.00 $0.51 $51.00
18 COUPLING PVC SCHEDULE 40 3/4" 200 EA $0.14 $28.00 $0.126 $25.20 $0.13 $26.00 $0.13 $26.00
19 COUPLING PVC SCHEDULE 40 2 1/2" 10 EA $1.26 $12.60 $1.107 $11.07 $1.12 $11.20 $1.14 $11.40
20 COUPLING PVC SCHEDULE 40 3" 10 EA $1.97 $19.70 $1.735 $17.35 $1.75 $17.50 $1.79 $17.90
21 ELBOW PVC SCHEDULE 4045 DEG 1"| 30 EA $0.49 $14.70 $0.432 $12.96 $0.44 $13.20 $0.44 $13.20




The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID NO.
RX NO.
DATE:
BUYER:

STA1154

2200 15021700205
3/31/2015

Steve Aden

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
SCHEDULE 40 PVC FITTINGS AND PIPE

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name ACT Pipe & Supply Ferguson Enterprises John Deere Landscapes Texas Irrigation Supply
City, State Pflugerville, TX Austin, TX Austin, TX Round Rock, TX
MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY |UNIT| PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
ELBOW PVC SCHEDULE 40 45 DEG 1
22 1/2" 25 EA $0.86 $21.50 $0.754 $18.85 $0.76 $19.00 $0.77 $19.25
ELBOW PVC SCHEDULE 40 45 DEG 1
23 1/4" 15 EA $0.68 $10.20 $0.602 $9.03 $0.61 $9.15 $0.62 $9.30
ELBOW PVC SCHEDULE 40 45 DEG
24 1/2" 25 EA $0.26 $6.50 $0.231 $5.78 $0.23 $5.75 $0.23 $5.75
25 ELBOW PVC SCHEDULE 40 45 DEG 2"| 25 EA $1.11 $27.75 $0.983 $24.58 $0.99 $24.75 $1.01 $25.25
ELBOW PVC SCHEDULE 40 45 DEG
26 3/4" 25 EA $0.40 $10.00 $0.358 $8.95 $0.36 $9.00 $0.36 $9.00
27 ELBOW PVC SCHEDULE 40 90 DEG 1"| 100 EA $0.32 $32.00 $0.281 $28.10 $0.28 $28.00 $0.29 $29.00
ELBOW PVC SCHEDULE 40 90 DEG 1
28 1/2" 25 EA $0.61 $15.25 $0.536 $13.40 $0.54 $13.50 $0.55 $13.75
ELBOW PVC SCHEDULE 40 90 DEG 1
29 1/4" 25 EA $0.56 $14.00 $0.497 $12.43 $0.50 $12.50 $0.52 $13.00
ELBOW PVC SCHEDULE 40 90 DEG
30 1/2" 100 EA $0.16 $16.00 $0.140 $14.00 $0.14 $14.00 $0.14 $14.00
31 ELBOW PVC SCHEDULE 40 90 DEG 2"| 25 EA $0.95 $23.75 $0.839 $20.98 $0.85 $21.25 $0.86 $21.50
ELBOW PVC SCHEDULE 40 90 DEG
32 3/4" 100 EA $0.18 $18.00 $0.157 $15.70 $0.16 $16.00 $0.16 $16.00
PIPE PVC SCHEDULE 40 1" x 20, bell
33 end 1,000 FT $0.31 $310.00 $57.415 $57,415.00 $0.32 $320.00 $0.32 $320.00
PIPE PVC SCHEDULE 401 1/2" x 20',
34 bell end 1,500 FT $0.47 $705.00 $64.350 $96,525.00 $0.50 $750.00 $0.49 $735.00
PIPE PVC SCHEDULE 401 1/4" x 20',
35 bell end 200 FT $0.38 $76.00 $70.835 $14,167.00 $0.42 $84.00 $0.41 $82.00
PIPE PVC SCHEDULE 40 1/2" x 20', bell
36 end 900 FT $0.20 $180.00 $31.240 $28,116.00 $0.16 $144.00 $0.16 $144.00
PIPE PVC SCHEDULE 40 2" x 20', bell
37 end 2,500 FT $0.63 $1,575.00 $87.542 $218,855.00 $0.68 $1,700.00 $0.67 $1,675.00
PIPE PVC SCHEDULE 40 3/4" x 20', bell
38 end 1,000 FT $0.22 $220.00 $34.657 $34,657.00 $0.22 $220.00 $0.22 $220.00
PIPE PVC SCHEDULE 40 2 1/2" x 20', 200 ET
39 bell end $1.00 $200.00 $176.285 $35,257.00 $1.12 $224.00 $1.09 $218.00
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID NO.
RX NO.
DATE:
BUYER:

STA1154

2200 15021700205
3/31/2015

Steve Aden

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
SCHEDULE 40 PVC FITTINGS AND PIPE

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name ACT Pipe & Supply Ferguson Enterprises John Deere Landscapes Texas Irrigation Supply
City, State Pflugerville, TX Austin, TX Austin, TX Round Rock, TX
MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY |UNIT| PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
PIPE PVC SCHEDULE 40 3" x 20, bell 100 ET
40 end $1.13 $113.00 $187.228 $18,722.80 $1.33 $133.00 $130.00 $13,000.00
TEE PVC SCHEDULE 40 1/2" x 1/2" x o5 EA
41 1/2" $0.20 $5.00 $0.174 $4.35 $0.18 $4.50 $0.18 $4.50
TEE PVC SCHEDULE 40 3/4" x 3/4" x o5 EA
42 3/4" $0.23 $5.75 $0.201 $5.03 $0.20 $5.00 $0.21 $5.25
43 TEE PVC SCHEDULE 40 1" x 1" x 1" 25 EA $0.42 $10.50 $0.375 $9.38 $0.38 $9.50 $0.38 $9.50
TEE PVC SCHEDULE 401 1/4" x 1 1/4" o5 EA
44 x11/4" $0.66 $16.50 $0.584 $14.60 $0.59 $14.75 $0.60 $15.00
TEE PVC SCHEDULE 401 1/2" x 1 1/2" o5 EA
45 x11/2" $0.81 $20.25 $0.711 $17.78 $0.72 $18.00 $0.73 $18.25
46 TEE PVC SCHEDULE 40 2" x 2" x 2" 25 EA $1.17 $29.25 $1.036 $25.90 $1.05 $26.25 $1.06 $26.50
TOTAL BID for Group 1 $4,035.45 $504,294.84 $4,158.80 $16,988.80
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID NO.
RX NO.
DATE:
BUYER:

STA1154

2200 15021700205
3/31/2015

Steve Aden

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
SCHEDULE 40 PVC FITTINGS AND PIPE

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name ACT Pipe & Supply Ferguson Enterprises John Deere Landscapes Texas Irrigation Supply

City, State Pflugerville, TX Austin, TX Austin, TX Round Rock, TX

MBE/WBE

ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY |UNIT| PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Group 2

47 PIPE GALV IRON 3/8" x 21' 105 FT No Bid No Bid $7.45 $782.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
48 PIPE GALV IRON 1/2" x 21' 210 FT No Bid No Bid $3.25 $682.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
49 PIPE GALV IRON 3/4" x 21' 210 FT No Bid No Bid $3.43 $720.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
50 PIPE GALV IRON 1" x 21' 210 FT No Bid No Bid $4.73 $993.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
51 PIPE GALV IRON 1 1/2" x 21' 420 FT No Bid No Bid $6.86 $2,881.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
52 PIPE GALV IRON 2" x 21' 420 FT No Bid No Bid $8.84 $3,712.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
53 NIPPLE GALV IRON 1/2" x 3" 25 EA $0.48 $12.00 $1.254 $31.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
54 NIPPLE GALV IRON 3/8" x 2" 25 EA $0.54 $13.50 $1.414 $35.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
55 NIPPLE GALV IRON 3/8" x 3" 25 EA $0.73 $18.25 $1.900 $47.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
56 NIPPLE GALV IRON 1/4" x 2" 25 EA $0.51 $12.75 $1.334 $33.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
57 NIPPLE GALV IRON 1/2" x 5" 25 EA $0.71 $17.75 $1.839 $45.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
58 NIPPLE GALV IRON 3/4" x 3" 25 EA $0.56 $14.00 $1.455 $36.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
59 NIPPLE GALV IRON 3/4" x 5" 25 EA $0.87 $21.75 $2.242 $56.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60 NIPPLE GALV IRON 1" x 3" 25 EA $0.82 $20.50 $2.124 $53.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
61 NIPPLE GALV IRON 2" x 3" 25 EA $1.60 $40.00 $4.142 $103.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
62 NIPPLE GALV IRON 2" x 5" 25 EA $2.48 $62.00 $6.449 $161.23 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
63 ELBOW GALV IRON STREET 3/4" 25 EA $1.31 $32.75 $3.731 $93.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
64 ELBOW GALV IRON 90 DEG 3/4" 25 EA $0.76 $19.00 $2.085 $52.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
65 PLUG GALV IRON 1/4" 10 EA $0.73 $7.30 $0.179 $1.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
66 PLUG GALV IRON 3/8" 10 EA $0.73 $7.30 $0.263 $2.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
67 PLUG GALV IRON 1/2" 10 EA $0.92 $9.20 $1.647 $16.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
68 PLUG GALV IRON 3/4" 20 EA $0.92 $18.40 $2.423 $48.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
69 BUSHING GALV IRON 3/4" x 1/2" 20 EA $1.25 $25.00 $1.095 $21.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
70 BUSHING GALV IRON 1" x 3/4" 20 EA $1.41 $28.20 $4.228 $84.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
71 BUSHING GALV IRON 1 1/2" x 3/4" 25 EA $2.76 $69.00 $7.932 $198.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
72 BUSHING GALV IRON 1 1/2" x 1" 25 EA $2.48 $62.00 $6.653 $166.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
73 BUSHING GALV IRON 2" x 1 1/2" 25 EA $2.66 $66.50 $7.40 $185.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
74 REDUCER GALV IRON 3/4" x 1/2" 10 EA $1.04 $10.40 $3.265 $32.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
75 REDUCER GALV IRON 1" x 3/4" 10 EA $1.61 $16.10 $5.373 $53.73 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
76 REDUCER GALV IRON 1 1/4" x 1" 10 EA $2.21 $22.10 $7.342 $73.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
77 REDUCER GALV IRON 1 1/2" x 1" 10 EA $2.85 $28.50 $9.652 $96.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
78 REDUCER GALV IRON 2" x 3/4" 10 EA $4.04 $46.40 $15.77 $157.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
79 REDUCER GALV IRON 2" x 1" 10 EA $3.88 $38.80 $13.166 $131.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
80 REDUCER GALV IRON 2" x 1 1/2" 10 EA $3.88 $38.80 $13.166 $131.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID NO. STA1154

RX NO. 2200 15021700205
DATE: 3/31/2015
BUYER: Steve Aden

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

SCHEDULE 40 PVC FITTINGS AND PIPE

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name ACT Pipe & Supply Ferguson Enterprises John Deere Landscapes Texas Irrigation Supply
City, State Pflugerville, TX Austin, TX Austin, TX Round Rock, TX
MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY |UNIT| PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
81 CAP GALV 3/4" 25 EA $0.95 $23.75 $2.803 $70.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
82 CAP GALV 2" 25 EA $2.45 $61.25 $8.212 $205.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
83 CAP GALV 1/4" 10 EA $0.88 $8.80 $0.451 $4.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
84 NIPPLE BRASS 1-1/2" x 6" 50 EA $12.55 $627.50 $16.844 $842.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
85 NIPPLE BRASS 1/8" x 2" 25 EA $0.79 $19.75 $1.064 $26.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
86 NIPPLE BRASS 1/8" x 3" 25 EA $0.97 $24.25 $1.301 $32.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
87 NIPPLE BRASS 1/8" X 6" 25 EA $1.67 $41.75 $2.237 $55.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL BID for Group 2 $1,585.30 $13,161.49 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL BID for Geoup 1 & 2 $5,620.75 $517,456.33 $4,158.80 $16,988.80

Prepared By: Julia

Ramirez

Approved By: Stephen T. Aden
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