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BID NO. 
RX NO.   
DATE:  
BUYER:  

ITEM 
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION

EST 
QTY UNIT

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

1 Place New Cable, Lashed (ABV*) 100000 FT. $0.59 $59,000.00 $0.55 $55,000.00 $0.63 $63,000.00 $0.65 $65,000.00 
2 Place New Cable, Lashed (not ABV) 10000 FT. $0.59 $5,900.00 $0.59 $5,900.00 $0.65 $6,500.00 $0.90 $9,000.00 

3 Place Inner duct/Maxcell in Existing Conduit
10000 FT.

$0.60 $6,000.00 $0.60 $6,000.00 $0.60 $6,000.00 $0.35 $3,500.00 
4 Place New Cable in Existing Conduit 50000 FT. $0.38 $19,000.00 $0.50 $25,000.00 $0.55 $27,500.00 $0.45 $22,500.00 
5 Overlash New Cable to Existing 25000 FT. $0.58 $14,500.00 $0.60 $15,000.00 $0.59 $14,750.00 $0.70 $17,500.00 
6 Trim Trees, Individual Spans (ABV)      20 SPAN $30.00 $600.00 $14.50 $290.00 $80.00 $1,600.00 $28.00 $560.00 
7 Place or Replace Tree Guard 5 EA No Bid No Bid $1.00 $5.00 $25.00 $125.00 $1.68 $8.40 
8 Rework Cable around Tree Limb 100 HR. No Bid No Bid $35.00 $3,500.00 $29.00 $2,900.00 $18.06 $1,806.00 
9 Place Fully Loaded Fiber Patch Panel (FPP) 100 EA $20.00 $2,000.00 $15.00 $1,500.00 $25.00 $2,500.00 $0.68 $68.00 

10
Place Fiber Distribution Panel/Connector 
Housing (FDP)

10 EA
No Bid No Bid $10.00 $100.00 $25.00 $250.00 $6.80 $68.00 

11 Place Conenctor Panel in FDP 120 EA No Bid No Bid $1.00 $120.00 $10.00 $1,200.00 $0.68 $81.60 

12
Place Polished SC or ST connector/Terminate 
SM Fiber 

1500 EA
$14.50 $21,750.00 $15.00 $22,500.00 $10.00 $15,000.00 $9.68 $14,520.00 

13 Repair and Replace Existing Splice Case 2 EA No Bid No Bid $110.00 $220.00 $50.00 $100.00 $2.00 $4.00 
14 Hang or Rehang splice case 25 EA $50.00 $1,250.00 $55.00 $1,375.00 $50.00 $1,250.00 $60.00 $1,500.00 
15 Place Extension Bracket 15 EA No Bid No Bid $30.00 $450.00 $30.00 $450.00 $30.00 $450.00 

16
Fusion Splicing, SM Fiber  (12 strand 
minimum)

2500 STRAND
$17.50 $43,750.00 $16.50 $41,250.00 $20.00 $50,000.00 $15.00 $37,500.00 

17 Bi-Directional OTDR Testing (node to node)
2500 STRAND

$4.00 $10,000.00 $2.40 $6,000.00 $8.00 $20,000.00 $6.98 $17,450.00 

18
Bi-Directional Power Meter Testing (node to 
node)

2500 STRAND
$2.50 $6,250.00 $2.40 $6,000.00 $10.00 $25,000.00 $6.90 $17,250.00 

19 Transfer Cable at Deadend Pole 5 EA $40.00 $200.00 $35.00 $175.00 $25.00 $125.00 $35.00 $175.00 
20 Transfer Down or Overhead Guy 5 EA $10.00 $50.00 $35.00 $175.00 $25.00 $125.00 $18.75 $93.75 
21 Transfer Extension Bracket 5 EA $10.00 $50.00 $30.00 $150.00 $25.00 $125.00 $0.68 $3.40 

22
Transfer Riser Cable & U-guard  (90 degree 
bend, cable, duct and/or innerduct)

5 EA
$50.00 $250.00 $35.00 $175.00 $25.00 $125.00 $11.68 $58.40 
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23 Transfer Sidewalk Guy 5 EA $15.00 $75.00 $12.00 $60.00 $25.00 $125.00 $8.68 $43.40 
24 Top Pole 5 EA $15.00 $75.00 $10.00 $50.00 $25.00 $125.00 $0.68 $3.40 
25 Contact Steel Pole 50 EA $35.00 $1,750.00 $40.00 $2,000.00 $45.00 $2,250.00 $8.68 $434.00 
26 Pole Make ready 200 EA $20.00 $4,000.00 $35.00 $7,000.00 $25.00 $5,000.00 $18.00 $3,600.00 
27 Unlash/Relash Broken Lashing Wire 10 SPAN $65.00 $650.00 $97.50 $975.00 $50.00 $500.00 $50.00 $500.00 
28 Relocate Slack, Lashed Cable 25 SPAN $10.00 $250.00 $97.50 $2,437.50 $39.00 $975.00 $21.68 $542.00 
29 Delash Cable 10 SPAN $10.00 $100.00 $48.00 $480.00 $35.00 $350.00 $0.60 $6.00 
30 Delash Slack 500 FT. $0.65 $327.00 $0.32 $160.00 $0.50 $250.00 $0.06 $30.00 
31 Remove/Replace Strand 1000 FT. $0.35 $350.00 $0.32 $320.00 $0.40 $400.00 $0.08 $80.00 
32 Remove Cable+Strand 1000 FT. $0.35 $350.00 $0.15 $150.00 $0.30 $300.00 $0.98 $980.00 
33 Procure and Place Wood Pole (30') 10 EA $650.00 $6,500.00 $400.00 $4,000.00 $300.00 $3,000.00 $190.00 $1,900.00 
34 Procure and Place Wood Pole (35') 10 EA $650.00 $6,500.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $300.00 $3,000.00 $190.00 $1,900.00 
35 Place New Anchor 20 EA $75.00 $1,500.00 $65.00 $1,300.00 $85.00 $1,700.00 $65.00 $1,300.00 
36 Place New or Replace Overhead Guy 40 EA $10.00 $400.00 $38.50 $1,540.00 $30.00 $1,200.00 $95.00 $3,800.00 
37 Place, Replace or Rehoist Down Guy 5 EA $12.00 $60.00 $12.00 $60.00 $15.00 $75.00 $6.80 $34.00 
38 Place or Replace Guy Guard 5 EA $5.00 $25.00 $8.00 $40.00 $5.00 $25.00 $0.68 $3.40 
39 Place New or Replace Sidewalk Guy 5 EA $30.00 $150.00 $12.00 $60.00 $50.00 $250.00 $6.98 $34.90 
40 Place New Strand, with hardware 90000 FT. $0.35 $31,500.00 $0.35 $31,500.00 $0.39 $35,100.00 $0.45 $40,500.00 
41 Place New Riser 25 EA $20.00 $500.00 $30.00 $750.00 $25.00 $625.00 $6.80 $170.00 
42 Hwy Closing with Police Support 32 HR. $87.00 $2,784.00 $48.00 $1,536.00 $45.00 $1,440.00 $46.80 $1,497.60 
43 Traffic Control Setup 15 DAY $95.00 $1,425.00 $298.00 $4,470.00 $125.00 $1,875.00 $98.98 $1,484.70 
44 Troubleshooting 200 HR. No Bid No Bid $35.00 $7,000.00 $35.00 $7,000.00 $36.68 $7,336.00 
45 Mobilization for afterhour emergency response 8 EA $250.00 $2,000.00 $52.50 $420.00 $125.00 $1,000.00 $68.98 $551.84 

46 Tree Guard 5 EA $1.15 $5.75 $4.44 $22.20 $4.63 $23.15 $4.25 $21.25 
47 Anchor Rods 100 EA $34.45 $3,445.00 $15.76 $1,576.00 $16.67 $1,667.00 $15.28 $1,528.00 
48 Small Splice Case 20 EA $119.04 $2,380.80 $139.15 $2,783.00 $121.24 $2,424.80 $126.50 $2,530.00 
49 Large Splice Case 10 EA $194.40 $1,944.00 $201.25 $2,012.50 $284.40 $2,844.00 $198.00 $1,980.00 
50 Riser Guard 25 EA $29.33 $733.25 $24.15 $603.75 $30.00 $750.00 $27.50 $687.50 

Section: B - Material
$275,827.79$262,193.50Section A: TOTAL BID $251,821.00 $305,190.00
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51 Sm Polish Connectors 1500 EA $3.96 $5,940.00 $6.57 $9,855.00 $4.39 $6,585.00 $4.03 $6,045.00 
52 1 Meter Fiber Patch Cable 100 EA $11.72 $1,172.00 $11.99 $1,199.00 $14.88 $1,488.00 $7.15 $715.00 
53 Spider fan out kit 100 EA $54.59 $5,459.00 $63.25 $6,325.00 $30.49 $3,049.00 $64.90 $6,490.00 
54 Buffer tube fan out kit 50 EA $15.94 $797.00 $19.32 $966.00 $16.20 $810.00 $16.50 $825.00 
55 Splice tray 10 EA $13.82 $138.20 $24.69 $246.90 $17.34 $173.40 $15.90 $159.00 
56 Strand with hardware 115000 IF. $0.26 $29,900.00 $0.18 $20,700.00 $0.19 $21,850.00 $0.46 $52,900.00 
57 Innerduct (3/4") 1000 IF. $0.37 $370.00 $0.41 $410.00 $0.42 $420.00 $0.39 $390.00 
58 Innerduct (1.5") 1000 IF. $0.47 $470.00 $0.52 $520.00 $0.66 $660.00 $0.50 $500.00 
59 Maxcell 3" 3-cell 1000 IF. $2.32 $2,320.00 $2.88 $2,880.00 $2.70 $2,700.00 $2.75 $2,750.00 
60 Maxcell 3" 2-cell 1000 IF. $2.18 $2,180.00 $2.40 $2,400.00 $1.76 $1,760.00 $3.08 $3,080.00 
61 Maxcell 2" 2-cell 4000 IF. $1.65 $6,600.00 $1.84 $7,360.00 $1.76 $7,040.00 $1.76 $7,040.00 
62 Maxcell 2" 1-cell 4000 IF. $0.89 $3,560.00 $0.99 $3,960.00 $0.85 $3,400.00 $0.94 $3,760.00 
63 24 Port Patch Panel (Fully Loaded) 100 EA $120.45 $12,045.00 $123.71 $12,371.00 $143.77 $14,377.00 $119.14 $11,914.00 
64 Corning CCH-04U Connector Housing 10 EA $259.71 $2,597.10 $294.40 $2,944.00 $295.46 $2,954.60 $297.00 $2,970.00 
65 Corning CCH-CP06-59 Connector Panel 40 EA $37.60 $1,504.00 $37.08 $1,483.20 $42.77 $1,710.80 $42.90 $1,716.00 
66 Corning CCH-CP08-3C Connector Panel 40 EA $52.42 $2,096.80 $35.32 $1,412.80 $59.65 $2,386.00 $60.50 $2,420.00 
67 Corning CCH-CP12-59 Connector Panel 40 EA $68.14 $2,725.60 $61.16 $2,446.40 $73.51 $2,940.40 $73.70 $2,948.00 

$346,670.25 $387,203.15

$88,383.50 $84,476.75 $82,013.15Section B: TOTAL BID

Approved By:  Sai Xoomsai Purcell

Section A & B TOTAL BID $340,204.50

$113,368.75

Prepared By:  Julia Ramirez

$389,196.54
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