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BID NO. 
RX NO.   
DATE:  
BUYER:  

ITEM 
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION

EST 
QTY UNIT

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

1
Driver Hourly Rate - Dump Truck  (12 
Yards) per specification 4.2 1,050 HR $55.00 $57,750.00 $70.00 $73,500.00 $58.00 $60,900.00 $87.50 $91,875.00 

2
Driver Hourly Rate - Tri-Axle (18 Yards) 
per specification 4.2 3,000 HR $65.00 $195,000.00 $82.00 $246,000.00 $70.00 $210,000.00 $117.00 $351,000.00 

3
Driver Hourly Rate - Belly-Dumps (24 
Yards) per specification 4.2 750 HR $85.00 $63,750.00 $95.00 $71,250.00 $85.00 $63,750.00 No Bid No Bid

4
Driver Hourly Rate - End-Dumps (24 
Yards) per specification 4.2 750 HR $85.00 $63,750.00 $95.00 $71,250.00 $85.00 $63,750.00 $125.00 $93,750.00 

5
Driver Hourly Rate - Centipede Truck (22 
Yards) per specification 4.2 750 HR $85.00 $63,750.00 No Bid No Bid $110.00 $82,500.00 No Bid No Bid 

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

Special Instructions:  Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name
City, State

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

TRUCKING AND HAULING SERVICES

8/19/2015

AgH2O Holding, LLCLewis Clark Trucking, LLC Melendrez Trucking, LLC
Del Valle, TX

Prepared By:  Julia Ramirez

Pflugerville, TX Austin, TX Round Rock, TX

$536,625.00

Approved By:  Georgia Billela

MBE/WBE

TOTAL BID $444,000.00 $480,900.00

6200 15022400219
GLB0023 REBID2

Georgia Billela

MG Limon Corporation dba 
Limon Construction

$462,000.00
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