City of Austin

Purchasing Office
P.O. Box 1088, Austin, TX 78767

May 26, 2020

Subject: Recommendation for Award of IFB 6300-DCM1022 - Erosion Control Materials

Thank you for your response to the IFB 6300-DCM1022 - Erosion Control Materials
solicitation for the City of Austin. The Purchasing staff has completed their evaluation and
has recommended award to L&M Bag & Supply Company, Inc.

Thank you for your continued interest in doing business with the City of Austin. A copy of the
final bid tab is attached for your review.

Sincerely,
DI ana r?/licgli;:(l)lilhsigned by Diana
Date: 2020.05.27 09:05:30
Mclntosh -~k

Diana C. Mclntosh
Procurement Specialist I
City of Austin
Purchasing Office
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CITY OF AUSTIN
BID TABULATION
EROSION CONTROL MATERIALS
SOLICITATION NO.:|IEB 6300-DCM1022
OPENING DATE (12-Mar-20
BUYER: Diana Mcintosh
Special Instructions: Offerors must use this Bid Sheet to submit pricing. Be advised that altering the bid sheet or taking exceptions to any portion of the solicitation may jeopardize acceptance of your Offer.
The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed, actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical or anticipated usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.
A bid of "0" (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of "no bid" or no response (space left blank) will be interpreted by the City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on that item. Be advised, a "no bid" or no response may be considered as non-responsive and may result in disqualification of the bid.
Prices offered on the bid sheet shall be all inclusive of fees not expressly allowed in the scope of work. The Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping or transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to deliver services or items to the Austin, Texas area. The Offeror shall provide all tools, labor, travel, and equipment necessary to perform the services required under this contract.
The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line items, cost, or any criteria or combination deemed most advantageous to the City.
ipt No. 1 2 3 4
Vendor Name GEO SOLUTIONS, INC. WHOLESALE AND MFR PVF INC. INNOVATIVE SOIL SOLUTIONS L&M BAG & SUPPLY COMPANY, INC.
Local Presence (Y/N) Y N Y N
MBEWBE
CATEGORY 1 - DESCRIPTION
SCOPE OF ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
ITEM UNIT OF EXTENDED UNIT OF UNIT OF UNIT OF
ITEM DESCRIPTION WORK . ANNUAL UNIT PRICE " ANNUAL UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE . ANNUAL UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE MANUFACTURER'S ANNUAL UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
NO. SECTION 500 MANUFACTURER'S INFORMATION MEASURE QUANTITY PRICE MANUFACTURER'S INFORMATION | MEASURE QUANTITY MANUFACTURER'S INFORMATION | MEASURE QUANTITY INFORMATION MEASURE QUANTITY
Or City Approved Equal: " .
Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: O @iy e G
Biaxial Geogrid, Tensar BX 1200 or City approved equal. Manufacturer: US Fabrics .
1.4 5.1 Manufacturer: S%’QSE 1,500 $ 155§ 2,325.00 [Part Number if bidding alternate: S%’QSE 1,500 $ 552| $ 8,280.00 [Manufacturer: S%’QSE 1,500 115] $ 1,725.00 g:;‘ﬂim:_ﬁf T S‘f{’:RAgE 150 | $ 092 $ 1,380.00
Approximate Unit Size = 13.1' x 164" or 240 sq yard Part Number if bidding alternate: BaseGrid 12 Part Number if bidding alternate: alternate: &
Unit Size Bid: Unit Size Bid: 13.12 ft x 164 ft or 240 Unit Size Bid: PP
sqyd Unit Size Bid:
y . Or City Approved Equal: " .
Uniaxial Geogrid, Tensar UX 1400 HS or City approved Or City Approved Equal: O City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal:
equal. X . Manufacturer: US Fabrics .
12 5.2 ’;,"ar;“’hjac“;’e':f Zfﬁa' Cft”""at"f’? S%’QSE 1,550 $ 2258 3,487.50 |Part Number if bidding alternate: S%’QSE 1,550 $ 5928 9,176.00 [Manufacturer: Synteen S%’QSE 1,550 122] $ 1,891.00 gar't“ﬂa“fe'zf _— S‘f{’:RAgE 1,550 $ 189§ 2,921.75
Approximate Unit Size = 4.3' x 250" or 120 sq yard art Number It bidding alternate: ensar BaseGrid 12 Part Number if bidding alternate: SF35 Gl RILITRIELIF (7 BleLelinle)
UX 1400 MSE (HS no longer available) Unit Size Bid: 13.12 ft x 164 ft or 240 Unit Size Bid: &' x 150', 100 s alternate:
Unit Size Bid: 4.3' X 250 sqyd T : ! 4 Unit Size Bid:
Wood Fiber Temporary Erosion Control Blanket with all Or City Approved Equal: . X Or City Approved Equal:
organic Materials, Western Excelsior Excel S-2 All Natural, Or City Approved Equal:
or City approved equal: Manufacture : __Western Excelsior__ SQUARE . SQUARE . SQUARE Manufacture : L&M Bag & SQUARE
1.3 5.3 Model No.: SS-2 All Naturan (Double Net YARD 3,000 $ 0.80| $ 2,400.00 |No Bid YARD 3,000 $ -1 s - Magulfa’;:tu.res.sv\z/e;\sltle;lnfrelen YARD 3,000 075( $ 2,250.00 Supply Company YARD 3,000 $ 062| $ 1,860.00
Approximate Unit Size = 4' x 180" or 80 sq yard Straw) U"fS. °'é. 5o 112 g.u’a Model No.: US-2XNN
Unit Size Bid: 4' x 112.5' (50 SY/Roll) nit Size Bid: & x 112. Unit Size Bid: 8 x 90
Coconut Fiber Temporary Erosion Control Blanket with all Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal:
organic Materials, Western Exceisior CC-4 All Natural or
1.4 City approved equal: 5.4 Manufacturer: S%L:QSE 1,700 $ 130 $ 2,210.00 |No Bid S%L:QSE 1,700 $ -1 3 - |Manufacturer: S%L:QSE 1,700 115( $ 1,955.00 [Manufacture : L&M Bag & SS{JLJRASE 1,700 $ 0.66| $ 1,126.25
Part Number if bidding alternate: Part Number if bidding alternate: Supply Company
Approximate Unit Size = 8' x 112.5' or 100 sq yard Unit Size Bid: Unit Size Bid: Model No.: US-2CNN
Unit Size Bid: 8' x 112.5'
Synthetic Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mat, Propex . . . Or City Approved Equal:
Lgndlok 450 or City approved equal: P Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: Y App a
SQUARE SQUARE SQUARE Manufacturer: SQUARE
1.5 : Qe @B , 55 Manufacture : Propex 4,000 $ 250( $ 10,000.00 [Manufacture : Propex 4,000 $ 792 $ 31,680.00 |Manufacture : Western Green 4,000 250 $ 10,000.00 - 4,000 $ 162| $ 6,480.00
Approximate Unit Size = 6.5' x 138.5' or 100 sq yard Model No.: Landlok TRM 450 YARD Model No.: 450 YARD Model No.: PP5-10 TRM YARD :I':l;r:\lal::ber if bidding YARD
Unit Size Bid: 8' x 112.5' (100 SY) Unit Size Bid: 8' x 125' Unit Size Bid: 8' x 112.5' (100 sy) PP
Unit Size Bid:
Temporary Erosion Control Blanket, American Excelsior Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: y . Or City Approved Equal:
Company Curlex Net Free or City approved equal: Or City Approved Equal:
Manufacture : Profile Products SQUARE Manufacture : American Excelsior SQUARE . SQUARE Manufacture : L&M Bag & SQUARE
16 | Approximate Unit Size = 8.5' x 106' or 100 sq yard 56 Model No.: Fulterra F4 Green Netless YARD 500 $ 097 $ 4850016 ompany YARD 500 $ 882| $ 4410.00 fManufacture . Western Green YARD 500 075 $ 375.00 [ Supply Company YARD EC0 $ ez © 21000
Wood Fiber Blanket Model No.: Curlex Net Free Unit Size éid' 8'x 112.5 Model No.: US-2XHV
Unit Size Bid: 6.5' x 90' (65 SY) Unit Size Bid: 8' x 90" : : Unit Size Bid: 8' x 90'
Temporary Erosion Control Blanket, Curlex High Velocity Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal:
or City approved equal: SQUARE SQUARE SQUARE Manufacture : L&M Bag & | SQUARE
17 5.7 Manufacture : North American Green VARD 500 $ 275|$ 137500 |NoBid YARD 500 $ -l s - |Manufacture : Wester Green YARD 500 100 $ 50000 [EETE - oD 500 $ 039 $ 195.00
Approximate Unit Size = 8' x 50' or 44 sq yard Model No.: SC-250 TRM Model No.: CC-4 ML;ZZ?/NDDTJSE?ZYXHV
Unit Size Bid: 6.5' x 55.5' (40 SY) Unit Size Bid: 8'x 112.5 Unit Size Bid: &' x 90'
Hydraulically-applied Erosion Control, Profile Flexterra HP- ) . y X y . Or City Approved Equal:
FGM (High Performance - Flexible Growth Medium) or City Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal:
1g |apProved equal 538 Manufacturer: BAG 50 $ 4475| S 2,237.50 |Manufacture : Flexterra BAG 50 $ 142.22| § 7,111.00 |Manufacture : Applegate BAG 50 38.00| § 1,900.00 g:;‘ﬂim:flf bicin BAG 50 $ 4425| s 2,212.50
Approximate Unit Size = 50 Ib bag Part Number if bidding alternate: Model No.: Flexible Growth Medium Model No.: Woodlock HPM M e 9
Unit Size Bid: Unit Size Bid: 50 Ib per bag Unit Size Bid: 50#'s bag i i,
Unit Size Bid:
Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: O @iy v G
19  |Hioh Flow Fiter Fabric 59 Manufacturer: SOUARE 1000 | 240(S  2,400.00 [No Bid SOUARE 1,000 $ s - |Manufacturer: SOUARE 1,000 0.85| 850,00 |Manufacturer: SAUARE ] 1000 | s 080 $ 800.00
Part Number if bidding alternate: Part Number if bidding alternate: M e 9
Unit Size Bid: Unit Size Bid: PP
Unit Size Bid:
Filter Fabric, 8 oz non-woven, TenCate Mirafi 180N, or City Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal:
approved equal: .
1.10 5.10 Manufacturer: S%’QSE 6,000 $ 0.94| $ 5,640.00 [No Bid S%’QSE 6,000 $ -|s - |Manufacturer: S%’QSE 6,000 0858 5,100.00 ng:m;“fmggﬁfx S‘f{’:RAgE 6,000 $ 061 3,660.00
Approximate Unit Size = 15' x 300" or 500 sq yd. Part Number if bidding alternate: Part Number if bidding alternate: Unit Size éid' 12.5' X 360"
Unit Size Bid: Unit Size Bid: OR 15' X 300'
Coir Fiber Logs, 12" x 10', Nedia KoirLog 12HD, or City Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal:
approved equal: Manufacturer:
1.41 5.11 Manufacturer: FEET 250 $ 5645  1,410.00 [NoBid FEET 250 $ -|s - |Manufacturer: FEET 250 5.00| $ 1,250.00 | E e i biciin FEET 250 $ 430| $ 1,075.00
Approximate Unit Size = 12" x 10' Log. Part Number if bidding alternate: Part Number if bidding alternate: alternate: Y
Unit Size Bid: Unit Size Bid: Unit Sizé Bid:
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Section 0600 - Bid Sheet
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SCOPE OF ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
ITEM UNIT OF EXTENDED UNIT OF UNIT OF UNIT OF
ITEM DESCRIPTION WORK " ANNUAL UNIT PRICE " ANNUAL UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE . ANNUAL UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE MANUFACTURER'S ANNUAL UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
NO. SECTION 500 MANUFACTURER'S INFORMATION MEASURE QUANTITY PRICE MANUFACTURER'S INFORMATION [ MEASURE QUANTITY MANUFACTURER'S INFORMATION | MEASURE QUANTITY INFORMATION MEASURE QUANTITY
Mulch Sock, 12", Mulch sock shall conform to the City of . . . . Or City Approved Equal:
Austin Specification 648S. Mulch sock shall be approved by Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal:
112 |Me O 5.12 Manufacturer: FEET 775 $ 390|$ 302250 |NoBid FEET 775 $ -ls - [Manutacturer: FEET 775 040( S 310,00 |Manufacturer: FEET 775 290 $ 2,247.50
Part Number if biddi It te: Part Number if biddi It te: Part Number if bidding
Approximate Unit Size = 12" dia x 10". a. .um gr 't bidding alternate: a. .um gr 't bidding alternate: alternate:
Unit Size Bid: Unit Size Bid: P .
Unit Size Bid:
Earth Anchors with cable attachment, Duckbill68-DB-1 or Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal:
City approved equal. Manufacture : Duckbill
113 513 Manufacturer: EACH 150 $ 8958 1,342.50 MEEZI%;OU'reEérd:JZn(;hor 68.DB1 EACH 150 $ 26.62| $ 3,993.00 |Manufacture : Gripple EACH 150 1035 | $ 1,552.50 |Manufacture : Platipus EACH 150 1050 | $ 1,575.00
Approximate Unit Size = 24 pieces/box Part Number if bidding alternate: Unit Size éid' 12 per box ( ri-ce Model No.: 3' Anchor Model No. S2 ARGS
Unit Size Bid: s P Unit Size Bid: Each Unit Size Bid: 1/8" x 3"
quoted per each)
Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: (Ol iy (ATt
1.14  |Bright Spike Nails, 3/8" x 8". 514 Manufacturer: EACH 7,000 $ 019 1,330.00 |No Bid EACH 7,000 $ -ls - [Manufacturer: EACH 7,000 -|s - [Mesiachucr N EACH 7,000 050 $ 3,500.00
[P . - . Part Number if bidding
Part Number if bidding alternate: Part Number if bidding alternate: B
Unit Size Bid: Unit Size Bid: CICHIEC
) ) Unit Size Bid:
Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal:
Fender Washers, 2" OD. . Manufacturer:
1.15 5.15 Manufacturer: EACH 10,000 $ 0.09( $ 900.00 |No Bid EACH 10,000 $ -1 $ - |Manufacturer: EACH 10,000 -1 $ - RO EACH 10,000 015( $ 1,500.00
[P . - . Part Number if bidding
Part Number if bidding alternate: Part Number if bidding alternate: B
Unit Size Bid: Unit Size Bid: CICHIEC
) ) Unit Size Bid:
Or City Approved Equal: (Ol iy (ATt
Wire Staples, 8" x 1". . . Manufacture : Deacero Manufacturer:
1.16 5.16 Manufaclurer.. o ) EACH 20,000 $ 0.08( $ 1,600.00 |No Bid EACH 20,000 $ -1 $ - |Model No.: 6" x 1" 11GA STAPLE EACH 20,000 003 $ 600.00 Part Number if bidding EACH 20,000 0.05( $ 940.00
Part Number if bidding alternate: o L B
o - Unit Size Bid: 1000 nPer Box alternate:
Unit Size Bid: P .
Unit Size Bid:
Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: (Ol iy (ATt
Wooden Stakes, 18" or City approved equal. Manufacture - E Dri Manufact .
117  |Approximate Unit Size = 100 each/box. 517 anutacture . tasy Urive EACH 1,000 $ 038§ 380.00 |Manufacturer: EACH 1,000 $ s - |Manufacturer: EACH 1,000 035| $ 350.00 |y anutacturer: - EACH 1,000 0.22| $ 220.00
Model No.: Wood Stake 2 Way Out - . - . Part Number if bidding
o i dL g " " Part Number if bidding alternate: Part Number if bidding alternate: B
Unit Size Bid: 1" x 2" x 24" (50/Bundle) o - o - alternate:
Unit Size Bid: Unit Size Bid: © o L
Unit Size Bid:
Or City Approved Equal:
Woven Wire Manufacture : Rangemaster SQUARE " SQUARE Manufacture : SQUARE Manufacturer: SQUARE
118 5.18 Model No.: Poultry Netting FEET 1,000 $ 0.07| § 72.00 [No Bid FEET 1,000 $ h $ ~ |Model No.: Berm Wire FEET 1,000 0.08] $ 80.00 Part Number if bidding FEET d:000 0.08| § 5200
Unit Size Bid: 72" x 150" roll Unit Size Bid: 6'x 150' alternate:
Unit Size Bid:
SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 1 = SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 1= §  42,617.00 SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 1=| § 64,650.00 SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 1 =| $ 30,688.50 SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 1 =| § 32,085.00
CATEGORY 2 - ADDITIONAL PRODUCTS
The City reserves the right to purchase and add additional items not specified in Category 1 above to the contract. For evaluation and funding purposes only, please indicate the cost for materials ordered in square yards per roll.
ITEM MINIMUM EXTENDED MINIMUM MINIMUM MANUFACTURER'S MINIMUM
ITEM DESCRIPTION ’ COST PERROLL ’ COST PERROLL f COST PERROLL COST PER ROLL
NO. MANUFACTURER'S INFORMATION QUANTITY PRICE MANUFACTURER'S INFORMATION QUANTITY EXTENDED PRICE | MANUFACTURER'S INFORMATION QUANTITY EXTENDED PRICE INFORMATION QUANTITY EXTENDED PRICE
Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: O @iy v G
24 [|Biaxial Geogrid, Tensar BX 1200 5.1 Manufacturer: $ 372.00 1 $ 372.00 |Manufacturer: US Fabrics $ 1,324.80 1 5 1,324.80 [Manufacturer: $ 276.00 1 $ 276.00 | Manufacturer: $ 219.88 1 s 219.88
. . N . Model No.:
Model No.: Model No.: BaseGrid 12 Model No.: SO VRS
Square Yards Per Roll 240 Square Yards Per Rolll 240 Square Yards Per Roll PorRoll q
Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: O @iy v G
2 |Uniaxial Geogrid, section 5.2, Tensar UX 1400 HS 52 Manufacturer: $ 270.00 1 $ 270.00 |Manufacturer: US Fabrics $ 1,184.00 1 5 1,184.00 [Manufacturer: $ 244.00 1 $ 244.0p | Manufacturer: $ 220.97 1 s 220.97
. . . Model No.:
Model No.: Model No.: SG 200 Model No.: ST VRS
Square Yards Per Roll 200 Square Yards Per Roll 200 Square Yards Per Roll PorRol q
y . y . Or City Approved Equal:
Wood Fiber Temporary Erosion Control Blanket with all Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal:
23 organice Materials, Westemn Excelsior Excel S-2 Al 5.3 Manufacturer: $ 40.00 1 $ 40.00 |No Bid $ - 1 $ - [Manufacturer: Western Green $ 75.00 1 $ 75.00 Manufacturer: $ 49.60 1 $ 49.60
Natural. Model No.:
Model No.: Model No.: SS-2 All Natural ST VRS
Square Yards Per Roll 100 Square Yards Per Roll I
Per Roll
Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: O @iy e G
Coconut Fiber Temporary Erosion Control Blanket with all Manufacturer:
24 organic Materials, Western Exceisior CC-4 All Natural 5.4 Manufacturer: $ 130.00 1 $ 130.00 |No Bid $ - 1 $ - |Manufacturer: $ 115.00 1 $ 115.00 Model No.: : $ 66.25 1 $ 66.25
Model No.: Model No.: . SO VRS
Square Yards Per Roll Square Yards Per Roll I
Per Roll
Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: O @iy e G
Synthetic Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mat, Propex Manufacturer:
2.5 [Landlok 450 55 Manufacturer: $ 250.00 1 $ 250.00 |Manufacturer: Propex $ 879.99 1 $ 879.99 |Manufacturer: Western Green $ 250.00 1 $ 250.00 Mi;:lal\(l:ou*rer. $ 202.50 1 $ 202.50
Model No.: Model No.: Landlok 450 Model No.: PP5-10 . ST VRS
Square Yards Per Roll 111.11 Square Yards Per Roll 100 Square Yards Per Roll PorRoll q
O City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal:
26 |Temporary Erosion Control Blanket, Curlex Net Free 56 Manufacturer: $ 63.05 1 $ 63,05 | Manufacturer: American Excelsior $ 705.60 1 $ 705.60 |Manufacturer: Western Green $ 75.00 1 $ 75.00 Manufacturer: $ 95.50 1 $ 95.50
. Company . Model No.:
Model No.: . Model No.: SS-All Natural
Square Yards Per Roll Model No.: Curlex Net Free 100 Square Yards Per Roll e S gua=E
80 Square Yards Per Roll Per Roll
Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: O @iy e G
2.7 Temporary Erosion Control Blanket, Curlex High Velocity 5.7 Manufacturer: $ 110.00 1 $ 110.00 [No Bid $ - 1 $ - [Manufacturer: Western Green $ 100.00 1 $ 100.00 Manufacturer: $ 31.20 1 $ 31.20
. . Model No.:
Model No.: Model No.: CC-4 ST VRS
Square Yards Per Roll 100 Square Yards Per Roll PorRol q




SCOPE OF ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
ITEM UNIT OF EXTENDED UNIT OF UNIT OF UNIT OF
ITEM DESCRIPTION WORK " ANNUAL UNIT PRICE " ANNUAL UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE . ANNUAL UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE MANUFACTURER'S ANNUAL UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
NO. SECTION 500 MANUFACTURER'S INFORMATION MEASURE QUANTITY PRICE MANUFACTURER'S INFORMATION | MEASURE QUANTITY MANUFACTURER'S INFORMATION | MEASURE QUANTITY INFORMATION MEASURE QUANTITY
Or City Approved Equal: (Ol iy (ATt
Hydraulically-applied Erosion Control, Profile Flexterra HP- Manufacturer: Flexterra Manufacturer: Applegate Manufact .
28 |FGM (High Performance-Flexible Growth Medium) 5.8 Manufacturer: $ 44.75 1 $ 44.75|Model No.: HP FGM $ 142.22 1 $ 142.22 |Model No.: Woodlock HPM $ 38.00 1 $ 38.00 Mzgzlaﬁou_'e" $ 44.25 1 $ 44.25
Model No.: 50 Ibs per bag 50 Ib Bag -
Square Yards
Square Yards Per Roll
Per Roll
Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: (Ol iy (ATt
29 |CoirFiberLogs, 12" x 10, Nedia Koirlog 12HD 5.11 Manufacturer: $ 56.40 1 s 56.40 |No Bid $ - 1 $ - [Manufacturer: Western Green $ 50.00 1 $ 50.00 | SRRECRCE $ 43.00 1 $ 43.00
8 Model No.:
Model No.: Model No.: 7 Ib Coir Log
Square Yards Per Roll 10" lon _—_ Square Yards
q 9 Per Roll
Or City Approved Equal: Or City Approved Equal: (Ol iy (ATt
Mulch Sock, 12"Mulch sock shall confirm to the City of Manufact .
210  |Austin Specification 648S 512 Manufacturer: $ 39.00 1 $ 39.00 |No Bid $ - 1 $ - |Manufacturer: $ 270.00 1 $ 270.00 Mzgzlaﬁou_'e" $ 29.00 1 $ 29.00
Model No.: Model No.: - Square Yards
Square Yards Per Roll Square Yards Per Roll >4
Per Roll
SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 2 = SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 2| $ 1,375.20 $ 4,236.61 SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 2=| § 1,493.00 SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 2| § 1,011.15
TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORIES 1 AND 2 = TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORIES 1 AND 2| § 43,992.20 TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGOREIS 1 AND 2=| § 68,886.61 TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORIES 1AND 2=| § 32,181.50 TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORIES 1 AND 2 § 33,096.15

CATEGORY 3 - DISCOUNT OFF OR MARKUP TO MANUFACTURER PRICE LISTS FOR NON-SPECIFIED PRODUCTS

The City anticipates an annual spending need of $5,000.00 for materials off catalog on the contract.

This information will not be used in the evaluation of the bid but is for informational purposes only and there is no guarantee of purchase. Please include additional pages as necessary.

The City may wish an Offeror provide additional products as they relate to this contract. In order to be paid for those additional products, provide manufacturers name and catalog numbers for the additional products you can provide the City. Indicate the minimum percentage discount or maximum markup to costs you can provide the City for these products. The percentage discount(s) or markup(s) listed shall be fixed throughout the term of the Contract including any subsequent renewal periods.

TRTEST

DELIVERY

VENDOR DELIVERY

THE ITEMS TO THE CITY:

METHOD:

COMMON CARRIER (FedEx.UPS)

COMPANY NAME:

EMAIL ADDRESS:

MINIMUM DISCOUNT FROM OR b MINIMUM DISCOUNT FROM OR by MINIMUM DISCOUNT FROM OR b MINIMUM DISCOUNT FROM OR
ITEM NO NAME AND NUMBER OF PRICE LIST NAME AND NUMBER OF PRICE LIST EEFE(_:‘IZIXE MAXIMUM MARKUP TO PRICE NAME AND NUMBER OF PRICE LIST E_F‘FE(_:T’!!E MAXIMUM MARKUP TO PRICE LIST NAME AND NUMBER OF PRICE LIST EEFE(_H:IXE MAXIMUM MARKUP TO PRICE LIST NAME AND NUMBER OF PRICE LIST EffESJ:IXE MAXIMUM MARKUP TO PRICE LIST
) % Discount % Discount . % Discount . % Discount
Name : Name : Name :
3.1 Name Number: or NIA or Number: or Number: or
Number . % Markup % Markup . % Markup . % Markup
. % Discount % Discount . % Discount . % Discount
Name : Name : Name :
3.2 Name Number or N/A or Number: or Nmbe er
Number e E— % Markup % Markup : % Markup e % Markup
) % Discount % Discount . % Discount . % Discount
Name : Name : Name :
33 Name Number: or NIA or Number: or Number: or
Number . % Markup % Markup . % Markup . % Markup
. % Discount % Discount . % Discount . % Discount
Name : Name : Name :
3.4 Name Number or N/A or Number: or Nmbe er
Number e E— % Markup % Markup : % Markup e % Markup
TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORY 3 = TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORY 3 = $5,000.00 TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORY 3 = $5,000.00 TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORY 3 = $5,000.00 TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORY 3 = $5,000.00
DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND
ALLOWED
NUMBER OF DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER THE OFFEROR SHALL DELIVERY MAXIMUM 3 BUSINESS DAYS COMMON CARRIER 22 DAYS 24-48 HOURS

Section 0600 - Bid Sheet
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City of Austin Purchasing Office — Log of Offers Rec \EB 6300 DCM1022 03/12/2020

Solicitation Number:

IFB Disclaimer: The information contained on
the following bid sheets are for information only

and does not constitute actual award/execution
of a contract.

Erosion Control Materials

D RFP/RFQS Disclaimer: The contents of a proposal shall

remain confidential until a contract is awarded. This log of
offers is for information purposes only and does not
constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

Vendor Name (on sealed offer)

Rec’d By Date & Time Received

For more information, you may contact the Purchasing Office by:
Phone - 512-974-2500

Email - Purchinfo@austintexas.gov
Physical Address — 124 W. 8 St., Third floor, Austin, TX 78701
Hours of Operation — Monday-Friday 7:46 a.m. to 4:45 p.m.

o Bid Read
Bid___Vendor Name (opening)* @ opening
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9. O

Form and Offers Distributed By:

DDDDD]DDDD

Form and Offers Received By:
* Only complete if the vendor name is different from the name on the offerors documents inside the envelope that is opened during the webinar.

Date:

Date:




BID SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN

EROSION CONTROL MATERIALS
s REVISED MARCH 8, 2020 *****

BUYER Diana Mcintosh

Special Instructions: Offerors must use this Bid Sheet to submit pricing. Be advised that altering the bid sheet or taking exceptions to any portion of the

may jeocp

of your Offer.

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities kisted, actual purchases may be more of less. Quantities are provided 85 a guide based on historical or anticipated usage. Order
quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

Abidof'o‘(zem)ﬂbemmmodbymmnnm(m)hmwmecnywlmemdbmfnrmnnm A bid of “no bid™ or no responsa (space laft biank) will be interpreted by the City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on that tem. Be advised, & "no

bid" or no

Prices offered on tha bid sheet shall be all inclusive of fees not expressly allowed in the scope of work. The Offeror shall not charge for

may be 3p

and may result In disqualification of the bid.

defiver services or Hems to the Austin, Texas area. Tha Offeror shall provide afl toots, labor, travel, and equipment necessary to perform the services required under this contract.
The Clty reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line items, cost, or any criteria or combination deemed most advantageous to the City.

per diem, and shipping of transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges, mieage, stop-fee, etc.) tc

CATEGORY 1 - DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED
SCOPE OF WORK UNIT OF
{IEMRC. [TEM DERCRIETION SECTION 500 MANUFACTURER'S INFORMATION MEASURE QAUNHNIUI'ITI"AL' UNILPRICE B§ | EXTENDED BRICE
Or Chy Approved Equal:
Biaxdal Geogrid, Tensar BX 1200 or City approved equal
11 54 g 1500 1558 23250
| Approximate Unit Size = 13 1" x 184’ or 240 sq yard Part Number if bidding altemate;
Linit Size Bid:
Or City Approved Ecqual:
Uniaxial Geogrid, Tensar UX 1400 HS or City approved equal T e
SQUARE
12 i A 473 B 52 1,550 2258 3,487.50
(Areraxinzie Unt Size ¥4.3" x 280 or 120 Sa yore Pert Number if bidding altermate: Tensar UX 1400 MSE (HS no longer YARD
|avaiable)
Unit Size Bid: 4.3'x 250
Or City Approved Equal:
‘Wood Fiber Temporary Erosion Conirol Blanket with sl organic Materials,
Westemn Excelsior Excel -2 Al Natursl, or City spproved equal: Manufactre : Western Excelsior SQUARE
1.3 §3 YARD 3,000 080| $ 2,400 00
Approximate Unit Sizo = 4'x 180" or B0 sq yard Model No.: SS-2 Al Natural (Double Net Straw)
Unit Size Bld: 4'x 112.5" (50 SY/Rol)
Or City Approved Equal:
(Coconut Fiber Temporary Erosion Control Bianket with ol onganic Matariais,
A, [ eerm Exmlfier CO-A AR NSl or: iy approved st 54 SEUARE 1,700 130]s 221000
Approxdimate Unit Size = 8' x 112.5' or 100 sq yard Model No.:
Linit Sizo Bid:
f Tl Mat, Propex Landiok 450 or Cly Or Chy Approved Equat:
15 . 55 " : SOUARE 4,000 250( s 10,000 00
- 385 G ! g
Approximats Unit Sze =8.5'x 1. or 100 sq yard Model No.: TRM 450 YARD
Unit Size Bid: 8'x 112.5° (100 SY)
Temporary Erosion Control Blanket, American Excelsior Company Curiex Net Or/Cty Approved Equal:
Firwe or Chy approved aquak Manufacture ; Profie Products
18 | approximets Unit Size = 8.5' x 106" or 100 sq yard 56 se:RAgE 500 087 $ 485.00
Mode! No.: Futerra F4 Green Netless Wood Fiber Blankat
Unit Size Bid: 6.5 x 90" (85 SY)
Or City Approved Equal:
Temporary Erosion Control Blanket, Curiex High Velocity or City approved
equal: Manufacture : North American Green SQUARE
1.7 5.7 YARD §00 2758 1,375 00
Approximate Unit Size = 8' x 50 or 44 aq yard Mode! No.: SC-250 TRM
Unit Size Bid: 6.5'x 55 5' (40 SY)
Or City Approved Equal:
Hydrauicaly-applied Erosion Control, Profile Flaxterma HP-FGM (High
Performance - Flaxible Growth Medium) or Cly spproved equal. by
18 58 BAG 50 “urs|s 2,237.50
Approximate Unit Size = 50 b bag Model No.:
Unit Size Bid:
Or City Approved Equal:
High Flow Fiter Fabric
19 59 1,000 240 S 2,400 00
Model No.: YARD
Unit Size Bid:
Or City Approved Equal:
Filter Fabric, 8 oz non-woven, TenCate Mirafl 180N, or City approved equal:
SQUARE
110 | ppproximats Uit Siza = 15' x 300" or 500 8q yd. 5.0 YARD 6,000 094] s 5,640.00
Mode! No.:
Unit Size Bid:
Or City Approved Equal:
Coir Fiber Logs, 12° x 10°, Nedis KoirLog 12HD. or City approved equal:
1.1 i 511 FEET 250 5641 8 1,410.00
Approximate Unit Skze = 12° x 10° Log. el N
Unit Sze Bid:
Section 0600 - Bid Sheet Poge 103




City of Austin Specification 6485
Muich Sock, 127, Muich sock shell conform tn the City of Austin Specification
8483 Muich sock shall be approved by the City
1.12 512 FEET 75 390 $ 3,0225
Approximate Unit Size = 127 dia x 10° Modet No.:
Unit Size Bid:
Or City Approved Equal:
Earth Anchore with cable attachment, DuckbBi88-DB-1 or City approved equal. "
1.13 - 513 EACH 150 895| s 1,342 6
Approximate Unit Size = 24 pleces/ox ihodaliio:
Unit Size Bid:
114  |Bright Spike Nalls, /8" x 8" 514 Model No.: EACH 7,000 019] S 1,330.00
Unit Size 8id:
M
Fender Washers, 2° 0D
115 515 Model No.: EACH 10,000 0093 900.0
Unit Size Bid:
Wire Staples, 8°x 1
118 5.16 Model No.: EACH 20,000 008 S 1,600.00
Unit Size Bid:
Wooden Stakes, 187 or Cty approved equal Marufactse :: Essy Ditve
117  |Approximate Unit Szo = 100 sachvbox. 517 Model No.: Wood Stake 2 way cut EACH 1,000 038 s 380.00
Unit Size Bid: 1* x 2 x 24" (50/ bundie)
Manufactre : Rangemaster
‘Woven Wire SQUARE
1.18 518 Mode! No.: Poultry Netting FEET 1,000 007| § 72.00
Unit Size Bid: 72" x 150' rol
SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 1= ¢ 42,617.00
CATEGORY 2 - ADDITIONAL PRODUCTS
The City reserves the right to purchase and add additional items not specified in Category 1 above to the contract. For evalkuation and funding purposes only, please indicate the cost for materials ordered in square yards per rofl.
ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER'S INFORMATION COST PER ROLL k| exTenoeo price
Or City Approved Equal:
24  |Blaxiel Googid, Tensar BX 1200 51 $ 37200 1 s 37200
Model No.:
Square Yards Per Roll
Or City Approved Equal:
22 Uniaxial Geogrid, section 5.2, Tensar UX 1400 HS 52 s 270.00 1 s 270.00
Model No.:
Square Yards Per Roll
Or Clty Approved Equai:
Wood Fiber Temporary Erosion Control Blanket with e organice .
23 Westem Excel §-2 Al Neturel 53 ManRchYS: Vesam Extalsior s 40.00 1 s 40,00
Mode! No.: SS-2 All Natural (Double Net Straw)
50 Square Yards Per Rold
Or City Approved Equal
Coconut Fiber Temporary Erosion Control Blanket with afl organic
24  |Materials, Westem Exceislor CC-4 All Natural 54 $ 130.00 1 $ 130.00
Model No.:
Square Yards Per Roll
Or City Approved Equal:
28 ! o ML g Cockok A0 55 s 250.00 1 $ 25000
Mode! No.:
Square Yards Per Roll
Or City Approved Equal:
Meanufacture | Profie Products
28 Temporary Erosion Control Blankst, Curlex Net Free 56 s 83.05 1 s 63.05
Modei No.: Futerra F4 Graen Netless Wood Fiber Blanket
85 Square Yards Per Roll
Section 0600 - Bid Sheet Page20f3




Or City Approved Equal:
. Manufacture : North American Green
27 Temporary Erosion Control Blanket, Curiex High Velocity 57 $ 110.00 1 $ 1100
Modet No.: SC-250 TRM
40 Square Yards Per Rol
Hydraulically-applied Erosion Control, Profile Flexterra HP-FGM (High
28 |Performance-Plexible Growth Medium) 58 Model No.: H 4475 1 $ “1
Square Yards Per Roll
Or City Approved Equal:
29 Colir Fiber Logs, 12" x 10°, Nadia KoirLog 12HD 5141 $ 568.40 1 $ 58 41
Modei No -
Square Yards Pes Rol
Chty of Austin Specification 643S
24p  |Mueh Sock. 12'Muich sock shal confrm to the Ciy of Austin Spociication 8483 512 $ 39.00 1 $ 3900
Model No.
Square Yards Per Roll
SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 2=| ¢ 1,378.2(
TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORIES 1AND 2=| § 43,992.2(

discount or maximum markup to costs you can provide the City for these prods

CATEGORY 3 - DISCOUNT OFF OR MARKUP TO MANUFACTURER PRICE LISTS FOR NON-SPECIFIED PRODUCTS

The City anticipates an annual spending need of $8,000.00 for matevials off catalog on the contract.

This information will ot be used in the evaluation of the bid but is for informational purposes only and these is no guarantee of purchase Please include additional pages as necessary.

mckymnywbhanoﬁcmptwideadﬂmdpmmumcymmﬁsmnd.Inordarmbopaldfnr&mudemm provide manufacturers name and catalog numbers for the additional products you can provide the City. Indicate the minimum percentage
Eisted shall be fixed throughout the term of the Contract inchuding any subsequent renewal periods.

LATEST MINIMUM DISCOUNT FROM OR
Ll NAKE AND NIMBER OF PRIGELIST EFFECTIVE MAXIMUM MARKUP TO PRICE LIST

% Discount

31 Name &
Number % Markap
% Discount

32 Name i
Number % Mg
33 Name % D:ealm
Number % Merip
% Discount

a4 Name o
Number % Markup

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORY 3=

$6,000.00

DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

DELIVERY METHOD: COMMON CARRIER (FedEx,UPS) [ VENDOR DELIVERY
COMPANY NAME: Geo Solutions Inc.
EMAIL ADDRESS: grant@geosolutionsinc.com
Section 060D - Bid Sheet Page3ol3



BID SHEET

CITY OF AUSTIN
EROSION CONTROL MATERIALS
SOLCITATION NO,:  {FB 8300-DCM1022
BUYER: Diana Mcintosh
Special Instructions: Offerors must use this Bid Sheet to submit pricing. Se advised that altering the bid sheet o taking exceptions to eny portion of the may jeop of your Offer.
The quantities noted below are estimates and not 8 guarantee of actual volume. The Clty does not guarantee the purchase of the quantiies isted, actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are p d as a guide based or usage. Order

Wil be as-needed and by the Clty for each order.

Awom'(m)wibomwmbyumn-m(m)mmnmnmwbmwmm A bid of "na bid” or no response (spece left blank) will be interpreted by the City that the Offeror does nat wish to bid on that kem. Be advised, a “no
bid” or no resp =P and may result in disquaification of the bid.

Prices offered on the bid sheet shall be afl inclusive of fees not expressly aliowed in the scope of work. The Offeror shall not charge for per diem, and shipping or tranzportation costs (trave! time, fuel surcharpes, mileage, stop-foe, etc ) to
defiver sarvices or ams to the Austin, Texas area. The Offeror shall provide all tools, labor, travel, and equipment necessary to perform the services required under this confract.
The City reserves the right to awand a single contract based on overall low cost or muliple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific line iflems, cost, or any criteria or deemed most o the City.

CATEGORY 1 - DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED
SCOPE OF WORK UNIT OF
[TEN.NO: TTEMDESCRIPTION SECTION 500 MANUFACTURER'S INFORMATION MEASURE £,","m“, UNITPRICE | EXTENDED PRICE
Or City Approved Equal:
Bisdal Geogrid, Tensar BX 1200 or City approved equal. {Manufacturer: US Fabrics SQUARE
14 51 YARD 1,500 $ 852| s 8,280.00
Approximats Unit Stzs = 13.1'x 184' or 240 3q yerd Part Numbes i bidding altemate: BaseGrid 12
Unit Size Bid: 13,12 x 184 or 240 s vd
Or City Approved Equal:
Unimdal Geoagrid, Tensar UX 1400 HS or City spproved equal. Manufacturer: US Fabrics
12 apororimets Und Sizo = 4.3 x 250° or 120 sq yerd 82 EVDARDUHI!E 1,550 $ 892} $ 9,176.00
Part Number i bidding altemata. SG 200
Unit Size Bid: 6.25 it x 283 ft or 200 sq yd
Wood Fiber Temporary Erosion Control Blanket with all organic Matesials,
Westem Excelsior Excel 8-2 Al Neturad, or Cy epproved equat: SQUARE
13 53 no bid YARD 3,000 $ -1 -
Apprenémate Unit Size = 4' x 180" or 60 sq yard
Coconut Fiber Temporary Erosion Control Bianket with all organic Materials,
14 |Westem Erosiior cct M anrai o Cay approved squat i ol S 1,700 ] -1s -
Approodmats Unlt Size = 8'x 112.5' or 100 8q yard
; Turt Res Mat, Propex Landiok 450 o Cly Or Cly Approved Equal:
approved oquel. : Propex BQUARE
15 | - 55 4,000 $ 92| 8 31,680.00
| Approndmats Unit Stz = 8.5 x 138.5" or 100 sq yard No.: 480 YARD
Unk Size Bid: 8' x 125
‘Temporary Erosion Control Bianket, American Excelsior Company Curiex Net O Clty Apy :
Free or City epproved oquat: .
4 mpary SQUARE
16 | - 58 500 $ 882( S 4410.00
| Appreoimate Uit Skze = 8.5 x 108 or 100 eq yard No.: Net Free YARD
Unit Size Bid: 8 x 80
Temporary Erosion Control Blanket, Curlex High Veloclty or Cly spproved
oqual
17 57 o bid semwis 500 s .ls !
(Appreximate Unit Bize = &' x 50° or 44 sq yard
Or City Approved Equal:
Hydrauiicaly-applied Erosion Control, Profie Flederra HP-FGM (High
Performance - Fiexdble Growth Medium) or City approved squat: Manufacture : Flexterra
1.8 58 BAG 50 $ 142221 38 7,111.00
Approximate Unit Sz = 50 b beg Model No.: Flexible Growth Medium
Unit Size Bid: 50 b per bag
v {HionFiw e el 59 o bid SAne 1,000 s s -
Fiter Febric, 8 az nor-woven, TenCats Mirafi 180N, or City epproved squat:
SQUARE
110 farenimeto Unk Size = 15'x 300" or 500 s yd 510 no bid YARD 6,000 s -ls -
Or Clty Approved Equal:
Colr Fiber Logs, 127 x 10°, Nedia Koirl.og 12HD, or City approved equat: 3 o
144 » | 5.1 FEET 250 $ -1s -
Unit Sze = 177 x 10" Log. N
Unit Size Bid:

Section 0800 - Bid Shost Page 1 of 3



Muich Sock, 127, Mulch sack shal conform to the Cly of Austin Spacification
6488, Muich sock shall be approved by the Ciy.
112 512 no bid FEET s -|s e
Approximats Unit Size = 127 da x 107
Or City Approved Equal:
Earth Anchors with cable attachment, DuckbB58-DB-1 or Clty approved equal ranut . D a
1193 Jagorouima =24 plecesa 513 EACH 150 26682} $ 3,993.00
e Bt =24 Madel No : Earch Anchor 83-DB1
Unit Size Bid: 12 per box (price quoted per each)
1.14  {Bright Bpike Nols, 30" x 8° 514 o bid EACH 7,000 -13 "
g, Jronr Washen, 2:00: 515 no bid EACH 10,000 s R
14g 7 Swlen BT 5.16 no bid EACH 20,000 -ls 5
Wooden Btakes, 15” or City approved equal.
1.7 |Apprximate Link Sizs = 100 eechbor. 517 no bid EACH 1,000 -1 $ -
Waven Wire SQUARE
1.18 5.18 na bid FEET 1,000 -1 8 -
SUBTOTAL FORCATEGORY 1= | § 64,850.00
CATEGORY 2 - ADDITIONAL PRODUCTS
The City reserves the right to purchase and add additional ems not specified in Category 1 above to the cortract. For evaluation and funding purposes only, please indicate the cost for materials ordered in square yards per rol,
MINIMUM
ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER'S INFORMATION COST PER ROLL QUANTITY EXTENDED PRICE
Or City Approved Equal:
Manufacturer: US Fabrics
21 Bimdal Geogrid, Tensar BX 1200 54 $ 1,324.80 1 $ 1,324.80
Mode! No.: BaseGrid 12
240 Square Yerds Per Roll
Or City Approved Equal:
|Manufacturer: US Fabrics
22 Unimist Geogrid, section 5.2, Tensar UX 1400 HS 52 $ 1,184.00 1 s 1,184.00
Modsl No : SG 200
200 Square Yards Per Roll
Wood Fiber Temporary Erusion Control Bianket with all organice
23 Westam Excel S-2 A Natural, 53 no bid § - 1 $ -
Coconut Fiber Temporary Esosion Control Blanket with ail organic
24 Westerm Exceisior CC-4 Al Natural 54 no bid $ - 1 $ -
Or City Approved Equal:
{Manufacturer: Propex
25 . ot M, Propex Landiok 450 55 s s79.99 1 $ 879.99
Model No.: Landiok 450
111.11 Square Yards Per Rol
Or CRy Approved Equat:
28  Temporary Erosion Control Blanket, Curlex Net Free 58 $ 705.80 1 $ 705.60
Mode! No.: Curiex Net Free
B0 Square Yards Per Roll
Saction 080D - Bid Sheet Page2ef3



27 Temporary Erosion Confrol Blanket, Curlex High Velocity 57 no bid " 1 $ .
Flexterra
Hydraulically-apphied Erosion Control, Profi Flexterma HP-FGM (High
28  |Performance-Flaxible Growth Medum) 59 Model No.: HP FGM 142.22 1 $ 142.22
50 s per bag

29 |CoF Foer Logs, 12°x 10, Nedia Koirlog 12HD 511 o bid - 1 s .
240 |Muich Sock, 12Much sock shal confim to the CRy of Austn Spectication 5408 512 o bid . 1 s .
BUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 2= | ¢ 4,238.81

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORIES 1AND 2=| § 68,888.64

CATEGORY 3 - DISCOUNT OFF OR MARKUP TO MANUFACTURER PRICE LISTS FOR NON-SPECIFIED PRODUCTS

The City anticipates an annual spending need of $5,000.00 for materials off catalog on the contract.

discount or maximum mariagp to costs you can provide the Cly for these products. The p o or
This information will not be used in the evaluation of the bid but is for informationat purposes only and there is no guarantee of purchase. Pleass include additional pages as necessary.

The City may wish an Offeror provide additional products as they relate to this contract. In order to be paid for thoss additional products, provide manufacturers name and catalog numbers for the additional products you can provide the Clly. indicate the minimum percentage
fisted shall be fixed throughout the term of the Contract including any subsequent renewal periods.

TRTESY

MINIMUM DISCOUNT FROM OR

ITEM NO NAME AND NUMBER OF PRICE LIST -TECTIVE | MAXIMUM MARKUP TO PRICE LIST

% Discount

31 NA or
% Markup
% Discount

32 NA or
% Markup
% Discount

33 NA or
% Mariup
% Discount

34 NA or
% Mariap

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORY 3= $5,000.00

DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO 8E FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

COMMON CARRIER (FedEx,UPS) O

WHOLESALE & MFR PVF INC

PURCHASING@WHOLESALEANDMFR COM

Section 0600 - Bid Stwet
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BID SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN
EROSION CONTROL MATERIALS
**+** REVISED MARCH 9, 2020 *****
Special Instructions: Offerors must use this Bid Sheet to submit pricing. Be advised that altering the bid sheet or taking exceptions to any portion of the of your Offer.
The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume The City does nat the p! of the listed, actual purchases may be more or less Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical or anticipated usage Order
ities will be ded and ified by the City for each order
A bid of "0" (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of "no bid" or no response (space left blank) will be interpreted by the City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on that item. Be advised, a “no bic
or no may be i as ive and may result in disqualification of the bid
Prices offered on the bid sheet shali be all inclusive of fees not expressly alowed in the scope of work The Offeror shall not charge for i per diem, and shipping or transportation costs {travel ime, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-fee, etc ) to
deliver services or items to the Austin, Texas area The Offeror shall provide all tools, labor, travel, and equipment necessary to perform the services required under this contract
The City reserves the right ta award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on individual or categories/groups of specific fine items, cost, or any criteria or combination deemed most advantageous to the City
CATEGORY 1 - DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED
SCOPE OF WORK UNIT OF
i ITEM DESCRIPTION
2t SECTION 500 MANUFACTURER'S INFORMATION MEASURE [ ANNUAL HRIGERIGE, | ESTERREN L
QUANTITY
Or City Approved Equal
Biaxal Geogrid Tensar BX 1200 or City approved equal _ 4
11 . 51 SOLANE 1.500 115 s 1,725.0(
Approximate Unit Size = 13 1" x 184 o 240 sq yard Part Number if bidding altemate
Linit Siza Rid
Or City Approved Equal
Unéaxial Geogrid, Tensar UX 1400 HS or Crty approved equal .
12 | approximate Unt Size = 4 ' x 250" or 120 sq yard 52 - e seXRASE 1520 122/5 18810t
Part Number If bidding aft SF 35
Unit Size Bid' 6" x 150° 100sy.
Or City Approved Equal
‘Wood Fiber Temporary Erosion Control Blankat with all organc Matenals
Westemn Excetsior Excel S 2 Al Natwral or City approved equal Manufacture - __Westem Green SQUARE
13 53 YARD 3,000 075( $ 2,250 0
Approximate Unit Size = 4' x 180" or 80 sq yard Model No S$S-2 All Natural _
Unit Size Bid: g'x1128
Or Clty Approved Equal
Coconut Fiber Temporary Erosion Control Blanket with a organic Materials.
14 Western Excersior CC-4 All Natural or City approved aqual 54 S(Y!lAJ:FDiE 1,700 1.15] s 1,055 0(
Approxmate Undt Sze = 8'x 112 5 o5 100 sq yard Model No = L
Unit Size Bid
s "
y ic Permanent Turf Rei Mat, Propex Landlok 450 or City Or City Approved Equal
Wppioved scual Manufacture : _Westemn Green _ SQUARE
15 i p— s 55 4,000 2.50| $ 10,000 0C
Approximate Urit Size = 8 5' x 138 5" or 100 sq yard Model No. __PP5.10 TRM _ YARD
Unit Size Bid _8'x 112 5' (100sy)_
Temporary Erosion Control Blanket, Amencan Excelsior Company Cudex Net OrCily Appraved Equal
Free or City wpproved equal Manufacture ___Westem Green_
16 Approximate Urit Size = 8.5’ x 106’ or 100 sq yard 56 SS%SE 500 075( $ 375.0
Model No - SS-2 All Natural
Unit Size Bid: _8'x 1125
Temporary Erosion Control Blanket. Curiex High Velocity or City approved OrCity Appraved Ecual
equal
17 - o 57 Manufacture  __Westem Green Se:RAgE 500 1.00] s 500 0¢
Unt Size = 8 44 sqyard
s Model No cc4
Unit Size Bid 8'x1125
Or City Approved Equal
Hydraulically-applied Erosion Control Profile Flexterra HP-FGM (High
Performance - Flexible Growth Medum) or Cdty approved equal =
1.8 58 BAG 50 38.00( § 1,900.0¢
Approximate Unit Size = 50 ib bag Model No : Woodlok HPM
Unit Size Bid __50 #s bag
Or City Approved Equal
1 | |MeFlow FitacFabic 59 seuane 1,000 085 s 850.0¢
Model No
Unit Size Bid* e
Or City Approved Equal
Fitter Fabric, 8 oz non-woven, TenCate Mirafi 180N, or City approved equal T
SQUARE
110 - . 510 6,000 0.85) § 5,100 0C
= 500 .
Approximate Unit Sze = 15 x 300 or sqyd ModelNo: o YARD
Unit Size Bid
Or City Approved Equal
Con Fiber Logs, 12" x 10°, Nedia KoirLog 12HD or City approved equal
im Approxmate Unt Size = 12° x 10 Log 511 s ke FEET 250 500 § 1,250 0C
Unit Slze Bid

Section 0600 - Bid Sheet
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City of Auslin Specification 648S:
Muich Sock, 127, Muich sock shal conform to the City of Austin Specification
B48S. Muich sock shall be approved by tha City
112 512 FEET 775 S 0.40| $ 310.0C
Appraximate Unit Size = 12" dia x 10' Madel No.:
Unit Size Bid:
Or City Approved Equal:
Earth Anchors with cable attachment, Duckbib88-DB-1 or City approved equal Miilitsctive.: Gripple
113 Approximate Unit Sze = 24 pieces/box 513 EACH 150 3 10.35( § 1,552.5C
Model No.: 3' anchor,
Unit Size Bid: each
1.14  |Bright Spike Nais, 3/8" x 8" 514 Model No EACH 7,000 s -1 -
Unit Size Bid -
Fender Washers, 2 OD ~
1.15 515 Model No EACH 10,000 $ R -
Unit Size Bid -
Manufacture : __ Deacero
Wire Staples, B* x 1
1.16 §16 Model No.: 6 X 1" 11GA STAPLE EACH 20,000 s 003§ 600.00
Unit Size Bld: 1000 per box,
‘Wooden Stakes, 18" or City approved equal Manuf; —
1.17  |Approximate Unit Size = 100 each/box 517 A No EACH 1,000 s 035§ 35000
Unit Size Bid:
1ag  |Weveniee 5.18 Model No.: _____Berm Wire SR 1,000 $ 0.08| § 80.00
Unit Size Bid: 6'x
150"
SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 1= | § 30,688.50
CATEGORY 2 - ADDITIONAL PRODUCTS
The City the right to and add addif ltems not ified in Category 1 above to the contract. For evaluation and funding purposes only, please indicate the cost for materials ordered in square yards per roil
; MINIMUM
ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER'S INFORMATION COST PER ROLL QUANTITY EXTENDED PRICE
Or City Approved Equal:
Manufacturer:
5y |Blaxal Geogrid, Tensar BX 1200 5.1 s 276.00 1 s 276,00
Model No.:
240________ Square Yards Per Roll
Or City Approved Equal:
. Manufacturer: Synteen
22 Uniaxlal Geogrid, section 5.2, Tensar UX 1400 HS 52 s 244.00 1 s 24400
Medel No.: SF 35
200_______ Square Yards Per Roll
Or City Approved Equal:
Wood Fiber Temporary Erosion Control Blanket with all oiganice Manufacturer: _Westem Green
23 Materials, Western Excelsior Excel S-2 AN Natural 53 $ 75.00 1 $ 7500
Mode! No.: SS-2 All Natural
100 Square Yards Per Rofl
Or City Approved Equal.
Coconut Fiber Temporary Erosion Control Blanket with all organic
24 Materials, Westem Exceisior CC-4 ANl Natural 54 s 115.00 1 s 11500
Model No.:
Square Yards Per Roll
Or City Appraved Equal:
o {Manufacturer: Westem Green_ =
25 F Turf Mat, Propex Landiok 450 55 s 250.00 1 s 250 00
Model No.: PP5-10
100 Square Yards Per Roll
Or City Approved Equal:
Western Green
26 Temporary Erosion Control Blanket, Curiex Net Free 56 $ 75.00 1 s 7500
Model No.: $S- All Natural
100 Square Yards Per Roil
Or City Approved Equal:
. Manufacturer; Western Green
27 Temporary Erosion Controt Blanket, Curlex High Veloctty 57 s 100.00 1 s 10000
Model No.: CC4,
100 Square Yards Per Roll



Hydrausicatly-applied Erosion Control, Profie Flexterra HP-FGM (High t . i
28 Performance-Flexible Growth Medium) 58 Model No.: Woodiok HPM $ 38.00 1 s 38.01
50# bag
Or City Approved Equal
; i Manufacturer: Western Green __
29 Cofir Fiber Logs, 12° x 10, Nedia KovLog 12HD 511 s 50.00 1 $ 500
Model No.: 7 Ib Coir Log
10'long
City of Austin Specification 648S
2.10 Muich Sock, 12"Muich sock shall confirm to the City of Austin Specifcation 6485 512 s 270.00 1 s 27000
Model No :
Saquare Yards Per Roll
SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 2=| g 1,483.0(
TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORIES 1AND 2=| § 32,181.5C

The City anticipates an annual spending need of $5,000.00 for materials off catalog on the contract

CATEGORY 3 - DISCOUNT OFF OR MARKUP TO MANUFACTURER PRICE LISTS FOR NON-SPECIFIED PRODUCTS

The City may wish an Offeror provide additional products as they relate to this contract In order to bc paid for those additional products, provide manufacturers name and catalog
|discount or maximum markup to costs you can provide the City for these products The p

for the

you can provide the City. Indicate the minimum percentage
listed shall be fixed throughout the term of the Contract including any subscquem renewal periods

This information will not be used in the evatuation of the bid but is for informational purposes only and there is no gt of Please Include ad pages as y
LATEST MINIMUM DISCOUNT FROM OR
UEMNe NAME AND'NUMBER OF PRICELIST EFFECTIVE MAXIMUM MARKUP TO PRICE LIST
Name % Discount
31 or
Number " o % Markup
% Discount
32 Name -
Number % Markup
% Discount
33 Name o
Number ____ % Markup
——— e % Discount
14 Name __ or
Number % Markup
TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORY 3 =| $5,000.00

RELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

DELIVERY METHOD COMMON CARRIER (FedEx,UPS) VENDOR DELIVERY
COMPANY NAME Innovative Soil Solutions
EMAIL ADDRESS brandon faust@ferguson com

Section 0600 - Bid Shest
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BID SHEET
CITY OF AUSTIN
EROSION CONTROL MATERIALS
“**** REVISED MARCH 9, 2020 *****
Special Instructions: Offerors must use this 8id Sheet to submit pricing. Be advised that akering the bid sheet or taking exceptions to any portion of the ion may of your Offer
The quammes noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume The City does not g the p of the ies kisted, actual purchases may be more of less. Quantities are provided as a guide based on histarical or anticipated usage Order
will be ded and ified by the City for each order
A bid of "0 (zero) wil be interpreted by me City as & no-charge (free) itemn and the City will not expect to pay for that item. A bid of "no bid” o7 no response (space left blank) will be interpreted by the City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on that item Be advised, a “no
bid" or no resp: may be ive and may result in disqualification of the bid.
Prices offered on the bid sheet shall be ell inclusive of fees not expressly allowed in the scope of work. The Offeror shall not charge sep for i d, per diem, and shipping or transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges mileage. stop-fee, etc )
deliver services or items to the Austin, Texas area. The Offeror shall provide all toois, labor, travel, and equipment necessary to perform the services required under this contract.
The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on Individual or categories/groups of specific fine items, cost, or any criteria or combination deemed most advantageous ta the City
CATEGORY 1 - DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED
SCOPE OF WORK UNIT OF
DESCRIPTION EXTE
IZEMNO: REH DERCRIE SECTION 500 MANUFACTURER'S INFORMATION measure | AWTLAL | UNITPRICE AOED PRIC
Or City Approved Equal
Biaxial Geogrid, Tensar BX 1200 or City approved equal
11 54 SaAns 1,500 0925 1380¢
Approximate Unit Size = 13 1" x 164' or 240 sq yard Part Number if bidding alternate:,
Or City Approved Equal”
Umiaxial Geogrid, Tensar UX 1400 HS or Ctty approved equal
i ) NN TS - S 52 Sguans 1550 188 s 29217
Part Number if bidding atternate.
Unit Size Bid:
Or City Approved Equal
‘Wood Fiber Temporary Erosion Control Blanket with efl organic Matenals,
Western Exceisior Excel S-2 A Netural, or City approved equal Manutacture  L&M Bag & Supply Co
SQUARE
13 . e 53 YARD 3,000 062§ 1,8600
Approximets Unit Size = 4" x 180 or 80 sq yard Model No. US-2XNN
Unit Size Bid 8' x 90"
Or City Approved Equal
Coconut Fiber Temporary Erosion Control Blanket with al organic Materials,
14 Westarn Excessior CC-4 Al Netural or City approved equal 54 Manufacture L&M Bag & Supply Co Se:RAgE 1.700 066§ 11282
Approximate Unit Size = 8'x 112 §' or 100 sq yard Madel No  US-2CNN
Ex112%
Synthetic Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mat, Propex Landiok 450 or City Or City Approved Equal
approved equal SQUARE
15 2 ’ SR ES Sort 55 4,000 182| 3 6,480 Ot
Approximate Unit Sze = 8 5'x 138 5' or 100 sq yard Model No YARD
Unit Size Bid: _
Temporary Erosion Control Blanket, American Excelsior Company Curlex Net Qi vpraved Eual
Free or Cry approved equal:
18 |agpraomate Ut Size = 8.5 x 108" or 100 sq yard 56 e it i 500 062| s at0.0¢
Model No ' US 2XNN
Unit Size Bid 8" x 90
Or City Approved Equal
Temporary Erosion Control Blanket, Curlex High Velocity or City approved
equal Manufacture  L&M Bag & Supply Co SQUARE
17 57 YARD 500 039§ 19500
|Approamate Unit Sze = 8' x 50° or 44 sq yard Model No ' US 2XHV
Unit Size Bid 8' x 90'
Or City Approved Equal:
| Hydraufically-apphed Erosion Control, Profiie Fiexterra HP-FGM (High
| Performance - Flexible Growth Medium) or City approved equal
18 58 BAG 50 4425 § 221250
|Approxamate Unt Sze = 50 b bag Model No.
Unit Size Bid:
Or City Approved Equal:
A et 59 SauARE 1,000 080 s 800.00
Model No.:
Unit Size Bid:
Or City Approved Equal
Fiter Fabric, 8 oz non-woven, TenCate Mirafi 180N, or City approved equal: |Manufacture  PROPEX {
SQUARE
1.10 P 5 ' o 500 510 6,000 0615 3,660 00/
Approximate Unit Size = 15' x 300' or sqyd. No. LMBOONT YARD
Unit Size Bid 12 5'x 360 or 15'x 300"
Or City Approved Equal
Cokr Fiber Logs, 12" x 10, Nedia KorLog 12HD, o City approved equal
11t ) . 511 FEET 250 4305 1,07500
Approdmate Unit Size = 12" x og Model No
Unit Size Bid
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City of Austin Specification 6485
Muich Sock, 12°, Muich sock shall conform to the City of Austin Specification
6485 Muich sock shall be approved by the City
112 512 FEET s $ 280| § 2247
Approxmate Unt Sze = 12° dia x 10° Model No
Unit Size Bid
Or City Approved Equal
Earth Anchors with cable attachmernt, Duckbi#68-DB-1 or City approved equal Manufactre  Platipus
113 i i Size = 513 EACH 150 $ 1050( § 1,575
Approximate Unit Sze = 24 pieces/box ModelNo S2 ARGS
Unit Size Bid 18" x 3"
114  |Bright Spike Nads 38" x 6” 514 Model No EACH 7.000 $ 050 S 3,500
Unit Size Bid*
Fender Washers, 7 0D
115 515 Model No EACH 10.000 $ 0.15) 8 1,500
Unit Size Bid
Wire Staples 8" x 1%
118 516 Model No EACH 20,000 $ 005 S 940 (
Unit Size Bid-
Wooden Stakes, 18™ or City approved equal
117  |Approxmate Unit Size = 100 eactvbox 517 Mod EACH 1,000 $ 0.22{ s 220(
el No
Unit Size Bid =
Woven Wirs SQUARE
118 518 Modal Nax FEET 1,000 $ 008§ 82¢
Unit Size Bid
SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 1= § 32,085.0
CATEGORY 2 - ADDITIONAL PRODUCTS
The City resesves the right to p and add additional items not ified in Category 1 above to the contract. For evaluation and funding purposes only, please indicate the cost for materials ordered in square yards per roll
ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER'S INFORMATION COST PER ROLL | ExTEnDED PRICI
Or City Approved Equal’
2% Blaxal Geogrid, Tensar BX 1200 51 $ 219.88 1 $ 2198
Model No.
Square Yards Per Roll
Or City Approved Equal
22 Uniaxial Geogrid, section 5 2, Tensar UX 1400 HS 52 s 229.97 4 s 2209
Model No
Square Yards Per Roll
Or City Approved Equal
Wood Fiber Temporary Erosion Control Blanket with all organice
23 Materials, Westem Excelsior Excel S-2 Afl Natural 53 $ 49.60 1 H 49 8(
Model No
Square Yards Per Rott
Or City Approved Equal
Coconut Fiber Temporary Erosion Control Blanket with all organic
24 Materiats, Western Exceisior CC-4 All Natural 54 $ 66.25 1 $ 66 2¢
Model No
Square Yards Per Roll
Or City Approved Equal
25 Tork Relnfs biaki Propsx Landiok 420 55 s 20250 1 s 202 5¢
Model No
Square Yards Per Rofl
Or City Approved Equal
26 Temporary Erosion Control Bianket, Curlex Net Free 56 s 95.50 1 s 9550
Model No
Square Yards Per Roll
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Or City Approved Equal
27  |Temporary Erosion Control Bianket, Curlox High Velocity 57 $ 3120 1 $ 3
Model No
Square Yards Per Ro}
Hydraulically-applied Erosion Comrol, Profile Flexterra HP-FGM (High
28  |Performance-Flexibie Growth Medium) 58 Model No $ 44.25 1 s 44
Square Yards Per Rol
Or City Approved Equal:
29 oK Fiber Logs, 17" x 10, Nedia KoiLog 12HD 511 s 43.00 1 s 43¢
Model No.:
Square Yards Per Roll
City of Austin Specification 6485
240  |Musch Sock, 12'Muich sock sha confim to the City of Austn Specification 8485 512 $ 29.00 1 s 29¢C
Modei No.:
Square Yards Per Roll
SUBTOTAL FOR CATEGORY 2=| g 1,011.1
TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORIES 1AND 2=| § 33,096.1

The City anticipates an annual spending need of $5,000.00 for materials off catalog on the contract.

discount or maximum markup to costs you can provide the City for these products. The

CATEGORY 3 - DISCOUNT OFF OR MARKUP TO MANUFACTURER PRICE LISTS FOR NON-SPECIFIED PRODUCTS

fisted shall be fixed throughout the term of the Contract including any subsequent renewal periods

This information will not be used in the evaluation of the bid but is for informational purposes only and there is no guarantee of purchase  Please include additional pages as necessary

The City may wish an Offeror provide additional products as they relate to this contract. in order to be paid for Iﬁm additional products, provide manufacturers name and catalog numbers for the additional products you can provide the City. Indicate the minimum percentag

bbb MINIMUM DISCOUNT FROM OR
ITEM NO NAME AND NUMBER OF PRICE LIST EFFE.ETI\_’.E MAXIMUM MARKUP TO PRICE LIST

Name % Discount

3t or
Number % Markup
% Discount

32 Name oF
Number % Markup
% Discount

33 iy o
Number % Markp
= % Discount

14 Name g
Number % Markup

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR CATEGORY 3=

$5,000.00

DELIVERY TERMS: DELIVERY IS TO BE FOB DESTINATION, PREPAID AND ALLOWED

{NUMBER OF DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER THE OFFEROR SHALL DELIVERY THE ITEMS TO THE CITY 24 - 48 Hours

DELIVERY METHOD: o COMMON CARRIER (FedEx,UPS) @ VENDOR DELIVERY
COMPANY NAME: L&M Bag & Supply Co, Inc
EMAIL ADDRESS: Gordon@LandMSupplyCo com
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