
BID NO. 

RX NO.   

DATE:  

BUYER:  

ITEM 

NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION

EST 

QTY UNIT

UNIT 

PRICE

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT 

PRICE

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT 

PRICE

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT 

PRICE

TOTAL 

PRICE

1.1 Project Manager 16 HRS $70.00 $1,120.00 $75.00 $1,200.00 $60.00 $960.00 $0.00 

1.2 Supervisor/Site Saftey Manager 56 HRS $63.00 $3,528.00 $67.20 $3,763.20 $50.00 $2,800.00 $0.00 

1.3 Technician 56 HRS $42.00 $2,352.00 $57.14 $3,199.84 $35.00 $1,960.00 $0.00 

1.4 Equipment Operator 56 HRS $45.00 $2,520.00 $57.14 $3,199.84 $45.00 $2,520.00 $0.00 

1.5 Laborer 56 HRS $31.00 $1,736.00 $48.00 $2,688.00 $30.00 $1,680.00 $0.00 

1.6 Vacuum Truck 40 HRS $98.00 $3,920.00 $63.00 $2,520.00 $125.00 $5,000.00 $0.00 

1.7 Frac Tank 40 HRS $5.25 $210.00 $15.75 $630.00 $0.00 

1.8 4" Portable Pump 20 HRS $11.88 $237.60 $20.00 $400.00 $23.75 $475.00 $0.00 

1.9 Barricade 56 HRS $18.75 $1,050.00 $17.50 $980.00 $2.25 $126.00 $0.00 

1.10 Sorbent Boom 10 foot length 20 HRS $30.00 $600.00 $39.75 $795.00 $67.00 $1,340.00 $0.00 

1.11 Level B PPE (suit, booties, gloves) 10 EA $35.00 $350.00 $175.00 $1,750.00 $225.00 $2,250.00 $0.00 

1.12 Sorbent Pads (Package of 50) 10 EA $75.00 $750.00 $57.50 $575.00 $47.25 $472.50 $0.00 

1.13 Sorbent (loose, granular, 50 lb bag) 20 EA $10.00 $200.00 $8.00 $160.00 $17.25 $345.00 $0.00 

1.14 Pressure washer and hose 20 HRS $31.25 $625.00 $28.00 $560.00 $22.50 $450.00 $0.00 

1.15 Water sample BTEX 1 EA $68.75 $68.75 $45.50 $45.50 $70.00 $70.00 $0.00 

1.16 Water sample TPH 1 EA $75.00 $75.00 $45.50 $45.50 $90.00 $90.00 $0.00 

1.17 Water Sample PAH 1 EA $200.00 $200.00 $97.50 $97.50 $200.00 $200.00 $0.00 

1.18 Water Sample Volatiles 1 EA $175.00 $175.00 $104.00 $104.00 $200.00 $200.00 $0.00 

1.19 Water Sample Semi-volatiles 1 EA $475.00 $475.00 $145.50 $145.50 $300.00 $300.00 $0.00 

1.20
Mobilization Fee Standard Response 1.5 hr 

supervisor/3hr for crew and equipment
1 EA

No Bid $0.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $425.00 $425.00 $0.00 

1.21

Vacuum Truck mobilization charge Rapid 

Response - Maximum 3hr response time
1 EA

No Bid $0.00 $315.00 $315.00 $475.00 $475.00 $0.00 

1.22 Disposal of bulk petroleum contaminatied 1 UNIT $0.65 $0.65 $75.00 $75.00 $1.00 $1.00 $0.00 

1.23 Intrinsically safe 3 gas meter 4 UNIT $150.00 $600.00 $145.00 $580.00 $75.00 $300.00 $0.00 

1.24a Other 1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $225.00 $225.00 $0.00 $0.00 

1.24b Other 1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $125.00 $125.00 $0.00 $0.00 

1.24c Other 1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $225.00 $225.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$20,793.00 $24,773.88 $23,069.50 $0.00 

2.1 Project Manager 10 HRS $70.00 $700.00 $75.00 $750.00 $60.00 $600.00 $0.00 

Fort Worth, TX

16011100194

STA1176

Steve Aden

8/16/2016

Clean Harbors Enviromental 

Services

Gruene Enviromental 

CompaniesTAS Enviromental Services

San Antonio, TX New Braunfels, TX

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

Special Instructions:  Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.
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SUBTOTAL FOR SCENARIO ONE(ITEMS 1.1 THRU 1.24):
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Fort Worth, TX

16011100194

STA1176

Steve Aden

8/16/2016

Clean Harbors Enviromental 

Services

Gruene Enviromental 

CompaniesTAS Enviromental Services

San Antonio, TX New Braunfels, TX

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

Special Instructions:  Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name

City, State

BID TABULATION

CITY OF AUSTIN

CONTRACT FOR  RAPID RESPONSE REMEDIATION & HAZMAT DISPOSAL SERVICES

MBE/WBE

2.2 Supervisor/Site Saftey Manager 16 HRS $63.00 $1,008.00 $67.20 $1,075.20 $50.00 $800.00 $0.00 

2.3 Technician 16 HRS $42.00 $672.00 $57.14 $914.24 $35.00 $560.00 $0.00 

2.4 Equipment Operator 16 HRS $45.00 $720.00 $57.14 $914.24 $45.00 $720.00 $0.00 

2.5 Laborer 16 HRS $31.00 $496.00 $48.00 $768.00 $40.00 $640.00 $0.00 

2.6 85 -gallon over pack drum 2 EA $175.00 $350.00 $153.00 $306.00 $185.00 $370.00 $0.00 

2.7 55-gallon drum 2 EA $65.00 $130.00 $43.00 $86.00 $65.00 $130.00 $0.00 

2.8 PPE 6 EA $90.00 $540.00 $650.00 $3,900.00 $1,584.00 $9,504.00 $0.00 

2.9
Mobilization Fee Standard Response 1.5 hr 

supervisor/3hr for crew and equipment
1 EA

No Bid $0.00 $750.00 $750.00 $425.00 $425.00 $0.00 

2.10
Mobilization Fee Standard Response 24hr for 

crew and equipment
1 EA

No Bid $0.00 $610.00 $610.00 $250.00 $250.00 $0.00 

2.11a Other EA $225.00 $225.00 $225.00 $225.00 $0.00 $0.00 

2.11b Other EA $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $0.00 $0.00 

2.11c Other EA $175.00 $525.00 $225.00 $225.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$5,491.00 $10,648.68 $13,999.00 $0.00 

3.1 Project Manager 10 HRS $70.00 $700.00 $75.00 $750.00 $60.00 $600.00 

3.2 Supervisor/Site Saftey Manager 30 HRS $63.00 $1,890.00 $67.20 $2,016.00 $50.00 $1,500.00 

3.3 Technician 30 HRS $42.00 $1,260.00 $57.14 $1,714.20 $35.00 $1,050.00 

3.4 Equipment Operator 30 HRS $45.00 $1,350.00 $57.14 $1,714.20 $45.00 $1,350.00 

3.5 Laborer 30 HRS $31.00 $930.00 $48.00 $1,440.00 $30.00 $900.00 

3.6 Vacuum Truck 30 HRS $98.00 $2,940.00 $63.00 $1,890.00 $125.00 $3,750.00 

3.7 Frac Tank 24 HRS $5.25 $126.00 $35.00 $35.00 $15.75 $378.00 

3.8 2" Portable Pump 24 HRS $9.38 $225.12 $15.00 $360.00 $8.50 $204.00 

3.9 Hand operated Drum Pump 24 HRS $6.25 $150.00 $35.00 $35.00 $4.75 $114.00 

3.10 Disposable drum pump 4 EA $35.00 $140.00 $35.00 $140.00 $60.00 $240.00 

3.11 85-gallon over pack drum 4 ea $175.00 $700.00 $153.00 $612.00 $185.00 $740.00 

3.12 55-gallon drum 4 EA $65.00 $260.00 $43.00 $172.00 $65.00 $260.00 

3.13 PPE 6 EA $90.00 $540.00 $30.00 $180.00 $1,584.00 $9,504.00 

3.14

Mobilization Fee Rapid Response 1.5 hr 

supervisor/3hr for crew and equipment 1 EA No Bid $0.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $425.00 $425.00 

SUBTOTAL FOR SCENARIO TWO (items 2.1 thru 2.11):
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Fort Worth, TX

16011100194

STA1176

Steve Aden

8/16/2016

Clean Harbors Enviromental 

Services

Gruene Enviromental 

CompaniesTAS Enviromental Services

San Antonio, TX New Braunfels, TX

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

Special Instructions:  Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name

City, State

BID TABULATION

CITY OF AUSTIN

CONTRACT FOR  RAPID RESPONSE REMEDIATION & HAZMAT DISPOSAL SERVICES

MBE/WBE

3.15

Vacuum Truck mobilization charge Rapid 

Response - Maximum 3hr response time 1 EA No Bid $0.00 $105.00 $315.00 $475.00 $475.00 

3.16

Sampling, analysis, profiling of liquid for 

disposal 1 EA $750.00 $750.00 $75.00 $75.00 $450.00 $450.00 

3.17 Cost per gallon for disposal of recovered liquid 400 gallons $1.95 $780.00 $250.00 $2,000.00 $2.25 $900.00 

3.18a Other 30 EA $98.00 $2,940.00 $0.00 $0.00 

3.18b Other 24 HRS $5.25 $126.00 $0.00 $0.00 

3.18c Other 1 EA $150.00 $150.00 $0.00 $0.00 

3.18d Other 1 EA $150.00 $150.00 $0.00 $0.00 

3.18e Other 2 EA $300.00 $600.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$16,707.12 $14,448.40 $22,840.00 

$0.00

SUBTOTAL FOR SCENARIO THREE (ITEMS 3.1 thru 3.18)

$42,991.12 $59,908.50

Approved By:  

TOTAL BID $49,870.96

Prepared By: Venisha Ready
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