
BID NO. 

RX NO.   

DATE:  

BUYER:  

ITEM 

NO.
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST QTY UNIT

UNIT 

PRICE

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT 

PRICE

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT 

PRICE

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT 

PRICE

TOTAL 

PRICE

1.1
Labor rate for services during normal business hours, 

defined as Monday through Friday 7:00 am - 6:00 pm
250

HOURLY 

RATE
No Bid No Bid $68.00 $17,000.00 $63.50 $15,875.00 $63.50 $15,875.00 

1.2

Labor rate for services after hours, defined as Monday 

through Friday 6:01 pm - 6:59 am, Saturday and Sunday 

and City holidays

125
HOURLY 

RATE
No Bid No Bid $100.00 $12,500.00 $88.90 $11,112.50 $88.90 $11,112.50 

1.3
Flat fee for Annual Preventative Maintenance and 

Inspection Services 
1 EA No Bid No Bid $1,088.00 $1,088.00 $8,890.00 $8,890.00 $8,890.00 $8,890.00 

1.4
Flat fee for Semi-Annual Preventative Maintenance and 

Inspection Services
2 EA No Bid No Bid $2,064.00 $4,128.00 $8,890.00 $17,780.00 $8,890.00 $17,780.00 

1.5
Discount off Price List for all Security Systems and 

Associated Components
$60,000.00

% 

DISCOUNT
No Bid No Bid 25.00% $45,000.00 15.00% $51,000.00 15.00% $51,000.00 

2.1
Labor rate for services during normal business hours, 

defined as Monday through Friday 7:00 am - 6:00 pm
1,000

HOURLY 

RATE
$90.00 $90,000.00 $68.00 $68,000.00 $63.50 $63,500.00 $63.50 $63,500.00 

2.2

Labor rate for services after hours, defined as Monday 

through Friday 6:01 pm - 6:59 am, Saturday and Sunday 

and City holidays

500
HOURLY 

RATE
$135.00 $67,500.00 $100.00 $50,000.00 $88.90 $44,450.00 $88.90 $44,450.00 

2.3
Flat fee for Annual Preventative Maintenance and 

Inspection Services
140 EA No Bid No Bid $68.00 $9,520.00 $60.00 $8,400.00 $60.00 $8,400.00 

2.4
Flat fee for Semi-Annual Preventative Maintenance and 

Inspection Services
280 EA No Bid No Bid $68.00 $19,040.00 $60.00 $16,800.00 $60.00 $16,800.00 

2.5
Discount off Price List for all Security Systems and 

Associated Components
$300,000.00

% 

DISCOUNT
25.00% $225,000.00 25.00% $225,000.00 15.00% $255,000.00 15.00% $255,000.00 

3.1
Monthly Alarm Monitoring Services Fee (13 Locations x 12 

months = Estimated Annual Amount)
156

MONTHLY 

RATE
$30.00 $4,680.00 $24.10 $3,759.60 $29.00 $4,524.00 $29.00 $4,524.00 

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE - SECTION 3 $4,680.00 $3,759.60 $4,524.00 $4,524.00 

$455,035.60 $497,331.50 $497,331.50

$382,500.00 $371,560.00 $388,150.00 $388,150.00 

No Bid $79,716.00 $104,657.50 $104,657.50 

AWS Inc.

Austin, TX

MBE

Olympus Private Security 

Solutions

Austin, TX

$387,180.00

Manchaca, TX

MBE

SimplexGrinnell LP

MBE/WBE

TOTAL BID

Round Rock, TX

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE - SECTION 1

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE - SECTION 2

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

Special Instructions:  Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name

City, State

BID TABULATION

CITY OF AUSTIN

SECURITY SYSTEM INSPECTION, INSTALLATION, MAINTENANCE, MONITORING, AND REPAIR SERVICES 

10/13/2016

16051900468

JRD0034

Jonathan Dalchau

Turnkey Security, Inc.
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BID NO. 

RX NO.   

DATE:  

BUYER:  

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION

CITY OF AUSTIN

SECURITY SYSTEM INSPECTION, INSTALLATION, MAINTENANCE, MONITORING, AND REPAIR SERVICES 

10/13/2016

16051900468

JRD0034

Jonathan Dalchau

ITEM 

NO.
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST QTY UNIT

UNIT 

PRICE

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT 

PRICE

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT 

PRICE

TOTAL 

PRICE

1.1
Labor rate for services during normal business hours, 

defined as Monday through Friday 7:00 am - 6:00 pm
250

HOURLY 

RATE
No Bid No Bid $65.00 $16,250.00 $70.00 $17,500.00 

1.2

Labor rate for services after hours, defined as Monday 

through Friday 6:01 pm - 6:59 am, Saturday and Sunday 

and City holidays

125
HOURLY 

RATE
No Bid No Bid $97.50 $12,187.50 $105.00 $13,125.00 

1.3
Flat fee for Annual Preventative Maintenance and 

Inspection Services
1 EA No Bid No Bid $1,040.00 $1,040.00 $2,736.00 $2,736.00 

1.4
Flat fee for Semi-Annual Preventative Maintenance and 

Inspection Services
2 EA No Bid No Bid $3,600.00 $7,200.00 $1,474.00 $2,948.00 

1.5
Discount off Price List for all Security Systems and 

Associated Components
$60,000.00

% 

DISCOUNT
No Bid No Bid 25.00% $45,000.00 30.00% $42,000.00 

2.1
Labor rate for services during normal business hours, 

defined as Monday through Friday 7:00 am - 6:00 pm
1,000

HOURLY 

RATE
$85.00 $85,000.00 $65.00 $65,000.00 $70.00 $70,000.00 

2.2

Labor rate for services after hours, defined as Monday 

through Friday 6:01 pm - 6:59 am, Saturday and Sunday 

and City holidays

500
HOURLY 

RATE
$127.50 $63,750.00 $97.50 $48,750.00 $105.00 $52,500.00 

2.3
Flat fee for Annual Preventative Maintenance and 

Inspection Services
140 EA $1,020.00 $142,800.00 $520.00 $72,800.00 $2,358.00 $330,120.00 

2.4
Flat fee for Semi-Annual Preventative Maintenance and 

Inspection Services
280 EA $680.00 $190,400.00 $780.00 $218,400.00 $1,474.00 $412,720.00 

2.5
Discount off Price List for all Security Systems and 

Associated Components
$300,000.00

% 

DISCOUNT
30.00% $210,000.00 25.00% $225,000.00 30.00% $210,000.00 

3.1
Monthly Alarm Monitoring Services Fee (13 Locations x 12 

months = Estimated Annual Amount)
156

MONTHLY 

RATE
$45.00 $7,020.00 $38.00 $5,928.00 $20.00 $3,120.00 

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE - SECTION 1

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE - SECTION 2

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE - SECTION 3

TOTAL BID

Entech Sales & Service

Austin, TX

No Bid $81,677.50 $78,309.00 

$698,970.00 $717,555.50 $1,156,769.00

Firetrol Protection Systems Star Asset Security, LLC

Austin, TX Orlando, FL

$691,950.00 $629,950.00 $1,075,340.00 

$7,020.00 $5,928.00 $3,120.00 

Vendor Name

City, State

MBE/WBE

Prepared By:  Venisha Ready

Approved By:  Jonathan Dalchau
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