
BID NO. 

RX NO.   
DATE:  
BUYER:  

ITEM 
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION
EST 
QTY

UNIT
UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

1.1
Labor rate for ELECTRICAL services during normal business 
hours - Master Electrician/Journeyman

8,000
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $56.00 $448,000.00 $59.00 $472,000.00 

1.2
Labor rate for ELECTRICAL services during normal business 
hours - Apprentice

1,500
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.00 $42,000.00 $40.00 $60,000.00 

1.3
Labor rate for ELECTRICAL services during normal business 
hours - Helper

200
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.00 $4,000.00 $40.00 $8,000.00 

1.4
Labor rate for ELECTRICAL services after hours - Master 
Electrician/Journeyman

800
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $76.00 $60,800.00 $70.00 $56,000.00 

1.5 Labor rate for ELECTRICAL services after hours - Apprentice 150
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.00 $5,700.00 $56.00 $8,400.00 

1.6 Labor rate for ELECTRICAL services after hours - Helper 20
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.00 $540.00 $56.00 $1,120.00 

2.A.1
Labor rate for CARPENTRY services during normal business 
hours - Master/Journeyman

2,500
Hourly 
Rate

$40.05 $100,125.00 $39.50 $98,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.A.2
Labor rate for CARPENTRY services during normal business 
hours - Apprentice

500
Hourly 
Rate

$32.69 $16,345.00 $35.00 $17,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.A.3
Labor rate for CARPENTRY services during normal business 
hours - Helper

200
Hourly 
Rate

$22.83 $4,566.00 $19.00 $3,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.A.4
Labor rate for CARPENTRY services after hours - 
Master/Journeyman

250
Hourly 
Rate

$67.75 $16,937.50 $59.25 $14,812.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.A.5 Labor rate for CARPENTRY services after hours - Apprentice 50
Hourly 
Rate

$54.18 $2,709.00 $52.50 $2,625.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.A.6 Labor rate for CARPENTRY services after hours - Helper 20
Hourly 
Rate

$39.85 $797.00 $28.50 $570.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.B.1
Labor rate for SHEET ROCK services during normal business 
hours - Master/Journeyman

1,500
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid $39.50 $59,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.B.2
Labor rate for SHEET ROCK services during normal business 
hours - Apprentice

500
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid $35.00 $17,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.B.3
Labor rate for SHEET ROCK services during normal business 
hours - Helper

200
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid $19.00 $3,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.B.4
Labor rate for SHEET ROCK services after hours - 
Master/Journeyman

150
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid $59.25 $8,887.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.B.5 Labor rate for SHEET ROCK services after hours - Apprentice 50
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid $52.50 $2,625.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.B.6 Labor rate for SHEET ROCK services after hours - Helper 20
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid $28.50 $570.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.C.1
Labor rate for WINDOW services during normal business hours - 
Master/Journeyman

1,000
Hourly 
Rate

$40.05 $40,050.00 $39.50 $39,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.C.2
Labor rate for WINDOW services during normal business hours - 
Apprentice

300
Hourly 
Rate

$53.90 $16,170.00 $35.00 $10,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.C.3
Labor rate for WINDOW services during normal business hours - 
Helper

100
Hourly 
Rate

$22.83 $2,283.00 $19.00 $1,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.C.4
Labor rate for WINDOW services after hours - 
Master/Journeyman

100
Hourly 
Rate

$67.75 $6,775.00 $59.25 $5,925.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.C.5 Labor rate for WINDOW services after hours - Apprentice 30
Hourly 
Rate

$54.18 $1,625.40 $52.50 $1,575.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.C.6 Labor rate for WINDOW services after hours - Helper 10
Hourly 
Rate

$39.85 $398.50 $28.50 $285.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

CONTRACT FOR GENERAL BUILDING INSTALLATION, MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR SERVICES

6/21/2016

SECTION 2 - TRADE CATEGORY - GENERAL BUILDING MAINTENANCE & REPAIR SERVICES

16010400180

TVN1016

Jonathan Dalchau

Craftcorps Inc.

$561,040.00 $605,520.00 

SECTION 2.A - CARPENTRY SERVICES

SUBTOTAL - SECTION 2.A $141,479.50 $138,057.50 

No Bid

SUBTOTAL - SECTION 2.C $67,301.90 $59,685.00 No Bid No Bid

Special Instructions:  Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name

City, State

Trini Construction 
Builder LLC

Austin, TX
MBE

SECTION 1 - TRADE CATEGORY - ELECTRICAL SERVICES

SUBTOTAL - SECTION 1 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid
SECTION 2.B - SHEET ROCK, INSTALLATION, AND SIDING SERVICES LABOR

SUBTOTAL - SECTION 2.B 

Titus Electrical

Round Rock, TX

Allied Electric Services, 
Inc.

Georgetown, TX
WBE

Austin, TX
MBE/WBE

No Bid $92,632.50 No Bid
SECTION 2.C - WINDOW SERVICES
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BID NO. 

RX NO.   
DATE:  
BUYER:  

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

CONTRACT FOR GENERAL BUILDING INSTALLATION, MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR SERVICES

6/21/2016
16010400180

TVN1016

Jonathan Dalchau

Craftcorps Inc.

Special Instructions:  Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name

City, State

Trini Construction 
Builder LLC

Austin, TX
MBE

Titus Electrical

Round Rock, TX

Allied Electric Services, 
Inc.

Georgetown, TX
WBE

Austin, TX
MBE/WBE

2.D.1
Labor rate for DOOR services during normal business hours - 
Master/Journeyman

800
Hourly 
Rate

$40.05 $32,040.00 $39.50 $31,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.D.2
Labor rate for DOOR services during normal business hours - 
Apprentice

200
Hourly 
Rate

$32.69 $6,538.00 $35.00 $7,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.D.3
Labor rate for DOOR services during normal business hours - 
Helper

50
Hourly 
Rate

$22.83 $1,141.50 $19.00 $950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.D.4 Labor rate for DOOR services after hours - Master/Journeyman 80
Hourly 
Rate

$67.75 $5,420.00 $59.25 $4,740.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.D.5 Labor rate for DOOR services after hours - Apprentice 20
Hourly 
Rate

$54.18 $1,083.60 $52.50 $1,050.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.D.6 Labor rate for DOOR services after hours - Helper 10
Hourly 
Rate

$39.85 $398.50 $28.50 $285.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.E.1
Labor rate for MASONRY services during normal business hours -
Master/Journeyman

2,000
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid $39.50 $79,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.E.2
Labor rate for MASONRY services during normal business hours -
Apprentice

500
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid $35.00 $17,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.E.3
Labor rate for MASONRY services during normal business hours -
Helper

200
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid $19.00 $3,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.E.4
Labor rate for MASONRY services after hours - 
Master/Journeyman

200
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid $59.25 $11,850.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.E.5 Labor rate for MASONRY services after hours - Apprentice 50
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid $52.50 $2,625.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.E.6 Labor rate for MASONRY services after hours - Helper 20
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid $28.50 $570.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.1
Labor rate for HVAC services during normal business hours - 
Master/Journeyman

8,000
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.2
Labor rate for HVAC services during normal business hours - 
Apprentice

1,500
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.3
Labor rate for HVAC services during normal business hours - 
Helper

200
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.4 Labor rate for HVAC services after hours - Master/Journeyman 800
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.5 Labor rate for HVAC services after hours - Apprentice 150
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.6 Labor rate for HVAC services after hours - Helper 20
Hourly 
Rate

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$451,345.00

No Bid No Bid

SECTION 2.D - DOOR SERVICES

SUBTOTAL - SECTION 2.D $46,621.60 $45,625.00 

TOTAL BID: SECTION 1 TO 3

No Bid

SECTION 2.E - MASONRY SERVICES

SUBTOTAL - SECTION 2.E No Bid $115,345.00 

No Bid No Bid

$561,040.00 $605,520.00

SECTION 3 - TRADE CATEGORY - HEATING, VENTILATION, AIR CONDITIONING (HVAC) SERVICES

SUBTOTAL - SECTION 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$255,403.00

SUBTOTAL - SECTION 2 No Bid $451,345.00 No Bid
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BID NO. 
RX NO.   
DATE:  
BUYER:  
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NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION
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UNIT
UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
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TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

1.1
Labor rate for ELECTRICAL services during normal business 
hours - Master Electrician/Journeyman

8,000
Hourly 

Rate
$74.00 $592,000.00 $63.40 $507,200.00 $75.00 $600,000.00 $53.50 $428,000.00 

1.2
Labor rate for ELECTRICAL services during normal business 
hours - Apprentice

1,500
Hourly 

Rate
$54.00 $81,000.00 $38.41 $57,615.00 $45.00 $67,500.00 $21.00 $31,500.00 

1.3
Labor rate for ELECTRICAL services during normal business 
hours - Helper

200
Hourly 

Rate
$40.00 $8,000.00 $30.38 $6,076.00 $45.00 $9,000.00 $18.00 $3,600.00 

1.4
Labor rate for ELECTRICAL services after hours - Master 
Electrician/Journeyman

800
Hourly 

Rate
$111.00 $88,800.00 $78.79 $63,032.00 $108.75 $87,000.00 $68.00 $54,400.00 

1.5 Labor rate for ELECTRICAL services after hours - Apprentice 150
Hourly 

Rate
$81.00 $12,150.00 $48.27 $7,240.50 $65.25 $9,787.50 $31.00 $4,650.00 

1.6 Labor rate for ELECTRICAL services after hours - Helper 20
Hourly 

Rate
$60.00 $1,200.00 $38.79 $775.80 $65.25 $1,305.00 $18.00 $360.00 

2.A.1
Labor rate for CARPENTRY services during normal business 
hours - Master/Journeyman

2,500
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $56.00 $140,000.00 

2.A.2
Labor rate for CARPENTRY services during normal business 
hours - Apprentice

500
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00 $12,500.00 

2.A.3
Labor rate for CARPENTRY services during normal business 
hours - Helper

200
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.00 $3,600.00 

2.A.4
Labor rate for CARPENTRY services after hours - 
Master/Journeyman

250
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $70.00 $17,500.00 

2.A.5 Labor rate for CARPENTRY services after hours - Apprentice 50
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.00 $1,750.00 

2.A.6 Labor rate for CARPENTRY services after hours - Helper 20
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.00 $360.00 

2.B.1
Labor rate for SHEET ROCK services during normal business 
hours - Master/Journeyman

1,500
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.00 $66,000.00 

2.B.2
Labor rate for SHEET ROCK services during normal business 
hours - Apprentice

500
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00 $12,500.00 

2.B.3
Labor rate for SHEET ROCK services during normal business 
hours - Helper

200
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.00 $3,600.00 

2.B.4
Labor rate for SHEET ROCK services after hours - 
Master/Journeyman

150
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $57.00 $8,550.00 

2.B.5 Labor rate for SHEET ROCK services after hours - Apprentice 50
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.00 $1,750.00 

2.B.6 Labor rate for SHEET ROCK services after hours - Helper 20
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.00 $360.00 

2.C.1
Labor rate for WINDOW services during normal business hours -
Master/Journeyman

1,000
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $56.00 $56,000.00 

2.C.2
Labor rate for WINDOW services during normal business hours -
Apprentice

300
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00 $7,500.00 

2.C.3
Labor rate for WINDOW services during normal business hours -
Helper

100
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.00 $1,800.00 

2.C.4
Labor rate for WINDOW services after hours - 
Master/Journeyman

100
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $70.00 $7,000.00 

2.C.5 Labor rate for WINDOW services after hours - Apprentice 30
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.00 $1,050.00 

2.C.6 Labor rate for WINDOW services after hours - Helper 10
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.00 $180.00 

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

Special Instructions:  Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

CONTRACT FOR GENERAL BUILDING INSTALLATION, MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR SERVICES
TVN1016
16010400180
6/21/2016
Jonathan Dalchau

Vendor Name J.S. Electric, Inc. JM Engineering, LLC TDIndustries, Inc. Elk Electric, Inc.

MBE/WBE WBE WBE
City, State Budda, TX Austin, TX Round Rock, TX Austin, TX

SECTION 1 - TRADE CATEGORY - ELECTRICAL SERVICES

SUBTOTAL - SECTION 1 $783,150.00 $641,939.30 $774,592.50 $522,510.00 
SECTION 2 - TRADE CATEGORY - GENERAL BUILDING MAINTENANCE & REPAIR SERVICES

SECTION 2.A - CARPENTRY SERVICES

SUBTOTAL - SECTION 2.A No Bid No Bid No Bid $175,710.00 
SECTION 2.B - SHEET ROCK, INSTALLATION, AND SIDING SERVICES LABOR

SUBTOTAL - SECTION 2.B No Bid No Bid No Bid $92,760.00 
SECTION 2.C - WINDOW SERVICES

SUBTOTAL - SECTION 2.C No Bid No Bid No Bid $73,530.00 

Page 3



BID NO. 
RX NO.   
DATE:  
BUYER:  

ITEM 
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION
EST 
QTY

UNIT
UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL 
PRICE

City, State Budda, TX Austin, TX Round Rock, TX Austin, TX
MBE/WBE WBE WBE

Vendor Name J.S. Electric, Inc. JM Engineering, LLC TDIndustries, Inc. Elk Electric, Inc.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

Special Instructions:  Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

CONTRACT FOR GENERAL BUILDING INSTALLATION, MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR SERVICES
TVN1016
16010400180
6/21/2016
Jonathan Dalchau

2.D.1
Labor rate for DOOR services during normal business hours - 
Master/Journeyman

800
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $56.00 $44,800.00 

2.D.2
Labor rate for DOOR services during normal business hours - 
Apprentice

200
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00 $5,000.00 

2.D.3
Labor rate for DOOR services during normal business hours - 
Helper

50
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.00 $900.00 

2.D.4 Labor rate for DOOR services after hours - Master/Journeyman 80
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $70.00 $5,600.00 

2.D.5 Labor rate for DOOR services after hours - Apprentice 20
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.00 $700.00 

2.D.6 Labor rate for DOOR services after hours - Helper 10
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.00 $180.00 

2.E.1
Labor rate for MASONRY services during normal business 
hours - Master/Journeyman

2,000
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.00 $88,000.00 

2.E.2
Labor rate for MASONRY services during normal business 
hours - Apprentice

500
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.00 $22,000.00 

2.E.3
Labor rate for MASONRY services during normal business 
hours - Helper

200
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.00 $3,600.00 

2.E.4
Labor rate for MASONRY services after hours - 
Master/Journeyman

200
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $57.00 $11,400.00 

2.E.5 Labor rate for MASONRY services after hours - Apprentice 50
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.00 $1,750.00 

2.E.6 Labor rate for MASONRY services after hours - Helper 20
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.00 $360.00 

3.1
Labor rate for HVAC services during normal business hours - 
Master/Journeyman

8,000
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid $66.47 $531,760.00 $79.00 $632,000.00 $62.00 $496,000.00 

3.2
Labor rate for HVAC services during normal business hours - 
Apprentice

1,500
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid $46.09 $69,135.00 $54.50 $81,750.00 $58.00 $87,000.00 

3.3
Labor rate for HVAC services during normal business hours - 
Helper

200
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid $30.38 $6,076.00 $45.00 $9,000.00 $18.00 $3,600.00 

3.4 Labor rate for HVAC services after hours - Master/Journeyman 800
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid $82.40 $65,920.00 $114.55 $91,640.00 $82.00 $65,600.00 

3.5 Labor rate for HVAC services after hours - Apprentice 150
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid $57.10 $8,565.00 $79.03 $11,854.50 $73.00 $10,950.00 

3.6 Labor rate for HVAC services after hours - Helper 20
Hourly 

Rate
No Bid No Bid $38.79 $775.80 $65.25 $1,305.00 $18.00 $360.00 

Prepared By:  Stephanie Hollanders
Approved By:  Jonathan Dalchau

SUBTOTAL - SECTION 3 No Bid $682,231.80 $827,549.50 $663,510.00 

TOTAL BID: SECTION 1 TO 3 $783,150.00 $1,324,171.10 $1,602,142.00 $1,712,310.00

SECTION 3 - TRADE CATEGORY - HEATING, VENTILATION, AIR CONDITIONING (HVAC) SERVICES

SECTION 2.E - MASONRY SERVICES

SUBTOTAL - SECTION 2.E No Bid No Bid No Bid $127,110.00 
SUBTOTAL - SECTION 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid $526,290.00 

SECTION 2.D - DOOR SERVICES

SUBTOTAL - SECTION 2.D No Bid No Bid No Bid $57,180.00 
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