The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
OEM PARTS AND REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLE DRIVELINE COMPONENTS
BID NO. JRD0002
RX NO. 7800 13091200590
DATE: 11/19/2013
BUYER: Jonathan Dalchau
Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.
. . L San Antonio Brake and Longhorn International
Vendor Name Drivetrain Specialists, LLC Clutch/ dba Lone Star Brake |Tru i
City, State Buda, TX San Antonio, TX Austin, TX
MBE/WBE
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION EST UNIT UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. QTY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Section 1: Houtly Labor Rate
1 Labor Rate Per Hour for Services Provided 50 | HRLY | $75.00 $3,750.00 $80.00 $4.000.00 $105.00 $5.250.00
During Normal Business Hours
Section 2: Most Frequently Ordered Items
2 SWITCH PRESSURE 3 EA $34.47 $103.41 $52.23 $156.69 $38.42 $115.26
3 SWITCH PTO 2 EA $15.19 $30.38 $23.74 $47.48 $16.94 $33.88
4 YOKE SWEEPER 8 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $37.42 $299.36
5 TRANSMISSION SELECTOR ELECTRO 1 EA $356.75 $356.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 SHAFT DRIVE STRAP KIT 8 EA $19.22 $153.76 $14.82 $118.56 $24.67 $197.36
7 U- JOINT STRAP KIT 22 EA $19.47 $428.34 $13.73 $302.06 $31.47 $692.34
8 U-JOINT DRIVE SHAFT 2 EA $21.87 $43.74 $12.58 $25.16 $50.67 $101.34
9 VALVE & CAP 2 EA $182.89 $365.78 No Bid No Bid $209.74 $419.48
10 PTO CHELSEA - 277XGFJPB5RB 3 EA $1,454.55 $4,363.65 $1,568.58 $4,705.74 $1,659.16 $4,977.48
11 PTO CHELSEA - 277XGFJP-B5XK 1 EA $1,454.55 $1,454.55 $1,568.58 $1,568.58 $1,620.70 $1,620.70
12 SWITCH PTO ROCKER 6 EA $23.07 $138.42 $22.59 $135.54 $27.37 $164.22
13 SWITCH PTO 4 EA $53.10 $212.40 $58.38 $233.52 $60.92 $243.68
14 PICKUP MAGNETIC PTO 4 EA $82.98 $331.92 $81.21 $324.84 $98.06 $392.24
15 BOX CONTROL OVERSPEED 12V 11 EA $483.37 $5,317.07 $720.50 $7,925.50 $528.03 $5,808.33
16 VALVE BRAKE AIR 3 EA $108.56 $325.68 $106.27 $318.81 $124.53 $373.59
17 JOINT UNIVERSAL 10 EA $17.16 $171.60 $14.21 $142.10 $11.71 $117.10
18 JOINT DRIVE SHAFT UNIVERSAL 2 EA $72.88 $145.76 $66.10 $132.20 $50.67 $101.34
19 U- JOINT DRIVESHAFT STRAP KIT 2 EA $11.18 $22.36 $9.31 $18.62 $18.58 $37.16
20 SWITCH ELECTRONIC OVERSPEED 3 EA $469.18 $1,407.54 $327.94 $983.82 $791.94 $2.375.82
21 U -JOINT 1 EA $124.57 $124.57 $84.67 $84.67 $88.34 $88.34
22 U-JOINT UD DRIVESHAFT 1 EA $124.57 $124.57 $84.67 $84.67 $88.34 $88.34
23 BUTTON THROTTLE CABLE 1 EA No Bid No Bid $31.44 $31.44 $25.77 $25.77
24 PTO GEAR BOX 1 EA $539.38 $539.38 $443.62 $443.62 $618.72 $618.72
25 SWITCH CARGO OVERSPEED 1 EA $469.18 $469.18 $347.95 $347.95 $791.94 $791.94
26 THROTTLE CABLE REAR 1 EA No Bid No Bid $74.76 $74.76 $49.09 $49.09
27 CABLE MIXER CONTROL 2 EA No Bid No Bid $85.90 $171.80 $51.31 $102.62
28 SENSOR TRANSMISSION SPEED 3 EA $60.00 $180.00 $91.44 $274.32 $419.82 $1,259.46
29 RING CLUTCH PLATE DRIVE 1 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30 O RING PTO SEAL 3 EA $1.17 $3.51 $1.10 $3.30 $1.35 $4.05
31 DIFFERENTIAL REAR 6:17 RATIO 1 EA $1,150.00 $1,150.00 $1,376.28 $1,376.28 $1,177.09 $1,177.09
32 GEARBOX PTO AUXILIARY 1 EA $1,816.24 $1,816.24 $1,284.40 $1,284.40 $1,916.55 $1,916.55
33 SWITCH OVERSPEED 1 EA $469.18 $469.18 $357.85 $357.85 No Bid No Bid
34 VALUE AIR PTO 1 EA $223.47 $223.47 $123.01 $123.01 $88.58 $88.58
TOTAL BID $20,473.21 $21,797.29 $24,281.23
Section 3: Pick up and Delivery
35 |Flat fee for Pickup and Delivery of City's 25 BA $35.00 $875.00 $3.00 $75.00 $40.00 $1,000.00
Drivable" units.
Section 4: Delivery Charge for Code Red Items Onl
36 |t fee for "Code Red” deliveries, to be made 10 EA $40.00 $400.00 $3.00 $30.00 $0.00 $0.00
within 4 business hours.

Prepared By: Julia Ramirez
Approved By: Jonathan Dalchau
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