The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
BRUSH LOADER BODIES WITH CRANES AND GRAPPLES

BID NO. JRDO0014
RX NO. 7800 1404100532
DATE: 5/7/2014
BUYER: Jonathan Dalchau

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Texas Waste Equipment,

Vendor Name Texas Timberjack, Inc. Inc. dba Heil of Texas Craneworks, Inc.
City, State Lufkin, TX San Antonio, TX Houston, TX
MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

Section 1: BRUSH LOADER BODIES WITH CRANES AND GRAPPLES

Brush Loader Body with Epsilon S2601.130

1 Crane and Prentice 42 SW Grapple or 1 EA No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Equivalent
Brush Loader Body with Epsilon M110L80
2 Crane and Prentice 42 SW Grapple or 1 EA $76,670.60 | $76,670.60 $89,967.00 | $89,967.00 | $99,333.00 | $99,333.00
Equivalent
Section 2: OPERATOR & LIMITED MAINTENANCE TRAINING
3 Hourly Labor Rate for Operator Training HR No bid No bid $0.00 $0.00 $157.00 $157.00
4 Hourly Labor Rate for Limited Maintenance HR No bid No bid $0.00 $0.00 $157.00 $157.00

Training

Prepared By: Julia Ramirez
Approved By: Jonathan Dalchau
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