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1.1 BLADE ATOMIC CUTTING 301 EA No Bid $22.98 $6,916.98 $31.10 $9,361.10 

1.2 SET 6-PK ATOMIC CUTTING BLADE 147 EA $111.71 $16,421.37 $124.90 $18,360.30 $169.00 $24,843.00 

1.3 WASHER BLADE SPACER 114 EA $2.98 $339.72 $3.60 $410.40 $4.90 $558.60 

1.4 WHEEL TORO DECK 93 EA $14.54 $1,352.22 $8.99 $836.07 $23.35 $2,171.55 

1.5 SCREW BLADE 93 EA $4.25 $395.25 $3.75 $348.75 $6.45 $599.85 

1.6 SPACER CASTER FORK 88 EA No Bid $2.69 $236.72 $5.20 $457.60 

1.7 BLADE MOWER DECK CUTTING 77 EA No Bid $17.11 $1,317.47 $26.95 $2,075.15 

1.8 TUBE WHEEL ASSEMBLY 56 EA $6.32 $353.92 $4.70 $263.20 $9.60 $537.60 

1.9 NUT FLANGE PROPANE 51 EA $0.62 $31.62 $0.70 $35.70 $0.95 $48.45 

1.1 SPACER TUBE ASSEMBLY 50 EA $4.91 $245.50 $4.65 $232.50 $7.45 $372.50 

1.11 NUT WHEEL 47 EA $4.46 $209.62 $1.12 $52.64 $6.75 $317.25 

1.12 SCREW ROLLER MOUNT 46 EA $1.53 $70.38 $0.59 $27.14 $2.35 $108.10 

1.13 BRACKET MOWER DECK 46 EA No Bid $5.07 $233.22 $6.90 $317.40 

1.14 MOUNT ROLLER DECK 46 EA No Bid $45.49 $2,092.54 $64.80 $2,980.80 

1.15 CUP ANTI SCALP 44 EA $24.91 $1,096.04 $24.84 $1,092.96 $37.70 $1,658.80 

1.16 HYDROSTAT PUMP ASSEMBLY 1 EA No Bid $3,714.30 $3,714.30 $4,750.00 $4,750.00 

1.17 TANK HYDRAULIC 1 EA No Bid $2,285.16 $2,285.16 $2,920.00 $2,920.00 

1.18 HOOD ENGINE ASSEMBLY 1 EA No Bid $1,963.11 $1,963.11 $2,508.45 $2,508.45 

1.19 MIXER PROPANE 1 EA $1,585.42 $1,585.42 $1,772.60 $1,772.60 $2,265.00 $2,265.00 

1.20 HYDRAULIC LIFT ARM ASSEMBLY LH 1 EA $1,582.23 $1,582.23 $1,634.98 $1,634.98 $2,090.00 $2,090.00 

1.21 HYDRO ASSEMBLY LH 1 EA $1,582.23 $1,582.23 $1,634.98 $1,634.98 $2,090.00 $2,090.00 

1.22 PLANETARY AXLE DRIVEN 1 EA No Bid $1,576.99 $1,576.99 $2,015.00 $2,015.00 

1.23 MIXER PROPANE 1 EA $1,585.42 $1,585.42 $1,772.60 $1,772.60 $2,265.00 $2,265.00 

1.24 WIRE HARNESS 1 EA No Bid $1,252.49 $1,252.49 $1,600.40 $1,600.40 

1.25 CONTROLLER 1 EA No Bid $1,142.73 $1,142.73 $1,460.20 $1,460.20 

1.26 SCREEN LCD 1 EA No Bid $885.33 $885.33 $1,132.00 $1,132.00 

1.27 ROOF CAB COVER 1 EA No Bid $728.01 $728.01 $984.95 $984.95 

1.28 CYLINDER HYDRAULIC 1 EA No Bid $709.04 $709.04 $959.30 $959.30 

$26,850.94 $53,528.91 $73,448.05 

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

Special Instructions:  Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.
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CONTRACT FOR OEM PARTS FOR TORO LAWN EQUIPMENT
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Euless, TX Clifton Heights, PAAustin, TX
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7800 16022400283

IFB MMO0102

MARIAN MOORE

HCOP, LLC Professional Turf Products* CAPP USA*
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Special Instructions:  Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name

City, State
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CITY OF AUSTIN

CONTRACT FOR OEM PARTS FOR TORO LAWN EQUIPMENT

4/5/2016
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7800 16022400283

IFB MMO0102

MARIAN MOORE

HCOP, LLC Professional Turf Products* CAPP USA*

2.1
Flat fee for "Code Red" deliveries, to be made 

as specified in the Scope of Work after the 

order is sent.

30 EA $100.00 $3,000.00 No Bid No Bid

* Deemed Non-Responsive due to failure to provide pricing as required by the solicitation.

Approved By:  Marian Moore

TOTAL BID (Extended Price Sections 1 & 2) $29,850.94 

Prepared By:  Stephanie Hollanders

SECTION 2 - DELIVERY CHARGE FOR CODE RED ITEMS ONLY

$73,448.05 $53,528.91 

Page 2


