The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

CONTRACT FOR REPAIR SERVICES WITH ASSOCIATED PARTS FOR STEERING, SUSPENSION & ALIGNMENT SERVICES

BID NO. MMOO0105
BUYER: Marian Moore

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Leif Johnson Truck City
Vendor Name Rush Truck Center, Austin Ford Atlas Spring Service D&B Auto Inc.*
City, State Buda, TX Buda, TX Austin, TX Austin, TX
MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Section 1 - Hourly Labor Rate
1.1 Labor Rate per Hour for Repair Services 500 Hour $82.50 $41,250.00 $125.00 $62,500.00 $90.00 $45,000.00
1.2 Fabrication of Suspension Components 200 Hour $82.50 $16,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.3 Repairs of Suspension Components 500 Hour $82.50 $41,250.00 $125.00 $62,500.00 $90.00 $45,000.00
MEDIUM-DUTY VEHICLES - Class 111, IV,
1.4 V & VI Wheel and Axle Alighment Services 250 Hour $82.50 $20,625.00 $125.00 $31,250.00 $90.00 $22,500.00
HEAVY-DUTY VEHICLES - Class VII and
1.5 VIII Wheel and Axle Alignment Services 250 Hour $82.50 $20,625.00 No Bid No Bid $90.00 $22,500.00
EQUIPMENT Wheel and Axle Alighment
1.6 Services 550 Hour $82.50 $45,375.00 No Bid No Bid $90.00 $49,500.00
Section 1 - SUBTOTAL $185,625.00 $156,250.00 $184,500.00
Section 2 - Priority Repairs
2.1 [Flat fee for Expedited Services | 100 | Each $50.00 [ $5,000.00 $250.00 | $25,000.00 $100.00 | $10,000.00
TOTAL BID (SECTION 1 & 2) $190,625.00 $181,250.00 $194,500.00

* Bidder did not meet solicitation requirements

Prepared By: Stephanie Hollanders
Approved By: Marian Moore
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