The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID NO.
RX NO.
DATE:
BUYER:

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

VEHICLE TIRE REPAIR AND REPLACEMENT SERVICES

SLWO0111

7800 15031300244
5/12/2015

Sandy Wirtanen

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name

Youngblood Auto & Tire

GCR Tires & Services

*Southern Tire Mart, LLILC

City, State

Austin, TX

Pflugerville, TX

Columbia, MS

MBE/WBE

ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION

EST
QTY

UNIT

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

Section 1: TIRE REPAIR AND REPLACEMENT SERVICES

11

Flat repair/replacement of tires on
passenger cars, light trucks, and trailers
for tire sizes of 13"-15"

62

EA

$15.00

$930.00

$16.00

$992.00

1.2

Flat repair/replacement of tires on
passenger cars, light trucks, and trailers
for tire sizes of 16" - 18"

187

EA

$15.00

$2,805.00

$16.00

$2,992.00

1.3

Flat repair/replacement of tires on
passenger cars, light trucks, and trailers
for tire sizes above 18" up to 22"

250

EA

$15.00

$3,750.00

$16.00

$4,000.00

1.4

Flat repair/replacement of tube tires on
large trucks with tire sizes of 8.25 x 20
and above equipped with multiple piece
wheels which include lock rings, etc.

50

EA

$20.00

$1,000.00

$25.00

$1,250.00

15

Flat repair/replacement of tubeless tires
on large trucks tire sizes of 215/75R175
and above

500

EA

$20.00

$10,000.00

$25.00

$12,500.00

1.6

Flat repair/replacement of front tube type
or tubeless type tires for agricultural type
equipment such as tractors, backhoes,
front-end loaders. Example sizes include
1100-16, 11L-16, 145/75-161, and 125L-
16

125

EA

$25.00

$3,125.00

$30.00

$3,750.00

1.7

Flat repair/replacement of front tube type
or tubeless type tires for agricultural type
equipment such as tractors, backhoes,
front-end loaders. Example sizes include
184-161, 184-28, 169-28, 195L-24, 28L-
26 and 184-13

250

EA

$35.00

$8,750.00

$55.00

$13,750.00

1.8

Flat repair/replacement on industrial
equipment such as forklifts, warehouse
trailers, etc. (All sizes)

125

EA

$25.00

$3,125.00

$30.00

$3,750.00

1.9

Flat repair/replacement for off-road
equipment such as road graders,
maintainers, excavators, etc. Example
size are 21 x 25 and above

125

EA

$50.00

$6,250.00

$65.00

$8,125.00

TOTAL PRICE FOR SECTION 1:

$39,735.00

$51,109.00

SECTION 2: TIRE REPAIR SUPPLIES
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
VEHICLE TIRE REPAIR AND REPLACEMENT SERVICES
BID NO. SLWO0111
RX NO. 7800 15031300244
DATE: 5/12/2015
BUYER: Sandy Wirtanen
Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.
Vendor Name Youngblood Auto & Tire GCR Tires & Services *Southern Tire Mart, LLC
City, State Austin, TX Pflugerville, TX Columbia, MS
MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY [UNIT| PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
2.1 O-Ring, 24" 75 EA $10.00 $750.00 $9.95 $746.25
2.2 O -Ring, 25" 75 EA $10.00 $750.00 $10.95 $821.25
2.3 Valve Stem, Truck 1 1/2 inch TR 501 100 EA $2.00 $200.00 $6.95 $695.00
2.4 Valve Stem, Truck 2 inch TR 500 100 EA $2.00 $200.00 $6.95 $695.00
2.5 Valve Stem, Truck 3 3/8 inch TR 571 100 EA $2.50 $250.00 $9.95 $995.00
2.6 Valve Stem, Truck 4 3/8 inch TR 573 100 EA $2.50 $250.00 $9.95 $995.00
2.7 Valve Stem, Truck 5inch TR 574 100 EA $2.50 $250.00 $9.95 $995.00
TOTAL PRICE FOR SECTION 2: $2,650.00 $5,942.50
SECTION 3: TRIP CHARGES
Service Call Fee During Regular Hours -
31 7AM - 7TPM 1,200 EA $30.00 $36,000.00 $50.00 $60,000.00
Service Call Fee During Non-Regular
3.2 Hours - 7PM - 7AM (Weekdays & All Day 100 EA
Weekends, and official City holidays) $60.00 $6,000.00 $95.00 $9,500.00
33 Flat Fee for Pickup of Replacement Tire 600 EA
' from Service Center or Tire Shop $10.00 $6,000.00 No Bid No Bid
Flat Fee for Return of Unrepairable Tire
3.4 to the Service Center 600 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL PRICE FOR SECTION 3: $48,000.00 $69,500.00
SECTION 4: LOOSE TIRE/RIM MOUNTING AND/OR DISMOUNTING SERVICES
Mounting only of loose tires and rims for
medium trucks at the City's Tire Shop.
(Rim sizes: 8.25 x 22.5, 9 x 22.5, 14 X
4.1 22.5) 200 EA $10.00 $2,000.00 $15.00 $3,000.00
Dismounting only of loose tires and rims
for medium trucks at the City's Tire Shop.
(Rim sizes: 8.25 x 22.54, 9 x 22.5, 14 X
4.2 22.5) 200 EA $10.00 $2,000.00 $15.00 $3,000.00
TOTAL PRICE FOR SECTION 4: $4,000.00 $6,000.00
TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR SECTIONS 1-4: $94,385.00 $132,551.50
*Non-Responsive

Prepared By: Julia Ramirez

Approved By: Sandy Wirtanen
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