The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
SECURITY SYSTEMS PARTS
BID NO. PAX0062
RX NO. 8100 15040300274
DATE: 7/8/2015
BUYER: Sai Xoomsai
Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.
Metroplex Control Systems International Systems of Convergint Technologies,
Vendor Name Schneider Electric dba Argyle Security Group |EPS Logix, Inc. America, LLC LLC
City, State Austin, TX San Antonio, TX Dallas, TX Louisville, KY Austin, TX
MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY |UNIT| PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
SECTION A - SECURITY CAMERA SYSTEM
1 Digital CCD Day/Night Camera 1/3" High Res 1 ‘ '
Color EA $210.65 $210.65 No Bid No Bid $259.00 $259.00 $264.38 $264.38 $322.40 $322.40
5 Digital CCD Day/Night Camera 1/3" High Res 1 . . _ _
Compact EA $105.70 $105.70 No Bid No Bid $135.00 $135.00 No Bid No Bid $161.85 $161.85
3 Camera Camclosure IS 2 EA $210.65 $421.30 No Bid No Bid $269.00 $538.00 $145.89 $291.78 $322.40 $644.80
4 Spectra IV Video Security Camera 1 EA $838.91 $838.91 No Bid No Bid $1,298.00 $1,298.00 $1,599.54 $1,599.54 $1,286.35 $1,286.35
5 Dome Wall Mount 2 EA $57.65 $115.30 No Bid No Bid $82.00 $164.00 $122.02 $244.04 $83.85 $167.70
6 Spectra IV 2 EA $838.91 $1,677.82 No Bid No Bid $1,485.00 $2,970.00 $1,298.91 $2,597.82 $1,286.35 $2,572.70
7 8 Power - Video - Connectors 1 EA $23.65 $23.65 $64.65 $64.65 $42.00 $42.00 $55.60 $55.60 $66.00 $66.00
8 8 Channel Video Transceiver 1 FA $291.96 $291.96 $901.32 $901.32 $545.00 $545.00 $757.90 $757.90 $900.00 $900.00
9 8 Megapixel 360 Degree Panoramic IP Camera 1 EA $664.48 $664.48 No Bid No Bid $949.00 $949.00 $1,423.65 $1,423.65 $969.80 $969.80
10 Camclosure Mini Dome 2 EA $210.65 $421.30 No Bid No Bid $270.00 $540.00 No Bid No Bid $322.40 $644.80
11 Camclosure 3-9.5mm 2 EA $210.65 $421.30 No Bid No Bid $270.00 $540.00 No Bid No Bid $322.40 $644.80
12 Fixed Mount Dome 1 EA $192.91 $192.91 $253.54 $253.54 $257.00 $257.00 $230.80 $230.80 $281.45 $281.45
13 Outdoor PTZ Camera 1 EA $2,711.87 $2,711.87 No Bid No Bid $3,429.00 $3,429.00 $2,574.85 $2,574.85 $4,156.10 $4,156.10
14 Spectra IV SE Dome 1 EA $976.39 $976.39 No Bid No Bid $1,339.00 $1,339.00 $1,855.08 $1,855.08 $1,496.30 $1,496.30
15 Spectra IV Dome System 1 EA $1,004.48 $1,004.48 No Bid No Bid $1,405.00 $1,405.00 $1,962.10 $1,962.10 $1,539.85 $1,539.85
16 Digital Color Camera 2 EA $210.65 $421.30 No Bid No Bid $249.00 $498.00 No Bid No Bid $322.40 $644.80
17 Dome Mount 1 EA $57.65 $57.65 $79.86 $79.86 $72.00 $72.00 $69.05 $69.05 $83.85 $83.85
18 Single Camera P/S 2 EA $102.74 $205.48 $142.00 $284.00 $129.00 $258.00 $123.05 $246.10 $150.15 $300.30
19 Spectra Wall Mount 1 EA $260.17 $260.17 $360.02 $360.02 $309.00 $309.00 $311.60 $311.60 $379.60 $379.60
20 Camclosure Panel 1 EA $43.61 $43.61 No Bid No Bid $53.00 $53.00 No Bid No Bid $66.95 $66.95
21 Spectra IV SE Dome 1 EA $838.91 $838.91 No Bid No Bid $1,098.00 $1,098.00 $1,599.54 $1,599.54 $1,286.35 $1,286.35
29 Camera, Outdoor-Fixed Dome, 3.1MPX, 4
Day/Night EA $664.48 $2,657.92 $1,154.00 $4,616.00 $780.00 $3,120.00 $1,086.70 $4,346.80 $969.80 $3,879.20
23 Spectra IV, Camera Kit, PTZ 2 EA $1,034.04 $2,068.08 $1,314.00 $2,628.00 $1,262.00 $2,524.00 $1,298.91 $2,597.82 $1,585.35 $3,170.70
24 Mount, Aluminum, 40lbs. Camera, Swivel-Head, 5
Enclosed EA $46.57 $93.14 $60.00 $120.00 $58.00 $116.00 $55.73 $111.46 $68.25 $136.50
o5 Enclosure, Ca}mera,Outdoor, Housing, Drop- 5
Bottom, Aluminum EA $121.96 $243.92 $156.00 $312.00 $135.00 $270.00 $146.05 $292.10 $178.10 $356.20
26 Camera, Ne'Fwork, Surveillance, 3.1 Mega Pixel, 5
Color,Day/Night EA $479.70 $959.40 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $604.00 $1,208.00 $945.22 $1,890.44 $700.05 $1,400.10
27 Enclosure, Camera, Housing, Indoor/Outdoor 4 EA $65.04 $260.16 $84.00 $336.00 $72.00 $288.00 $77.90 $311.60 $94.90 $379.60
28 |Mount, Steel, Corner/Wall, Adapter, For-Camera : EA $40.65 $121.95 $52.00 $156.00 $72.00 $216.00 $48.70 $146.10 $59.15 $177.45
29 Camera, Surveillance, Outdoor, Clear Dome, 5
Surface Mount EA $147.83 $295.66 $275.10 $550.20 $190.00 $380.00 $272.35 $544.70 $226.85 $453.70
30 Camera, Surveillance, Outdoor, Smoked Dome 2 EA $147.83 $295.66 $300.45 $600.90 $190.00 $380.00 $296.22 $592.44 $226.85 $453.70
31 Cam_era, Digital, High-Resolution, Security, 1 . . . .
Lowlight, Color EA $210.65 $210.65 No Bid No Bid $269.00 $269.00 No Bid No Bid $322.40 $322.40

Page 1




The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
SECURITY SYSTEMS PARTS
BID NO. PAXO0062
RX NO. 8100 15040300274
DATE: 7/8/2015
BUYER: Sai Xoomsai

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Metroplex Control Systems International Systems of Convergint Technologies,
Vendor Name Schneider Electric dba Argyle Security Group |EPS Logix, Inc. America, LLC LLC
City, State Austin, TX San Antonio, TX Dallas, TX Louisville, KY Austin, TX
MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY |UNIT| PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
32 Camera, Surveillance, PTZ, Spectra IV, 3
Indoor/Outdoor, Smoke EA $838.91 $2,516.73 $1,065.00 $3,195.00 $1,098.00 $3,294.00 $1,053.98 $3,161.94 $1,286.35 $3,859.05
33 Camera, Video-Surveillance, Smoke 1 EA $210.65 $210.65 $300.44 $300.44 $529.00 $529.00 $230.80 $230.80 $322.40 $322.40
34 Mount, Camera, Ceiling, Wall, T-Rail 2 EA $42.13 $84.26 $54.55 $109.10 $55.00 $110.00 $50.45 $100.90 $61.75 $123.50
35 Camera, Color, Ultra Hig Res., 650 TVL, Dig. 3
Day/Night EA $105.70 $317.10 $134.40 $403.20 $139.00 $417.00 $132.65 $397.95 $161.85 $485.55
36 Lens, Camera, Varifocal, Hig Res., Auto-Iris 3 EA $65.04 $195.12 $83.70 $251.10 $85.00 $255.00 $77.90 $233.70 $94.90 $284.70
Section A - TOTAL BID $22,435.54 $17,921.33 $30,074.00 $31,042.58 $34,421.50
SECTION B - COMNET
Transmitter, Video, 10-Bit, Digital, Single Fiber, 8-
37 15VDC, 2-Miles 2 EA $683.70 $1,367.40 $522.92 $1,045.84 $479.00 $958.00 No Bid No Bid $487.50 $975.00
Receiver, Video, 10-Bit, Digital, Single Fiber, 43
38 Miles 2 EA $406.52 $813.04 $522.92 $1,045.84 $479.00 $958.00 $473.70 $947.40 $487.50 $975.00
Converter, media, 10/100Mbps Ethernet,
39 1310/1550nm, 24VAC 1 EA $314.13 $314.13 $488.06 $488.06 $433.00 $433.00 $442.11 $442.11 $455.00 $455.00
Section B -TOTAL BID $2,494.57 $2,579.74 $2,349.00 $1,389.51 $2,405.00
SECTION C - GE SECURITY
Transmitter-Video, FM XMTR, 2-Way Data, 2-
40 Fiber, MM, 850NM 3 EA No Bid No Bid $510.00 $1,530.00 $398.00 $1,194.00 $509.20 $1,527.60 $558.00 $1,674.00
Transmitter, Single Mode Fiber Module
41 Transceiver 2 EA $683.70 $1,367.40 $1,037.00 $2,074.00 $802.00 $1,604.00 $1,012.90 $2,025.80 $1,110.00 $2,220.00
Transmitter, Video-Data Transceiver,
42 1310/1550nm, Laser 2 EA $4006.52 $813.04 $865.85 $1,731.70 $685.00 $1,370.00 $865.05 $1,730.10 $948.00 $1,896.00
Section C- TOTAL BID $2,180.44 $5,335.70 $4,168.00 $5,283.50 $5,790.00
SECTION D - SECURITY SYSTEM PARTS NOT INDENTIFIED ABOVE
Percent Discount based on the
manufactures suggested price for
additional items not identified in the
43 sections above. 5,000 No Bid No Bid 5% $4,750.00 0% No Bid 0% $5,000.00 35% $3,250.00
Section D -TOTAL BID $0.00 $4,750.00 $0.00 $5,000.00 $3,250.00
TOTAL BID for Section A thru D $27,110.55 $30,586.77 $36,591.00 $42,715.59 $45,866.50

Prepared By: Julia Ramirez

Approved By: Sai Xoomsai Purcell
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