The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
CONTRACT FOR
BID NO. IFB SMB0100
RXNO. RQM 8600 15123000177
DATE: 2/16/2016
BUYER: SANDY BRANDT
Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.
Vendor Name Justin Seed, Co. KBW Supply Turfcare of Texas Ameriturf
City, State Justin, TX Donna, TX McKinney, TX Italy, TX
MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
HERBICIDES
1 Revolver Herbicide 20 87 0z bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Rejected Rejected No Bid No Bid
2 Katana Herbicide 6 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $136.50 $273.00 $179.00 $1,074.00
3 Glyphosate Pro Herbicide 41% 6 30 gallons No Bid No Bid $546.20 $3,277.20 $465.00 $2,790.00 $424.00 $2,544.00
4 Andersons Crabgrass & Goosegrass Control 58 28.8 Ib bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 llloxan Herbicide 3 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 MSMA + Herbicide 5 2.5 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $66.58 $332.90
7 Battleship Herbicide 5 2.5 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $81.25 $406.25 $59.65 $298.25
8 Specticle Pre-emergent Herbicide 50 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 Ronstar Flow Pre-emergent Herbicide 160 2.5 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $367.25 $58,760.00 $305.55 $48,888.00
10 Barricade Pre-emergent Herbicide 80 5 |b bottle No Bid No Bid $102.50 $8,200.00 $56.90 $4.,552.00 $49.72 $3,977.60
11 Surflan Pre-emergent Herbicide 24 2.5 gallons No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $149.50 $3,588.00 $127.84 $3,068.16
12 Certainty Herbicide 50 1.25 oz bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $94.90 $4,745.00 $73.86 $3,693.00
FUNGICIDES
13 Daconil Weather Stick Fungicide 40 2.5 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $105.63 $4,225.20 $92.33 $3,693.20
14 Insignia Fungicide 8 2.5 gallon No Bid No Bid $2,730.00 $21,840.00 No Bid No Bid $2,730.00 $21,840.00
15 Heritage Fungicide Granular 15 30 Ib bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 Cleary's 3336 Fungicide 20 2.5 gallon No Bid No Bid $149.45 $2,989.00 $145.00 $2,900.00 $127.85 $2,557.00
17 Fore 80% Fungicide 30 6 Ib bag No Bid No Bid $35.14 $1,054.20 No Bid No Bid $31.81 $954.30
18 Subdue Maxx Fungicide 30 gallon No Bid No Bid $515.00 $15,450.00 $377.00 $11,310.00 $284.10 $8,523.00
19 Lexicon Fungicide 21 21 oz bottle No Bid No Bid $456.12 $9,578.52 No Bid No Bid $456.12 $9,578.52
20 Banol Fungicide 4 2.5]jug No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $422.50 $2,112.50 $775.00 $3,100.00
21 Segway Fungicide 17 39.2 0z bottles No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
22 Velista Fungicide 30 22 oz bottle No Bid No Bid $192.50 $5,775.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
INSECTICIDES
23 Bifen 30 Gallon No Bid No Bid $28.80 $864.00 $44.20 $1,326.00 $31.81 $954.30
24 Chlorpyrifos 30 Gallons No Bid No Bid $45.65 $1,369.50 $53.20 $1,596.00 $54.76 $1,642.80
25 Advion Ant Insecticide 30 25 Ib bags No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
26 Extinguish Fire Ant Bait 40 25 Ib bags No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $195.10 $7,804.00
27 Top Choice Insecticide 30 50 Ib bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.00 $1,950.00 $113.50 $3,405.00
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
CONTRACT FOR
BID NO. IFB SMB0100
RX NO. RQM 8600 15123000177
DATE: 2/16/2016
BUYER: SANDY BRANDT
Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.
Vendor Name Justin Seed, Co. KBW Supply Turfcare of Texas Ameriturf
City, State Justin, TX Donna, TX McKinney, TX Italy, TX
MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
28 Avid Insecticide 20 gallon No Bid No Bid $535.00 $10,700.00 $202.80 $4,056.00 $157.00 $3,140.00
GREENS GRADE FERTILIZERS
29 18-3-18 65% Methalene Urea 360 50 Ib bags $30.53 $10,990.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30 K-Mag 0-0-22 600 50 Ib bags $21.80 $13,080.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
31 21-0-0 320 50 Ib bags $15.97 $5,110.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
32 12-24-10 Starter 230 50 Ib bags $17.10 $3,933.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
33 Peletized Gypsum 600 50 Ib bags No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
34 UFLEX 46-0-0 80 50 Ib bags No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.85 $2,068.00
19-19-19 Fairway grade, 7.42% ammonacial
nitrogen, 11.57% urea nitrogen, available
35 phosgphate (K205) 19%, solgble potash (K20) 8 1000 Ib bags
19%, Chiorline (Ci) 15%
$362.50 $2,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
19-19-19 Fairway grade, 7.42% ammonacial
nitrogen, 11.57% urea nitrogen, available
36 phosgphate (K205) 19%, solgble potash (K20) 40 50 Ib bags
19%, Chiorline (Ci) 15%
$18.33 $733.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
37 Coron 14-2-14 60% 120 2.5 gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.00 $8,640.00 No Bid No Bid
38 Coron 28-0-0 4 55 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,683.00 $6,732.00 No Bid No Bid
39 Coron 12-3-12 24 2.5 gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.00 $1,728.00 No Bid No Bid
40 HydraHume 56 2.5 gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.00 $4,032.00 $114.58 $6,416.48
41 Axilo/Iron Wave 116 5 Ib bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.53 $525.48
42 Renova 66 2.5 gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.00 $4,752.00 $58.32 $3,849.12
43 Kickstand RTU 28 2.5 gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $112.50 $3,150.00 $101.35 $2,837.80
44 Promate N 10 2.5 gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $178.00 $1,780.00 $71.42 $714.20
45 Brexil Multi 96 51b bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.39 $1,285.44
46 Kendal 36 2.5 gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.00 $2,592.00 $66.85 $2,406.60
GROWTH REGULATORS
47 |Primo Max Link Pack 2 | 10gallon | NoBid NoBid | $274000 | $5480.00 | NoBid [ NoBid [ $1,193.00 | $2386.00

Page 2




The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
CONTRACT FOR
BID NO. IFB SMB0100
RX NO. RQM 8600 15123000177
DATE: 2/16/2016
BUYER: SANDY BRANDT
Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.
Vendor Name Justin Seed, Co. KBW Supply Turfcare of Texas Ameriturf
City, State Justin, TX Donna, TX McKinney, TX Italy, TX
MBE /WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
48 Primo Max 5 gallon No Bid No Bid $290.00 $1,450.00 $157.30 $786.50 $119.32 $596.60
49 Anuew 133 1.51b bag No Bid No Bid Withdrawn | Withdrawn No Bid No Bid $97.50 $12,967.50
WETTING AGENTS
50 Soaker Plus 20 2.5 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $90.00 $900.00 63.75 $1,275.00
51 Soaker Plus 2 55 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $720.00 $1,440.00 $1,320.00 $2,640.00
MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS
52 Spray Tank Cleaner 60 quart No Bid No Bid $9.38 $562.80 $10.40 $624.00 $5.00 $300.00
53 Indicator Dye 120 gallon No Bid No Bid $40.40 $4,848.00 $28.60 $3,432.00 $52.70 $6,324.00
54 Spray Tank Defoamer 96 pint No Bid No Bid $4.55 $436.80 $11.70 $561.60 $5.72 $549.12
55 Foam Indicator 20 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.23 $1,144.00 No Bid No Bid
56 Dynamic Surfactant 40 2.5 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $90.00 $3,600.00 $48.88 $1,955.20
TOTAL BID $36,747.40 $93,875.02 $150,484.05 $180,164.57

Prepared By: VERONICA HAWKINS
Approved By: SANDY BRANDT
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

CONTRACT FOR GOLF COURSE GROUNDS MAINTENANCE MATERIALS

BID NO. IFB SMB0100

RX NO. RQM 8600 15123000177

DATE: 3/8/2016

BUYER: SANDY BRANDT

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.
CGT Farm

Vendor Name Helena Chemical SiteOne Landscape Supply BWI- Schulenburg Management

City, State San Antonio, TX Austin, TX Schulenburg, TX Converse, TX

MBE/WBE

ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT | TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE | PRICE
HERBICIDES No Bid No Bid
1 Revolver Herbicide 20 87 oz bottle $560.00 $11,200.00 $560.00 $11,200.00 $560.00 $11,200.00 | No Bid No Bid
2 Katana Herbicide 6 bottle $163.00 $978.00 $172.66 $1,035.96 $161.50 $969.00 No Bid No Bid
3 Glyphosate Pro Herbicide 41% 6 30 gallons $390.00 $2,340.00 $565.56 $3,393.36 $326.50 $1,959.00 No Bid No Bid
4 Andersons Crabgrass & Goosegrass Control 58 28.81Ibbag | Withdrawn | Withdrawn No Bid No Bid $79.50 $4611.00 | NoBid | No Bid
5 llloxan Herbicide 3 gallon $260.00 $780.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 MSMA + Herbicide 5 2.5 gallon $65.00 $325.00 $87.86 $439.30 $312.50 $1,562.50 No Bid No Bid
7 Battleship Herbicide 5 2.5 gallon $135.00 $675.00 $66.24 $331.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 Specticle Pre-emergent Herbicide 50 gallon $1,440.00 $72,000.00 $1,400.00 $70,000.00 $1,440.00 $72,000.00 | No Bid No Bid
9 Ronstar Flow Pre-emergent Herbicide 160 2.5 gallon $292.95 $46,872.00 $412.50 $66,000.00 $412.50 $66,000.00 | No Bid No Bid
10 Barricade Pre-emergent Herbicide 80 5 |b bottle $76.00 $6,080.00 $102.50 $8,200.00 $102.50 $8,200.00 No Bid No Bid
11 Surflan Pre-emergent Herbicide 24 2.5 gallons $122.25 $2,934.00 $119.06 $2,857.44 $112.00 $2,688.00 No Bid No Bid
12 Certainty Herbicide 50 1.25 oz bottle $78.00 $3,900.00 $69.88 $3,494.00 $73.50 $3,675.00 No Bid No Bid
FUNGICIDES
13 Daconil Weather Stick Fungicide 40 2.5 gallon $35.00 $1,400.00 $104.70 $4,188.00 $107.00 $4,280.00 No Bid No Bid
14 Insignia Fungicide 8 2.5 gallon $2,730.00 $21,840.00 $2,730.00 $21,840.00 $2,730.00 $21,840.00 | No Bid No Bid
15 Heritage Fungicide Granular 15 30 Ib bag $48.90 $733.50 $56.33 $844.95 $46.50 $697.50 No Bid No Bid
16 Cleary's 3336 Fungicide 20 2.5 gallon $121.00 $2,420.00 $181.71 $3,634.20 $141.99 $2,839.80 No Bid No Bid
17 Fore 80% Fungicide 30 6 Ib bag $31.80 $954.00 $30.77 $923.10 $47.25 $1,417.50 No Bid No Bid
18 Subdue Maxx Fungicide 30 gallon $365.00 $10,950.00 $515.00 $15,450.00 $867.00 $26,010.00 | No Bid No Bid
19 Lexicon Fungicide 21 21 oz bottle $456.12 $9,578.52 $456.12 $9,578.52 $456.00 $9,576.00 No Bid No Bid
20 Banol Fungicide 4 2.5jug $937.50 $3,750.00 $937.50 $3,750.00 $937.50 $3,750.00 No Bid No Bid
21 Segway Fungicide 17 39.2 0z bottles $395.00 $6,715.00 $395.00 $6,715.00 $395.16 $6,717.72 No Bid No Bid
22 Velista Fungicide 30 22 o0z bottle $192.50 $5,775.00 $192.50 $5,775.00 $192.50 $5,775.00 No Bid No Bid
INSECTICIDES

23 Bifen 30 Gallon $31.00 $930.00 $26.80 $804.00 $34.15 $1,024.50 No Bid No Bid
24 Chlorpyrifos 30 Gallons $43.20 $1,296.00 $55.25 $1,657.50 $46.67 $1,400.10 No Bid No Bid
25 Advion Ant Insecticide 30 25 |b bags $270.00 $8,100.00 $298.90 $8,967.00 $226.80 $6,804.00 No Bid No Bid
26 Extinguish Fire Ant Bait 40 25 Ib bags $170.00 $6,800.00 No Bid No Bid $165.75 $6,630.00 No Bid No Bid
27 Top Choice Insecticide 30 50 Ib bag $125.00 $3,750.00 $137.50 $4,125.00 $137.50 $4,125.00 No Bid No Bid
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

CONTRACT FOR GOLF COURSE GROUNDS MAINTENANCE MATERIALS

BID NO. IFB SMB0100
RX NO. RQM 8600 15123000177
DATE: 3/8/2016
BUYER: SANDY BRANDT
Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.
CGT Farm
Vendor Name Helena Chemical SiteOne Landscape Supply BWI- Schulenburg Management
City, State San Antonio, TX Austin, TX Schulenburg, TX Converse, TX
MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL | UNIT | TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE | PRICE | PRICE
28 Avid Insecticide 20 gallon $108.15 $2,163.00 $595.00 $11,900.00 $595.00 $11,900.00 | No Bid No Bid
GREENS GRADE FERTILIZERS
29 18-3-18 65% Methalene Urea 360 50 Ib bags $30.00 $10,800.00 $50.00 $18,000.00 $52.90 $19,044.00 | No Bid No Bid
30 K-Mag 0-0-22 600 50 Ib bags $14.50 $8,700.00 $21.27 $12,762.00 $16.05 $9,630.00 No Bid No Bid
31 21-0-0 320 50 Ib bags $10.00 $3,200.00 $8.86 $2,835.20 $8.60 $2,752.00 No Bid No Bid
32 12-24-10 Starter 230 50 Ib bags $28.40 $6,532.00 $33.99 $7,817.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
33 Peletized Gypsum 600 50 Ib bags $7.25 $4,350.00 $7.39 $4,434.00 $7.50 $4,500.00 No Bid No Bid
34 UFLEX 46-0-0 80 50 Ib bags $22.40 $1,792.00 No Bid No Bid $34.30 $2,744.00 No Bid No Bid
19-19-19 Fairway grade, 7.42% ammonacial
nitrogen, 11.57% urea nitrogen, available
3 phosgphate (K205) 19%, solgble potash (K20) 8 1000 Ib bags
19%, Chiorline (Ci) 15%
$280.00 $2,240.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
19-19-19 Fairway grade, 7.42% ammonacial
nitrogen, 11.57% urea nitrogen, available
36 phosgphate (K205) 19%, solgble potash (K20) 40 50 Ib bags
19%, Chiorline (Ci) 15%
$14.00 $560.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
37 Coron 14-2-14 60% 120 2.5gal $37.50 $4,500.00 $26.96 $3,235.20 $37.75 $4,530.00 No Bid No Bid
38 Coron 28-0-0 4 55 gallon Withdrawn | Withdrawn $628.70 $2,514.80 $683.00 $2,732.00 No Bid No Bid
39 Coron 12-3-12 24 2.5 gal $37.50 $900.00 $26.96 $647.04 $39.25 $942.00 No Bid No Bid
40 HydraHume 56 2.5 gal $45.00 $2,520.00 $33.69 $1,886.64 $25.00 $1,400.00 No Bid No Bid
41 Axilo/Iron Wave 116 5 Ib bag $45.00 $5,220.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
42 Renova 66 2.5 gal $137.50 $9,075.00 No Bid No Bid $66.25 $4,372.50 No Bid No Bid
43 Kickstand RTU 28 2.5 gal $105.00 $2,940.00 No Bid No Bid Rejected Rejected No Bid No Bid
44 Promate N 10 2.5 gal Withdrawn | Withdrawn No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
45 Brexil Multi 96 5 1b bag $45.00 $4,320.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
46 Kendal 36 2.5 gal $162.50 $5,850.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GROWTH REGULATORS
47 |Primo Max Link Pack 2 | 10gallon | $1400.00 |  $2800.00] $2740.00 | $5480.00 | $1,14800 | $2296.00 | NoBid | NoBid
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The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID NO. IFB SMB0100

BID TABULATION

CITY OF AUSTIN
CONTRACT FOR GOLF COURSE GROUNDS MAINTENANCE MATERIALS

RX NO. RQM 8600 15123000177
DATE: 3/8/2016
BUYER: SANDY BRANDT
Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.
CGT Farm
Vendor Name Helena Chemical SiteOne Landscape Supply BWI- Schulenburg Management
City, State San Antonio, TX Austin, TX Schulenburg, TX Converse, TX
MBE /WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL | UNIT | TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE | PRICE | PRICE
48 Primo Max 5 gallon $140.00 $700.00[  $290.00 $1,450.00 $115.00 $575.00 No Bid | No Bid
49 Anuew 133 1.51b bag $97.50 $12,967.50 $97.50 $12,967.50 $97.50 $12,967.50 | No Bid No Bid
WETTING AGENTS No Bid No Bid
50 Soaker Plus 20 2.5 gallon $100.00 $2,000.00 $99.44 $1,988.80 $55.00 $1,100.00 No Bid | No Bid
51 Soaker Plus 2 55 gallon $1,100.00 $2,200.00| $2,171.30 $4,342.60 $1,099.00 $2,198.00 No Bid No Bid
MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS No Bid No Bid
52 Spray Tank Cleaner 60 quart $14.00 $840.00 $9.28 $556.80 $9.95 $597.00 No Bid | No Bid
53 Indicator Dye 120 gallon $55.00 $6,600.00 $23.85 $2,862.00 $88.95 $10,674.00 | No Bid No Bid
54 Spray Tank Defoamer 96 pint $9.00 $864.00 $6.75 $648.00 $5.50 $528.00 No Bid No Bid
55 Foam Indicator 20 gallon $45.00 $900.00 $27.63 $552.60 $39.00 $780.00 No Bid | No Bid
56 Dynamic Surfactant 40 2.5 gallon $105.00 $4,200.00 $60.20 $2,408.00 Rejected Rejected No Bid No Bid
TOTAL BID $342,809.52 $354,492.41 $372,013.62 NO BID
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