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1.1 Maple, bigtooth 15 gallon 25 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.2 Orchid tree, Anacacho 15 gallon 20 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.3 Pecan 15 gallon 215 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.4 Pecan 25/30 gal. 10 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.5 Catalpa 15 gallon 25 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.6 Redbud, Mexican 15 gallon 14 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.7 Redbud, Texas 15 gallon 10 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.8 Willow, desert 15 gallon 5 EA $55.00 $275.00 no bid no bid
1.9 Willow, desert 25/30 gal. 2 EA $137.50 $275.00 no bid no bid
1.10 Texas Olive 15 gallon 10 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.11 Dogwood, Roughleaf 15 gallon 17 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.12 Persimmon, Texas 15 gallon 10 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.13 Anacua 15 gallon 50 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.14 Kidney, Texas 5 gallon 13 EA $13.75 $178.75 no bid no bid
1.15 Elbowbush 15 gallon 30 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.16 Ash, Texas 15 gallon 140 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.17 Ash, Texas 25/30 gal. 10 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.18 Honeylocust, golden 15 gallon 50 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.19 Holly, possumhaw 5 gallon 18 EA $14.85 $267.30 no bid no bid
1.20 Holly, possumhaw 15 gallon 2 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.21 Holly, possumhaw 25/30 gal. 6 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.22 Lead tree, goldenball 15 gallon 10 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.23 Sweetwood, Arroyo 15 gallon 2 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.24 Retama 15 gallon 10 EA $55.00 $550.00 no bid no bid
1.25 Sycamore, Mexican 15 gallon 140 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.26 Sycamore, Mexican 25/30 gal. 10 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.27 Sycamore, American 45/50 gal. 8 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.28 Mesquite 15 gallon 25 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.29 Carolina cherry laurel 15 gallon 4 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.30 Plum, Mexican 15 gallon 10 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.31 Plum, Mexican 25/30 gal. 2 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.32 Wafer ash 5 gallon 14 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.33 Oak, Texas Red 15 gallon 40 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.34 Oak, Texas Red 25/30 gal. 10 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.35 Oak, Live (Escarpment) 15 gallon 140 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.36 Oak, Live (Escarpment) 25/30 gal. 12 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid

MBE/WBE

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

Special Instructions:  Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.
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1.37 Oak, Live (Escarpment) 45/50 gal. 3 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.38 Oak, Live (Escarpment) 100 gal. 3 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.39 Oak, Bur 15 gallon 10 EA $55.00 $550.00 no bid no bid
1.40 Oak, Bur 25/30 gal. 5 EA $121.00 $605.00 no bid no bid
1.41 Oak, Chinkapin 15 gallon 13 EA $55.00 $715.00 no bid no bid
1.42 Oak, Chinkapin 25/30 gal. 5 EA $121.00 $605.00 no bid no bid
1.43 Oak, Chinkapin 45/50 gal. 3 EA $220.00 $660.00 no bid no bid
1.44 Oak, Mexican white 15 gallon 10 EA $55.00 $550.00 no bid no bid
1.45 Oak, Mexican white 25/30 gal. 5 EA $121.00 $605.00 no bid no bid
1.46 Sumac, Fragrant 5 gallon 10 EA $13.75 $137.50 no bid no bid
1.47 Sumac, Prairie Flame Leaf 5 gallon 10 EA $13.75 $137.50 no bid no bid
1.48 Sumac, Prairie Flame Leaf 15 gallon 10 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.49 Sumac, Evergreen 5 gallon 10 EA $14.85 $148.50 no bid no bid
1.50 Sumac, Evergreen 15 gallon 10 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.51 Palmetto, Dwarf 5 gallon 2 EA $13.75 $27.50 no bid no bid
1.52 Eve's necklace 5 gallon 5 EA $14.85 $74.25 no bid no bid
1.53 Eve's necklace 15 gallon 10 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.54 Mountain Laurel, Texas 15 gallon 10 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.55 Bald-cypress 45/50 gal. 3 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.56 Elm, cedar 15 gallon 152 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.57 Elm, cedar 25/30 gal. 10 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.58 Elm, cedar 45/50 gal. 2 EA $210.00 $420.00 no bid no bid
1.59 Mexican buckeye 15 gallon 4 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid

 Section 1 TOTAL BID $6,781.30 $0.00
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2.1 Guajillo Seeding 45 EA no bid no bid $1.75 $78.75 
2.2 Acacia, Sweet Seeding 45 EA no bid no bid $1.75 $78.75 
2.3 Acacia, Catclaw Seeding 45 EA no bid no bid $1.75 $78.75 
2.4 Maple, bigtooth Seeding 160 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.5 Boxelder Seeding 160 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.6 Scarlet buckeye Seeding 45 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.7 Orchid tree, Anacacho Seeding 445 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.8 Beautyberry, American Seeding 435 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.9 Pecan Seeding 233 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.10 Catalpa Seeding 160 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.11 Sugarberry Seeding 50 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.12 Hackberry Seeding 245 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.13 Redbud, Mexican Seeding 445 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.14 Redbud, Texas Seeding 500 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.15 Willow, desert Seeding 445 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.16 Brazilwood Seeding 45 EA no bid no bid $1.75 $78.75 
2.17 Dogwood, Roughleaf Seeding 538 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.18 Smoke tree, American Seeding 445 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.19 Persimmon, Texas Seeding 445 EA no bid no bid $1.75 $778.75 
2.20 Anacua Seeding 210 EA no bid no bid $1.75 $367.50 
2.21 Kidneywood, Texas Seeding 35 EA no bid no bid $1.75 $61.25 
2.22 Elbowbush Seeding 35 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.23 Buckthorn, Carolina Seeding 473 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.24 Ash, Green Seeding 283 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.25 Ash, Texas Seeding 233 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.26 Honeylocust, golden Seeding 160 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.27 Holly, possumhaw Seeding 455 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.28 Holly, yaupon Seeding 500 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.29 Walnut, Texas Seeding 35 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.30 Walnut, Black Seeding 195 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.31 Osage orange Seeding 210 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.32 Agarita Seeding 45 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.33 Fragrant mimosa Seeding 45 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid

SECTION 2: Seedings
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2.34 Mulberry, Red Seeding 445 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.35 Retama Seeding 445 EA no bid no bid $1.75 $778.75 
2.36 Sycamore, American Seeding 195 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.37 Cottonwood, Eastern Seeding 160 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.38 Mesquite Seeding 210 EA no bid no bid $1.75 $367.50 
2.39 Chickasaw plum Seeding 45 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.40 Plum, Mexican Seeding 500 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.41 Black cherry, escarpment Seeding 248 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.42 Wafer ash Seeding 100 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.43 Oak, Texas Red Seeding 198 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.44 Oak, Live (Escarpment) Seeding 245 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.45 Oak, Bur Seeding 245 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.46 Oak, Chinkapin Seeding 195 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.47 Oak, Mexican white Seeding 160 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.48 Oak, Post Seeding 210 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.49 Sumac, Fragrant Seeding 525 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.50 Sumac, Prairie Flame Leaf Seeding 480 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.51 Sumac, Evergreen Seeding 480 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.52 Locust, Black Seeding 210 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.53 Willow, Black Seeding 160 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.54 Soapberry, Western Seeding 538 EA no bid no bid $1.75 $941.50 
2.55 Lindeimer's senna Seeding 45 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.56 Bumelia, gum Seeding 265 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.57 Eve's necklace Seeding 438 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.58 Mountain Laurel, Texas Seeding 445 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.59 Bald-cypress Seeding 195 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.60 Elm, American Seeding 198 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.61 Elm, cedar Seeding 283 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.62 Mexican buckeye Seeding 480 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.63 Rusty blackhaw viburnum Seeding 100 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.64 Toothache tree Seeding 45 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid

Approved By:  Terry V. Nicholson

Section 2 TOTAL BID $0.00 $3,610.25

Prepared By:  Julia Ramirez

TOTAL BID for Section 1 & 2 $6,781.30 $3,610.25  
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