The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN
CONTRACT FOR FORENSIC AND CHEMISTRY SUPPLIES

BID NO. |[EAD0251REBID

RX NO. [16052400476

DATE: 6/23/2016

BUYER: |Erin D'Vincent

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

Vendor Name VWR International LL.C Expotech USA Inc. Summus Industries
City, State Suwanee, GA Houston, TX Sugar Land, TX
MBE/WBE MB
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

Methanol (CAS Number: 67-56-1) ACS, 500 ml
bottle, 6/case, Part No.: J'T Baker - 3016-02,
EMD Chemicals, Fisher - MX0485-6, or

1 Approved Equal Equivalent 60 EA $12.7378 $764.27 $119.00 $7,140.00 * *

Methanol (CAS Number: 67-56-1) ACS, 4 liter
bottle, Part No.: EMD Millipore MX0485-3, or
2 Approved Equal, 4 EA $33.0694 $132.28 $40.00 $160.00 * *

Acetone, (CAS Number: 67-41-1) ACS, 1 liter
bottle, 6/case, Part No.: EMD Millipore
3 AX0120-9, or Approved Equal 60 EA $29.7854 $1,787.12 $80.00 $4,800.00 * *

Acetone, (CAS Number: 67-41-1) ACS, 4 liter
bottle, Part No.: EMD Millipore AX0120-7, or
4 Approved Equal 3 EA $83.1923 $249.58 $48.00 $144.00 * *

Hexane, 95+%, Spectro or environmental
grade, 500 ml Glass bottle only, 6/case, Part
5 No.: Alfa Aesar 43263-AK, or Approved Equal 90 EA $27.9695 $2,517.26 $120.00 $10,800.00 * *

Sulfuric Acid, (CAS Number: 7664-93-9) HR
ACS, 98% 500 ml bottles 6/case, Part No.: JT
6 Baker 2876-05, or Approved Equal 12 EA $15.2315 $182.78 $220.00 $2,640.00 * *

Ethyl, alcohol, (CAS Number: 64-17-5) ACS,
500ml bottle, 6/case, Part No.: JT Baker 9229-

7 01, or Approved Equal 18 EA $31.8796 $573.83 $980.00 $17,640.00 * *
Weighing paper, 6"x6", 500/ pack, Part No.:
8 VWR 12578-201, or Approved Equal 3,500 EA $0.0245 $85.75 $22.00 $77,000.00 * *

Dropper bottles, amber 30 ml, 12/case, Part
9 No.: Fisher 02-991A, or Approved Equal 12 EA $2.4167 $29.00 $40.00 $480.00 * *
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Pipettes, Disposable, polyethylene, single
squeeze, 500/ pack (1000/ case), Part No.: Lab
10 Safety 21F249, or Approved Equal 1,000 EA $0.0146 $14.60 $24.00 $24,000.00 * *

Volumetric Flask, Glass, 10 ml, (6/pk), Part
No.: Kimble Kontes 28014-10, or Approved
11 Equal 144 EA $20.0010 $2,880.14 $320.00 $46,080.00 * *

Volumetric Flask, Glass, 25 ml, (6/pk), Part
No.: Kimble Kontes 28014-25, or Approved
12 Equal 72 EA $22.1068 $1,591.69 $215.00 $15,480.00 * *

Volumetric Flask, Glass, 50 ml, (6/pk), Part
No.: Kimble Kontes 28014-50, or Approved
13 Equal 36 EA $23.6774 $852.39 $225.00 $8,100.00 * *

Pipets, Disposable, sterile, general purpose, low
density polyethylene, 400 individually
wrapped/package, Part No.: VWR 73990-098,

14 or Approved Equal 1 EA $0.0968 $0.10 $65.00 $65.00 * *
Scalpel handles, No.3, Part No.: Fisher 19-
15 062515, or Approved Equal 3 EA $3.8902 $11.67 $5.00 $15.00 * *

Micro Vial Kits, Crimp Top, 12x32mm,
standard opening, caps: aluminum, clear,
PTFE/Red Rubber, 100/kit, Part No.: National
16 Scientific C4011-87, or Approved Equal 10,000 EA $0.2376 $2,376.00 $35.00 $350,000.00 * *

Micro Vials, SUN-Sri Glass; 300 Microliters,
12x32mm, 11mm closure, 100/pack, Part No.:
17 VWR 14232-654, or Approved Equal 1,500 EA $0.8263 $1,239.45 $110.00 $165,000.00 * *
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Micro Vial Caps, aluminum, clear PTFE/Red
Rubber, 1000/ case OR 100/ case; Part No.:
18 VWR 46610-744, or Approved Equal 500 EA $0.0668 $33.40 $16.00 $8,000.00 * *

Crinkle dish, aluminum, with tabs, oil free,
crimped side for rigidity, flat bottom, 57ml,
(20z) capacity 100 units/pack, 10 packs/case;
Part No.: Dynamed 80065C, or Approved

19 Equal 100 EA $0.0397 $3.97 $80.00 $8,000.00 * *

Nalgene 500 ml wide mouth bottle; Part No.:

20 Nalgene 2110-0016, or Approved Equal 1 EA $4.0071 $4.01 $150.00 $150.00 * *
Nalgene 1000 ml (1 liter); Part No.: Nalgene
21 2110-0032, or Approved Equal 1 EA $5.8526 $5.85 $130.00 $130.00 * *

Red Tie Straps, 1000 per bag, Part No.:
22 Associated Bag - 84-1-04R, or Approved Equal | 1,000 EA $0.0141 $14.10 $16.00 $16,000.00 * *

Scalpel Blades, replacements, No. 10, non-sterile
accepted, 50/pk, Part No.: VWR - BD371210,
23 or Approved Equal 250 EA $0.6063 $151.58 $46.00 $11,500.00 * *

Scalpel Blades, replacements, No. 11, non-sterile
accepted, 50/pk, Part No.: VWR - BD371211,
24 or Approved Equal 150 EA $0.6218 $93.27 $46.00 $6,900.00 * *

Cotton Swab Tip, streil, 6 in., 2/pk, 100
pkg/box, 10 boxes/cs; Part No.: VWR - 10805-
25 154, Dynarex 4305, or Approved Equal 40 EA $0.0566 $2.26 $125.00 $5,000.00 * *
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Container, 60 ml, polypropylene, with caps,
translucent, storage or transport of most liquid
ot solid specimens, sterile, bulk packaging,
100/ case, Part#: V' W R 25384-144, or

26 Approved Equal 100 EA $0.1883 $18.83 $40.00 $4,000.00 * *

Filter Paper, Grade 413, 5 cm, qualitative, crepe,
porosity, coarse, flow rate, medium, Part No.:
27 VWR Cat #28310-015, or Approved Equal 2 EA $2.5915 $5.18 $8.00 $16.00 * *

Filter Paper, Grade 413, 7.5 cm, qualitative,
crepe, porosity, coarse, flow rate, medium, Part
28 No.: VWR Cat #28310-026, or Approved Equal 2 EA $2.8250 $5.65 $8.00 $16.00 * *

Filter Paper, Grade 413, 11 cm, qualitative,
crepe, porosity, coarse, flow rate, medium, Part
29 No.: VWR Cat #28310-081, or Approved Equal 2 EA $2.7250 $5.45 $9.00 $18.00 * *

Filter Paper, Grade 415, 11 cm, qualitative,
crepe, porosity, coarse, flow rate, fast, Part No.:
30 VWR Cat #28320-085, or Approved Equal 2 EA $3.1268 $6.25 $7.00 $14.00 * *

Filter Paper, Grade 415, 5.5 cm, qualitative,
crepe, porosity, coarse, flow rate, fast, Part No.:
31 VWR Cat #28320-019, or Approved Equal 2 EA $2.1625 $4.33 $7.00 $14.00 * *

Filter Paper, Grade 415, 7.5 cm, qualitative,
crepe, porosity, coarse, flow rate, fast, Part No.:
32 VWR Cat #28320-020, or Approved Equal 2 EA $2.4507 $4.90 $7.50 $15.00 * *
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Filter paper, GE Whatman #5, qualitative,
70mm, 100 circles, Cat. No: 1005-070, or

33 Approved Equal 20 EA $10.0200 $200.40 $16.00 $320.00 * *
Ahlstrom qualitative grade 601, 11cm 100

34 circles, lot # 7480801, or Approved Equal 10 EA $6.9844 $69.84 $17.00 $170.00 * *
Weighing paper, VWR, 4x4 520 pk, Cat

35 No:12578-165, or Approved Equal 20 EA $7.0909 $141.82 $25.00 $500.00 * *
Re-closable bags, Uline, 3x5, 2mil, 1000/ carton,

36 S-1293, or Approved Equal 1 EA $9.2121 $9.21 $26.00 $26.00 * *

Filter paper qualitative p8, Fisher Scientific,
porosity: coarse, flow rate: fast, 46x57cm, 100
37 ct, cat no: 09-802-1B, or Approved Equal 5 EA $647.5600 $3,237.80 $68.00 $340.00 * *

Q-tips, Landall, single tipped applicators, 6in,
38 200 ct, ref: 541400, or Approved Equal 20 EA $7.9801 $159.60 $210.00 $4,200.00 * *

Parafilm, Sigma-Aldrich, roll size 4in x 125 ft, P
code: 1001936632, Lot # 3110, or Approved
39 Equal 4 EA $19.8862 $79.54 $46.00 $184.00 * *

Professional Kimwipes, Kimberly-Clark,
Kimtech science brand, 280 ct, 4.4x8.4
40 (11x21cm) 1 ply, or Approved Equal 3 EA $2.8788 $8.64 $8.00 $24.00 * *

Safeseal Micro tubes, Starstedt, 1000 ct, Ref:
72.695.500, 2mL,PP lot #: 0631/4007021, or
41 Approved Equal 5 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid * *

Sterile surgical blades, Glass van, 100/box,
carbon steel #2001T-11, batch: 141609AC, or
42 Approved Equal 100 EA $0.1485 $14.85 No Bid No Bid * *
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Tecnol Procedure mask, Kimberly-Clark,
50/box, ref: 47117, EN14683 type I, or
43 Approved Equal 50 EA $0.2045 $10.23 $23.00 $1,150.00 * *

Wash Bottles, Azlon 506465-0005, 500 ml
Driplok Right-to-Know Wash Bottle for
Methanol w/Label, Safety Vented, LDPE, 5/cs,
44 or Approved Equal 10 EA $5.6900 $56.90 $35.00 $350.00 * *

Wash Bottles, Azlon 506465-0002, 500 ml
Driplok Right-to-Know Wash Bottle for
Ethanol w/Label, Safety Vented, LDPE, 5/cs,
45 or Approved Equal 10 EA $5.8620 $58.62 $45.00 $450.00 * *

Wash Bottles, Azlon 506465-0006, 500 ml
Driplok Right-to-Know Wash Bottle Variety
Pack w/Label, Safety Vented, LDPE, Acetone,
Isopropanol, Ethanol, Methanol, and Blank,

46 5/cs, or Approved Equal 20 EA No Bid No Bid $37.00 $740.00 * *

Wash Bottles, Azlon 506475-0002, 500 ml
Driplok Customizable Blank Right-to-Know
Write-On/Label, Safety Vented, LDPE, 5/cs,
47 or Approved Equal 10 EA $6.0000 $60.00 $36.00 $360.00 * *

Wash Bottles, Azlon 506915-0006, 500 ml Right;
to-Know Wash Bottle for Isopropyl Alcohol

w/Label, Sloped Shoulder Design, LDPE, 5/cs,
48 or Approved Equal 10 EA $2.8667 $28.67 $29.00 $290.00 * *

Wash Bottles, Azlon 506465-0001, 500 ml
Driplok Right-to-Know Wash Bottle for
Acetone w/Label, Safety Vented, LDPE, 5/cs,
49 or Approved Equal 10 EA $6.0580 $60.58 $36.00 $360.00 * *
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pH Strips, Color Bonded 0-14 pH range,
100/ pk, Part No.: Lab Safety #53279, or
50 Approved Equal 600 EA $0.0938 $56.28 $25.00 $15,000.00 * *
EMD Millipore Sodium Chloride, ACS Reagent
Grade, 500g Poly Bottle, 4x500g bottles per
51 case, or Approved Equal 5 EA $111.6000 $558.00 $76.00 $380.00 * *
Acetonitrile, CHROMASOLYV, gradient grade
for HPLC >99.9%, CAS 75-05-8 (4x 4L Bottles
52 per Case), or Approved Equal 20 EA $42.2042 $844.08 No Bid No Bid * *
Methanol, CHROMASOLYV for HPLC
>99.9%, CAS 67-56-1 (4x 4L Bottles per
53 Case),or Approved Equal 20 EA $12.4225 $248.45 No Bid No Bid * *
2-Propanol, CHROMASOLYV for HPLC
>99.9%, CAS 67-63-0 (4x 4L Bottles per Case),
54 or Approved Equal 20 EA $18.1725 $363.45 No Bid No Bid * *
Formic Acid, LCMS grade (UltraPure) 10 x
1mI Ampules, CAS 64-18-6, or Approved
55 Equal 5 EA $91.7800 $458.90 No Bid No Bid * *
Capillary-piston assemblies, 250 plL max.
volume, for Pos-D'TM and Gilson®
Microman® positive-displacement pipettes. Pre-
sterilized, pre-assembled, 180 tips in 3 racks of
56 60 (C-250), or Approved Equal 100 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid * *
Teledyne Tekmar Crimp Cap. Item #14-4436-
000. For headspace septa and 20mm top
headspace vials, 125 per pack, or Approved
57 Equal 1,250 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid * *
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Teledyne Tekmar Septa. Item #14-4385-043.
Butyl rubber septa without Teflon face. For
20mm top headspace vials, 125 per pack.
Recommended for temperatures up to 100

degrees C. Color coded grey, or Approved
58 Equal 1,250 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid * *

Teledyne Tekmar Vials. 14-4440-024 Vials,
22ml headspace, w/20mm top, 125 per pack, or
59 Approved Equal 1,250 EA $0.3956 $494.50 No Bid No Bid * *

LCMS Certified, Clear, Glass 2mL volume,
12x32mm Screw Top with Cap and Preslit
PTFE/Silicone Septa (kit) 100/pkg, or

60 Approved Equal 1,000 EA No Bid No Bid $108.00 $108,000.00 * *

TOTAL BID $22,867.30 $922,161.00 *

* Summus Industries withdrew their bid.

Prepared By: Stephanie Hollanders
Approved By: Joshua Pace
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