The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

BID NO.
RX NO.
DATE:
BUYER:

GALO0044

9100
6/12/2013
Israel Espinoza

BID TABULATION
CITY OF AUSTIN

VACCINES

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations may jeopardize acceptance of the bid.

McKesson Medical -Surgical,

Dixon-Shane LLC, dba R &

Novartis Vaccines and

Vendor Name Regimed Medical Inc. S Northeast, LLC Diagnostics, Inc.
City, State St. Peters, MO Golden Valley, MN Philadelphia, PA East Hanover, NJ
MBE/WBE
ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT | PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
SECTION 1 -- HOURLY LABOR RATE - NORMAL BUSINESS HOURS (15 points)
Gardasil - Human Papillomavirus Vaccine
Order Quantity = 1 vial/pkg NDC # 0006- SINGLE
4045-00 (0.5mL per vial)Federal Excise Tax = DOSE
1 $0.75 per Unit 375 VIAL $145.66 $54,622.50 $151.94 $56,977.50 $142.52 $53,445.00 No Bid No Bid
Tetanus and Diphtheria Toxoids Adsorbed
(0.5mL per vial) Order Quantity = 10 SINGLE
vials/pkg NDC # 0006-4133-41 Federal DOSE
2 Excise Tax = $0.75 per Unit 1130 VIAL $20.22 $22,848.60 $24.99 $28,238.70 $213.02 $240,712.60 No Bid No Bid
SINGLE
Measles, Mumps and Rubella Vaccine (0.5 mL DOSE VIAL
per vial with diluent) WITH
. . STERILE
Order Quantity = 10 vials/pkg NDC # 0006- DILUENT
3 4681-00 Federal Excise Tax = $0.75 per Unit 1380 $56.72 $78,273.60 $61.66 $85,090.80 $565.83 $780,845.40 No Bid No Bid
Pneunovax - Pneumococcal Vaccine (0.5mL
. . . MULTI
per vial) Order Quantity = 1 vial/pkg NDC # DOSE
0006-4739-00 Federal Excise Tax = $4.92 per VIAL
4 Unit 125 $342.43 $42,803.75 $377.77 $47,221.25 $333.20 $41,650.00 No Bid No Bid
Varivax - Varicella Vaccine Live (0.5mL per SINGLE
vial with diluent) Order Quantity = 1 vial/pkg DO“S;TXSAL
NDC # 0006-4826-00 Federal Excise Tax = STERILE
5 $0.75 per Unit 25 | DILUENT $102.48 $2,562.00 $107.00 $2.675.00 $102.88 $2.572.00 No Bid No Bid
Varivax - Varicella Vaccine (0.5mL per vial SINGLE
with diluent) Order Quantity = 10 vials/pkg Do
NDC # 0006-4827-00 Federal Excise Tax = STERILE
6 $0.75 per Unit 570 | DWUENT $97.71 $55,694.70 $99.72 $56,840.40 $942.89 $537,447.30 No Bid No Bid
Zostavax - Zoster Vaccine (0.65mL per vial) SINGLE
Order Quantity = 10 vials/pkg NDC # 0006- DOSE
7 4963-41 Federal Excise Tax = $0.00 per Unit 40 VIAL $171.92 $6,876.80 $179.01 $7,160.40 $1,739.76 $69,590.40 No Bid No Bid
Menveo - Meningococcal Vaccine (0.5mL per
vial) Order Quantity = 10 vials/pkg NDC # SINGLE
46028-208-01 Federal Excise Tax = $1.875 per DOSE
8 Unit 170 VIAL $61.11 $10,388.70 $126.22 $21,457.40 No Bid No Bid $67.27 $11,435.90
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Decavac - Tetanus / Diphtheria booster
(0.5mL per glass syringe) S%)NO(;EE
Order Quantity = 10 syringes/pkg NDC # PREFILLED
49281-291-10 Federal Excise Tax = $1.50 per SYRINGE
9 Unit 150 $23.51 $3,526.50 $264.33 $39,649.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Decavc - Tetanus, Diptheria Toxoids absorbed
(0.5mL per vial) Order Quantity = 10 SINGLE
vials/pkg NDC # 49281-291-83 Federal DOSE
10 Excise Tax = $1.50 per Unit 20 VIAL $23.51 $470.20 $264.33 $5,286.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Adacel - Tetanus / Diphthetia / Acellular
Pertussis (0.5mL per vial) SINGLE
Order Quantity = 10 vials/pkg NDC # 49281- DOSE
11 400-10 Federal Excise Tax = $2.25 per Unit 1240 VIAL $44.36 $55,006.40 $47.72 $59,172.80 $408.02 $505,944.80 No Bid No Bid
Adacel - Tetanus / Diphthetia / Acellular Sg\g}le‘E
Pertussis (0.5mL per syringe) Order Quantity PREFILLED
= 5 syringes/pkg NDC # 49281-400-15 SYRINGE
12 Federal Excise Tax = $2.25 per Unit 835 $44.42 $37,090.70 $49.00 $40,915.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Menactra - Meningococcal Vaccine (0.5mL per
vial) Order Quantity = 5 vials/pkg NDC # SINGLE
49281-589-05 Federal Excise Tax = $0.75 per DOSE
13 Unit 290 VIAL $121.97 $35,371.30 $132.75 $38,497.50 $589.48 $170,949.20 No Bid No Bid
Tubersol - Tuberculin Purified Protein
Derivative (1.0mL per vial, 10 tests per vial) 10 DOSE
Order Quantity = 1 vial/pkg NDC # 49281- VIAL
752-21
14 Federal Excise Tax = $0.00 per Unit 150 $40.74 $6,111.00 $44.86 $6,729.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Energix B - Hepatitis B Vaccine (1.0mL per
vial) Order Quantity = 10 vials/pkg NDC # SINGLE
58160-821-11 Federal Excise Tax = $0.75 per DOSE
15 Unit 1130 VIAL $56.65 $64,014.50 $60.95 $68,873.50 $535.50 $605,115.00 No Bid No Bid
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Hepatitis B Vaccine (1.0mL in one syringe) SINGLE
Order Quantity = 10 syringes/pkg NDC # DOSE
58160-821-52 Federal Excise Tax = $0.75 per e
16 Unit 550 $56.65 $31,157.50 $62.54 $34,397.00 $551.25 $303,187.50 No Bid No Bid
Hepatitis A Vaccine (1.0mL in one syringe) SINGLE.
Order Quantity = 10 syringes/pkg NDC # DOSE
58160-826-52 Federal Excise Tax = $0.75 per e
17 Unit 680 $68.76 $46,756.80 $75.82 $51,557.60 $642.33 $436,784.40 No Bid No Bid
Boostrix - Tetanus / Diphtheria / Acellular SI)NO%]EP
Pertussis (0.5mL per syringe) Order Quantity PREFILLED
= 10 syringes/pkg NDC # 58160-842-52 SYRINGE
18 Federal Excise Tax = $0.75 per Unit 440 $38.90 $17,116.00 $44.68 $19,659.20 $370.65 $163,086.00 No Bid No Bid
Rabavert - Rabies Pre/Post Exposure Vaccine
(1.0 mL single dose. Pre-packaged with SINGLE
syringe, 2 needles, freeze dried vaccine and DOSE
diluent.) Order Quantity = 1 dose/pkg NDC PAKAGE
# 63851-501-01
19 Federal Excise Tax = $0.00 per Unit 60 $266.90 $16,014.00 $293.90 $17,634.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL BID $586,705.55 $688,033.15 $3,911,329.60 $11,435.90

Prepared By: Julia Ramirez

Approved By: Israel Espinoza
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