
MHJ0202

6/9/2016

Marty James

ITEM EST QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE

1.1 4,200 Bag No Bid No Bid $32.99 $138,558.00 $32.99 $138,558.00 $26.99 $113,358.00

1.2 2,000 Case No Bid No Bid $13.45 $26,900.00 $12.99 $25,980.00 $17.99 $35,980.00

1.3 650 Bag No Bid No Bid $28.43 $18,479.50 $26.49 $17,218.50 $24.00 $15,600.00

1.4 2,000 Bag No Bid No Bid $17.48 $34,960.00 $10.99 $21,980.00 $17.00 $34,000.00

1.5 1,200 Case No Bid No Bid $17.28 $20,736.00 $15.99 $19,188.00 $21.99 $26,388.00

1.6 2,000 Case No Bid No Bid $17.28 $34,560.00 $12.79 $25,580.00 $14.99 $29,980.00

1.7 100 Bag No Bid No Bid $22.05 $2,205.17 $16.00 $1,600.00 $14.50 $1,450.00

1.8 4,000 Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.15 $16,600.00 $7.00 $28,000.00

1.9 12 Box No Bid No Bid $22.05 $264.62 $44.00 $528.00 $66.99 $803.88

1.10 12 Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 $228.00 $23.99 $287.88

1.11 4 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid $100.00 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00

2.1 400 EA No Bid $2.67 $1,068.00 No Bid $1.05 $418.00 $3.75 $1,500.00

2.2 2,500 EA No Bid $2.78 $6,940.00 No Bid $1.05 $2,612.50 $3.75 $9,375.00

2.3 3,500 EA No Bid $2.87 $10,052.00 No Bid $1.27 $4,427.50 $4.00 $14,000.00

2.4 3,500 EA No Bid $2.91 $10,192.00 No Bid $1.45 $5,082.00 $5.00 $17,500.00

2.5 250 EA No Bid $3.00 $750.00 No Bid $1.76 $440.00 $6.00 $1,500.00

2.6 532 EA No Bid $3.00 $1,596.00 No Bid $1.98 $1,053.36 $4.00 $2,128.00

2.0 SUPPLIES

Martingale Collar - 5-8 in x 3/8 in

Purina EN Gastroenteric Hospital Feeding 

Pack

Dry Dog Food 32 lbs/bag

Purina Pro Plan Savor Canned Dog Food 

13 oz/can

Purina Pro Plan Savor Cat Food Chicken & 

Rice 16 lbs/bag

Purina Pro Plan Focus Kitten food

Chicken & Rice 7 lbs/bag

MWI Animal Health

Austin, TX

Tomlinsons Feed & Pets 

Inc.

Georgetown, TX

BID TABULATION

CITY OF AUSTIN

CONTRACT FOR PET FOOD AND OTHER SUPPLIES

Bid No.

RX No.

Date

Buyer

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Boise, ID

C Specialties Inc.

Indianapolis, IN

Sageline Inc

Austin, TX

Ad Clarity

Tough nylon with a nickel-plated swivel clip 

Adjustable Dog Collar - 14-20 in x 3/4 in

1.0 PET FOOD

SUBTOTAL A No Bid No Bid

Purina Pro Plan Focus Canned Kitten Food 

3 oz/can

$276,663.29 $267,860.50 $285,847.76

Friskies Feline pate' style Canned Cat 

Food 5 oz/can

Back-2-Nature Paper Cat Litter 30 liter/bag

Tough nylon with a nickel-plated swivel clip 

Adjustable Dog Collar - Small

Tough nylon with a nickel-plated swivel clip 

Adjustable Dog Collar - 6-10 in x 3/8 in

Tough nylon with a nickel-plated swivel clip 

Adjustable Dog Collar - 10-16 in x 5/8 in

Tough nylon with a nickel-plated swivel clip 

Adjustable Dog Collar - 18-26 in x 1 in

Lone Star Pine Pellets or Equivalent 40 

lbs/bag

Oxbow Timothy Hay 50 lbs/box

Purina Rabbit chow 50 lbs/bag

Delivery charge for emergency orders 

(orders with delivery required in less than 2 

business days, after hours, and/or on 

weekends)
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ITEM EST QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE

MWI Animal Health

Austin, TX

Tomlinsons Feed & Pets 

Inc.

Georgetown, TX

BID TABULATION

CITY OF AUSTIN

CONTRACT FOR PET FOOD AND OTHER SUPPLIES

Bid No.

RX No.

Date

Buyer

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Boise, ID

C Specialties Inc.

Indianapolis, IN

Sageline Inc

Austin, TX

Ad Clarity

2.7 3,325 EA No Bid $3.07 $10,214.40 No Bid $1.98 $6,583.50 $4.49 $14,929.25

2.8 4,655 EA No Bid $3.24 $15,082.20 No Bid $2.73 $12,698.84 $4.99 $23,228.45

2.9 4,655 EA No Bid $3.40 $15,827.00 No Bid $3.14 $14,593.43 $5.99 $27,883.45

2.10 332 EA No Bid $3.67 $1,219.10 No Bid $3.74 $1,241.68 $7.99 $2,652.68

2.11 2,000 EA $2.65 $5,300.00 $5.19 $10,384.00 No Bid $1.93 $3,850.00 $8.99 $17,980.00

2.12 6,000 EA $3.40 $20,400.00 $5.64 $33,840.00 No Bid $3.29 $19,734.00 $9.99 $59,940.00

2.13 3,000 EA $1.45 $4,350.00 $2.00 $6,000.00 No Bid $1.38 $4,125.00 $4.50 $13,500.00

2.14 300 EA No Bid $6.40 $1,920.00 No Bid $11.87 $3,561.36 $25.00 $7,500.00

2.15 300 EA No Bid $6.48 $1,944.00 No Bid $11.87 $3,561.36 $25.00 $7,500.00

2.16 300 EA No Bid $6.55 $1,965.00 No Bid $11.87 $3,561.36 $25.00 $7,500.00

2.17 100 EA No Bid $8.66 $865.60 $8.09 $808.69 $8.79 $879.12 $19.00 $1,900.00

2.18 100 EA No Bid $8.74 $873.60 $8.16 $815.62 $8.79 $879.12 $18.99 $1,899.00

2.19 100 EA No Bid $8.87 $887.20 $8.08 $808.21 $8.79 $879.12 $18.99 $1,899.00

3.1  $   1,000.00 0% $1,000.00 No BId No Bid 10% $900.00 $1,000.00

3.2  $   8,000.00 10% $7,200.00 20% $6,400.00 No Bid 10% $7,200.00 $8,000.00

Prepared By:  Stephanie Hollanders

Approved By:  Marty James

SUBTOTAL C $8,200.00 $6,400.00 $0.00 $8,100.00 $9,000.00

$30,050.00 $131,620.10 $2,432.52 $90,181.25 $234,314.83

Other types of animal food (rabbit, 

bird, goat, and hamster)

Please list the discount from MSRP 

you are able to offer on these foods.

3.0 Additional Items

The City may wish to order additional 

animal care and handling items not 

listed above, please provide your 

product catalog percentage (%) 

discount for other products and 

services available. 

TOTAL A+B+C

EZ Walk Harness - Small

EZ Walk Harness - Medium

EZ Walk Harness - Large

Gentle Leader - Small

Gentle Leader - Medium

Gentle Leader - Large

SUBTOTAL B

Martingale Collar - 6-10 in x 3/8 in

Martingale Collar - 10-16 in x 5/8 in

Martingale Collar - 14-20 in x 3/4 in

Martingale Collar - 18-26 in x 1 in

Nylon Dog Leash - 4' x 5/8"

Nylon Dog Leash - 6' x 1"

Nylon Cat Collar - One Size

$38,250.00 $138,020.10 $279,095.81 $366,141.75 $529,162.59
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