
ADDENDUM 
CITY OF AUSTIN, TEXAS 

Solicitation: CRR0103 Addendum No: 1 Date of Addendum: 03/08/2016 

This addendum is to incorporate the following changes to the above referenced solicitation: 

I. Questions: 

1.1 (Q) Please provide the bid sheet for the previous solicitation for medical supplies. 

(A) The bid sheet for the previous solicitation related to medical supplies is available for public 
view on our Vendor Connection website, under the closed solicitation #CEA0006, and is 
also available as an attachment to this addendum. 

1.2 (Q) Can we provide a bid on some of the items on the bid sheet, but not all? 

(A) Please refer to the 0600-Bid Sheet instructions which are below for reference: 
A bid of '0' (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will 
not expect to pay for that item. A bid of 'no bid' will be interpreted by the City that the 
responder does not wish to bid on that item. Failure to respond to each section of this bid 
sheet may result in disqualification of your bid. The quantities noted below are annual 
estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase 
of the quantities listed. Quantities are provided as a guide, actual quantities purchased may 
be more or less. 

II. Extension: The proposal due date is hereby extended until Thursday, March, 24, 2016 at 2:00pm. 

Ill. ALL OTHER TERMS AND CONDITIONS REMAIN THE SAME. 

APPROVEDBY:C~·cU4oLu.'~ LLL~ 3/ ,;f WILl? 
Claudia Rodriquez, Sr. uyer Date 
Purchasing Office, 512-974-3092 

ACKNOWLEDGED BY: 

Name Authorized Signature Date 

RETURN ONE COPY OF THIS ADDENDUM TO THE PURCHASING OFFICE, CITY OF AUSTIN, WITH 
YOUR RESPONSE OR PRIOR TO THE SOLICIATION CLOSING DATE. FAILURE TO DO SO MAY 
CONSTITUTE GROUNDS FOR REJECTION. 
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BID TABULATION 
CITY OF AUSTIN 

MEDICAL SUPPUES 
BID NO. CEA0006 
RXNO. 9100 10021200232 
DATE: 4/8/2010 
BUYER: Colleen Athey 

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations rna jeopardize acceptance of the bid. 
Vendor Name McKesson Medical Cudinol Heolth Interboro Pac~ging Carp. 
City, State Richmond, VA Dublin,OH MontROmery, NY 
MBE/WBE 

ITEM EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL 
NO. ITEM DESCRIJYTION QTY UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE 

I Syrin~/NDL, Vanish Paint item# 348825 328 BOX $45.83 $15,032.24 $43.70 $14,333.60 NO BID NO BID 

Tube, Hemog:ud Sst Plus Gold SML, item # 
2 207068 144 BOX $32.10 $4,622.40 $37.05 $5,335.20 NO BID NO BID 

Lancet, Press-ACT SFIY 26G, item# 
3 475430/475431 700 BOX $14.49 $10,143.00 $523 $3,661.00 NO BID NO BID 

Glove, Exam L TX PF TEX XSM - L, item # 
4 354432 1,633 BOX $5.66 $9,242.78 $20.78 $33,933.74 $3.55 $5,797.15 

Specula, Vaginol Klecnspec Prem 590, item # 
5 584270 151 BOX $39.71 $5,996.21 $39.20 $5,919.20 NO BID NO BID 

Tube, VAC/Hemagard STR LA V 3ML, item # 
6 225708 125 BOX $19.80 12,475.00 $22.85 12,856.25 NO BID NO BID 

Glove, Exam LTX PF SMTH SM-XL, item# 
7 354436 1,896 BOX 15.66 110,731.36 $3.17 16,010.32 13.55 16,730.80 

Test Kit, PREG HCG Urine Quickvue !STEP, 
8 item # 450296 83 KT $42.11 $3 495.13 $41.57 $3,450.31 NO BID NO BID 

Sanitizer, Hand/ Aloe W /Pump PERFM 15oz, 
9 item# 463154 643 cs $58.44 $37,576.92 $84.19 $54,134.17 NO BID NO BID 

Nuaient. Ensure Assoned Flavors 8 oz, item # 
to 88952 298 cs $24.81 17,393.38 $24.50 $7,301.00 NOBID · NO BID 

Collection Set, BLD Safety Luer ADPT, item # 
tt 226131 76 BOX $54.26 $4,123.76 $38.95 $2,960.20 NO BID NO BID 
12 Prcnatol, Tab 27-0.8MG, item# 479459 850 BT $2.30 $1,955.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Container, SPCMN W /UD N/S 40Z, item# 
13 188725 543 BG $2.62 $1,422.66 $39.49 $21,443.07 NO BID NO BID 
14 Container Shorps Red 10qt, item# 586939 34 cs $59.57 $2.025.38 $79.33 $2,697.22 NO BID NO BID 

15 Scole, PHYS W /Dil!itol Display, item # 375044 5 EA $278.26 $1,391.30 $365.62 $1,828.10 NO BID NO BID 
Media, Jembec-Mnd Thoyer Martin, item # 

16 231841 149 BX $11 .75 $1,750.75 $37.84 $5,638.16 NO BID NO BID 
17 Scale, Digitol baby/INF, item# 571781 3 cs $482.42 $1,447.26 $535.80 $1,607.40 NO BID NO BID 
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BID TABULATION 
CITY OF AUSTIN 

MEDICAL SUPPLIES 
BID NO. CEA0006 
RXNO. 9100 10021200232 
DATE: 4/8/2010 
BUYER: Colleen Athey 

Special Instructions: Be advised that exceptions taken to any portion of the solicitations rna jeopardize acc~tance of the bid. 
Vendor Name 
City, State 
MBE/WBE 

ITEM 
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION 

Syringe/ NDL, Vanish Point 3CC, item# 
18 348826 

19 Svrlnge/NDL, U.. 3CC, item # 384307 
20 Alcohol, isopropyl 70% 16oz, item# 49176 

Bag, Biohaz Red 17x7x30 1.3ML, item # 
21 281190 

Wipes, PureU, 175 Wipes/EA 75 Wipes per 
22 Caniste, item# 621550 
23 Pad Alcohol Pre_p Med, item # 256238 

Nebulizer, Micro-Mist W /UNJV TU, item# 
24 235435 
25 Tissue, Facial Kleenex , item # 330644 

Thermometer Kit, Dig Oral LF Perfm, item # 
26 491094 

Test Strip, BLD Glu Microfill F/Contour, item 
27 # 536178 

Test Kit, preg HCG Serum/Urine Cards QS, 
28 Item# 347175 

29 Collection Set, BLD 21GX3/4", Item# 531936 

Holder, Tube One Use Non-Stackablc:, item # 
30 458363 

Bag, Biohaz Red 21X9X43 3MIL, item# 
31 281208 
32 Test Strip, PH 0-6.8, item # 488306 

Gown, Exam T/P/T Econ Wht 30X42, item# 
33 201061 

34 Bandage, ADHSV Strip 3/4", item# 296237 

Test Strip, BLD GLUC H ACCU-CK 
35 CMFRT/ADVNTG, item# 571226 

Test Kit, Pregnancy HCG Serum/Unne, ttem 
36 # 571226 

Paper, EKG Perfm Permtrace 216MMX183, 
37 item # 455257 

Mouthpiece, Spirocard/Sptroxcatd, item # 
38 471935 

Muk, Particulate Respirator N95, item # 
39 679671 

Prepared By: Julia Ramirez 
Approved By: Colleen Athey 

EST 
QTY UNIT 

33 BX 
215 BX 
47 cs 

12 cs 

20 cr 
405 BX 

16 cs 
847 BX 

13 BX 

30 BX 

5 KT 

12 BX 

70 BG 

12 cs 
50 PK 

35 cs 

1,127 BX 

15 VL 

29 KT 

6 cs 

12 BX 

4 cs 

TOTAL BID 

McKesson Medical Grdinal Health Jnterboro Pacluging Corp. 
Richmond, VA Dublia,OH Moatgamety, NY 

UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL 
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE 

$45.83 $1,512.39 $43.70 $1,442.10 NO BID NO BID 
$5.72 $1,229.80 $5.94 $1,277.10 NO BID NO BID 

$26.28 $1,235.16 $14.22 $668.34 NO BID NO BID 

$60.50 $726.00 $68.17 $818.04 $48.32 $579.84 

$51.54 $1030.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
$1.60 $648.00 $1.20 $486.00 NO BID NO BID 

$65.29 $1,044.64 $64.46 $1,031.36 NO BID NO BID 
$1.30 $1,101.10 $0.97 $821.59 NO BID NO BID 

$67.05 $871.65 $38.33 $498.29 NO BID NO BID 

$21 .57 $647.10 $21.85 $655.50 NO BID NO BID 

$186.49 $932.45 $184.12 $920.60 NO BID NO BID 

$45.20 $542.40 $5220 $626.40 NO BID NO BID 

$7.55 $528.50 $8.71 $609.70 NO BID NO BID 

$46.80 $561.60 $52.74 $632.88 $35.74 $428.88 

$11.06 $553.00 $5.59 $279.50 NO BID NO BID 

$1265 $442.75 $17.78 $622.30 NO BID NO BID 

$3.93 $4,429.11 $4.01 $4,519.27 NO BID NO BID 

$59.41 $891.15 $117.31 $1,759.65 NO BID NO BID 

$24.88 $721.52 $24.70 $716.30 NO BID NO BID 

$254.80 $1,528.80 $215.22 $1,291 .32 NO BID NO BID 

$213.88 $2,566.56 $214.30 $2,571 .60 NO BID NO BID 

$92.82 $371.28 $104.54 $418.16 NO BID NO BID 

$144,940.29 $195,774.94 $13,536.67 

., 
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UNIT 
PRICE 

I 

TOTAL 
PRICE 
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