

**PRICE SHEET  
CITY OF AUSTIN ("CITY")  
INSPECTION AND TESTING OF AERIAL DEVICES**

**Solicitation No.: IFB 7800 MMO1019**

**Special Instructions:** Offerors must use this Price Submittal to submit pricing. Be advised that altering the Price Submittal sheet or taking exceptions to any portion of the solicitation may jeopardize acceptance of your Offer.

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities or items listed, actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are provided as a guide based on historical or anticipated usage. Order quantities will be as-needed and specified by the City for each order.

A bid of "0" (zero) will be interpreted by the City as a no-charge (free) item and the City will not expect to pay for that item. Be advised, a "no bid" or no response, field or section left blank, may be considered as non-responsive and result in disqualification of the bid.

Prices offered on the bid sheet shall be all inclusive of fees not expressly allowed in the Scope of Work. The Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping or transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to deliver services or items to the Austin, Texas area. The Offeror shall provide all tools, labor, travel, and equipment necessary to perform the services required under this contract.

The City reserves the right to award a single contract based on overall low cost or multiple awards based on categories/groups of specific line items, cost, or any criteria deemed most advantageous to the City.

**SECTION 1: INSPECTION OF AERIAL LADDERS, LIFTING DEVICES AND GROUND LADDERS**

**1A: AERIAL LADDERS AND LIFTING DEVICES**

LINE ITEM	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
1.1A	Inspection of Mobile & Locomotive Cranes	40	EA	NO BID	
1.2A	Inspection of Vehicle Mounted Elevating & Rotating Devices	26	EA	NO BID	
1.3A	Inspection of Boom-Supported Elevating Work Platforms	48	EA	NO BID	
1.4A	Inspection of Digger Derricks	6	EA	NO BID	
1.5A	Inspection of Fire Apparatus with Aerial Ladder, Elevated Platform or Water Tower	19	EA	\$800.00	\$15,200.00
<b>TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE -SECTION 1A</b>					<b>\$ 15,200.00</b>

**1B: FIRE APPARATUS GROUND LADDERS**

LINE ITEM	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PRICE (PER LINEAR FT.)	EXTENDED PRICE
1.1B	Inspection of Fire Apparatus Ground Ladders	6700	LINEAR FT.	\$2.50	\$16,750.00
<b>TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE -SECTION 1B</b>					<b>\$16,750.00</b>

**TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE - SECTION 1** **\$ 31,950.00**

**SECTION 2: RE-INSPECTION OF AERIAL LADDERS, LIFTING DEVICES AND GROUND LADDERS**

**2A: AERIAL LADDERS AND LIFTING DEVICES**

LINE ITEM	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
2.1A	Re-Inspection of Mobile & Locomotive Cranes	10	EA	NO BID	
2.2A	Re-Inspection of Vehicle Mounted Elevating & Rotating Devices	10	EA	NO BID	
2.3A	Re-Inspection of Boom-Supported Elevating Work Platforms	15	EA	NO BID	
2.4A	Re-Inspection of Digger Derricks	3	EA	NO BID	
2.5A	Re-Inspection of Fire Apparatus with Aerial Ladder, Elevated Platform or Water Tower	5	EA	\$400.00	\$2,000.00
<b>TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE -SECTION 2A</b>					<b>\$ 2,000.00</b>

## SECTION 2B: FIRE APPARATUS GROUND LADDERS

LINE ITEM	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PRICE (PER LINEAR FT.)	EXTENDED PRICE
2.1B	Re-Inspection of Fire Apparatus Ground Ladders	500	LINEAR FT.	\$1.25	\$625.00
TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE -SECTION 2B					\$625.00

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE -SECTION 2 *\$ 2625.00*TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR SECTIONS 1 AND 2: *\$ 34,575.00*COMPANY NAME: *MISTRAS GROUP INC*EMAIL ADDRESS: *JAMES.GLATTIS@MISTRASGROUP.COM*